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UNITED INDEPENDENT SCHOOL DISTRICT
CONSTRUCTION SUPPLIES AND MATERIALS

RFP 054-2009

VENDORS . ]
PERCENTAGE DISCOUNTS BRICKS & TILE INTERNATIONAL LOWE'S McCOY'S BUILDING SUPPLY
% OFF CATALOG PRICE 0% 10% 0%
% OFF LIST PRICE 0% 0% 0%
% OFF SHELF PRICE 0% 10% 0%
EST DELIVERY TIME all in stock 7-10 days 2-3 days after receiving the PO
DESCRIPTION UNIT UNIT COST | NOTES | BRAND NAME & ITEM # | UNIT COST NOTES BRAND NAME & ITEM # | UNIT COST NOTES BRAND NAME & ITEM #
FLOOR LEVELER, PATCHING COMPOUND 25 LBS. BAG NO BID $14.00 = mapei 3174 $16.29 - dap 271254
MASONRY TYPE N 50 LBS. BAG $6.95 - alamo cement $7.20 - alamo 10354 $7.19 70 |bs alamo 040218
PORTLAND CEMENT 50 LBS. BAG $8.40 - alamo cement $8.00 - alamo 10352 $8.19 92.5 lbs alamo 040215
READY MIX 25 LBS. BAG $3.95 C"”;)eltssm'x alamo cement $3.30 80 lbs alamo 10385 $3.49 - txi 040200
COVE BASE, 4" BLACK 4' LONG BX. NO BID $85.00 - flexco 206424 $64.79 - macklanburg-duncan
DRILL BIT, MASONRY 1" x 6" EACH NO BID $3.75 - uta 300363 NO BID
DRILL BIT, MASONRY 3/16 x 4%" EACH NO BID $2.90 - uta 300509 $2.29 4" worlwide 32168890
DRIP EDGE 1%" x 1%" x 10' EACH NO BID $1.80 - dot 11707 $2.49 - prime source 110240
FELT, ROOFING #30 EACH NO BID $22.75 - gaf 10308 $21.95 - tarco 080303
FENCE; BAND, BRACE 1-5/8" EACH NO BID $0.59 - master halco 110516 NO BID
FENCE; BAND, TENSION 1-7/8" EACH NO BID $0.59 - master halco 110516 NO BID
FENCE; CAPS, 1 3/8" EACH NO BID $3.15 - master halco 110516 NO BID
FENCE; TENSION BAR 8' EACH NO BID $11.09 - master halco 110516 NO BID
FLAT STRAP, %2" x 8 x 20 EACH NO BID NO BID NO BID
FLAT STRAP, 1%4" x %" x 20 EACH NO BID NO BID NO BID
CHICKEN WIRE 2"x50" EACH NO BID $16.88 - garden zone 92276 $15.99 | 24" x 50 ft | prime source 060445
HINGES, 4 %" x 4%" EACH NO BID $19.43 - batta lion 251101 NO BID
INSULATION, ROLLS R-11 EACH NO BID $34.00 - jm 91109 $32.43 23" owens corning 050103
LUMBER 2x12x20 WHITE WOOD EACH NO BID $18.00 - gp 5210 $21.99 yellow pci 0105181
LUMBER 2x8x10 WHITE WOOD EACH NO BID $6.10 - gp 76855 $5.89 yellow pci 010303
LUMBER, 2 x 6 x 10 WHITE WOOD EACH NO BID $5.22 - gp 31100 $4.49 - boise 012803
LUMBER, 2 x 6 x 16 WHITE WOOD EACH NO BID $7.20 - gp 33789 $7.49 - hampton 012812
LUMBER, TREATED 2 x 4 x 16 EACH NO BID $8.10 - gp 79670 $7.99 - great southern 010724
LUMBER, TREATED 2 x 6 x 16 EACH NO BID $9.90 - gp 90297 $9.99 - great southern 01081200
LUMBER, TREATED 2 x 8 x 16 EACH NO BID $13.90 - gp 201519 $14.95 - great southern 010906
NAIL, #16 COMMON LB. NO BID $42.00 50 lbs griprite 69057 $2.59 - prime source 12012900
NAIL, #8 COMMON LB. NO BID $42.00 50 lbs griprite 69054 $2.59 - prime source 12012500
NAIL, FINE #3 LB. NO BID $53.00 50 Ibs griprite 88981 $2.69 - prime source 12015827
NAIL, FINE #8 LB. NO BID $53.00 50 lbs griprite 88981 $2.69 - prime source 12016300
NAIL, PANELING BX. NO BID $2.50 6 0z hillman 3217 $2.59 - prime source 12014309
NAIL, ROOFING 7/8" BX. NO BID $40.00 - griprite 184062 $2.59 - prime source 12014309
NAIL, SHEETROCK LB. NO BID $43.00 30 Ibs griprite 184371 $3.29 - prime source 1210021
PLEXIGLAS SHEETS 4' X 8' X 1/8" EACH NO BID $63.59 - plaskolite 140380 NO BID
PLYWOOD, BC %" 4'X8' EACH NO BID $19.44 - gp 12224 $16.99 AC pci 020101
PLYWOOD, BC 3/4" 4'X8' EACH NO BID $33.00 - gp 12229 $13.79 - pci 020112
PLYWOOD, CDX %" 4'X8' EACH NO BID $12.20 - gp 12192 $11.99 - pci 020203
ROOF FLASHING 12" X 25' ROLLS NO BID $16.95 - amerimax 139307 $20.29 - prime source 110321
SCREW, DRYWALL #6x 1" LB. NO BID NO BID NO BID
SCREW, DRYWALL #6 x 1%" LB. NO BID $56.00 25 |bs griprite 184022 $4.39 prime source 12122600
SCREW, SELF-TAPPING #10 x 1%" LB. NO BID $74.00 50 Ibs protuist 88981 $6.09 #6x11/4" sealtite 121221
SHINGLES, ROOF (TAN COLOR) PER BUNDLE PKG NO BID $22.00 - owens corning 10212 $21.99 20 yr owens corning 080103
SQUARE TUBING, 1" x 20" EACH NO BID NO BID NO BID
SQUARE TUBING, 1%" x 20' EACH NO BID NO BID NO BID
STAPLES, T-50 %" BX. NO BID $3.30 - stanley 91431 $2.99 | - | arrow 324027
STAPLES, T-50 3/4" BX. NO BID $2.95 - stanley 97832 NO BID
STAPLES, T-50 3/8" BX. NO BID $2.95 - stanley 91428 $3.99 | - | arrow 324024
TILE, CEILING 2 x 2 FIBERGLASS BX. NO BID $34.00 - armstrong 40684 NO BID
TILE, CEILING 2 x 4 FIBERGLASS BX. NO BID $40.00 - armstrong 54195 $31.99 - usg interior 150209
TILE, VINYL (COLOR MAY VARY) 45 SQFT BOX EACH NO BID $39.00 - azrock 12758 $65.00 - azrock/ armstrong
ALUMINUM WINDOWS FOR PORTABLES 36" X 36" EACH NO BID $94.00 - better bilt 6132 $69.95 - atrium 13101401




