United Independent School District
Food Service Kitchen Parts & Supplies

RFP 041-2013

DESCRIPTION

Hertiage Food Service

3-Wire

Hagar Restaurant Service

Commerical Kitchen Parts

Pasco Brokeage Inc.

Atex Restaurant Supply

Whaley Food Service Repairs

& Service
% off Catalog Price 0-30% depends on vendor ‘contact Pasco for pricing NA
9% off List Price 0-35% See Attachment 0-30% depends on vendor 0-35% 50%'e><°‘”tf“:h°" disc. varies by item 20% 5.500
% off Shelf Price 0-30% depends on vendor 20%
Addendums I, II, & lll Acknowledged NO YES NO LIl YES 1l NO YES LIl YES 1'NO NO
Vendors Hertiage Food Service 3-Wire Hagar Restaurant Service Commer;‘caslelf‘i/(lzzen Parts Pasco Brokeage Inc. Atex Restaurant Supply Whaley Food Service Repairs
Description OES“ .| it Price | Ext. Price Unit Price Ext. Price Unit Price Ext. Price Unit Price | Ext. Price Unit Price | Ext. Price Unit Price Ext. Price Unit Price | Ext. Price
uanti
Gaskets 20 x 47 3/4 No Bid $6,030.00 $95.00 $5,700.00 $100.50 $6,030.00 Nobid | $117.59 | $7.055.40 No Bid
60 17020-2007 CA 17020-2043
Gaskets i
$527.93 $10,558.60 $6.21 $621.10 $623.85 $12,477.00 $527.94 | $10,558.80 No bid $8.13 $162.60 $274.46 $5,489.20
Model/Part # GROE 110898 20 | | | | | | | | | |
Brand Proposed: | 11 Green (Pkg of 100) | |_Based on Qty (100)/Green || Groen | ] |
Band Blade [ 25 [__NoBid ] ] [NoBd ] | [ si625 | sa0625  |[_siLs3 $288.25_|[__Nobid | $14.72__ | $368.00
UOte#1071892 1071892
[Balank 17214 Spindie -
141.06 23.18 149.36 48.08 134.77 04.31 141.07 23.21 No bid 201.63 604.89 116.17 8.51
Model/Part # BLAK 17514 3 | # | 4 | | # 4 | $ | 4 | # 4 | ! | & # | i | 834
Brand Proposed: | 11 Blakeslee 11 Blakeslee | Blakeslee | Impellar-17514 |
Thermostat for Kettle
$140.85 $1,408.50 $133.03 $1,330.30 $126.20 $1,262.00 $133.03 $1,330.30 $152.15 $1,521.50 $190.15 $1,901.50 $114.25 $1,142.50
Veiipon 4 VOLC 835220 w | | | | | | I | I | I | I |
Brand Proposed: | 11 Vulcan 11 Vulcan | Vulcan | Vulc 833220 I} Vulc 833220 |
Valve
214.47 1,715.76 202.56 1,620.48 191.64 1,533.12 202.56 1,620.48 231.65 1,853.20 289.53 2,316.24 173.96 1,391.68
Vtelpar # VUL 8414561 BEZAETIKE sewas || s s E sonas || smes | s [ s EEEE
Brand Proposed: | 11 Vulcan 11 Vulcan | Vulcan | Vulc 841496-1 (] Vulc 841496-1 |
Thermostat for Steam Table i
100.78 ,031.20 .06 1,762.40 101.79 ,071.60 116.30 ,652.00 No bid 136.06 ,442.40 89.93 3,597.20
Model/Part # DUKE 2081-2 40 | b | . | | 844 s | | b . | s s | " | | s %5, | b h
Brand Proposed: | 11 Duke 11 Duke | Duke | I} Duke 2081-2 | 212081
[Rotor Single Lobe .
1,519.99 ,039.98 1,788.23 ,576.46 1,445.58 2,801.16 1,520.00 3,040.00 No bid 2,341.68 ,683.36 1,430.58 2,861.16
Viodepan # GROE 027179 o | swstese [ ssosses || simszs | sasress || siessss | s [ siszo00 [ ssom || wova | IE - [ sueoss |
Brand Proposed: | 11 Groen 11 Groen | Groen | (] Groen 027179 |
O-Ring 10 |_NoBd ] | NoBid__ | | [ s378__ 1 s3re0__|[__Nobd ] [RNobid__] [ s135 | si3s0 Nobid |
Brand Proposed: | | 11 [ [ Il GR9034
Air Acutator i
,502.80 18,011.20 ,195.54 20,782.16 527.80 18,111.20 19554 | $20,782.16 No bid 6,078.78 24,315.12 ,017.89 16,071.56
ViodePan # GROE NT5442 NIEEZIE [ ssaosse | [| seezreo | s [ soasse [ [ nove | [ | s [ seoras [ s
Brand Proposed: | 11 Groen 11 Groen | Groen | I} Groen 75442 |
High Limit Switches $101.79 $2,035.80 $60.44 $1,208.80 $58.36 $1,167.20 $60.44 $1,208.80 $100.95 $2,199.00 $137.43 $2,748.60 No bid
Model/Part # VULC 346358-2 20 | ) o ) o ) T ) ’ ) i .
Brand Proposed: | 958827-G3 11 Vulcan 11 Vulcan | Vulcan | Vulc 958827-G3 (] Vulc 346358-2 |
|Round Cens
$48.06 $2,306.88 $45.39 $2,178.72 $43.22 $2,074.56 $45.39 $2,178.72 $51.90 $2,491.20 $64.88 $3,114.24 $38.98 $1,871.04
Vespar e v sy | 46 | | | | | | I | I | I | I |
Brand Proposed: | 11 Vulcan 11 Vulcan | Vulcan | Vulc 357036-3 (| | 009046
Draw Off Valve i
$552.74 $3,316.44 $650.29 $3,901.74 $424.69 $2,548.14 $552.75 $3,316.50 No bid $851.55 $5,109.32 $520.23 $3,121.38
VioeiPan & GROE 9045 o | | (| | (| | | | | | | |
Brand Proposed: | 11 Groen 11 Groen | Groen | (] Groe 9046 | 009048
Stem 2" i
$110.13 $660.78 $127.07 $762.42 $111.13 $666.78 $127.07 $762.42 No bid $148.68 $892.08 $98.27 $580.62
Model/Part # GROE 9048 6 | | | | | | | | | | | |
Brand Proposed: | 11 Groen 11 Groen | Groen | ] Groe 9048 |
Handle 3" i
$8.66 $51.96 $10.00 $60.00 $9.16 $54.96 $0.85 $59.10 No bid $11.69 $70.14 $7.73 $46.38
Viodeliet # GROE 5029 o | | (| | (| | | | | | | | | |
Brand Proposed: | 11 Groen 11 Groen | Groen | (] Groen 9029 | 009029
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Vendors Hertiage Food Service 3-Wire Hagar Restaurant Service °°m"‘e’jﬂ°‘;'e'f\'1‘i§2e” Parts Pasco Brokeage Inc Atex Restaurant Supply Whaley Food Service Repairs
Description QES‘-“ Unit Price | Ext. Price Unit Price | Ext. Price Unit Price | Ext. Price Unit Price Ext. Price Unit Price | Ext. Price Unit Price | Ext. Price Unit Price | Ext. Price
uanti
Door Strike Kit
116.37 65.48 100.91 39.64 104.44 17.76 109.91 30.64 125.70 502.80 157.10 628.40 94.39 77.56
Model/Part # GROE 423014-G1 4 | $ | i | | $ i | $ i | $ has | $ | $ | $ # | $ | e
Brand Proposed: | 11 Vulcan | Vulcan | Groen | Vulcan 423014-G1 (| Groen 423014-G1 |
|Bearinas $8.82 $70.56 $8.33 $66.64 $8.34 $66.72 $8.33 $66.64 $9.80 $78.40 $11.90 $95.20 $7.15 $57.20
Part #: 347080-2 8
Brand Proposed: | 11 Vulcan 11 Vulcan | Hobart | Vulcan 247080-2 [} 347080-2 |
Washer $12.42 $186.30 $11.73 $175.95 $11.54 $173.10 $11.73 $175.95 $13.80 $207.00 $16.77 $251.55 $10.07 $151.05
Part #: 343143-1 15
Brand Proposed: | 11 Vulcan 11 Vulcan | Hobart | Vulcan 343143-1 (] 343143-1 | 343143-1
Switch DPST $33.84 $507.60 $31.96 $479.40 $30.58 $458.70 $31.96 $479.40 $36.55 $548.25 $45.68 $685.20 $27.45 $411.75
Part #: 340324-6 15
[Brand Proposed: | 11 Vulcan 11 Vulcan | Hobart | (] 340324-6 |
Pump Motor 828.75 2,486.25 877.50 2,632.50 810.00 2,430.00 828.75 2,486.25 No bid 1,184.63 3,553.80 682.50 2,047.50
Model/Part # BLAK 8337 3 | $828- $2,486. $877. $2,632. $810. $2,430. $828. $2, i $1, $3,553. E $2,
Brand Proposed: | 11 Blakeslee 11 Blakeslee | Hobart | I} Blak 8337 |
Collar i
$103.64 $310.92 $100.75 $329.25 $99.55 $208.65 $103.65 $310.95 No bid $148.16 $444.48 $85.36 $256.08
Model/Part # BLAK 7562 3 | | | | | | | | | | | |
Brand Proposed: | 11 Blakeslee 11 Blakeslee | Blakeslee | (] Blak 13087 |
|Bracket Pump Case Motor .
315.85 947.55 334.43 1,003.29 299.27 897.81 315.85 947.55 No bid 51.48 1,354.44 260.11 780.33
Model/Part # BLAK 13087 3 | $ | $ | | $ $ | | $ $ | $ 8 | ! | | 4 $ | # | #
Brand Proposed: | 11 Blakeslee 11 Blakeslee | Blakeslee | I} Blak 9551 |
Imfellar Spingle $194.86 $584.58 $206.33 $618.99 $186.00 $558.00 $194.86 $584.58 No bid $260.73 $809.19 No bid
Model/Part # BLAK 9551 3 - - - - - - - -
Brand Proposed: 95551/Blakeslee 11 Blakeslee | Blakeslee | (] Blak 9551 |
Drain Seal Ring ;
25.49 101.96 26.99 107.96 24.49 97.96 25.49 101.96 No bid 36.44 145.76 20.99 83.96
Model/Part # BLAK 9551 4 | s | ® | | s ® | s s | s s | ! | | b ® | $ | b
Brand Proposed: | 11 Blakeslee | Blakeslee | Blakeslee | I} Blak 18644 |
Cam Shaft i
287.54 862.62 304.46 013.38 272.63 817.89 287.55 62.65 No bid 11.02 1,233.06 236.80 710.40
Model/Part # BLAK 13898 3 | $ | $ | | $ $ | | $ $ | $ ki | ! | | . i | ki | ¥
Brand Proposed: | 11 Blakeslee 11 Blakeslee | Blakeslee | (| Blak 13898 |
Door "
40.16 1,320.48 66.06 1,398.18 24.27 1,272.81 40.16 1,320.48 No bid 29.18 1,887.54 62.80 1,088.40
ViodlPart # BLAK 14755 s | swows | samas || sweos | siasess || sz | [ swots | sramas ]| wote | [ s | s [ seee0 | s
Brand Proposed: | 11 Blakeslee 11 Blakeslee | Blakeslee | I} Blak 14795 |
Impeller P Tank 372.96 1,118.88 394.90 1,184.70 353.02 1,059.06 372.96 1,118.88 No bid 33.12 1,599.36 07.15 921.45
Model/Part # BLAK 95682 3 8372/ 1118, $394. $1,184. $353. $1,059. $372. $1, i 5. $1,509. 33 2
Brand Proposed: 11 Blakeslee 11 Blakeslee | Blakeslee | (| Blak 95682 |
] ] I
Impeller 151.30 53.90 160.20 80.60 144.40 33.20 151.30 53.90 No bid 216.27 648.81 124.60 73.80
ModelPart # BLAK 95673 3 $151. $453. $160. $480. $144. $433. $151. 4 i s $648. I3 53
Brand Proposed: 11 Blakeslee 11 Blakeslee | Blakeslee | I} Blak 95673 |
|Bracket Pump i
507.46 1,522.38 529.61 1,588.83 79.60 1,438.80 507.45 1,522.35 No bid 725.35 2,176.05 17.90 1,253.70
Vit 4 BLAK 4657 s | s | sz || swe | ssss || sme | s [ sores | sseas || wowa | [ s | s [[sareo [ s
Brand Proposed: [ 11 Blakeslee 11 Blakeslee | Blakeslee | (| |
Elements - Skillets No Bid No bid $290.52 $1,743.12 $303.37 | $1,820.22 No bid No bid No bid
Model/Part #: 2FE 6
Brand Proposed: | 11 11 | | I} |
Elements - Kettles No Bid No bid $94.96 $1,139.52 No bid No bid No bid No bid
Model/Part #: 2FE 12
Brand Proposed: | 11 | | | (| |
Elements - Ovens No Bid No bid $83.10 $831.00 $100.90 | $1,009.00 No bid No bid No bid
Model/Part #: 2FE 10
Brand Proposed: | 11 [ate Chart shows prices of other | Prices on other brands listed | | |l |
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Commerical Kitchen Parts

Vendors Hertiage Food Service 3-Wire Hagar Restaurant Service & servion Pasco Brokeage Inc. Atex Restaurant Supply Whaley Food Service Repairs
vi
Description QES‘-“ Unit Price | Ext. Price Unit Price | Ext. Price Unit Price | Ext. Price Unit Price Ext. Price Unit Price | Ext. Price Unit Price | Ext. Price Unit Price | Ext. Price
uanti
Elements - Warmers i i
No Bid $88.20 $529.20 $80.60 $483.60 $105.00 $630.00 No bid No bid No bid
Model/Part # 2FE s | “ | (| | | | | | “ | | a | | a |
Brand Proposed: | | [___Crescor Part#0811-265 | | Crescor | (] |
Probe Convection Oven
$62.64 $1,879.20 $59.16 $1,774.80 $56.68 $1,700.40 $59.16 $1,774.80 $67.95 $2,038.50 $84.56 $2,536.80 $50.81 $1,524.30
Model/Part #: 353589-1 30 | | | | | | | | | | | |
Brand Proposed: | 11 Vulcan 11 Vulcan | Vulcan | Vulcan 353589-1 ] 353589-1 |
Micro Switch - Ovens i
$35.10 $1,053.00 $37.80 $1,134.00 $44.20 $1,326.00 $45.90 $1,377.00 No bid $47.39 $1,421.70 No bid
Model/Part # CRES 808-116 30 | | | | | | | | | ! | | | | ! |
Brand Proposed: | 11 Crescor 11 Crescor | | (] |
[Releif Value - Kettle " "
$135.75 $1,357.50 No bid $102.37 $1,023.70 $156.64 $1,566.40 No bid $183.26 $1,832.60 $121.13 $1,211.30
Model/Part # KE54941-2 10 | | | | ! | | | | | | | ! | | | | |
Brand Proposed: | 11 11 Cleveland | Vulcan | ] SKE54941-2 |
Cabinet Sensors - Traulsen Warmer i i
$34.45 $1,033.50 No bid $34.95 $1,048.50 $30.75 $1,192.50 No bid No bid No bid
Model/Part # RIH232LP 30 | | | | ! | | | | | ! | | ! | | ! |
Brand Proposed | 11 11 Traulsen | Traulsen | (] |
Thermal Fuse - Traulsen Warmer No Bid No bid $25.72 $771.60 $29.10 $873.00 No bid No bid No bid
Model/Part # RIH232LP 30
Brand Proposed | 11 11 Traulsen | Traulsen | ] |
Auxilary Fan - Traulsen Warmer No Bid No bid $100.73 $4,3890.20 $12546 | $5,018.40 No bid No bid No bid
Model/Part # RIH232LP 40
Brand Proposed | 11 11 Traulsen | Traulsen | (] |
Temperature Controllers -
Convection Ovens 0 $155.79 No bid $130.48 $433.20 $147.14 $4,414.20 No bid No bid No bid
Model/Part# VC4ED
Brand Proposed Vulcan Vulcan
Blower Motors - Convection Ovens $547.83 $5,478.30 No bid $488.96 $4,889.60 $517.40 $0.00 No bid No bid No bid
Model/Part # VCAED 10
Brand Proposed | 11 11 [ Vulcan | | |
Blower Wheels - Convection Ovens | 10 T NoBid | ][ Nobid [ | | $97.24 | $972.40 || $102.26 [ $1,022.60 || Nobid | (] Nobid | | Nobid |
Vulcan
Infinite Switch - 40 No Bid No bid $14.25 $570.00 $15.28 $611.20 No bid No bid No bid
Wells Steam Tables
Electronic Control Board - 8 No Bid No bid $139.48 $1,115.84 $155.81 | $1,246.48 No bid No bid No bid
Convection Ovens
353613-2
Oven Timers [ 15 [ Nomd ] ] Nobd__] ] s7ass__] siiis70_|[_se3ss $1250.25 |[_Nobid | [_Nobid ] [RNobid ]

240v 1-hr/ 411690-2
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