RFP 2014-052
DISTRICT-WIDE HVAC FILTERS

Advanced Filtration Air Filter Products Inc. Fastnal Company FilterFirst
Products, LLC
FILTERS #1 YEARLY USAGE —
U_mt Price ) Unit Price in ) Unit Price in ) Unit Price in (U.S. )
Est. Annual BOX in (U.S. Annual Price Annual Price Annual Price Annual Price
(U.S. Dollars) (U.S. Dollars) Dollars)
Dollars)
40x15-3/4x 2
11 132 |$ 4000 (S 440.00 | $ 15.85 | $ 17435 [ $ 29.98 | $ 329.78 no bid| $ -
Est. Annual Total
S 440.00 S 174.35 S 329.78 S -
Advanced Filtration Air Filter Products Inc. Fastnal Company FilterFirst
YEARLY  USAGE Products, LLC
FILTERS #2 Unit Price o o it Price in (U.S
Est. Annual BOX in(U.S. Annual Price Unit Price in Annual Price Unit Price in Annual Price Unit Price in (U.S. Annual Price
(U.S. Dollars) (U.S. Dollars) Dollars)
Dollars)
15x20x2 9,864 822 |$ 347 |$  34,228.08 | $ 257 |$ 2535048 | $ 254 | S 25,054.56 3.18 | $ 31,367.52
16x20x2 11,988 999 [ $ 3.60 [ $  43,156.80 | $ 213 [$ 2553444 |3 254 [ $ 30,449.52 3.06 [ $ 36,683.28
16x24x2 120 10| $ 418 | $ 501.60 | $ 235 (S 282.00 | $ 277 | $ 332.40 3.90 | $ 468.00
20x20x2 4,176 348 | $ 415|$ 1733040 | $ 249 [$  10,398.24 | $ 277 (S 11,567.52 3.60 [ $ 15,033.60
20x25x2 4,080 340 | $ 5.06 | $ 20,644.80 | $ 2.81|$ 11,464.80 | $ 3.08 | $ 12,566.40 415 [ $ 16,932.00
20x30x2 132 13 9.24 | $ 1,219.68 | $ 435|$ 574.20 | $ 377 [ $ 497.64 6.24 [ $ 823.68
24x24x2 144 12|$ 5.68 | $ 817.92 | $ 317 | $ 456.48 | $ 342 | S 492.48 470 | $ 676.80
16x25x2 7,872 656 | $ 436 | S 3432192 |$ 247 [$ 1944384 | $ 277 (S 21,805.44 352 [$ 27,709.44
20x4x2 36 3($ 472 | $ 169.92 | $ 3.18 | $ 114.48 | $ 3.08 | $ 110.88 423 [S 152.28
12x24x2 24 2% 344 [ $ 82.56 | $ 217 [ $ 52.08 | $ 254 [ $ 60.96 3013 72.24
8x16x1 12 1($ 559 | $ 67.08 | $ 322 |$ 38.64 | $ 2.85| S 34.20 3.67 S 44.04
12x12x1 12 1]$ 5.68 | $ 68.16 | $ 255 [ $ 30.60 | $ 236 [ $ 28.32 3.08[$ 36.96
12x24x1 24 2(s 3.10 | $ 74.40 | $ 217 | $ 52.08 | $ 236 | S 56.64 2.68 | S 64.32
12x30x1 72 6% 8.36|$ 601.92 | $ 3.96 [ $ 285.12 | $ 6.28 [ $ 452.16 4.45|$ 320.40
13x19x1 24 2(s 552 |$ 132.48 | $ 3.96 | $ 95.04 | $ 5.56 | $ 133.44 4.88 | S 117.12
14x24x1 12 1]$ 468 |$ 56.16 | $ 274 [ $ 32.88 | $ 2.85[$ 34.20 4.55|$ 54.60
14x25x1 72 6|S 3.87 | $ 278.64 | $ 224 | S 161.28 | $ 259 | $ 186.48 293 | $ 210.96
15x20x1 1,176 98 |$ 339 [ $ 3,986.64 | $ 214 [ $ 2,516.64 | $ 236 [ $ 2,775.36 270 [ $ 3,175.20
16x20x1 420 35S 298 | S 1,251.60 | $ 2.07 | $ 869.40 | $ 236 | S 991.20 2.60 | $ 1,092.00
16x25x1 5,964 497 [ $ 368 [$ 2194752 | $ 207 [$ 1234548 | $ 259 [ $ 15,446.76 283 [ $ 17,176.32
16x30x1 3,648 304 | $ 817 S 29,804.16 | $ 3.92|$ 14,300.16 | $ 533 |$ 19,443.84 4.80 | $ 17,510.40
16x31x1 36 318 8.17|$ 294.12 | $ 4.48 | $ 161.28 | $ 729 [ $ 262.44 6.73 [ $ 242.28
18x18x1 48 41 6.47 | S 310.56 | $ 2.83 | S 135.84 | $ 3.04 | $ 145.92 445 | S 213.60
18x30x1 168 1413 9.93|$ 1,668.24 | $ 419 |$ 703.92 | $ 8.15|$ 1,369.20 531[$ 892.08
20x20x1 1,920 160 | $ 372 | S 7,142.40 | $ 2.09 | $ 4,012.80 | $ 259 | $ 4,972.80 292 | S 5,606.40
20x21.5x1 600 5(% 6.80 [ $ 4,080.00 | $ 42118 2,526.00 | $ 729 [ $ 4,374.00 639 [$ 3,834.00
20x22x1 60 5($ 6.80 | $ 408.00 | $ 429 [$ 257.40 | $ 7.29 | $ 437.40 4.45 | $ 267.00
20x25x1 456 38($ 439 (S 2,001.84 | $ 259 | S 1,181.04 [ $ 2.89 S 1,317.84 324 | $ 1,477.44
20x30x1 24 2 (s 8.17 | $ 196.08 | $ 335 (S 80.40 | $ 339 | S 81.36 437 [$ 104.88
24x24x1 84 71% 498 |$ 41832 | $ 3.02[$ 253.68 | $ 298 [ $ 250.32 379 [ $ 318.36
16x23.5x1 12 1(s 418 S 50.16 | $ 293 |$ 35.16 | $ 6.28 | S 75.36 6.05 | S 72.60
Est. Annual Total 53,291 $ 20653 S 227,312.16 | $ 108.56 | S 133,745.88 | $ 147.94 | $ 155,807.04 126.51 ] $ 182,749.80




Filtration Products

Florence Filter

Insco Distributing

Joe E. Fly Co. Inc

FILTERS #1 YEARLY USAGE
Est. Annual BOX Unit Price Annual Price Unit Price in Annual Price Unit Price in Annual Price Unit Pricein (U.S. Annual Price
in (U.S. (U.S. Dollars) (U.S. Dollars) Dollars)
40x15-3/4x2 11 132 |$ 2493 |S 27423 | $ 19.95 | $ 219.45 no bid| $ - 1595 | $ 175.45
Est. Annual Total s 274.23 $ 219.45 $ - $ 175.45
Filtration Products Florence Filter Insco Distributing Joe E. Fly Co. Inc
FILTERS #2 YEARLY USAGE
Est. Annual BOX Unit Price Annual Price Unit Price in Annual Price Unit Price in Annual Price Unit Price in (U.S. Annual Price
in (U.S. (U.S. Dollars) (U.S. Dollars) Dollars)

15x20x2 9,864 822 |$ 3.00 |$ 29,592.00 | $ 3.60 | $ 3551040 | $ 2.85| S 28,112.40 3.50 | $ 34,524.00
16x20x2 11,988 999 | $ 286 [$  34,285.68 | $ 3.60 [ $  43,156.80 | $ 239 (S 28,651.32 3413 40,879.08
16x24x2 120 10| $ 3.77 | $ 452.40 | $ 3.90 | $ 468.00 | $ 341 S 409.20 4.00 [ $ 480.00
20x20x2 4,176 348 | $ 349 [$ 1457424 | $ 390 [$  16,286.40 | $ 279 [ $ 11,651.04 3.80 [ $ 15,868.80
20x25x2 4,080 340 | $ 3.99 |$ 16,279.20 | $ 425[$S 17,340.00 | $ 339 | S 13,831.20 419 [ $ 17,095.20
20x30x2 132 13 5.94 [ $ 784.08 | $ 6.40 [ $ 844.80 | $ 4.65|$ 613.80 5.66 | $ 747.12
24x24x2 144 12|$ 451 (S 649.44 | $ 470 | $ 676.80 | $ 3.80 | $ 547.20 457 S 658.08
16x25x2 7,872 656 | $ 337 [$  26,5528.64 | $ 3.90 [$ 30,700.80 | $ 279 [ $ 21,962.88 375 [ $ 29,520.00
20x4x2 36 3($ 4.07 [ $ 146.52 | $ 425 [$ 153.00 | $ 3.79 | $ 136.44 419 S 150.84
12x24x2 24 2| 295 (S 70.80 | $ 3.60 [ $ 86.40 | $ 252 $ 60.58 338 [ $ 81.12
8x16x1 12 1($ 2.81|$ 33.72 | $ 3.65| S 43.80 | $ 572 |$ 68.64 4.40 | S 52.80
12x12x1 12 1] 2.86 [ $ 3432 |$ 335 (S 40.20 | $ 2.63[$ 31.56 345 [ $ 41.40
12x24x1 24 2(s 259 | $ 62.16 | $ 3.20 | $ 76.80 | $ 2.60 | $ 62.40 3.15 | $ 75.60
12x30x1 72 6|$ 413 |$ 29736 | $ 4.85|$ 349.20 | $ 6.90 [ $ 496.80 4.40 | $ 316.80
13x19x1 24 2(s 3.60 | $ 86.40 | $ 4.65 | S 111.60 | $ 6.40 | $ 153.60 535S 128.40
14x24x1 12 1] 432 (S 51.84 | $ 425[$ 51.00 | $ 312 | $ 37.44 446 | S 53.52
14x25x1 72 6|S 2.82|$ 203.04 | $ 335 (S 24120 | $ 273 | $ 196.56 335 (S 241.20
15x20x1 1,176 98 |[$ 2.65 [ $ 3,116.40 | $ 320 [ $ 3,763.20 | $ 257 (S 3,022.32 3.16 [ $ 3,716.16
16x20x1 420 35S 255 |$ 1,071.00 | $ 3.20 | $ 1,344.00 | $ 248 | S 1,041.60 3.10 | $ 1,302.00
16x25x1 5,964 497 | $ 278 [$  16,579.92 | $ 335[$ 1997940 | $ 277 (S 16,520.28 330 (S 19,681.20
16x30x1 3,648 304 | $ 456 S 16,634.88 | S 510 | $ 18,604.80 | $ 3.78 | $ 13,789.44 4.65 | S 16,963.20
16x31x1 36 3| 499 |$ 179.64 | $ 775 [ $ 279.00 | $ 7.62 | $ 274.32 6.90 [ $ 248.40
18x18x1 48 41 423 [$ 203.04 | $ 4.85|$ 232.80 | $ 3.76 | $ 180.48 4.40 | S 211.20
18x30x1 168 1413 49318 828.24 | $ 5.50 [ $ 924.00 | $ 9.12|$ 1,532.16 5.00 [ $ 840.00
20x20x1 1,920 160 | $ 2.80 | $ 5,376.00 | $ 335 (S 6,432.00 | $ 277 | $ 5,318.40 330 (S 6,336.00
20x21.5x1 600 5(% 499 |$ 2,994.00 | $ 7.70 [ $ 4,620.00 | $ 7.62 | $ 4,572.00 6.65 | $ 3,990.00
20x22x1 60 5($ 413 [ $ 247.80 | $ 4.85|$ 291.00 | $ 333 |$ 199.80 4.40 | S 264.00
20x25x1 456 38($ 3013 1,372.56 | $ 3.60 [ $ 1,641.60 | $ 321 (S 1,463.76 3.55 [ $ 1,618.80
20x30x1 24 2(s 4.06 | S 97.44 | $ 415 [ $ 99.60 | $ 3.90 | $ 93.60 435S 104.40
24x24x1 84 71% 352 [$ 295.68 | $ 3.80 [ $ 319.20 | $ 335 (S 281.40 395 [$ 331.80
16x23.5x1 12 1(s 447 | S 53.64 | $ 7.10 | $ 85.20 | $ 6.90 | $ 82.80 6.35 S 76.20
Est. Annual Total 53,291 $ 139.68 | $ 173,182.08 | $ 156.85 | $ 204,753.00 | $ 125.66 | $ 155,395.42 148.02 | $ 196,597.32




YEARLY USAGE Joe E. Fly Co. Inc MSC Industrial Supply Pure Air Filter Co. Trane Supplys
FILTERS #1 Est. Annual BOX Ui:lt(:.r:e Annual Price Unit Price in Annual Price Unit Price in Annual Price Unit Price in (U.S. Annual Price
Dollars) (U.S. Dollars) (U.S. Dollars) Dollars)
40x15-3/4x 2 11 132 nobid |$ - no bid S - S 39.66 | $ 436.26 no bid S -
Est. Annual Total $ - $ - $ 436.26 $ -
YEARLY  USAGE Joe E. Fly Co. Inc MSC Industrial Supply Pure Air Filter Co. Trane Supplys
FILTERS #2 Est. Annual BOX Uirr\\lt(l.'jz.:e Annual Price Unit Price in Annual Price Unit Price in Annual Price Unit Price in (U.S. Annual Price
Dollars) (U.S. Dollars) (U.S. Dollars) Dollars)

15x20x2 9,864 822 DNMS DNMS S 435[S 4290840 | S 3.14 | $ 30,972.96 311 (S 30,677.04
16x20x2 11,988 999 DNMS DNMS $ 4.27|$ 51,188.76 | $ 291 (S 34,885.08 240 [ $ 28,771.20
16x24x2 120 10 DNMS DNMS S 457 S 548.40 | $ 344 | S 412.80 2.84 | S 340.80
20x20x2 4,176 348 DNMS DNMS $ 475|$  19,836.00 | $ 339 [ $ 14,156.64 2.63[$ 10,982.88
20x25x2 4,080 340 DNMS DNMS S 531|$ 21,664.80 | $ 3.90 | $ 15,912.00 3.05|$ 12,444.00
20x30x2 132 11 DNMS DNMS $ 8.03|$ 1,059.96 | $ 5.06 [ $ 667.92 7.22|$ 953.04
24x24x2 144 12 DNMS DNMS S 536 | S 771.84 | $ 426 | S 613.44 347 | S 499.68
16x25x2 7,872 656 DNMS DNMS $ 476 | $ 3747072 | $ 339 [ $ 26,686.08 256 [ $ 20,152.32
20x4x2 36 3 DNMS DNMS S 4.86 | S 174.96 | $ 416 | S 149.76 3.01 (S 108.36
12x24x2 24 2 DNMS DNMS $ 3.90 [ $ 93.60 | $ 3.03[$ 72.72 217 [ $ 52.08
8x16x1 12 1 DNMS DNMS S 3.94 | $ 47.28 | $ 5.01|$ 60.12 no bid no bid
12x12x1 12 1 DNMS DNMS no bid nobid | $ 3.03[$ 36.36 223 (S 26.76
12x24x1 24 2 DNMS DNMS S 433 [$ 24.00 | $ 2,64 | S 63.36 224 | S 53.76
12x30x1 72 6 DNMS DNMS S 451 (S 72.00 | $ 6.20 | $ 446.40 1.18 | $ 84.96
13x19x1 24 2 DNMS DNMS S 4.05|$ 24.00 | $ 536 | S 128.64 no bid no bid
14x24x1 12 1 DNMS DNMS S 414 [ $ 12.00 | $ 3.70 | $ 44.40 495 [$ 59.40
14x25x1 72 6 DNMS DNMS S 454 | S 72.00 | $ 3.06 | $ 220.32 263 | S 189.36
15x20x1 1,176 98 DNMS DNMS $ 47218 1,176.00 | $ 2.60 [ $ 3,057.60 3.00 [ $ 3,528.00
16x20x1 420 35 DNMS DNMS S 427 S 420.00 | $ 253 |$ 1,062.60 220 | $ 924.00
16x25x1 5,964 497 DNMS DNMS S 44218 5,964.00 | $ 279 [ $ 16,639.56 240 [ $ 14,313.60
16x30x1 3,648 304 DNMS DNMS S 411 (S 3,648.00 | $ 424 | S 15,467.52 319 | $ 11,637.12
16x31x1 36 3 DNMS DNMS $ 7.27|$ 36.00 | $ 1131 |$ 407.16 no bid no bid
18x18x1 48 4 DNMS DNMS S 414 | S 48.00 | $ 3.89 | $ 186.72 no bid no bid
18x30x1 168 14 DNMS DNMS S 421 (S 168.00 | $ 713 [ $ 1,197.84 6.93 | $ 1,164.24
20x20x1 1,920 160 DNMS DNMS S 455 |$ 1,920.00 | $ 2.81|$ 5,395.20 240 | S 4,608.00
20x21.5x1 600 5 DNMS DNMS $ 4118 600.00 | $ 6.51[$ 3,906.00 no bid no bid
20x22x1 60 5 DNMS DNMS S 411 (S 60.00 | $ 426 | S 255.60 5.80 | $ 348.00
20x25x1 456 38 DNMS DNMS $ 468 |$ 456.00 | $ 328 [ $ 1,495.68 276 [ $ 1,258.56
20x30x1 24 2 DNMS DNMS S 482 |$ 24.00 | $ 436 | S 104.64 321 (S 77.04
24x24x1 84 7 DNMS DNMS S 5.17 | $ 84.00 | $ 3.40 | $ 285.60 3.15 | $ 264.60
16x23.5x1 12 1 DNMS DNMS S 414 | S 12.00 | $ 285.60 | $ 3,427.20 no bid no bid
Est. Annual Total 53,291 S - $ - $ 14039 | $ 190,584.72 | $ 450.05 § $ 178,417.92 80.73 ] $ 143,518.80

* DNMS=Does Not Meet Specifications
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