
United Independent School District

HVAC Equipment Supplies

Tab RFP 019-2013

Airgas 

Refrigerants Inc.

Insco 

Distributing

0% 10%

0% 10%

0% 10%

Airgas 

Refrigerants Inc.

Insco 

Distributing

Item # Unit Description
Manufacturer or 

Equal

MFG. 

Number
Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost

Brand & Item 

#
Unit Cost

Brand & 

Item #
Unit Cost

Brand & 

Item #

1 EA
Run Capacitor 35/5, MFD, 

5% 370 VAC
Global

2227-

35/5X370
$2.70 4633330 $11.00

2 EA
Run CapaciTor 25 MFD, 5% 

370VAC
Global 2212-25X370 $2.63 463320 $7.00 $9.46

3 EA
Run Capacitor 35/5 mfd, 

440VAC
Mars 85744-12185 $3.42 463352 $11.00 $20.13

4 EA
Contactor 3 pole, 40FLA, 

50A, 600VAC coil 24VAC
Fasco H340A $19.62 $17.00

5 EA
Contactor 2 pole, 30A- coil 

120VAC
Mars

685744-

91322
$7.02 468507 $7.00 $9.79

6 EA
Contactor 3 pole, 40A-600V, 

coil-120V

Benshaw / Service  

First 

RSC-

32GAC120 / 

GTR02099

$17.89 468556 $12.00 Venti $4,641.00

7 GAL Coil Cleaner Non Acid Virginia AKF1 $9.78 443846 $15.30

8 EA
Liquid line filter dryer, 3/8 

SWEAT
Parker 163S $7.82 468417 $12.00 $16.00

9 EA
Liquid line filter dryer, 1/2 

ODF Solder
Parker 164S $7.92 536126 $13.00 $27.39

10 EA
Liquid Line filter dryer, 5/8 

ODF Solder
Parker 165S $13.00 $29.04

11 EA
Transformer 40VA PR1 

120/208/240V SEC 24V- 

Footmount

Smart Electric SE403 No bid $7.00

No bid

No bid

No bid

No bid

No bid
No bid

0%

20%

0%

Interline Brands dba 

Sexuaer

SECTION II.

SECTION I.

% OFF CATALOG PRICE:

% OFF LIST PRICE:

% OFF SHELF PRICE:

Vendor

Vendor

Interline Brands dba 

Sexuaer

No bid

Trane

0%

0%

0%

Trane

R & M Refrigeration 

Supply

70%

80%

40%

R & M Refrigeration 

Supply



United Independent School District

HVAC Equipment Supplies

Tab RFP 019-2013

Airgas 

Refrigerants Inc.

Insco 

Distributing

Interline Brands dba 

Sexuaer
Vendor Trane

R & M Refrigeration 

Supply

Manufacturer or 

Equal

MFG. 

Number
Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost

Brand & Item 

#
Unit Cost

Brand & 

Item #
Unit Cost

Brand & 

Item #

12 EA
Fan Relay - SPNO/SPNC - 

12A.cont 120vac-coil 24vac
Global/ Zettler

GFR380 / 

AZ2900-1AB-

24A

$6.80

13 EA
Silver Brazing Alloy .050"x 

1/8 sticks 
Harris 61035 $60.38 336248 $150.00 $154.44

14 EA HVAC foil tape Shurtape AF100 $5.61 943001 $7.20 $13.23

15 EA

Electric motor 1HP, 

1100rpm 380-415/460v-1ph 

2.5 amps, 50/60Hz, frame 

48Y shaft 0.5x3.1 flats

A.Osmith F48B20A05 $290.00

16 EA

Blower motor 3/4hps, 

1075rpm 3Spd, 227volts, 

1PH, 3.3amps, 60Hz, frame 

48YZ

Dayton 6GC94G $102.51 4423796 $199.00 Fasco

17 CYL
Gas refrigerant R-22, 30lbs 

cylinder 

Chlorodifluorometone

Honeywell Genetron22 $439.00 $430.00 $468.00

Dual element fuse FNM 

6/10 
IR 35amp, 250vac & 

IR10Kamp, 125vac

Dual element low peak fuse

600vac & 300VDC

Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost
Brand & Item 

#
Unit Cost

Brand & 

Item #
Unit Cost

Brand & 

Item #
20 EA $8.10

21 EA $10.00

22 EA $14.25

23 EA $54.00 Manitowoc

24 EA $67.00

25 EA $57.25

26 EA $62.50

27 EA $5.11
407087 - 

sealed unit
$3.80

No bid

No bid

No bid

Description

Description

No bid No bid

No bid

No bid

No bid No bid No bid

No bid

$9.58 539053

EA Cooper Bussmann LPS-RK-30SP

18

Compressor Starter

EA Fusetron Fuses FNM-6

19

No bid

No bid

No bid

Evaporator Motor
Dual Voltage Evaporator Motor

Ice Machine Thick Control
Ice Machine Water Inlet Valve

 Ice Machine Dump Valve

No bid

Timer (Replacement Kit only)

Defrost Limit Control



United Independent School District

HVAC Equipment Supplies

Tab RFP 019-2013

Airgas 

Refrigerants Inc.

Insco 

Distributing

Interline Brands dba 

Sexuaer
Vendor Trane

R & M Refrigeration 

Supply

Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost
Brand & Item 

#
Unit Cost

Brand & 

Item #
Unit Cost

Brand & 

Item #

28 EA $3.99
289691 

sexauer brand
$10.10

29 EA $13.80

30 EA $160.00 Tecumseh

31 EA $920.00
Russel or Equ 

320

32 EA $62.00 Fasco 

33 EA $51.00

34 EA $19.00 Copper

35 EA $1.39
E James 

3l150v belt 

465362

$6.10

36 EA $12.33
Broan #688 

466192
$234.00 Loren Cook

37 EA $8.50
Parker 0532 

466544
$12.00

38 EA $290.00 Manitowoc

39 EA $439.00 $430.00 $468.00
Honeywell 

Genetron 22 

R2230

40 EA $129.00 $98.00 $104.72
Hudson 

Technogoy 

R134A-30

41 EA $95.90 $128.00 $167.98
Arkema Inc 

R404a24

42 EA $27.00

43 EA $39.00

44 EA $754.00
Russel or Equ 

320

45 EA $26.51
Conbraco 

78307RV Bn-

483400

$140.00 Manitowoc

46 EA $55.00 Manitowoc

47 EA $7.46
sealed unit 

SPP6 134643
$14.10

48 EA $9.56
Renown  

463904
$15.30 Virginia

49 EA $70.29 Bohn

50 EA $37.07
White 

Rodgers 90-

105  468392

$57.34

No bid

No bid

No bid

No bid

No bid

Description

No bid

No bid

 8hr Defrost Timer

High Temperature Wire (12ga)

High Limit Switches (Coolers/Freezers)
Replacement Compressors

Complete Evaporator System

 Motors
 Fan Cycle

 Remote Thermometer

Expansion Valve

Solenoid Valve

Starter Capacitor Kit

Acid Cleaner

Defrost Time/Fan Delay

Replacement V-Belts

Exhaust Fan Systems

Filter Driers

Control Board Ice Machine

Freon (22)

Freon (134A)

Freon (404A)

High Temperature Wire (10ga)

No bid

No bid

Defrost Heaters

Evaporator Coil AE120B
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Airgas 

Refrigerants Inc.

Insco 

Distributing

Interline Brands dba 

Sexuaer
Vendor Trane

R & M Refrigeration 

Supply

Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost
Brand & Item 

#
Unit Cost

Brand & 

Item #
Unit Cost

Brand & 

Item #
51 EA $8.90

52 EA $7.02
Eaton 

C25BNB2307  

468506

8.10/ 19.80
Fasco or Eq. 2 

pole / 3 pole

53 EA $78.00 Honeywell

54 EA $42.10 Manitowoc

55 EA $48.00 Manitowoc

No bid

prices subject to change 

due to market

prices subject to change 

due to market

No bid No bid No bid

Notes

Description

T6054- Thermostat
Ice Maker Part Water Level

Bin Switch

3-N-1 Kick Stark for compressor

Contactors

No bid


