Section |. Day Trips

United Independent School District
Charter Bus Services
RFP 012-2013

Vendors

Bill's Sparkling Charter

Kerville Bus DBA/Coach USA & Megabus

Cougar Bus Lines, LTD

Daisy Charters & Shuttles

Imperial Bus Company

DOT #/MC#

537119/268020

136534/27530

1127893/459987

397239/226521

1261610/492765

Bus Fleet

Regular Bus

Handicap Bus 0

Regular Bus

Handicap Bus 15

Regular Bus

Handicap Bus 2

Regular Bus

Handicap Bus 1

Regular Bus

Handicap Bus 0

Headquarters 9Corpus Christi,Tx = San Antonio, Tx = Laredo, Tx = San Antonio, Tx : San Antonio, Tx
DESTINATION Regular Bus Hagcljjigap gi?)t Regular Bus Hag(ljjiscap Seat CAP. Regular Bus | Handicap Bus gilit Regular Bus Hag(l:iji;:ap g:lit Regular Bus Hagﬂi;:ap g;lit
SAN ANTONIO $1,850.00 No Bid 57 $1,838.00 | $1,838.00 55 $1,290.00 [ $1,650.00 54-56 | $1,828.00 | $1,828.00 57 * $1,800.00 NA 49-57
CORPUS CHRISTI $1,850.00 No Bid 57 $1,838.00 | $1,838.00 55 $1,290.00 [ $1,650.00 54-56 | $1,828.00 | $1,828.00 57 * $1,800.00 NA 49-57
BROWNSVILLE $2,300.00 No Bid 57 $2,155.00 [ $2,155.00 55 $1,450.00 [ $1,750.00 54-56 | $2,191.00 | $2,191.00 57 $2,150.00 NA 49-57
MCALLEN $1,850.00 No Bid 57 $1,925.00 [ $1,925.00 55 $1,290.00 [ $1,650.00 54-56 | $1,828.00 | $1,828.00 57 * $1,800.00 NA 49-57
KINGSVILLE $1,500.00 No Bid 57 $2,276.00 | $2,276.00 55 $1,290.00 [ $1,650.00 54-56 | $1,828.00 | $1,828.00 57 * $1,650.00 NA 49-57
EAGLE PASS $1,500.00 No Bid 57 $1,838.00 | $1,838.00 55 $1,290.00 [ $1,650.00 54-56 | $1,828.00 | $1,828.00 57 * $1,650.00 NA 49-57
AUSTIN $2,550.00 No Bid 57 $2,245.00 | $2,245.00 55 $1,450.00 [ $1,750.00 54-56 | $2,273.00 | $2,273.00 57 $2,260.00 NA 49-57
NEW BRAUNFELS $2,200.00 No Bid 57 $1,955.00 | $1,955.00 55 $1,450.00 [ $1,750.00 54-56 | $1,944.00 | $1,944.00 57 $2,100.00 NA 49-57
HOUSTON $3,250.00 No Bid 57 $2,775.00 | $2,775.00 55 $2,450.00 [ $2,750.00 54-56 | $3,078.00 | $3,078.00 57 $2,950.00 NA 49-57
DALLAS No Bid No Bid | No Bid| $3,645.00 | $3,645.00 55 $2,650.00 | $2,950.00 54-56 | $3,638.00 | $3,638.00 57 $3,750.00 NA 49-57
DEL RIO $2,100.00 No Bid 57 $1,838.00 [ $1,838.00 55 $1,450.00 [ $1,750.00 54-56 | $1,881.00 | $1,881.00 57 $1,950.00 NA 49-57
UVALDE $1,600.00 No Bid 57 $1,838.00 [ $1,838.00 55 $1,290.00 [ $1,650.00 54-56 | $1,828.00 | $1,828.00 57 * $1,650.00 NA 49-57
EL PASO No Bid No Bid | No Bid| $4,930.00 | $4,930.00 55 $3,500.00 $3,800.00 54-56 | $7,012.00 | $7,012.00 57 $4,900.00 NA 49-57
ALICE $1,500.00 No Bid 57 $1,838.00 [ $1,838.00 55 $1,290.00 [ $1,650.00 54-56 | $1,828.00 | $1,828.00 57 * $1,800.00 NA 49-57
HARINGEN $2,150.00 No Bid 57 $2,100.00 | $2,100.00 55 $1,450.00 [ $1,750.00 54-56 | $1,909.00 | $1,909.00 57 $1,900.00 NA 49-57
LA JOYA $1,650.00 No Bid 57 $2,010.00 | $2,010.00 55 $1,290.00 [ $1,650.00 54-56 | $1,828.00 | $1,828.00 57 * $1,650.00 NA 49-57
SINTON $1,850.00 No Bid 57 $1,925.00 | $1,925.00 55 $1,290.00 [ $1,650.00 54-56 | $1,828.00 | $1,828.00 57 * $1,800.00 NA 49-57
GREGORY PORTLAND $1,850.00 No Bid 57 $1,925.00 | $1,925.00 55 $1,290.00 [ $1,650.00 54-56 | $1,828.00 | $1,828.00 57 * $1,800.00 NA 49-57
ROMA $1,500.00 No Bid 57 $2,266.00 [ $2,266.00 55 $1,290.00 [ $1,650.00 54-56 | $1,828.00 | $1,828.00 57 * $1,650.00 NA 49-57
EDCOUCH ELSA $2,000.00 No Bid 57 $1,925.00 [ $1,925.00 55 $1,290.00 [ $1,650.00 54-56 | $1,828.00 | $1,828.00 57 * $1,820.00 NA 49-57




Section I. Day Trips

United Independent School District
Charter Bus Services
RFP 012-2013

Vendors OK Tours, L.L.C. Regent Coach Line Star Shuttle ,Inc. Tornado Tours, Inc. Zima Real Bus Line,LLC
DOT #/MC# 570178/277375 823332/365568 660715/309567 991034/418249 1764020/644733
Bus Fleet Regular Bus Handicap Bus 1 Regular Bus Handicap Bus 1 Regular Bus Handicap Bus 3 Regular Bus Handicap Bus 0 Regular Handicap Bus 1
14 19 34 2 Bus 11
Headquarters San Antonio, Tx San Antonio, Tx San Antonio, Tx San Antonio, Tx Houston, Tx
DESTINATION Regular Bus Hagtjjiscap gz?’t Regular Bus Handicap Bus g/i?f Regular Bus Hagiigap Cslz?’t Regular Bus Hagii;:ap (‘S:,(Aif:1>t R(Ie?;ﬁ:]uuslar Hagiigap Seat CAP.
SAN ANTONIO $1,895.00 | $2,395.00 56 $2,227.99 | $2,227.99 56 $2,452.17 | $2,452.17 | 48-56 | $1,500.00 NA 52-55 |$1,350.00 [ $1,850.00| 52-56
CORPUS CHRISTI $1,895.00 | $2,395.00 | 56 | $2,160.59 | $2,160.59 56 $2,410.91 | $2,410.91 [ 48-56 | $1,500.00 NA 52-55 |$1,350.00| $1,850.00 52-56
BROWNSVILLE $2,195.00 | $2,695.00 | 56 | $2,581.84 | $2,581.84 56 $2,859.60 | $2,859.60 [ 48-56 | $1,850.00 NA 52-55 |$1,700.00| $2,100.00 [ 52-56
MCALLEN $1,895.00 | $2,395.00 56 $2,147.11 | $2,147.11 56 $2,410.91 | $2,410.91 | 48-56 | $1,500.00 NA 52-55 |$1,350.00| $1,850.00| 52-56
KINGSVILLE $1,695.00 | $2,295.00 56 $1,965.13 | $1,965.13 56 $2,162.61 | $2,162.61 | 48-56 | $1,500.00 NA 52-55 |$1,350.00| $1,850.00| 52-56
EAGLE PASS $1,795.00 | $2,225.00 56 $2,012.31 | $2,012.31 56 $2,158.81 | $2,158.81 [ 48-56 | $1,500.00 NA 52-55 |$1,350.00 | $1,850.00| 52-56
AUSTIN $2,325.00 | $2,625.00 56 $2,757.08 | $2,757.08 56 $3,049.16 | $3,049.16 | 48-56 | $1,850.00 NA 52-55 |$1,750.00 | $1,850.00| 52-56
NEW BRAUNFELS $2,295.00 | $2,600.00 56 $2,436.93 | $2,436.93 56 $2,695.53 | $2,695.53 [ 48-56 | $1,500.00 NA 52-55 |$1,400.00 | $1,900.00| 52-56
HOUSTON $2,600.00 | $3,100.00 56 $3,532.18 | $3,532.18 56 $3,718.97 | $3,718.97 | 48-56 | $2,500.00 NA 52-55 |$2,300.00 [ $2,300.00| 52-56
DALLAS $3,395.00 | $3,795.00 | 56 | $4,068.01 | $4,068.01 56 $4,551.15 | $4,551.15 | 48-56 | $2,800.00 NA 52-55 |$2,500.00 | $2,500.00 [ 52-56
DEL RIO $1,895.00 | $2,495.00 | 56 | $2,379.64 | $2,379.64 56 $2,673.28 | $2,673.28 [ 48-56 | $1,750.00 NA 52-55 |$1,750.00| $2,250.00 52-56
UVALDE $1,825.00 | $2,325.00 56 $2,056.12 | $2,056.12 56 $2,208.24 | $2,208.24 | 48-56 | $1,500.00 NA 52-55 |$1,350.00| $1,850.00| 52-56
EL PASO $4,495.00 | $4,995.00 56 $5,257.62 | $5,257.62 56 $6,438.49 | $6,438.49 | 48-56 | $4,200.00 NA 52-55 |$3,400.00 | $3,400.00| 52-56
ALICE $1,825.00 | $2,395.00 56 $1,833.70 | $1,833.70 56 $1,957.28 | $1,957.28 | 48-56 | $1,500.00 NA 52-55 |$1,350.00 | $1,850.00| 52-56
HARINGEN $1,895.00 | $2,600.00 56 $2,409.97 | $2,409.97 56 $5,013.30 | $5,013.30 | 48-56 | $1,850.00 NA 52-55 |$1,450.00 | $1,950.00| 52-56
LA JOYA $1,895.00 | $2,600.00 56 $2,029.16 | $2,029.16 56 $2,177.82 | $2,177.82 | 48-56 | $1,500.00 NA 52-55 |$1,400.00 | $1,900.00| 52-56
SINTON $1,895.00 | $2,600.00 56 $2,187.55 | $2,187.55 56 $4,955.56 | $4,955.56 [ 48-56 | $1,500.00 NA 52-55 |$1,350.00 | $1,850.00| 52-56
GREGORY PORTLAND $1,895.00 | $2,600.00 56 $2,211.14 | $2,211.14 56 $2,412.74 | $2,412.74 | 48-56 | $1,500.00 NA 52-55 |$1,350.00 [ $1,850.00| 52-56
ROMA $1,725.00 | $1,925.00 56 $1,789.89 | $1,789.89 56 $1,907.04 | $1,907.04 | 48-56 | $1,350.00 NA 52-55 |$1,300.00 | $1,800.00| 52-56
EDCOUCH ELSA $1,895.00 | $2,600.00 56 $2,285.28 | $2,285.28 56 $2,624.12 | $2,624.12 | 48-56 | $1,500.00 NA 52-55 | $1,350.00 | $1,850.00| 52-56




Section Il. Overnight Trips

United Independent School District
Charter Bus Services
RFP 012-2013

Vendors Bill's Sparkling Charter Kerville Bus DBA/Coach USA & Megabus Cougar Bus Lines, LTD Daisy Charters & Shuttles Imperial Bus Company
DOT #/MC# 537119/268020 136534/27530 1127893/459987 397239/226521 1261610/492765
BUS FLEET Regul;ir Bus Handicap Bus 0 Reguil)’a;r Bus Handicap Bus 15 Regu:ILz:igr Bus Handicap Bus 2 Regulzzr Bus Handicap Bus 1 Regulgr Bus Handicap Bus 0
Headquarters Corpus Christi,Tx San Antonio, Tx Laredo, Tx San Antonio, Tx San Antonio, Tx

DESTINATION Regular Bus Hagiigap giit Regular Bus Hagﬂiscap Seat CAP. Regular BUS |\ hdicap Bus gﬁ?f Regular Bus Hagiig i gﬁ?f Regular Bus Hagiigap cff\?f
SAN ANTONIO $1,400.00 No Bid 57 $3,130.00 [ $3,130.00 55 $1,900.00 $2,200.00 54-56 | $3,028.00 | $3,028.00 57 ** $2,400.00 NA 49-57
CORPUS CHRISTI $1,400.00 No Bid 57 $3,130.00 [ $3,130.00 55 $1,900.00 $2,200.00 54-56 | $3,028.00 | $3,028.00 57 ** $2,400.00 NA 49-57
BROWNSVILLE $1,500.00 No Bid 57 $3,110.00 | $3,110.00 55 $2,000.00 $2,300.00 54-56 | $3,028.00 | $3,028.00 57 ** $2,600.00 NA 49-57
MCALLEN $1,400.00 No Bid 57 $3,130.00 | $3,130.00 55 $1,900.00 $2,200.00 54-56 | $3,028.00 | $3,028.00 57 ** $2,400.00 NA 49-57
KINGSVILLE $1,400.00 No Bid 57 $3,130.00 | $3,130.00 55 $1,900.00 $2,200.00 54-56 | $3,028.00 | $3,028.00 57 ** $2,400.00 NA 49-57
EAGLE PASS $1,400.00 No Bid 57 | $3,130.00 | $3,130.00 55 $1,900.00 [ $2,200.00 54-56 | $3,028.00 | $3,028.00 [ 57 * | $2,400.00 NA 49-57
AUSTIN $1,500.00 No Bid 57 | $3,130.00 | $3,130.00 55 $2,000.00 [ $2,300.00 54-56 | $3,028.00 | $3,028.00 [ 57 * | $2,700.00 NA 49-57
NEW BRAUNFELS $1,500.00 No Bid 57 $3,130.00 [ $3,130.00 55 $2,000.00 $2,300.00 54-56 | $3,028.00 | $3,028.00 57 ** $2,550.00 NA 49-57
HOUSTON $1,600.00 No Bid 57 $3,110.00 [ $3,110.00 55 $3,000.00 $3,300.00 54-56 | $3,078.00 | $3,078.00 57 $3,200.00 NA 49-57
DALLAS $1,600.00 No Bid 57 $3,790.00 [ $3,790.00 55 $3,200.00 $3,500.00 54-56 | $3,638.00 | $3,638.00 57 $3,750.00 NA 49-57
DEL RIO $1,500.00 No Bid 57 $3,130.00 | $3,130.00 55 $2,000.00 $2,300.00 54-56 | $3,028.00 | $3,028.00 57 ** $2,400.00 NA 49-57
UVALDE $1,400.00 No Bid 57 $3,130.00 | $3,130.00 55 $1,900.00 $2,200.00 54-56 | $3,028.00 | $3,028.00 57 ** $2,400.00 NA 49-57
EL PASO $1,600.00 No Bid 57 $5,050.00 | $5,050.00 55 $4,050.00 $4,350.00 54-56 | $7,012.00 | $7,012.00 57 $4,900.00 NA 49-57
ALICE $1,300.00 No Bid 57 | $3,130.00 | $3,130.00 55 $1,900.00 [ $2,200.00 54-56 | $3,028.00 | $3,028.00 [ 57 * | $2,400.00 NA 49-57
HARLINGEN $1,400.00 No Bid 57 | $3,130.00 | $3,130.00 55 $2,000.00 [ $2,300.00 54-56 | $3,028.00 | $3,028.00 [ 57 * | $2,400.00 NA 49-57
LA JOYA $1,300.00 No Bid 57 | $3,130.00 | $3,130.00 55 $1,900.00 [ $2,200.00 54-56 | $3,028.00 | $3,028.00 [ 57 * | $2,400.00 NA 49-57
SINTON $1,400.00 No Bid 57 $3,130.00 [ $3,130.00 55 $1,900.00 $2,200.00 54-56 | $3,028.00 | $3,028.00 57 ** $2,400.00 NA 49-57
GREGORY PORTLAND $1,400.00 No Bid 57 $3,130.00 [ $3,130.00 55 $1,900.00 $2,200.00 54-56 | $3,028.00 | $3,028.00 57 ** $2,400.00 NA 49-57
ROMA $1,300.00 No Bid 57 $3,130.00 | $3,130.00 55 $1,900.00 $2,200.00 54-56 | $3,028.00 | $3,028.00 57 ** $2,400.00 NA 49-57
EDCOUCH ELSA $1,400.00 No Bid 57 | $3,130.00 | $3,130.00 55 $1,900.00 [ $2,200.00 54-56 | $3,028.00 | $3,028.00 [ 57 ** | $2,400.00 NA 49-57

NOTES:

On Night trips-the charge is per

day.

* These trips are based on a 12-15 hrs,

shorter trips will reduce the price, call
for quote./**These trips are based on a
36-39 hours. Shorter trips will reduce
the cost.

Dallas and El Paso prices are
based on Two Day Trip.




Section Il. Overnight Trips

United Independent School District

Charter Bus Services
RFP 012-2013

Vendors OK Tours, L.L.C. Regent Coach Line Star Shuttle ,Inc. Tornado Tours, Inc. Zima Real Bus Line,LLC
DOT #/MC# 570178/277375 823332/365568 660715/309567 991034/418249 1764020/644733
BUS FLEET Regu:llir Bus Handicap Bus 1 Regullz;r Bus Handicap Bus 1 Reguzl;zr Bus Handicap Bus 3 Regul;ir Bus Handicap Bus 0 F;igsuﬁr Handicap Bus 1
Headquarters San Antonio, Tx San Antonio, Tx San Antonio, Tx San Antonio, Tx Houston, Tx

DESTINATION Regular Bus Hagiigap gf\?t Regular BUS | 1. dicap Bus cszi‘;t Regular Bus Hagiigap gﬁ? Regular Bus Hagiigap gﬁ? Reé;guuslar Hagiiscap Seat CAP.
SAN ANTONIO $2,295.00 | $2,895.00 56 $2,383.00 [ $2,383.00 56 $2,452.17 | $2,452.17 | 48-56 | $2,000.00 NA 52-55 |$1,850.00 | $2,000.00| 52-56
CORPUS CHRISTI $2,295.00 | $2,895.00 56 $2,383.00 [ $2,383.00 56 $2,410.91 | $2,410.91 | 48-56 | $2,000.00 NA 52-55 |$1,850.00 | $2,000.00| 52-56
BROWNSVILLE $2,725.00 | $3,100.00 56 $2,581.84 | $2,581.84 56 $2,859.60 [ $2,859.60 [ 48-56 | $2,000.00 NA 52-55 |$2,000.00 | $2,000.00| 52-56
MCALLEN $2,725.00 | $3,100.00 56 $2,383.00 [ $2,383.00 56 $2,410.91 | $2,410.91 | 48-56 | $2,000.00 NA 52-55 |$1,850.00 | $2,000.00| 52-56
KINGSVILLE $2,325.00 | $2,795.00 56 $2,383.00 | $2,383.00 56 $2,162.61 | $2,162.61 | 48-56 | $2,000.00 NA 52-55 |$1,850.00 [ $2,000.00| 52-56
EAGLE PASS $2,325.00 | $2,795.00 | 56 | $2,383.00 | $2,383.00 56 $2,158.81 | $2,158.81 [ 48-56 | $2,000.00 NA 52-55 |$1,850.00| $2,000.00 [ 52-56
AUSTIN $2,725.00 | $2,875.00 | 56 | $2,757.08 | $2,757.08 56 $3,049.16 | $3,049.16 [ 48-56 | $2,350.00 NA 52-55 |$2,000.00| $2,000.00 [ 52-56
NEW BRAUNFELS $2,795.00 | $2,875.00 56 $2,436.93 | $2,436.93 56 $2,695.53 | $2,695.53 [ 48-56 | $2,000.00 NA 52-55 |$1,900.00 | $2,000.00| 52-56
HOUSTON $3,300.00 | $3,695.00 56 $3,532.18 | $3,532.18 56 $3,718.97 | $3,718.97 | 48-56 | $3,000.00 NA 52-55 |$2,800.00 | $2,800.00| 52-56
DALLAS $3,825.00 | $4,100.00 56 $4,068.01 | $4,068.01 56 $4,551.15 | $4,551.15 [ 48-56 | $3,300.00 NA 52-55 |$3,100.00 | $3,100.00| 52-56
DEL RIO $2,625.00 | $2,795.00 56 $2,383.00 [ $2,383.00 56 $2,673.28 | $2,673.28 | 48-56 | $2,000.00 NA 52-55 |$2,000.00 | $2,000.00| 52-56
UVALDE $2,325.00 | $2,525.00 56 $2,383.00 [ $2,383.00 56 $2,208.24 | $2,208.24 | 48-56 | $2,000.00 NA 52-55 |$1,850.00 | $1,850.00| 52-56
EL PASO $4,925.00 | $5,200.00 56 $5,257.62 | $5,257.62 56 $6,438.49 | $6,438.49 | 48-56 | $4,600.00 NA 52-55 | $4,500.00 [ $4,500.00| 52-56
ALICE $2,725.00 | $2,950.00 | 56 | $2,383.00 | $2,383.00 56 $1,957.28 | $1,957.28 [ 48-56 | $2,000.00 NA 52-55 |$1,850.00| $1,850.00 52-56
HARLINGEN $2,900.00 | $2,950.00 | 56 | $2,409.97 | $2,409.97 56 $5,013.30 | $5,013.30 [ 48-56 | $2,000.00 NA 52-55 |$2,000.00| $2,000.00 [ 52-56
LA JOYA $2,695.00 | $2,950.00 | 56 | $2,383.00 | $2,383.00 56 $2,177.82 | $2,177.82 | 48-56 | $2,000.00 NA 52-55 |$2,000.00| $2,000.00 [ 52-56
SINTON $2,725.00 | $2,950.00 56 $2,383.00 [ $2,383.00 56 $4,955.56 [ $4,955.56 [ 48-56 | $2,000.00 NA 52-55 |$1,850.00| $1,850.00| 52-56
GREGORY PORTLAND $2,795.00 | $2,950.00 56 $2,383.00 [ $2,383.00 56 $2,412.74 | $2,412.74 | 48-56 | $2,000.00 NA 52-55 |$1,850.00| $1,850.00| 52-56
ROMA $2,625.00 | $2,925.00 56 $2,383.00 [ $2,383.00 56 $1,907.04 [ $1,907.04 | 48-56 | $1,850.00 NA 52-55 |$1,850.00 | $1,850.00| 52-56
EDCOUCH ELSA $2,795.00 | $3,200.00 [ 56 | $2,383.00 | $2,383.00 56 $2,624.12 | $2,624.12 | 48-56 | $2,000.00 NA 52-55 | $1,850.00| $1,850.00 [ 52-56

NOTES:

The overnight prices are quoted on 48
hours. If using more than 48 hours the

price will increase.

The seating capacity is 48 with two
wheelchair positions or 52 with one
wheelchair position or 56 with no
wheelchair position. Please note the
passenger seating capacity is included
on our listing of motor coaches.




