Section I. Catalog Discount

Vendor

United Independent School District
Police Officer Uniforms, Equipment, and Supplies
RFP 2012-072

Discount on any item not listed below or catalog item

Al & Rob Sales

0%

Amistad Army Store

Code Blue Police Suppl

ly Galls, LLC

GT Distributors, Inc.

NovaStar/ DBA: Zenitram
Communications, Inc.

0%

0%

15%/Except Lighting
Equipment

8%

10%

Vendor

Section Il. Police Officer Uniforms and Safety Boots

Al & Rob Sales

Brand & Model

Amistad Army Store

Code Blue Police Supply

Galls, LLC

GT Distributors, Inc.

NovaStar/ DBA: Zenitram
Communications, Inc.

Item

Est. Qty.

Proposed (if
other than
specified)

Unit Price

Unit Price

specified)

Brand & Model
Proposed (if
other than

Unit Price
other than

specified)

Brand & Model
Proposed (if

Unit Price

specified)

Brand & Model
Proposed (if
other than

Proposed (if
other than
specified)

Unit Price

Brand & Model

Brand & Model
Proposed (if
other than
specified)

Unit Price

'WOMEN’S POLICE OFFICER UNIFORM LONG SLEEVE SHIRT
with:

5-5 % oz polyester material; Nano-Tex moisture-wicking
Coolest Comfort technology for permanent moisture
management
Built-in sunscreen, up to UV 40+ ; Long sleeves with nanded
collar and permanent collar stavs
Permanent military creases; Sewn badges tabs with inner
support strap
Large fully lined, pleated pockets with scalloped flaps and
hook and loop closures
Machine wash and dry; light blue ; Sizes 32-48

Reference:
Gall's SR748 Women'’s Elbeco Long Sleeve Tex Trop
All shirts must include Patch:
Measures 2 %” high
Reference: Gall's UA155 (flag)
Department Patch Must Be Included:
(Police Dept. Patch) see attached sample
WOMEN’S POLICE OFFICER UNIFORM SHORT SLEEVE SHIRT

20

No Bid

No Bid

Style 9313;p
$a200 | V€ ©

specs ELBECO

r

$30.00 SR748

ELBECO
#9313LC

$32.08

No Bid

with:
100% Polyester is fade and shrink resistant
Nano-Tex moisture-wicking Coolest Comfort technology for
permanent moisture management
Built-in sunscreen, up to UV 40+ ; Short Sleeves with a
convertible collar
Permanent military creases ; Sewn badge tabs with inner
support straps
Large fully lined, pleated pockets with scalloped flaps and
hook and loop closures
Machine wash and dry ; light blue; Size: 30-48
Reference: Gall’s SR749 Women'’s Elbeco Short Sleeve Tex
Tron
All shirts must include Patch:
Measures 2 %” high
Reference: Gall's UA155 (flag)
Department Patch Must Be Included:

(Police Dept. Patch) see attached sample

20

No Bid

No Bid

$37.90 | ELBECO 9813

$26.00 SR749

ELBECO#9813L
C

$31.18

No Bid




United Independent School District
Police Officer Uniforms, Equipment, and Supplies

RFP 2012-072

NovaStar/ DBA: Zenit
Vendor Al & Rob Sales Amistad Army Store Code Blue Police Supply Galls, LLC GT Distributors, Inc. ovastar/ L enttram
Communications, Inc.
Brand & Model Brand & Model Brand & Model Brand & Model Brand & Model Brand & Model
Pi d (if Pi d (if Pi d (if Pi d (if Pi d (if Pi d (if
Item Est. Qty. | Unit Price roposed (i Unit Price roposed (i Unit Price roposed (i Unit Price roposed (i Unit Price roposed (i Unit Price roposed (i
other than other than other than other than other than other than
specified) specified) specified) specified) specified) specified)
WOMEN’S POLICE OFFICER UNIFORM GABARDINE
TROUSERS with:
6-1/2 to 7 oz Gabardine polyester; Creaset permanent
creases; Fade and shrink resistant; Extra-deep quarter top
front nockets
Side waist elastic panels for personal fit; Stretch fabric for
comfort and mobility ELBECO
Bar tacked at stress points for superior durability #E9314LC,
Exclus;ve trlp?le-stl.tdjed crobtch to prevent blowoutf 20 No Bid No Bid $39.05 ELBECO E9314 $31.00 TR596 $34.57 Size 4-18, No Bid
Shortened front rise eliminates baggy appearance ; Design by $38.03 Size 20-24,
women for women
Curved at hip and straight leg design complements a
woman'’s shape
Machine wash and dry; Navy blue; 1/2 Stripe in light blue
Sizes: 4-26; Inseam: 30-34
Reference: Elebeco TR596 Women’s Tex-Trop Polyester
Gabardine Trousers
WOMEN’S TACTICAL PANTS WITH:
6.14 oz ripstop 65% polyester/35% cotton fabric
Treated with Teflon for Stain, Liquid and soil resistance; Fade
and shrink resistant Propper 5.11 #64360,
Diamond guest has been added to crotch for outstanding 20 No Bid No Bid $35.95 PP No Bid $37.08 | Only available No Bid
durabilitv and felxibility F524950 up to size 20
Welded pocket added to right side, parallel to magazine
pocket
Colors - Black, Dark Navy, TDU Greene, TDU Khaki; Sizes: 4-26
and Inseam: 30-34
MEN’S POLICE OFFICER UNIFORM LONG SLEEVE SHIRT with:
Long sleeve zipper-front polyester shirt, fused banded collar,
extra long tails
Cotton blend inner yoke and collar band, stitched in military ELBECO #313
creases, fully lined placket fronts W/ZIPPER , *
Machine wash and dry; Light blue $32.08%, |siZE141/2-17
izes: 14 % - 22: . 32-
Sizes: 14 % - 22; Sleeve length: 32-38 100 No Bid No Bid $41.90 | ELBECOZ313 | $30.79 SW531  [$38.49%* 8| 1/2, **SIZE 18- No Bid
Reference: Gall's SH531 Elbeco Tex-Trop Zipper Front Long 44.91%%* 20 & 38"
Sleeve Polvester Shirt SLEEVE, ***
All shirts must include Patch: SIZE 22
Measures 2 %" high
Reference: Gall's UA155 (flag)
Department Patch Must Be Included:
(Police Dept. Patch) see attached sample
MEN’S POLICE OFFICER UNIFORM SHORT SLEEVE SHIRT with:
Short sleeve zipper-front polyester shirt, convertible collar,
extra long tails
Cotton blend inner yoke and collar band, stitched in military ELBECO
creases, fully lined placket fronts #23313, *SIZE
Machine wash and dry, Light blue; Sizes: 14 1/2 - 22 $31.18%, 141/2-171/2
Reference: Gall’s SH532 Elbeco Tex-Trop Zipper Front Short 170 No Bid No Bid $37.95 ELBECO 23313 $27.00 SH532 $37.41%, **G|ZE 18-208’( No Bid
Sleeve Polvester Shirt $43.65%** 38" SLEEVE
All shirts must include Patch: *xxgIZE 22'
Measures 2 %” high
Reference: Gall's UA155 (flag)
Department Patch Must Be Included:
(Police Dept. Patch) see attached sample




United Independent School District
Police Officer Uniforms, Equipment, and Supplies
RFP 2012-072

Vendor

Al & Rob Sales

Amistad Army Store Code Blue Police Supply

Galls, LLC

GT Distributors, Inc.

NovaStar/ DBA: Zenitram
Communications, Inc.

Item

MEN’S POLICE OFFICER UNIFORM GABARDINE TROUSERS

Est. Qty.

Unit Price

Brand & Model

Proposed (if
other than
specified)

Brand & Model

Proposed (if
other than
specified)

Brand & Model

Proposed (if
other than
specified)

Unit Price Unit Price

Proposed (if
other than
specified)

Unit Price

Brand & Model

Brand & Model

Proposed (if
other than
specified)

Unit Price

Brand & Model

Proposed (if
other than
specified)

Unit Price

with:
Extra deep, quarter top pockets, 1" belt loops, Comfort
stretch waistband
French fly for additional support, double pile, cotton-blended
crotch lining for added comfort
Bar-tacked at stress points for superior durability, Machine
wash and drv
Navy blue; 1/2 " stripe in light blue
Sizes: 28-54 ; Inseam: 30-36
Reference:
Gall's TR165 Elbeco Men's Tex-Trop Polyester Gabardine
Trousers

170

No Bid

No Bid $38.90 ELBECO E314

$31.00 TR165

ELBECO #E314
W/STRIPE,
*SIZE 28-42,
*SIZE 44-50,
***52-54

$34.57%,
$38.03**,
$41.48***

No Bid

MEN’S TACTICAL PANT WITH:

6.14 oz ripstop 65% polyester/35% cotton fabric or classic fit

Treated with Teflon finish for stain, liquid and soil resistance,
Fade and shrink resistant
Diamond guest has been added to crotch for outstanding
durability and felxibility, Self adjusting tunnel waistband for
comfort
Welded pocket added to right side, parallel to magazine
pocket
Badge holder front belt loops; Quick access, low profile
patent pending pockets
Genuine YKK sippers and Prym snaps

Discrete double knee with interior knee pad pocket
Colors: All; Sizes: 28-44; Inseam: 30-36
Reference: 5.11 Tactical Flex-Tac

30

No Bid

$  67.50| Style #74369 $67.00

$55.00 TR909

$52.81 5.11 #74369

No Bid

MEN’S TACTICAL PANT - Traditional jean fit:
Fitted waistband (non-elastic); 9 pockets, including internal
magazine Pockets

Genuine YKK zippers, Prym snaps; Teflon treated for soil and

stain resistance

Sizes: 28-44 evens, 33-36 evens and odds, and 38 — 44 evens;
Inseam: 30-36

Colors: Charcoal, Khaki, TDU Green, Dark Navy

20

Reference: 5.11 Tactical Traditional Jean Fit

No Bid

$49.99 Style#74385 [ $  49.95( 5.11#74385

$40.00 TR910

$37.08 5.11#74251

No Bid




United Independent School District

Police Officer Uniforms, Equipment, and Supplies

RFP 2012-072

NovaStar/ DBA: Zenit
Vendor Al & Rob Sales Amistad Army Store Code Blue Police Supply Galls, LLC GT Distributors, Inc. ovastar/ L enttram
Communications, Inc.
Brand & Model Brand & Model Brand & Model Brand & Model Brand & Model Brand & Model
Pi d (if Pi d (if Pi d (if Pi d (if Pi d (if Pi d (if
Item Est. Qty. | Unit Price roposed (i Unit Price roposed (i Unit Price roposed (i Unit Price roposed (i Unit Price roposed (i Unit Price roposed (i
other than other than other than other than other than other than
specified) specified) specified) specified) specified) specified)
MEN’S TACTICAL PANT — Taclite Pro Pant
Tough, lightweight, breathable, Teflon treated for soil and
stain resistance
Trademarked rear strap and slash pockets , Double-reinforced
seat and knees
Quick-access multipurpose pocket , Fade and wrinkle . .
resistant 20 No Bid $46.99 Style#74273 $49.25 5.11, #74273 $36.00 TR506 $37.08 5.11 #74273 No Bid
Genuine YKK zippers, Prym Snaps
Sizes: 28-44 ; Inseams: 30-36
Colors: Black, Stone, Coyote, TDU Green, Tundra, TDU Khaki,
Dark Navv. Charcoal
Reference: 5.11 Taclite Pro Pant
Men’s — Taclite Pro Shirt
Hidden Buttons Down Collar, 5.11's Patented hidden
document pockets, Long sleeve has adiustable cuffs
Teflon treated for soil and stain resistance 511
Short Sleeve, Sizes: Small-3XL .
! $37.08*, | #71175;72175,
. i i 20 No Bid 49.99 Style#71175 49.25 5.11, #71175 42.00 SR571 No Bid
Colors: White, Black, TDU Green, TDU Khaki, Dark Navy, 0 BI $ yle $ S $40.45** *SIZE S-2XL, o Bi
 Charcoal * *XSIZE 3XL
Long Sleeve Taclite Pro Shirt, Sizes: Small - 3XL
Colors: White, Black, TDU Green, TDU Khaki, Dark Navy,
Charcoal
Reference: 5.11 Taclite Pro Pant
Men’s - Taclite Pro Shirt *SIZE S-3XL,
Tall Short Sleeve; Sizes: Small - 3XL ; Colors: Black, TDU Khaki, **SIZE LG-5XL,
Dark Navy ' $37.08*, | 5.11 #71175T, ,
20 No Bid 52.99 Style#71175T 49.25 5.11, #71152 36.00 SR570 No Bid
Tall Long Sleeve Pro Shirt; Sizes: Large - 5 XL; Colors:Black, $ v s $ $40.45** | 472175T, TALLS
TDU Khaki,Dark navy only available in
Reference: 5.11 Taclite Pro Pant LG-5XL
Men’s — 5.11 Tactical Shirt
Hidden Buttons Down Collar, 5.11's Patented hidden
document pockets ) SH207 for Short 5.11 #71001,
Long Sleeve has adjustable cuffs and Sleeve keepers Short 5.11, on either sleeve and #72002, *SIZE S
- Sizes: X- - tyle # 37.08*, |2XL REG, **SIZE .
Sleeve; Sizes: X-small - 3XL 20 No Bid $49.99 | Style#71152 | $49.95 style $40.00 | SH209 for Long | ° No Bid
Colors: Black, Grey, Khaki, OD Green,Sage, Fire Navy, Coyote, 71152(S/S) or $40.45** | 3XL-4XL REG,
sleeve/same
Tundra 72157 (L/L) . h ***S|ZE L-5XL
Long Sleeve,Sizes: X-Small - 3XL, Colors: Black, Grey, Khaki,OD price eac| TALL
Gree, Sage, Fire Navv, Covote, Tundra
Reference: 5.11 Tactical Shirt
'WOMEN TACLITE PRO PANT
Sizes: 2-20; Inseam: 30-32
6 No Bid $49.99 Style#64360 $49.25 5.11, #64360 $36.00 TR642 $37.08 5.11 #64630 No Bid
Color: Black, TDU Khaki, TDU Green, Dark Navy and Charcoal
Reference: 5.11 Taclite Pro Pants
Womens 5.11 Taclite Pro Long Sleeve Shirt and Short Sleeve
2 Pocket with Badge Strip 5.11 #62070,
] ; Sizes: S-XL; 3 NOT AVAILABLE
Long Sleeve; Short Sleeve; Sizes: S-XL; Colors: Black, TDU 6 No Bid $49.99 | Style#62070 | $49.25 | s5.11,#62070 | $36.00 | Sm932/s | $37.08 No Bid
Khaki, Dark Navv IN SHORT
Short Sleeve; Sizes: 2-20; Colors: Khaki, Black, OD Green, Fire SLEEVE
Navv
Reference: 5.11 TacLite Pro Shirt




United Independent School District
Police Officer Uniforms, Equipment, and Supplies

RFP 2012-072

NovaStar/ DBA: Zenitram

Vendor Al & Rob Sales Amistad Army Store Code Blue Police Supply Galls, LLC GT Distributors, Inc. L
Communications, Inc.
Brand & Model Brand & Model Brand & Model Brand & Model Brand & Model Brand & Model
L Proposed (if L Proposed (if L Proposed (if L Proposed (if L Proposed (if L Proposed (if
Item Est. Qty. | Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price
other than other than other than other than other than other than
specified) specified) specified) specified) specified) specified)
[ALL SEASON JACKET
Zippered side vent with snap closure allows for easy access to
vour duty rig
® b i i L -
. Tazlar\d nylon shfel}:wnh leblnIThlnsulate liner ) GERBER
Zippered side vents with snap-tab closures; Cargo pockets ) ) OUTERWEAR )
with snaps 10 No Bid No Bid $95.00 | ELBECO3800 | $79.00 JA102 $82.67 No Bid
. Lo . #71N1 NAVY,
Under-the-arm zippers for ventilation; Knit cuffs and
waistband: Hidden inside pocket H7IN3 BLACK
Shoulder epaulets and badge tab
Sizes: S-3X; Length: Regular or Long
Reference: Gall’s JA102 All Season Jacket
TACTICAL WATERPROOF PRECINT JACKET
Double-welt center front with internal storm flap gives added
Twor :rhote;tion liuztains.tﬁl;a\i/n Iand@wfilnd | 5.11 #48103,
wo front hand pockets with Velcro® flap closures s151.60° *S1ZE XL-2XL
Lower back pocket ; Zipper sleeve pocket; BBS chest pockets 5 No Bid No Bid $115.00 | ELBECO 39404 No Bid $157 '30*; REG/LONG, No Bid
e L ' **SIZE 3XL-4XL
Bi-swing shoulder for more range of movement ; Functioning
REG/LONG
epaulets
Sizes: S-3X; Color: Black and Navy Blue
Reference: 5.11Tactical Jacket or Gall’s JA486
REVERSIBLE WINDBREAKER (reversible Lime Green to Black) $94.97+
Sizes: S-XL; 1XL - 4XL 45 No Bid No Bid $115.00 | ELBECO 39400 No Bid $99.97++ 5.11 #48095 No Bid
Reference: First Class
TACTICAL QUARTER BOOT
Haste Patrol Boot Black ; Sizes: 4-15; Width: Medium, Wide 45 No Bid No Bid $116.00 5.11, #11008 $86.00 SP839 $89.77 No Bid
Reference: 5.11 HASTE QUARTER BOOT
ZIPPER BOOT —TACTICAL BOOT — QUARTER BOOT
Leather/Nylon Upper; Non-metallic with composite shank
Moisture wicking and antibacterial treatment; Compression
molded sole
M-Pact contoured sockliner with memory foam a5 No Bid No Bid $135.00 | UnderAmo4R | $81.00 | SP931Fwo0s | $87.88 No Bid
YKK side circular zipper with nylon tab cover; easy on/off
Colors: Black; Men's Sizes: 8-14 in med and wide widths;
Women's Sizes: 5-11 in med and wide widths
Reference: Bates IP-SP931 Mens; Bates IP-FW005 Women'’s




United Independent School District
Police Officer Uniforms, Equipment, and Supplies

RFP 2012-072

NovaStar/ DBA: Zenit
Vendor Al & Rob Sales Amistad Army Store Code Blue Police Supply Galls, LLC GT Distributors, Inc. ovastar/ L enitram
Communications, Inc.
Brand & Model Brand & Model Brand & Model Brand & Model Brand & Model Brand & Model
L Proposed (if L Proposed (if L Proposed (if L Proposed (if L Proposed (if L Proposed (if
Item Est. Qty. | Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price
other than other than other than other than other than other than
specified) specified) specified) specified) specified) specified)
ZIPPER BOOT —~TACTICAL BOOT — QUARTER BOOT - 6” zipper
boot
Bates Individual Comfort System; Leather/ballistic nylon
upper
Fiberglass Shank; slip and oil resistant rubber outsole; non-
metallic
Tread design provides natural walking motion
Multi-directional lugs provides maximum grip and stability 45 No Bid No Bid No Bid $77.00 SP930 $87.88 No Bid
YKK side zipper with textured rubber tab cover; easy on/off
Color: Black Men’s Sizes: 8-14 in med and wide widths
Women's Sizes: 5-11 in med and wide widths
Reference: Bates Individual Comfort System
POLICE CAPS N " i
, o ) 115 No Bid No Bid $9.95 OK Hat $9.00 HW425 $8.08 HERO'S PRIDE No Bid
Must be embroidered to say Police (in Gold or Silver)
Section Ill. Police Accessories
48” PVC VYNIL RAINCOAT WITH CHOICE OF TITLE (I.E. Neese Ind.
CROSSING GUARD. SECURITY. POLICE OFFICER. ETC.) 60 $39.95 Green Grey No Bid $20.00 Neese $12.00 RW032 No Bid No Bid
Reference: Gall's RW032 Reflective
NICKEL FINISHED HANDCUFFS
Reference: Gall’s RS021 Smith & Wesson Nickel Finished 55 No Bid No Bid $26.00 S&W $21.00 RS021 $20.36 Peerless 700 No Bid
Handcuffs
TRAFFIC MESH BLUE VEST “POLICE”
SIZES: Small and Large Sizes 30 No Bid No Bid $30.00 OK-1 $23.00 HS190 No Bid No Bid
Reference: Gall's H5190
TRAFFIC REFLECTIVE SECURITY VEST “SECURITY”
SIZES: Small and Large Sizes 30 No Bid No Bid $30.00 OK-1 $12.00 HS235 No Bid No Bid
Reference: Gall's H5235
~BODY ARMOR
Reference: ABA Xtreme XT 02 IIA Galls Variabl ABAXTO2
alls Variable - : .
Armor Advantage Program 30 No Bid No Bid No Bid CallOn Cos $697.50 LEVEL A No Bid
Ballistic Package, 2 Apex Carriers
2 Strap Kits, and Soft Trauma Insert
[ADJUSTABLE BLACK BELT WITH VELCRO INSIDE — SAM
BROWN 30 No Bid No Bid No Bid $9.00 NP251 $15.13 BIANCHI 8100 No Bid
Reference: Gall’s NP251
POLICE DUTY HOLSTER
Black Hawk Level IIl Serpa Duty Holsters 10 No Bid No Bid $105.00 Per Spec $84.00 LP568 $59.26 No Bid
Reference: Gall's LP568
HIGH RIDE BELT LOOP
10 No Bid No Bid No Bid $12.00 ZA1452 No Bid No Bid
Reference: Gall's ZA1452
~POLICE DUTY RIGS
Reference: Bianchi Accumold — IP-NP364 or Safariland IP- 7 No Bid No Bid $57.95 | BIANCHI #7960 | $50.00 NP364 $16.95 BIANCHI 7912 No Bid
LPOTO
~DOUBLE MAGAZINE . . .
. . 7 No Bid No Bid $35.70 BIANCHI# 7902 $26.00 NP352 $26.43 BIANCHI 7902 No Bid
Reference: Bianchi Accumold IP-NP352
HAND CUFF CASE i i ]
. , 7 No Bid No Bid $29.45 | BIANCHI #7900 | $19.00 NP351 $19.24 No Bid
Reference: Bianchi Accumold IP-NP351




United Independent School District
Police Officer Uniforms, Equipment, and Supplies
RFP 2012-072

NovaStar/ DBA: Zenitram

Vendor Al & Rob Sales Amistad Army Store Code Blue Police Supply Galls, LLC GT Distributors, Inc. L
Communications, Inc.
Brand & Model Brand & Model Brand & Model Brand & Model Brand & Model Brand & Model
Item Est. Qty. | Unit Price Proposed (if Unit Price Proposed (if Unit Price Proposed (if Unit Price Proposed (if Unit Price Proposed (if Unit Price Proposed (if
other than other than other than other than other than other than
specified) specified) specified) specified) specified) specified)
[ADJUSTABLE RADIO HOLDER
7 No Bid No Bid $36.50 | BIANCHI7923 | $27.00 NP445 $27.12 No Bid
Reference: Galls NP445
FOUR SNAPS BELTS KEEPER 11/8
] A/ 7 No Bid No Bid $10.95 BIANCHI 7906 $10.00 NP354 $8.57 No Bid
Reference: Bianchi Accumold IP-NP354
UNDER BELT
7 No Bid No Bid No Bid $16.00 LP157 $16.89 | BIANCHI 7205 No Bid
Reference: Galls Brand
HEAVY DUTY LEATHER GLOVES DAMASCUS
60 No Bid No Bid No Bid $24.00 GL214 $20.46 No Bid
Reference: Gall’s GL214 DFK300
VEHICLE FIRST AID KIT WITH NYLON POUCH
60 No Bid No Bid No Bid $11.00 EM118 No Bid No Bid
Reference: Gall's EM118
STREAMLIGHT C4 LED St light
i 10 No Bid $125 | Style#76813 | $116.00 reamig $100.00 FL622 $91.00 No Bid
Reference: Streamlight C4 LED IP-FL622 AC/DC 75713
STREAMLIGHT HOLDER (BW/|
(BW) 10 No Bid No Bid $13.00 | Bianchi #7926 | $10.00 NP362 $9.74 No Bid

Reference: NP-362 Galls

ONE LINE PROFESSIONAL NAME PLATE
Pin back, Clutch back, Magnetic back, V.H. Blackington
Polished or brushed finish, Silver plate with blue letters, Gold 60 $10.95 Blackington No Bid $12.00 o 12 $5.00 NTO17 $7.80 [ BLACKINTON J1 No Bid

plate with blue letters
Reference: Gall's NTO17

POLICE BADGES

V.H. Blackington BLACKINTON
Police Badges Rhodium Block Letters - Blue);Karat Klad Badge 10 No Bid No Bid $118.00 #B1794g $112.00 BC138 $114.93 81794 No Bid

Reference: Blackinton B1794;31/2x21/2

Section IV. Police Equipment

PARTITIONS-EXPANDED METAL
Aluminum construction; 1 1/2" x 5/4: screen openings
Must fit 2013 Ford Taurus Police Interceptor; 1-year 10 No Bid No Bid No Bid $390.00 $5021 $529.49 $790.00 Setina

warranty
Reference: Gall's S5021

9-K CANINE PARTITION
Expanded metal ventilation to help the canine keep cool

1/4” thick with 12 %4” X 27” opening; Must fit Ford Crown
Victoria Police Interceptor; Must fit Chevrolet Impala Police
Package
From year model 2002 and up, 1-year warranty
Reference: Gall’s SS078

5 No Bid No Bid No Bid $499.00 $5078 $608.43 $910.00 Setina

CITATION HOLDER
Hinged plate conceals forms and prevents write-trough;Top

opening
3/4” storage compartment with adjustable plastic divider RTS Somar ' saunders SAUNDERS
high capacity clip with swivel license holder; Velcro 10 $24.95 Aluminum No Bid $ 2699 #12205 $13.00 Cpo07 $17.48 12205 $39.00 Galls
wraparound strip secures entire unit
Rounded edges; Heavy-duty aluminum construction; 11 1/5"
Hx61/2"Wx21/4"D
Reference: Gall's CP007
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Est. Qty.

Brand & Model
Proposed (if
other than
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Brand & Model
Proposed (if
other than
specified)

Unit Price

Brand & Model
Proposed (if
other than
specified)
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Brand & Model
Proposed (if
other than
specified)

Unit Price

Brand & Model
Proposed (if
other than
specified)

Unit Price

Brand & Model
Proposed (if
other than
specified)

Unit Price

100 WATT SIREN WITH TAP Il
Wail, yelp, and Hi-Lo tones; Airhorn; Tap ll-horn activated
functions
llluminated control panel; PA/radio rebroadcast;Siren
override provides instant PA use
Wired in noise cancelling microphone; Push to talk mic
override;Manual siren
Wiring harness and bracket included;Measures 2 1/2 "H x 6
1/2" W x 8 1/2"D; 5-vear warranty
Reference: Gall's SK023

10

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

$229.00 SK023

$298.30

$398.00 | Fed Signal Galls

9-FUNCTION SWITCH CONTROL CENTER — Whelen
Directly interfaces with Whelen Edge® series.
Small diameter, 22 gauge, output wires reduce cable size to
switch remote relavs (not included)
4-position, 3-level slide switch with different LED indicators
for three separate, primary warning light controls

6 push button switches for secondary lightbar functions

Backlighted legend windows switch from green to red
Reference: Gall's SE009

10

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

$139.00 SE009

$157.85

$269.00 Whelen

FULL FUNCTION SIREN
Wail, yelp, air horn, thunder, manual and two-tone sounds;
Meet class A sound requirements

Automatic short circuit protection against speaker shorts
High/low voltage shutdown protection; LED backlighting

Positive and negative switching for AUX and PKILL inputs

Rotary knob selection; Public address, radio repeat, hands
free
2"H x5 % “W x 6 % “D; 7-year warranty
Reference: Gall’s SK124

10

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

$129.00 SK124

WHELEN

$204.60 29551100

$239.00 Galls

CAR CONSOLE — makes installing electronics easy
Installs in the front seat or into the transmission hump and
fits up to five electronic units. Must fit 2013 Ford Taurus,

Crown Victoria
Reference: Gall’'s VE381

10

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

$375.00 VE381

No Bid

No Bid

100 WATT SIGNAL SPEAKER
Reference: Gall's SK179

10

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

$164.00 SK179

$218.40

$275.00 Galls

LED MINI BAR
Extruded aluminum chassis for strength and stability
Flash patterns are selectable via internal jumpers;raws 2
amps
Comes standard with an 8 cord and cigar plug for quick and
easy installation, includes magnetic mount
Must meet SAE requirements; 5-year warranty; 2.5" HY x
22"Wx12"D
Reference: Gall's LBOO4

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

$569.00 LB497

WHELEN

$724.35 LT2AAAAM

$890.00 Galls

LIGHTBAR WITH TRAFFIC ADVISOR
LED modules with two wire control; Pre-wired with 15'
passenger side cable exit
Draws 5-7 amps; 2 1/2 "Hx 48 1/2" W x 12" D

Reference: Gall's LBOO8 RB

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

$1,527.00 LB595

No Bid

No Bid




United Independent School District
Police Officer Uniforms, Equipment, and Supplies

RFP 2012-072

NovaStar/ DBA: Zenit
Vendor Al & Rob Sales Amistad Army Store Code Blue Police Supply Galls, LLC GT Distributors, Inc. ovastar/ L enttram
Communications, Inc.
Brand & Model Brand & Model Brand & Model Brand & Model Brand & Model Brand & Model
Item Est. Qty. | Unit Price Proposed (if Unit Price Proposed (if Unit Price Proposed (if Unit Price Proposed (if Unit Price Proposed (if Unit Price Proposed (if
other than other than other than other than other than other than
specified) specified) specified) specified) specified) specified)
90 WATT HIDE-A-WAY STROBE SYSTEM WHELEN
10 No Bid No Bid No Bid $289.00 GR225 $237.60 $419.00 Galls
Reference: Gall's GR225 $690CCCC
FLASHER FOR VEHICLES WITH LIGHT CONTROL MODULE
Two flash patterns; 5-year warranty; 2"W x 2"D x 4" L 10 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Reference: Gall's FS008
SIX HEAD LED DECK MASTER
Six heads gf LED lights that fit around the third brake light of 10 No Bid No Bid No Bid $238.00 GR241 No Bid $498.00 Galls GR241, D
any vehicle, must meet SAE standards; 5-year warranty L16-6CV
Reference: Gall's GR241
FORD CROWN VICTORIA POLICE HEADLIGHT PACKAGE
”No holes drilled” installation; Three flash pattern; 5-year 10 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
warrantv
Reference: Gall's FS058
MINI PHANTOM MAX COMBO KIT
Includes a dash light and two deck lights
Includes full three rows of LEDs across the light for even
brighter warning power 5 No Bid No Bid No Bid $229.00 DL186 No Bid sa2000 | "hantommax
24 selectable flash patterns with push-button control DL186
includes dash, deck, mirror, and suction cup mount; 5-year
warrantv
Reference: Gall's DL186
2-WAY VHF RADIO SYSTEM
Motorola M400 Mobile Radio; 40 watts 32 Channel Mobil
Motorola VHF
o __ VHFAntenna 10 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $469.00 | O orod
Hi-Gain Installation on automobile with Power Cable Ant- M400
Cable: connectors
Reference: Motorola
WHISTLES (fox|
(fox) . . 100 $6.95 ACME BRAND No Bid No Bid $4.00 UA330 No Bid No Bid
Fox cushion whistles; Reference: Gall's UA330
ASP 26’ Expandable Baton
P 10 $69.95 SENTRY 426 No Bid $100.00 AsP $66.00 BAO36 $67.22 ASP52511 No Bid
Reference: Galls BAO36
ASP Baton Holder ASAP SIDE BREAK
10 $39.95 No Bid $18.00 Dutyman $30.00 BA009 $29.92 No Bid
Reference: Galls BAOO9 (BW) SCHBRARD v
FINGERPRINT PAD
15 No Bid No Bid No Bid $19.00 LE137 $19.57 No Bid
Reference: Gall’s LE137
Section V. Handguns
MAGAZINES FOR HANDGUNS
High capacity and easy loading, made to fit Glock Model 179 25 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $21.25 No Bid
mm
(AMMUNITION — 9MM, 124 GRAIN, FULL METAL JACKET,
SILVER TIP HOLLOW POINT = WINCHESTER 10 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $208.81 |FEDERAL AE9AP No Bid
500 rounds per case
--PLEASE INDICATE PRICE PER CASE--
(AMMUNITION — 9MM, 124 Federal HST
500 rounds per case 10 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $334.45 No Bid
--PLEASE INDICATE PRICE PER CASE--
We come to your Department
Trade in program on existing hand-guns for future purchase of hand-guns NA NA NA NA and evaluate your weapons.
We then make an offer.




United Independent School District
Police Officer Uniforms, Equipment, and Supplies

RFP 2012-072

NovaStar/ DBA: Zenit
Vendor Al & Rob Sales Amistad Army Store Code Blue Police Supply Galls, LLC GT Distributors, Inc. ovastar/ L enitram
Communications, Inc.
Brand & Model Brand & Model Brand & Model Brand & Model Brand & Model Brand & Model
L Proposed (if L Proposed (if L Proposed (if L Proposed (if L Proposed (if L Proposed (if
Item Est. Qty. | Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price
other than other than other than other than other than other than
specified) specified) specified) specified) specified) specified)
Section VI. Vehicles Decals
DECALS FOR CROWN VICTORIA/FORD TAURUS/CHEVY
limPALA:
Decals printing on reflective vinyl for entire car, full color; 10 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Quote must include installation
Quote must include removal of old decals; quote must
include set-up fee ; Lifetime warranty
Section VII. Alarms and Vehicle Tint
Vehicle Alarms — please provide two different models of car
alarms with a detailed description of features . . . . . .
10 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Model I:
Model II:
Wind tint f
Incowtint Torcareovan 10 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Ford Econoline series
Wind tint
Incow tin — 10 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
for Crown Victoria - Sedan
Wind tint
Incow 10 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
for Chevy Impala - Sedan
Wind tint
Incow ™ 10 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
for Ford Truck- Regular Cab
Wind tint
Incow 10 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
for Ford Truck- Super Crew
Wind tint
Incow 10 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
for Ford Truck- Crew Cab
Please provide the price to move old tint from a vechicle. ( If price varies
. . NA NA NA NA NA NA
by type of car, provide price for each type)
Section VIII. Bike Patrol
United Unif
TR 600 Mocean Tech Strech Zipp off Lep pant 2 No Bid No Bid $46.50 nite 379:; orms $55.00 TR600 No Bid No Bid
United Uniforms
#561 with Police
SH557 Mocean Color Block Bike Shirt 4 No Bid No Bid $62.90 Front & Back $50.00 SH557 No Bid No Bid
Reflective
Lettering
GL464 Blk XL Mechanix M-Pact glove 1 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
LE 346 Thermobak 3L Hydration System 1 No Bid No Bid No Bid $64.00 LE346 $53.94 | No Bid
UA528 Standard Back Emblems(Security) White & Black 4 No Bid No Bid $5.00 | Heros #5251 $4.00 UA528 $3.75 | HERO'S PRIDE No Bid
FW 134 Men'’s Tactical Mirage Shoe 1 No Bid No Bid $68.00 | Under $70.00 FW134 No Bid No Bid
Section VIlIl. Miscalleneous Items
price i i
Embroidery Varies No Bid No Bid §7.00 | CCISPErINE ]y ARiES VARIES No Bid No Bid
(names)
SEW PATCHS-
. . . . NO CHARGE; . .
Alterations Varies No Bid No Bid $0.00 HEMMED PANT 0 No Bid No Bid
NO CHARGE




