UNITED INDEPENDENT SCHOOL DISTRICT
HEAVY EQUIPMENT RENTAL SERVICES
RFP 2012-061

VENDOR Hertz Equipment Rental HoltCat
SECTION I: PERCENTAGE DISCOUNTS
% off CATALOG PRICE
% off LIST PRICE Already Discounted 0%
% off SHELF PRICE
SECTION II: GENERAL EQUIPMENT COST PER WEEK COST PER MONTH COST PER WEEK | COST PER MONTH
Automatic Level #AX-1 for Elevation w/ Legs $305.08 $479.08 No Bid
Concrete Finisher 48" $324.08 $516.08
Dozer STD Track 70 HP $858.08 $2,410.08 $1,767.00 | $3,477.00
Air Pavement Breaker 30# w/ Moil Point 1" X 4 1/4" $190.08 $230.08
Concrete Finisher 36" $317.08 $535.08
Saw Concrete 13 HP $325.08 $567.08 No Bid
Push Around Manlift (GENIE) 23" to 25" No Bid
Push Around Manlift (GENIE) 30" to 33"
#MP 60 FH (BOOM) 60" Lift $738.08 $2,154.08
Motorgrader #730 A $2,658.08 $5,150.08 $4,720.00 | $9,850.00
Ditchwitch Trencher #4500 $1,300.08 $3,270.08 No Bid
# L 35 Backhoe Tractor No Bid $1,290.00 | $2,100.00
Dump Truck 6 1/2 yd $728.08 $1,505.08 No Bid
Motorgrader #710 A $2,658.08 $5,150.08 $3,900.00 | $8,174.00
#460 Trencher UIT 4" BOOM $1,167.08 $2,713.08 No Bid
Front End Loader Mod #821 13 CAB-H & A 3.5-Y $1,355.08 $3,805.08 $3,762.00 | $7,866.00
20" to 30"Height Manlift (GENIE) No Bid No Bid

Notes:

For Motor graders, the only make & model available
at HERC is JD 670D. Delivery and pick-up to be
charged at $48/hour. HERC estimates 7 truck loads
to deliver 13 items above. 6 hours round trip delivery
have been added to rates and broken down to each
item.




