United Independent School District
Tabulation for RFP 2012-017 Hardware Supplies

Clark Securit . H & H Overhead Independent Stanley Securit
Vvendor Products / S Sy e Door Co., Inc. Hardv?/are Inc. Solut?/ons Inc.y

Item Description M%';;S:e Unit Price Bf‘&lltr.ld Unit Price | Alt. Brand | Unit Price Bf‘&lltr.ld Unit Price Bf‘&lltr.ld Unit Price Bf‘elltr.]d
Classroom Function Locks Each | $120.73 $132.00 $125.00 $99.14
#Al70pd-Sat-626
Classroom Function Lock Each | $212.33 $286.20 $226.00 $201.29
#28-10g37-LI 26d
Privacy Function Locks

Each $94.21 $103.00 $99.00 $77.89
# Al 40sa-Sat-626
Office Locks #Als3pd-Sat-626 Each $120.73 $132.00 $125.00 $99.14
Office Locks #Als3pd-Sat-626 X $132.00 No bid No bid
Sc9 "E" Kw Lever Lock Each $120.73 No bid $125.00 e
Single Cylinder Deadbolt Each $30.18 $33.00 B560P626 $37.00
#B160n-626 Schlage
Double Cylinder Deadbolt Each $40.71 $44.50 bgsslp;zzee $44.00
#B162n-626
Norton Door Closer #8501 Bc-Al Each $74.00 $147.00 $112.00
Door Protector Guard 1% X 8 X 12 Each | $16.23 $24.15 $14.00 No bid
Trilogy Digital Lock
Weather Proof #D| 2700-Wp-26-D Each $348.04 $417.50 $511.00 $389.73 No bid
Trilogy Digital Lock #DI 2700-26-D Each $323.02 $387.50 $475.00 $361.13
Classroom Locks #L9070-068-626xcs9 Each $318.76 $348.50 $310.00 $284.90
Classroom Locks # M-561-Dg-626xfa3 Each $197.93 $270.50 $200.00 $146.72
Door Hinges # Bb31-Us 26d 4.5 X 4.5 Sets $3.70 $12.75 $20.00 $7.44
Metal Door Silencer # 1229 A Each $Oé0:74 sold 100/{ $0.11 $0.06
Dummy Handle Set # A12-Ptbdx Each No bid No bid
#448-B26d Each $15.00 | $1,024.00 |
Side Latch # Tp-222 Each
Wall Bracket 1%4" Ss # Tp-1833 Each No bid )
Wall Bracket 1¥4" Ss # Tp-1843 Each No bid No bid No bid
Male Shoulder Screws # Tp-304 Each o
Female Barrel Nut # Tp-303 Each
Boxes Key Blanks # Sargent Rg Each $39.00 50/bx $37.40
Boxes Key Blanks # Sc-4 Each $9.00 50/bx $44.00 $8.99
Boxes Key Blanks # Y-11 Each $9.00 50/bx $30.00 $8.99
Pkgs. # 264 B.C. Key Blanks Each $1.46 150/pk $1.85 $43.00 $1.90
Pkgs. # 279 B.C. Key Blanks Each $1.46 150/pk $1.85 $4.00 $1.90




United Independent School District
Tabulation for RFP 2012-017 Hardware Supplies

Clark Security

H & H Overhead

Independent

Stanley Security

Vendor Products Fairway Supply Inc. Door Co., Inc. Hardware Inc. Solutions Inc.
Item Description MUer;;ch):e Unit Price Bf‘altr.ld Unit Price | Alt. Brand | Unit Price Bf‘altr.ld Unit Price Bf‘altr.ld Unit Price Bf‘altr.]d
Pkgs. # 288 B.C. Key Blanks Each $1.46 150/pk $1.85 $4.00 $1.90
Pkgs. # 309 B.C. Key Blanks Each $1.46 150/pk $1.85 $4.00 $1.90
Pkgs. # 312 B.C. Key Blanks Each $1.46 150/pk $1.85 $4.00 $1.90
Pkgs. # 072 T. Key Blanks Each $1.46 150/pk $1.85 $4.00 $1.90
Pkgs. # 075 T. Key Blanks Each $1.46 150/pk $1.85 $4.00 $1.90
Pkgs. # 078 T. Key Blanks Each $1.46 150/pk $1.85 $4.00 $1.90
Pkgs. # 155 T. Key Blanks Each $1.46 150/pk $1.85 $4.00 $1.90
Pkgs. # 160 T. Key Blanks Each $1.46 150/pk $1.85 $4.00 $1.90
Pkgs. # 159 B.C. Key Blanks Each $1.46 150/pk $1.85 $4.00 $1.90
Pkgs. # 162 B.C. Key Blanks Each $1.46 150/pk $1.85 $4.00 $1.90
Pkgs. # 168 B.C. Key Blanks Each $1.46 150/pk $1.85 $4.00 $1.90
Pkgs. # 170 B.C. Key Blanks Each $1.46 150/pk $1.85 $4.00 $1.90
Pkgs. # 183 B.C. Key Blanks Each $1.46 150/pk $1.85 $4.00 $1.90
Pkgs. # 189 B.C. Key Blanks Each $1.46 150/pk $1.85 $4.00 $1.90
Pkgs. # 249 B.C. Key Blanks Each $1.46 150/pk $1.85 $4.00 $1.90
Pkgs. # 258 B.C. Key Blanks Each $1.46 150/pk $1.85 $4.00 $1.90
Boxes Give Away Key Rings Each $11.79 100/bx | $11.86 $8.42
Boxes Metal Rim Tags 1%2" Each $19.08 100/bx | $11.86 No bid $17.68
Boxes Brass Ket Tags 1-3/8" Each $17.04 100/bx | $75.65 $65.09
Boxes Pin Tumbler Tweezera #Tpt-5 Each $16.84 $22.30 $40.00 $15.61 No bid
Each The Dumping Block # Tbh-3 Each $39.60 $56.20 $109.00 No bid
Quick Pull Steel Blades # Qp-1 Each $63.38 $28.00 $12.00
Lever Poening Tool # K-22 Each | $18.28 No bid $54.00 $33.90
Each Multiple Cavity Plug
Holders Bench #Cph-9 Each $33.28 $41.99 | $90.00 No bid
Ea #C.Ph-10 Solid Plug Holder Each $45.59 No bid $125.00 $30.84
Ea Sut-600 Adjustable Plug Holder Each No bid $57.50 $42.00
Kwik Set Cylinder Remover Tool Each $0.66 $2.50 No bid
Locksmith Stamps Each $44.29 $39.95 $33.90
Locksmith Master Each No bid $39.95 $15.80
Cutter # P-9mc Each $86.16 $95.25 $182.00 $77.80
Nylon Brushes Each $25.09 $16.39 $32.00 $9.48
Padlock Shim Picks # Psa-20 Each $24.09 $32.05 $56.00 $24.25
Latch Guard Protector # Lpg2 Each $3.46 No bid $14.00 No bid
Entrance Lock # A153-Pd-605 Each $126.22 $138.00 | $131.00 $103.90
Mortise Door Knob Classroom Each | $197.93 No bid $216.00 $149.82
Lock #M-561-Gd-626 Xfa3
Rim Exit Bevice # 99I-Us26d-36" Each $814.45 $824.50 $850.00 $707.92
Rim Cylinder #20-022-Usa 26d Each $26.07 $28.50 $28.00 $22.88




United Independent School District
Tabulation for RFP 2012-017 Hardware Supplies

Clark Security

H & H Overhead

Independent

Stanley Security

Vendor Products TR SNFR Y e Door Co., Inc. Hardware Inc. Solutions Inc.

Item Description ML(Jer:;Srfe Unit Price Blll:\alltr;d Unit Price | Alt. Brand | Unit Price Blll:\alltr;d Unit Price Blll:\alltr;d Unit Price Blll:\alltr;d
Closer Arm # 8020-1 Each No bid No bid $43.90
Back Set 2-3/8" #11-096 Each $18.79 | $23.00 | $27.00 $16.95
Lock Board Cover # 63005-Pc Each No bid No bid No bid
Falcon T-Series 2 3/8" Dead Latch Each $17.85 $24.40 | $31.00 $13.70 |
Flush Bolts # 3917-12"-626 Sets $10.12 No bid $21.00 No bid
Handicap Mirror # B-293-1630 Each No bid $105.00
Door Closer # Lcn 1461-Rwpa-Al Each $152.62 $154.50 $170.00 $133.90
Vonduprin Exit Device Each | $581.32 $588.00 $610.00 $509.59
# 99e0-Us 26d X 36"
Entry Door Knob W/Key # P400-Us3 Each $11.57 $17.21 $131.00 $11.10
Jamb Weather Strip # Cp 401-36 X 84 Each No bid No bid $22.00 No bid
Boxes Key Blanks # Sc-1 Each $8.50 50/bx $19.50 $30.00 $8.99
Boxes Key Blanks # Kw-1 Each $8.50 50/bx $19.50 $28.00 $8.99
Boxes Key Blanks # Cs-9 Each No bid $19.50 $30.00 $8.99
Boxes Key Blanks # F Each $19.00 50/bx No bid $50.00 $9.99
Boxes Key Blanks # Fa-3 Each $11.50 50/bx $32.00 $50.00 $8.99
Boxes Key Blanks # M-1 Each $8.50 50/bx $19.50 $28.00 $8.99
Boxes Key Blanks # Best-M Each $19.00 50/bx $32.50 $73.00 $19.50
Boxes # Ar-4 Key Blanks Each $20.00 50/bx $28.00 $38.00 $8.99
Boxes # Kb1573h Key Blanks Each $29.50 50/bx $50.00 $21.99 No bid
3068 X 1-3/4" Sp-Ds2 X L1 Metal Door Each $319.00
3068 X 5-3/4" Kd 16-Gauge Each $165.00
Lhr Metal Frame X Una Anchors
3068 X 1-3/4" Sp+ Dds2xxI1 Each No bid
Hollow Metal Door
6068 Dbl D/U (Pr 3068 X 1-3/4 20 Gauge
Hollow Metal Door X L1 Active Each $859.00
Door Z2 Astragal)
6070 Dbl D/U ( Pr 3070 X 1-3/4 20 Gauge
Hollow Metal Door X L1 Active Each No bid No bid $859.00 No bid
Door, Mb Inactive Door X 21
Astragal)
3068 X 5-3/4 Kd 16 Gauge Lh Metal Each $191.00
Frame X Expansion Bolts
3068 X 1-3/4 Sp-Ds2 X L1 Hollow Each $319.00
Metal Door
3070 X 1-3/4 18 Gauge Hollow Metal
Door Machine Prep To Existing Mf Each $443.00
Specs-Republic Hinge Locations X
Exit Device Prep

% Off Catalog Price: 0% N/A 25% 62% 43.58%

% Off List Price: 30-55% 5%-55% 0% 62% 43.58%
% Off Shelf Price: 0% N/A 0% 62% 0%
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