UNITED INDEPENDENT SCHOOL DISTRICT
MISCELLANEOUS METAL MATERIALS

RFCQ CQ019-2013

VENDORS Atlas Adhesive EC Steel & Supply Laredo Discount Lone Star Steel &
PERCENTAGE DISCOUNTS Tape Metals Supply
% Off Catalog Price 0% 0% 10% 0%
% Off List Price 0% 0% 10% 0%
% Off Shelf Price 0% 0% 10% 0%
ESTIMATED DELIVERY TIME 16-21 days 5 days 1-2 days Same day
DESCRIPTION AMOUNT | UNIT
WELDING TYPE HINGES 1" X 1" 100 | EACH $0.57 $0.87
NEW STEEL PIPE 1 %" X 21' 120 | EACH $31.00 $31.08 $27.91
NEW BLACK PIPE %" X 21' 10 | EACH $15.00 $11.97 $22.75
NEW STEEL PIPE 134" X 21' 6 EACH $26.50 $28.98 $23.79
NEW STEEL PIPE 3" X 21' 24 | EACH $90.00 $108.78 $72.69
NEW STEEL PIPE 2" X 40' 40 EACH $110.00 $104.58 $39.04 (21')
DOWNSPOUT 16 EACH $39.00 $25.00 $2.89 ft.
WELDING TYPE ELBOW 134" 40 | EACH $6.50 $5.27 $2.99
WELDING TYPE ELBOW 1%" 40 | EACH $4.50 $2.96 $2.85
SHEET METAL R-26 GAUGE EACH $29.00 $19.90 no bid
PANELS PRE-FINISHED WHITE W/FOLLOWING
DIMENSIONS
Ixg EACH $22.00 $19.12 $19.92
3'X 10" EACH $27.50 $23.90 $24.90
3'X 12" EACH $33.00 $28.68 $29.88
3'X 18" EACH $49.50 $43.02 $44.82
X217 EACH $57.75 $50.19 $52.29
VINYL BACK INSULATION TAPE 3" 10 EACH $26.00 $196.00 (6'x100'x3") $14.99
3/8 X 2 X 20 FLAT STRAP 50 EACH $36.00 $34.20 $29.50
% X 2 X 20 FLAT STRAP 10 EACH $20.00 $23.00 $22.10
3/16 X 1% X 20 FLAT STRAP 100 EACH No Bids $11.00 $13.40 $12.50
% X 1 X 20 FLAT STRAP 20 EACH $10.00 $11.20 $10.17
% X 1% X 20 FLAT STRAP 20 EACH $20.00 $17.00 $15.31
1% X % X 20 FLAT STRAP 30 EACH $10.50 $8.00 no bid
3/8 X 2% X 20 FLAT STRAP 10 EACH $45.00 $43.00 $41.33
3/8 X 6 X 20 FLAT STRAP 5 EACH $116.00 $102.40 $89.84
1/8 X 3 X 20 FLAT STRAP 5 EACH $18.50 $16.20 $16.99
1/8 X 1 X 1 X 20 FLAT STRAP 2 EACH $5.50 $6.00 $6.88
% X % X 20' SQUARE TUBING 100 | EACH $6.50 $8.00 $5.29
% X 3" X 40' SQUARE TUBING 16 EACH $256.00 $242.40 $233.60
1% X 1/8 X 24 SQUARE TUBING 10 EACH $29.50 $36.00 $34.80
1% X 1/8 X 20 SQUARE TUBING 10 EACH $24.00 $29.28 $23.98
14 X 20 ROUND ROD 30 EACH $8.50 $8.20 $9.71
%" X 2" X 2" X 20' ANGLE IRON 20 EACH $41.00 $36.40 $42.95
%" X 1%" X 1%" X 20 ANGLE IRON 5 EACH $28.00 $28.40 $31.54
3/16" X 2 X 2/20 ANGLE IRON 5 EACH $31.50 $27.80 $31.25
3/16 X 2 X 3 X 20 ANGLE IRON 5 EACH $32.00 $38.40 $38.97
1% X STEEL @ 90 ELBOW 30 EACH $6.50 $5.27 $2.99
EACH $160.00 $158.61 $148.42
4X 8 X 3/16 FLOOR PLATE (DIAMOND PLATE) 10
TIE WEDGE ST-15 200 EACH $1.50 $170.00 cs ($1.70 ea) No bid
%" X 18" DOWEL 100 | EACH $1.30 $1.50




UNITED INDEPENDENT SCHOOL DISTRICT
MISCELLANEOUS METAL MATERIALS
RFCQ CQ019-2013

VENDORS Atlas Adhesive Laredo Discount Lone Star Steel &
EC Steel & Supply

PERCENTAGE DISCOUNTS Tape Metals Supply
14" X 20' REBAR 100 EACH $6.50 $8.00 no bid
R-10 INSULATION 3 %" X 5' 100' 12 EACH $198.00 $196.00 $239.00
STIRRUP 12" 100 EACH $1.20 $0.75 ]
STIRRUP 14" 100 EACH $1.45 $0.90 No bid
1% X1% X1/8” EACH $12.00 $13.00 $11.99
3/16” X 3” X 3” ANGLE IRON EACH $49.99 $42.40 $41.22
3” X %” CHANNEL IRON EACH $53.00 $47.60 $38.99
6” X %” CHANNEL IRON EACH $110.00 $102.00 $98.47
4 X 8 X 3/10” DIAMOND PLATE EACH $160.00 $159.00 no bid
4X 8 X 16 ga. FLAT EXPANDED METAL EACH $29.00 $47.63 $32.46
4 X 8 X 16 ga. EXPANDED METAL EACH $29.00 $47.63 $34.50
CROSS TEE 4’ 200 | EACH No bid $2.50
CROSS TEE 2/ 150 | EACH $1.25
MAIN TEE 12’ 100 | EACH $8.50 No bid
WALL ANGLE 10’ 200 | EACH $5.50
4/8 - 5/8 SHEETROCK 300 | EACH $11.50
STUD 20 GA. 3-5/8” 500 | EACH $6.90 $4.19 ('10)
TRACK 20 GA. 3-5/8” 200 | EACH $6.00 $4.06 ('10) No bid
CEILING TILE 2”X4” 150 BOX $62.50 No bid
CEILING TILE 2”X2” #409 150 BOX $56.00

2 BOX $30.00 $22.50 (250 pcs per bag)
SELF TAPERED SCREW 1-1/4”
INSULATION R-19 50 BAG no bid .55 sq. ft.
INSULATION R-11 50 BAG no bid .27 sq. ft
Provided pricing
for all types of
Notes tape such as
vinyl, aluminum,
foam, etc.

One (1) vendor submitted a "No bid"




