UNITED INDEPENDENT SCHOOL DISTRICT
BAND EQUIPMENT
RFP 2010-042

VENDOR THE BAND SHOP CASCIO INTERSTATE MUSIC
ITEM EST uIsD BRAND /MODEL uIsD BRAND /MODEL
MODEL / DESCRIPTION QTY| PRICE EXT. ETA PROPOSED; if left blank we will PRICE EXT. ETA PROPOSED; if left blank we will
assume you are bidding the specified model assume you are bidding the specified model
1 GEMEINHARDT PICCOLO REF; 4WSSK or Equal 1 $1,870.00 $1,870.00 15-30 days $1,199.00 $1,199.00 0-40 days
2 GEMEINHARDT FLUTE REF: 2SP or Equal 4 $600.00 $2,400.00 15-30 days $225.00 $900.00 0-30 days
3 YAMAHA FLUTE YFL-461H OR Equal 2 $1,900.00 $3,800.00 15-30 days $1,047.00 $2,094.00 0-30 days
4 FOX OBOE REF: 330 or Equal 1 $3,147.00 $3,147.00 15-30 days $2,939.00 $2,939.00 0-30 days
5 FOX BASSOON REF: FOX 51 or Equal 1 $3,769.00 $3,769.00 15-30 days $3,520.00 $3,520.00 0-30 days
6 RIDENOUR Bb CLARINET REF: TR 147 or Equal 4 No Bid No Bid $579.00 $2,316.00 0-45 days Buffet E11 BC2501-5-0
7 BUFFET Bb CLARINET REF: E11 or Equal 2 $899.00 $1,798.00 15-30 days $799.00 $1,598.00 0-45 days Buffet BC2501F-2-0
8 SELMER BASS CLARINET REF: 1430P or Equal 1 $1,899.00 $1,899.00 15-30 days $1,242.00 $1,242.00 0-45 days Selmer 1430LP
9 RIDENOUR BASS CLARINET REF: BC 147 or Equal 2 No Bid No Bid $1,465.00 $2,930.00 0-30 days Yamaha YCL221lI1
10 VITO CONTRA- BASS CLARINET REF: 7182 or Equal 1 No Bid No Bid $3,097.00 $3,097.00 0-30 days
11 YAMAHA ALTO SAXOPHONE REF: YAS475 or Equal 2 $2,295.00 $4,590.00 15-30 days $1,390.00 $2,780.00 0-30 days
12 YAMAHA ALTO SAXOPHONE REF: YAS-23 or Equal 3 $1,759.00 $5,277.00 15-30 days $813.00 $2,439.00 0-30 days
13 YAMAHA TENOR SAX REF: YTS-23 or Equal 2 $2,400.00 $4,800.00 15-30 days $1,024.00 $2,048.00 0-30 days
14 YAMAHA BARITONE SAX REF: YBS-52 or EQUAL 1 $5,200.00 $5,200.00 15-30 days $3,442.00 $3,442.00 0-30 days
15 YAMAHA CORNET REF: YCR-2310 11 OR EQUAL 4 $1,100.00 $4,400.00 15-30 days $493.00 $1,972.00 0-30 days
16 BACH TRUMPET REF: BACH 180S37 OR EQUAL 2 $2,679.00 $5,358.00 15-30 days $1,645.00 $3,290.00 0-30 days
17 BACH CORNET REF: BACH 181 ML OR EQUAL 1 $2,450.00 $2,450.00 15-30 days $1,601.00 $1,601.00 0-40 days
18 HOLTON FRENCH HORN REF: HOLTON 379 OR EQUAL 1 $3,000.00 $3,000.00 15-30 days $1,964.00 $1,964.00 0-30 days
19 YAMAHA EUHPHONIUM REF: YEP-201 OR EQUAL 1 $2,100.00 $2,100.00 15-30 days $991.00 $991.00 0-30 days
20 YAMAHA EUHPHONIUM REF: YEP-321S OR EQUAL 1 $2,300.00 $2,300.00 15-30 days $1,353.00 $1,353.00 0-30 days
21 BACH TENOR TROMBONE REF: BACH TB301 OR EQUAL 2 $740.00 $1,480.00 15-30 days $379.00 $758.00 0-30 days
22 BACH TENOR TROMBONE REF: BACH 36 BO OR EQUAL 2 $2,999.00 $5,998.00 15-30 days $1,839.00 $3,678.00 0-30 days
23 BACH TENOR TROMBONE REF: BACH 36 B OR EQUAL 2 $2,650.00 $5,300.00 15-30 days $1,839.00 $3,678.00 0-30 days
24 BACH TENOR TROMBONE REF: BACH 42 B OR EQUAL 2 $3,329.00 $6,658.00 15-30 days $1,839.00 $3,678.00 0-30 days
25 CERVENY TUBA REF: CBB 681-4 OR EQUAL 1 $3,989.00 $3,989.00 15-30 days $3,445.00 $3,445.00 0-30 days Cerveny CBB 6814110
26 YAMAHA TUBA REF: YBB - 105WC OR EQUAL 2 $2,850.00 $5,700.00 15-30 days $1,741.00 $3,482.00 0-30 days
27 KING SOUSAPHONE REF: 2370W OR EQUAL 2 $3,999.00 $7,998.00 15-30 days $2,747.00 $5,494.00 0-30 days
28 KING SOUSAPHONE REF: KING 2350W OR EQUAL 1 $6,400.00 $6,400.00 15-30 days $3,922.00 $3,922.00 0-30 days
29 KING SOUSAPHONE REF: 2350WSP OR EQUAL 1 $7,100.00 $7,100.00 15-30 days $4,719.00 $4,719.00 0-30 days
30 MUSSER ORCH BELLS REF: MUSSER M645 OR EQUAL 1 $999.00 $999.00 15-30 days $758.00 $758.00 0-30 days
31 PEARL PERCUSSION KITS REF: PK800 OR EQUAL 6 $259.00 $1,554.00 15-30 days $180.00 $1,080.00 0-30 days
32 YAMAHA CON BASS DRUM REF: CB640BFS7 OR EQUAL 1 $1,500.00 $1,500.00 15-30 days $1,130.00 $1,130.00 0-45 days
33 YAMAHA GLOCKENSPIEL REF: YG-250 OR EQUAL 1 $759.00 $759.00 15-30 days $440.00 $440.00 0-30 days Yamaha YG-250D
34 MC ADAMS METRONOME REF: 20X OR EQUAL 2 $959.00 $1,918.00 15-30 days $620.00 $1,240.00 0-30 days
35 DIGIMET DIGITAL METRONOME (OR EQUAL) 2 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
36 PETERSONS STROBE TUNER REF: CS5000 Il OR EQUAL 1 No Bid No Bid $3,599.00 $3,599.00 0-30 days
%OFF CATALOG PRICE 30% %OFF CATALOG PRICE 0%
%OFF LIST PRICE 30% %OFF LIST PRICE 25%
%OFF SHELF PRICE 30% %OFF SHELF PRICE 0%
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UNITED INDEPENDENT SCHOOL DISTRICT

BAND EQUIPMENT
RFP 2010-042

VENDOR HILLJE MUSIC CENTER MIDWEST MUSICAL IMPORTS
ITEM EST UISD . . UISD . )
MODEL / DESCRIPTION ory| price | EXT- ETA | R i e v | PRICE | EXT. BT A R e e
1 GEMEINHARDT PICCOLO REF; 4WSSK or Equal 1 No Bid $1,519.00 $1,519.00 5-30 days Emerson EBLP
2 GEMEINHARDT FLUTE REF: 2SP or Equal 4 No Bid $170.00 $680.00 5-30 days Selmer Prelude FL711
3 YAMAHA FLUTE YFL-461H OR Equal 2 $1,089.00 $2,178.00 2-4 weeks $1,050.00 $2,100.00 5-30 days
4 FOX OBOE REF: 330 or Equal 1 No Bid $2,865.00 $2,865.00 6-8 months
5 FOX BASSOON REF: FOX 51 or Equal 1 No Bid $3,408.00 $3,408.00 3-4 months
6 RIDENOUR Bb CLARINET REF: TR 147 or Equal 4 No Bid $352.00 $1,408.00 5-30 days Buffet B12
7 BUFFET Bb CLARINET REF: E11 or Equal 2 $650.00 $1,300.00 2-4 weeks $565.00 $1,130.00 5-30 days
8 SELMER BASS CLARINET REF: 1430P or Equal 1 No Bid $1,222.00 $1,222.00 5-30 days 1430LP
9 RIDENOUR BASS CLARINET REF: BC 147 or Equal 2 No Bid $941.00 $1,882.00 5-30 days Jupiter 673 BN
10 VITO CONTRA- BASS CLARINET REF: 7182 or Equal 1 No Bid $3,020.00 $3,020.00 5-30 days
11 YAMAHA ALTO SAXOPHONE REF: YAS475 or Equal 2 $1,439.00 $2,878.00 2-4 weeks $1,380.00 $2,760.00 5-30 days
12 YAMAHA ALTO SAXOPHONE REF: YAS-23 or Equal 3 $839.00 $2,517.00 2-4 weeks $823.00 $2,469.00 5-30 days
13 YAMAHA TENOR SAX REF: YTS-23 or Equal 2 $1,059.00 $2,118.00 2-4 weeks $1,039.00 $2,078.00 5-30 days
14 YAMAHA BARITONE SAX REF: YBS-52 or EQUAL 1 $3,549.00 $3,549.00 2-4 weeks $3,448.00 $3,448.00 5-30 days
15 YAMAHA CORNET REF: YCR-2310 11 OR EQUAL 4 $519.00 $2,076.00 2-4 weeks $438.00 $1,752.00 5-30 days
16 BACH TRUMPET REF: BACH 180S37 OR EQUAL 2 No Bid $1,614.00 $3,228.00 5-30 days
17 BACH CORNET REF: BACH 181 ML OR EQUAL 1 No Bid $1,570.00 $1,570.00 5-30 days
18 HOLTON FRENCH HORN REF: HOLTON 379 OR EQUAL 1 No Bid $1,921.00 $1,921.00 5-30 days
19 YAMAHA EUHPHONIUM REF: YEP-201 OR EQUAL 1 $1,029.00 $1,029.00 2-4 weeks $1,009.00 $1,009.00 5-30 days
20 YAMAHA EUHPHONIUM REF: YEP-321S OR EQUAL 1 $1,399.00 $1,399.00 2-4 weeks $1,375.00 $1,375.00 5-30 days
21 BACH TENOR TROMBONE REF: BACH TB301 OR EQUAL 2 No Bid $387.00 $774.00 5-30 days
22 BACH TENOR TROMBONE REF: BACH 36 BO OR EQUAL 2 No Bid $1,801.00 $3,602.00 5-30 days
23 BACH TENOR TROMBONE REF: BACH 36 B OR EQUAL 2 No Bid $1,801.00 $3,602.00 5-30 days
24 BACH TENOR TROMBONE REF: BACH 42 B OR EQUAL 2 No Bid $1,801.00 $3,602.00 5-30 days
25 CERVENY TUBA REF: CBB 681-4 OR EQUAL 1 No Bid $3,540.00 $3,540.00 5-30 days Jupiter 582L
26 YAMAHA TUBA REF: YBB - 105WC OR EQUAL 2 $1,799.00 $3,598.00 2-4 weeks $1,785.00 $3,570.00 5-30 days
27 KING SOUSAPHONE REF: 2370W OR EQUAL 2 No Bid $2,680.00 $5,360.00 5-30 days
28 KING SOUSAPHONE REF: KING 2350W OR EQUAL 1 No Bid $3,820.00 $3,820.00 5-30 days
29 KING SOUSAPHONE REF: 2350WSP OR EQUAL 1 No Bid $4,595.00 $4,595.00 5-30 days
30 MUSSER ORCH BELLS REF: MUSSER M645 OR EQUAL 1 No Bid $780.00 $780.00 5-30 days
31 PEARL PERCUSSION KITS REF: PK800 OR EQUAL 6 No Bid No Bid
32 YAMAHA CON BASS DRUM REF: CB640BFS7 OR EQUAL 1 $1,219.00 $1,219.00 2-4 weeks $1,240.00 $1,240.00 5-30 days
33 YAMAHA GLOCKENSPIEL REF: YG-250 OR EQUAL 1 $419.00 $419.00 2-4 weeks $485.00 $485.00 5-30 days
34 MC ADAMS METRONOME REF: 20X OR EQUAL 2 $599.00 $1,198.00 2-4 weeks No Bid
35 DIGIMET DIGITAL METRONOME (OR EQUAL) 2 No Bid No Bid
36 PETERSONS STROBE TUNER REF: CS5000 Il OR EQUAL 1 No Bid No Bid
%OFF CATALOG PRICE 20-50% %OFF CATALOG PRICE 5-50%
%OFF LIST PRICE 20-50% %OFF LIST PRICE 5-50%
%OFF SHELF PRICE 20-50% %OFF SHELF PRICE 5-50%
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UNITED INDEPENDENT SCHOOL DISTRICT
BAND EQUIPMENT
RFP 2010-042

VENDOR MUSIC MAN INC N.E.M.C.
ITEM EST UISD . . UISD . )
MODEL / DESCRIPTION ory| price | EXT- ETA | R e e | PRICE | EXT. BT A R e e
1 GEMEINHARDT PICCOLO REF; 4WSSK or Equal 1 $1,141.00 1141.00 Immediate $1,165.00 $1,165.00 7-10 days
2 GEMEINHARDT FLUTE REF: 2SP or Equal 4 $222.00 888.00 Immediate $212.00 $848.00 4-5 days
3 YAMAHA FLUTE YFL-461H OR Equal 2 $1,046.00 2092.00 Immediate $1,050.00 $2,100.00 7-10 days
4 FOX OBOE REF: 330 or Equal 1 $2,881.00 2881.00 60 days $2,749.00 $2,749.00 30-60 days
5 FOX BASSOON REF: FOX 51 or Equal 1 $3,474.00 3474.00 2-3 months $3,396.00 $3,396.00 30-45 days
6 RIDENOUR Bb CLARINET REF: TR 147 or Equal 4 No Bid $179.00 $716.00 3-5 days Olds NCL110
7 BUFFET Bb CLARINET REF: E11 or Equal 2 $689.00 1378.00 Immediate Buffet E11 (BC2501-2-0) $625.00 $1,250.00 5-7 days Buffet E11 (BC2501-2-0)
8 SELMER BASS CLARINET REF: 1430P or Equal 1 $1,219.00 1219.00 Immediate $1,219.00 $1,219.00 7-10 days
9 RIDENOUR BASS CLARINET REF: BC 147 or Equal 2 No Bid $899.00 $1,798.00 3-5 days Olds NBCL110
10 VITO CONTRA- BASS CLARINET REF: 7182 or Equal 1 $3,046.00 3046.00 60-90 days $3,026.00 $3,026.00 30-60 days
11 YAMAHA ALTO SAXOPHONE REF: YAS475 or Equal 2 $1,381.00 2762.00 Immediate $1,388.00 $2,776.00 7-10 days
12 YAMAHA ALTO SAXOPHONE REF: YAS-23 or Equal 3 $808.00 2424.00 Immediate $816.00 $2,448.00 7-10 days
13 YAMAHA TENOR SAX REF: YTS-23 or Equal 2 $1,019.00 2038.00 Immediate $1,028.00 $2,056.00 7-10 days
14 YAMAHA BARITONE SAX REF: YBS-52 or EQUAL 1 $3,427.00 3427.00 Immediate $3,437.00 $3,437.00 10-20 days
15 YAMAHA CORNET REF: YCR-2310 11 OR EQUAL 4 $419.00 1676.00 30 days $494.50 $1,978.00 10-30 days
16 BACH TRUMPET REF: BACH 180S37 OR EQUAL 2 $1,608.00 3216.00 Immediate $1,607.00 $3,214.00 7-10 days
17 BACH CORNET REF: BACH 181 ML OR EQUAL 1 $1,565.00 1565.00 30 days $1,572.00 $1,572.00 10-15 days
18 HOLTON FRENCH HORN REF: HOLTON 379 OR EQUAL 1 $1,931.00 1931.00 Immediate $1,918.00 $1,918.00 7-10 days
19 YAMAHA EUHPHONIUM REF: YEP-201 OR EQUAL 1 $991.00 991.00 Immediate $990.00 $990.00 10-15 days
20 YAMAHA EUHPHONIUM REF: YEP-321S OR EQUAL 1 $1,352.00 1352.00 Immediate $1,351.00 $1,351.00 7-10 days
21 BACH TENOR TROMBONE REF: BACH TB301 OR EQUAL 2 $372.00 744.00 Immediate $375.00 $750.00 7-10 days
22 BACH TENOR TROMBONE REF: BACH 36 BO OR EQUAL 2 $1,798.00 3596.00 Immediate $1,795.00 $3,590.00 10-15 days
23 BACH TENOR TROMBONE REF: BACH 36 B OR EQUAL 2 $1,798.00 3596.00 Immediate $1,795.00 $3,590.00 10-15 days
24 BACH TENOR TROMBONE REF: BACH 42 B OR EQUAL 2 $1,798.00 3596.00 Immediate $1,795.00 $3,590.00 10-15 days
25 CERVENY TUBA REF: CBB 681-4 OR EQUAL 1 No Bid $3,554.00 $3,554.00 7-15 days Cerveny CBB681-411-0
26 YAMAHA TUBA REF: YBB - 105WC OR EQUAL 2 $1,751.00 3502.00 Immediate $1,739.00 $3,478.00 7-10 days
27 KING SOUSAPHONE REF: 2370W OR EQUAL 2 $2,698.00 5396.00 Immediate $2,683.00 $5,366.00 10-30 days
28 KING SOUSAPHONE REF: KING 2350W OR EQUAL 1 $3,848.00 3848.00 Immediate $3,829.00 $3,829.00 10-15 days
29 KING SOUSAPHONE REF: 2350WSP OR EQUAL 1 $4,619.00 4619.00 Immediate $4,610.00 $4,610.00 10-15 days
30 MUSSER ORCH BELLS REF: MUSSER M645 OR EQUAL 1 $742.00 742.00 Immediate $744.00 $744.00 10-30 days
31 PEARL PERCUSSION KITS REF: PK800 OR EQUAL 6 $165.00 990.00 Immediate $144.35 $866.10 7-15 days
32 YAMAHA CON BASS DRUM REF: CB640BFS7 OR EQUAL 1 $1,164.00 1164.00 Immediate $1,128.00 $1,128.00 10-30 days
33 YAMAHA GLOCKENSPIEL REF: YG-250 OR EQUAL 1 $461.00 461.00 Immediate $446.00 $446.00 10-15 days
34 MC ADAMS METRONOME REF: 20X OR EQUAL 2 No Bid No Bid
35 DIGIMET DIGITAL METRONOME (OR EQUAL) 2 No Bid No Bid
36 PETERSONS STROBE TUNER REF: CS5000 Il OR EQUAL 1 No Bid $3,272.00 $3,272.00 7-10 days
%OFF CATALOG PRICE %OFF CATALOG PRICE
%OFF LIST PRICE 30-60% %OFF LIST PRICE

%OFF SHELF PRICE
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UNITED INDEPENDENT SCHOOL DISTRICT
BAND EQUIPMENT
RFP 2010-042

VENDOR NICK RAIL MUSIC PERIPOLE BERGERAULT, INC
ITEM EST UISD . . UISD . )
MODEL / DESCRIPTION ory| price | EXT: ETA | R o e e | PRICE | EXT. BT R e
1 GEMEINHARDT PICCOLO REF; 4WSSK or Equal 1 $1,339.00 1339.00 10-30 days No Bid
2 GEMEINHARDT FLUTE REF: 2SP or Equal 4 $259.00 1036.00 10-30 days No Bid
3 YAMAHA FLUTE YFL-461H OR Equal 2 $1,105.00 2210.00 60-90 days No Bid
4 FOX OBOE REF: 330 or Equal 1 $2,965.00 2965.00 60-90 days No Bid
5 FOX BASSOON REF: FOX 51 or Equal 1 $3,545.00 3545.00 60-90 days No Bid
6 RIDENOUR Bb CLARINET REF: TR 147 or Equal 4 No Bid
7 BUFFET Bb CLARINET REF: E11 or Equal 2 No Bid
8 SELMER BASS CLARINET REF: 1430P or Equal 1 $1,289.00 1289.00 10-30 days No Bid
9 RIDENOUR BASS CLARINET REF: BC 147 or Equal 2 No Bid
10 VITO CONTRA- BASS CLARINET REF: 7182 or Equal 1 $3,215.00 3215.00 10-30 days No Bid
11 YAMAHA ALTO SAXOPHONE REF: YAS475 or Equal 2 $1,459.00 2918.00 10-30 days No Bid
12 YAMAHA ALTO SAXOPHONE REF: YAS-23 or Equal 3 $863.50 2590.50 10-30 days No Bid
13 YAMAHA TENOR SAX REF: YTS-23 or Equal 2 $1,075.00 2150.00 10-30 days No Bid
14 YAMAHA BARITONE SAX REF: YBS-52 or EQUAL 1 $3,649.00 3649.00 10-30 days No Bid
15 YAMAHA CORNET REF: YCR-2310 11 OR EQUAL 4 $527.00 2108.00 30-60 days No Bid
16 BACH TRUMPET REF: BACH 180S37 OR EQUAL 2 $1,710.00 3420.00 10-30 days No Bid
17 BACH CORNET REF: BACH 181 ML OR EQUAL 1 $1,663.00 1663.00 10-30 days No Bid
18 HOLTON FRENCH HORN REF: HOLTON 379 OR EQUAL 1 $2,040.00 2040.00 10-30 days No Bid
19 YAMAHA EUHPHONIUM REF: YEP-201 OR EQUAL 1 $1,080.00 1080.00 10-30 days No Bid
20 YAMAHA EUHPHONIUM REF: YEP-321S OR EQUAL 1 $1,460.00 1460.00 10-30 days No Bid
21 BACH TENOR TROMBONE REF: BACH TB301 OR EQUAL 2 $394.00 788.00 10-30 days No Bid
22 BACH TENOR TROMBONE REF: BACH 36 BO OR EQUAL 2 $1,910.00 3820.00 10-30 days No Bid
23 BACH TENOR TROMBONE REF: BACH 36 B OR EQUAL 2 $1,910.00 3820.00 10-30 days No Bid
24 BACH TENOR TROMBONE REF: BACH 42 B OR EQUAL 2 $1,910.00 3820.00 10-30 days No Bid
25 CERVENY TUBA REF: CBB 681-4 OR EQUAL 1 $3,769.00 3769.00 30-60 days No Bid
26 YAMAHA TUBA REF: YBB - 105WC OR EQUAL 2 $1,889.00 3778.00 10-30 days No Bid
27 KING SOUSAPHONE REF: 2370W OR EQUAL 2 $2,849.00 5698.00 10-30 days No Bid
28 KING SOUSAPHONE REF: KING 2350W OR EQUAL 1 $4,075.00 4075.00 10-30 days No Bid
29 KING SOUSAPHONE REF: 2350WSP OR EQUAL 1 $4,895.00 4895.00 10-30 days No Bid
30 MUSSER ORCH BELLS REF: MUSSER M645 OR EQUAL 1 $829.00 829.00 10-30 days $1,430.00 $1,430.00 15-30 days Bergerault #GV
31 PEARL PERCUSSION KITS REF: PK800 OR EQUAL 6 $149.00 894.00 30-60 days No Bid
32 YAMAHA CON BASS DRUM REF: CB640BFS7 OR EQUAL 1 $1,310.00 1310.00 10-30 days No Bid
33 YAMAHA GLOCKENSPIEL REF: YG-250 OR EQUAL 1 $489.00 489.00 60-90 days $1,430.00 $1,430.00 15-30 days Bergerault #GV
34 MC ADAMS METRONOME REF: 20X OR EQUAL 2 No Bid
35 DIGIMET DIGITAL METRONOME (OR EQUAL) 2 $625.00 1250.00 10-30 days No Bid
36 PETERSONS STROBE TUNER REF: CS5000 Il OR EQUAL 1 $3,295.00 3295.00 10-30 days No Bid
%OFF CATALOG PRICE %OFF CATALOG PRICE |25% +Shipping
%OFF LIST PRICE 30% %OFF LIST PRICE
%OFF SHELF PRICE %OFF SHELF PRICE
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UNITED INDEPENDENT SCHOOL DISTRICT
BAND EQUIPMENT
RFP 2010-042

VENDOR SAM ASH MUSIC STAGERIGHT CORPORATION
ITEM EST UISD . . UISD . )
MODEL / DESCRIPTION ory| price | EXT: ETA | R o e e | PRICE | EXT. BT A R e e

1 GEMEINHARDT PICCOLO REF; 4WSSK or Equal 1 $1,152.00 14-21 days No Bid

2 GEMEINHARDT FLUTE REF: 2SP or Equal 4 $220.00 14-21 days No Bid

3 YAMAHA FLUTE YFL-461H OR Equal 2 $1,065.00 14-21 days No Bid

4 FOX OBOE REF: 330 or Equal 1 $2,905.00 14-21 days No Bid

5 FOX BASSOON REF: FOX 51 or Equal 1 $3,490.00 14-21 days No Bid

6 RIDENOUR Bb CLARINET REF: TR 147 or Equal 4 No Bid

7 BUFFET Bb CLARINET REF: E11 or Equal 2 $540.00 14-21 days No Bid

8 SELMER BASS CLARINET REF: 1430P or Equal 1 $1,249.00 14-21 days No Bid

9 RIDENOUR BASS CLARINET REF: BC 147 or Equal 2 No Bid

10 VITO CONTRA- BASS CLARINET REF: 7182 or Equal 1 $3,119.00 14-21 days No Bid

11 YAMAHA ALTO SAXOPHONE REF: YAS475 or Equal 2 $1,410.00 14-21 days No Bid

12 YAMAHA ALTO SAXOPHONE REF: YAS-23 or Equal 3 $819.00 14-21 days No Bid

13 YAMAHA TENOR SAX REF: YTS-23 or Equal 2 $1,045.00 14-21 days No Bid

14 YAMAHA BARITONE SAX REF: YBS-52 or EQUAL 1 $3,420.00 14-21 days No Bid

15 YAMAHA CORNET REF: YCR-2310 11 OR EQUAL 4 $406.00 14-21 days No Bid

16 BACH TRUMPET REF: BACH 180S37 OR EQUAL 2 $1,653.00 14-21 days No Bid

17 BACH CORNET REF: BACH 181 ML OR EQUAL 1 $1,608.00 14-21 days No Bid

18 HOLTON FRENCH HORN REF: HOLTON 379 OR EQUAL 1 $1,942.00 14-21 days No Bid

19 YAMAHA EUHPHONIUM REF: YEP-201 OR EQUAL 1 $1,010.00 14-21 days No Bid

20 YAMAHA EUHPHONIUM REF: YEP-321S OR EQUAL 1 $1,375.00 14-21 days No Bid

21 BACH TENOR TROMBONE REF: BACH TB301 OR EQUAL 2 $386.00 14-21 days No Bid

22 BACH TENOR TROMBONE REF: BACH 36 BO OR EQUAL 2 $1,845.00 14-21 days No Bid

23 BACH TENOR TROMBONE REF: BACH 36 B OR EQUAL 2 $1,845.00 14-21 days No Bid

24 BACH TENOR TROMBONE REF: BACH 42 B OR EQUAL 2 $1,845.00 14-21 days No Bid

25 CERVENY TUBA REF: CBB 681-4 OR EQUAL 1 $3,427.00 14-21 days No Bid

26 YAMAHA TUBA REF: YBB - 105WC OR EQUAL 2 $1,769.00 14-21 days No Bid

27 KING SOUSAPHONE REF: 2370W OR EQUAL 2 $2,779.00 14-21 days No Bid

28 KING SOUSAPHONE REF: KING 2350W OR EQUAL 1 $3,916.00 14-21 days No Bid

29 KING SOUSAPHONE REF: 2350WSP OR EQUAL 1 $4,789.00 14-21 days No Bid

30 MUSSER ORCH BELLS REF: MUSSER M645 OR EQUAL 1 $805.00 14-21 days No Bid

31 PEARL PERCUSSION KITS REF: PK800 OR EQUAL 6 $184.00 14-21 days No Bid

32 YAMAHA CON BASS DRUM REF: CB640BFS7 OR EQUAL 1 $1,050.00 14-21 days No Bid

33 YAMAHA GLOCKENSPIEL REF: YG-250 OR EQUAL 1 $502.00 14-21 days No Bid

34 MC ADAMS METRONOME REF: 20X OR EQUAL 2 $579.00 14-21 days No Bid

35 DIGIMET DIGITAL METRONOME (OR EQUAL) 2 No Bid

36 PETERSONS STROBE TUNER REF: CS5000 Il OR EQUAL 1 No Bid
%OFF CATALOG PRICE 0% %OFF CATALOG PRICE 5%
%OFF LIST PRICE 0% %OFF LIST PRICE 5%
%OFF SHELF PRICE N/A %OFF SHELF PRICE 5%
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UNITED INDEPENDENT SCHOOL DISTRICT
BAND EQUIPMENT
RFP 2010-042

VENDOR STEVE WEISS MUSIC TAYLOR MUSIC
ITEM EST UISD . . UISD . )
MODEL / DESCRIPTION ory| price | EXT: ETA | R o e v | PRICE | EXT. BT A R e e
1 GEMEINHARDT PICCOLO REF; 4WSSK or Equal 1 No Bid $1,299.00 $1,299.00 15-30 days
2 GEMEINHARDT FLUTE REF: 2SP or Equal 4 No Bid $235.00 $940.00 10 days
3 YAMAHA FLUTE YFL-461H OR Equal 2 No Bid $1,069.00 $2,138.00 10 days
4 FOX OBOE REF: 330 or Equal 1 No Bid $2,849.00 $2,849.00 10 days
5 FOX BASSOON REF: FOX 51 or Equal 1 No Bid $3,439.00 $3,439.00 10-90 days
6 RIDENOUR Bb CLARINET REF: TR 147 or Equal 4 No Bid No Bid
7 BUFFET Bb CLARINET REF: E11 or Equal 2 No Bid $740.00 $1,480.00 10-30 days BC2501F-2-0
8 SELMER BASS CLARINET REF: 1430P or Equal 1 No Bid $1,205.00 $1,205.00 10 days
9 RIDENOUR BASS CLARINET REF: BC 147 or Equal 2 No Bid No Bid
10 VITO CONTRA- BASS CLARINET REF: 7182 or Equal 1 No Bid $3,019.00 $3,019.00 10-30 days
11 YAMAHA ALTO SAXOPHONE REF: YAS475 or Equal 2 No Bid $1,399.00 $2,798.00 10 days
12 YAMAHA ALTO SAXOPHONE REF: YAS-23 or Equal 3 No Bid $829.00 $2,487.00 10 days
13 YAMAHA TENOR SAX REF: YTS-23 or Equal 2 No Bid $1,029.00 $2,058.00 10 days
14 YAMAHA BARITONE SAX REF: YBS-52 or EQUAL 1 No Bid $3,429.00 $3,429.00 10 days
15 YAMAHA CORNET REF: YCR-2310 11 OR EQUAL 4 No Bid $515.00 $2,060.00 10 days
16 BACH TRUMPET REF: BACH 180S37 OR EQUAL 2 No Bid $1,616.00 $3,232.00 10 days
17 BACH CORNET REF: BACH 181 ML OR EQUAL 1 No Bid $1,569.00 $1,569.00 30-60 days
18 HOLTON FRENCH HORN REF: HOLTON 379 OR EQUAL 1 No Bid $1,919.00 $1,919.00 10 days
19 YAMAHA EUHPHONIUM REF: YEP-201 OR EQUAL 1 No Bid $1,000.00 $1,000.00 10 days
20 YAMAHA EUHPHONIUM REF: YEP-321S OR EQUAL 1 No Bid $1,349.00 $1,349.00 10 days
21 BACH TENOR TROMBONE REF: BACH TB301 OR EQUAL 2 No Bid $388.00 $776.00 10 days
22 BACH TENOR TROMBONE REF: BACH 36 BO OR EQUAL 2 No Bid $1,800.00 $3,600.00 10-30 days
23 BACH TENOR TROMBONE REF: BACH 36 B OR EQUAL 2 No Bid $1,800.00 $3,600.00 10-30 days
24 BACH TENOR TROMBONE REF: BACH 42 B OR EQUAL 2 No Bid $1,800.00 $3,600.00 10-30 days
25 CERVENY TUBA REF: CBB 681-4 OR EQUAL 1 No Bid No Bid
26 YAMAHA TUBA REF: YBB - 105WC OR EQUAL 2 No Bid $1,740.00 $3,480.00 10 days
27 KING SOUSAPHONE REF: 2370W OR EQUAL 2 No Bid $2,688.00 $5,376.00 10-15 days
28 KING SOUSAPHONE REF: KING 2350W OR EQUAL 1 No Bid $3,819.00 $3,819.00 10 days
29 KING SOUSAPHONE REF: 2350WSP OR EQUAL 1 No Bid $4,595.00 $4,595.00 10 days
30 MUSSER ORCH BELLS REF: MUSSER M645 OR EQUAL 1 $771.00 771.00 week $739.00 $739.00 10 days
31 PEARL PERCUSSION KITS REF: PK800 OR EQUAL 6 $133.99 803.94 week $179.00 $1,074.00 10 days
32 YAMAHA CON BASS DRUM REF: CB640BFS7 OR EQUAL 1 $1,179.11 1179.11 week Yamaha CB640BCS7 $1,249.00 $1,249.00 10-15 days CB64BCS7
33 YAMAHA GLOCKENSPIEL REF: YG-250 OR EQUAL 1 $459.98 459.98 week Yamaha YG-250d $490.00 $490.00 10 days
34 MC ADAMS METRONOME REF: 20X OR EQUAL 2 No Bid $569.00 $1,138.00 10 days
35 DIGIMET DIGITAL METRONOME (OR EQUAL) 2 No Bid $595.00 $1,190.00 10-15 days
36 PETERSONS STROBE TUNER REF: CS5000 Il OR EQUAL 1 No Bid $3,219.00 $3,219.00 10 days
%OFF CATALOG PRICE 0-20% %OFF CATALOG PRICE 0%
%OFF LIST PRICE 0-50% %OFF LIST PRICE 10-60%
%OFF SHELF PRICE 0-20% %OFF SHELF PRICE 0%
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UNITED INDEPENDENT SCHOOL DISTRICT
BAND EQUIPMENT
RFP 2010-042

VENDOR TEMPEST MUSIC WASHINGTON MUSIC CENTER
ITEM EST UISD . ; uIsD . ;
MODEL / DESCRIPTION orv| price | EXT ETA | S mepenenos | PRICE | EXT ETA | aovowyeoars o mespn
1 GEMEINHARDT PICCOLO REF; 4WSSK or Equal 1 $1,595.00 1595.00 30 days Tempest wood piccolo $1,182.00 $1,182.00 30 days
2 GEMEINHARDT FLUTE REF: 2SP or Equal 4 No Bid $220.00 $880.00 30 days
3 YAMAHA FLUTE YFL-461H OR Equal 2 $795.00 1590.00 Immediate Tempest flute, model 600 $1,040.00 $2,080.00 30 days
4 FOX OBOE REF: 330 or Equal 1 | $1,595.00 1595.00 30 days Tempest oboe $2,890.00 $2,890.00 90 days
5 FOX BASSOON REF: FOX 51 or Equal 1 $3,495.00 3495.00 30 days Tempest wood bassoon $3,455.00 $3,455.00 30 days
6 RIDENOUR Bb CLARINET REF: TR 147 or Equal 4 $495.00 1980.00 30 days Tempest Trek clarinet $230.00 $920.00 30 days Jupiter 631NM
7 BUFFET Bb CLARINET REF: E11 or Equal 2 $995.00 1990.00 Immediate Tempest wood clarinet $787.00 $1,574.00 30 days
8 SELMER BASS CLARINET REF: 1430P or Equal 1 | $1,595.00 1595.00 30 days Tempest Low Eb Bass clarinet | $1,210.00 $1,210.00 30 days
9 RIDENOUR BASS CLARINET REF: BC 147 or Equal 2 $1,995.00 3990.00 30 days Tempest Low-C Bass clarinet | $926.00 $1,852.00 30 days Jupiter 673 BN
10 VITO CONTRA- BASS CLARINET REF: 7182 or Equal 1 No Bid $3,018.00 $3,018.00 30 days
11 YAMAHA ALTO SAXOPHONE REF: YAS475 or Equal 2 $1,095.00 2190.00 Immediate Tempest alto saxophone $1,381.00 $2,762.00 30 days
12 YAMAHA ALTO SAXOPHONE REF: YAS-23 or Equal 3 $1,095.00 3285.00 Immediate Tempest alto saxophone $808.00 $2,424.00 30 days
13 YAMAHA TENOR SAX REF: YTS-23 or Equal 2 $1,295.00 2590.00 30 days Tempest tenor saxophone $1,018.00 $2,036.00 30 days
14 YAMAHA BARITONE SAX REF: YBS-52 or EQUAL 1 | $2,995.00 2995.00 30 days Tempest bari saxophone $3,421.00 $3,421.00 30 days
15 YAMAHA CORNET REF: YCR-2310 11 OR EQUAL 4 No Bid $489.00 $1,956.00 30 days
16 BACH TRUMPET REF: BACH 180537 OR EQUAL 2 $895.00 1790.00 Immediate | Tempest silver plated trumpet | $1,603.00 $3,206.00 30 days
17 BACH CORNET REF: BACH 181 ML OR EQUAL 1 No Bid $1,560.00 $1,560.00 30 days
18 HOLTON FRENCH HORN REF: HOLTON 379 OR EQUAL 1 | $1,995.00 1995.00 30 days Tempest double horn $1,913.00 $1,913.00 30 days
19 YAMAHA EUHPHONIUM REF: YEP-201 OR EQUAL 1 $895.00 895.00 30 days Tempest euphonium $985.00 $985.00 30 days
20 YAMAHA EUHPHONIUM REF: YEP-321S OR EQUAL 1 $895.00 895.00 30 days Tempest euphonium $1,345.00 $1,345.00 30 days
21 BACH TENOR TROMBONE REF: BACH TB301 OR EQUAL 2 No Bid $369.00 $738.00 30 days
22 BACH TENOR TROMBONE REF: BACH 36 BO OR EQUAL 2 | $1,195.00 2390.00 Immediate | Tempest trombone w/F attach. | $1,792.00 $3,584.00 30 days
23 BACH TENOR TROMBONE REF: BACH 36 B OR EQUAL 2 | $1,195.00 2390.00 Immediate | Tempest trombone w/F attach. | $1,792.00 $3,584.00 30 days
24 BACH TENOR TROMBONE REF: BACH 42 B OR EQUAL 2 | $1,195.00 2390.00 Immediate | Tempest trombone w/F attach. | $1,792.00 $3,584.00 30 days
25 CERVENY TUBA REF: CBB 681-4 OR EQUAL 1 | $2,995.00 2995.00 30 days Tempest rotory tuba $3,614.00 $3,614.00 30 days
26 YAMAHA TUBA REF: YBB - 105WC OR EQUAL 2 No Bid $1,730.00 $3,460.00 30 days
27 KING SOUSAPHONE REF: 2370W OR EQUAL 2 No Bid $2,677.00 $5,354.00 30 days
28 KING SOUSAPHONE REF: KING 2350W OR EQUAL 1 No Bid $3,821.00 $3,821.00 30 days
29 KING SOUSAPHONE REF: 2350WSP OR EQUAL 1 No Bid $4,598.00 $4,598.00 30 days
30 MUSSER ORCH BELLS REF: MUSSER M645 OR EQUAL 1 No Bid $738.00 $738.00 30 days
31 PEARL PERCUSSION KITS REF: PK800 OR EQUAL 6 No Bid $149.00 $894.00 30 days
32 YAMAHA CON BASS DRUM REF: CB640BFS7 OR EQUAL 1 No Bid $1,123.00 $1,123.00 45 days
33 YAMAHA GLOCKENSPIEL REF: YG-250 OR EQUAL 1 No Bid $297.00 $297.00 30 days
34 MC ADAMS METRONOME REF: 20X OR EQUAL 2 No Bid $589.00 $1,178.00 30 days
35 DIGIMET DIGITAL METRONOME (OR EQUAL) 2 No Bid $659.00 $1,318.00 30 days
36 PETERSONS STROBE TUNER REF: CS5000 Il OR EQUAL 1 No Bid $3,397.00 $3,397.00 30 days
%OFF CATALOG PRICE No Bid %OFF CATALOG PRICE No Bid
%OFF LIST PRICE No Bid %OFF LIST PRICE No Bid
%OFF SHELF PRICE No Bid %OFF SHELF PRICE No Bid
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UNITED INDEPENDENT SCHOOL DISTRICT
BAND EQUIPMENT
RFP 2010-042

VENDOR WOODWIND AND BRASSWIND
ITEM EST UISD . ’
MODEL / DESCRIPTION orv| price | BT ETA | someyouareising et
1 GEMEINHARDT PICCOLO REF; 4WSSK or Equal 1 $1,316.00 1316.00 14-30 days
2 GEMEINHARDT FLUTE REF: 2SP or Equal 4 $258.00 1032.00 14-30 days
3 YAMAHA FLUTE YFL-461H OR Equal 2 $1,103.00 2206.00 14-30 days
4 FOX OBOE REF: 330 or Equal 1 $3,050.00 3050.00 14-30 days
5 FOX BASSOON REF: FOX 51 or Equal 1 $3,609.00 3609.00 14-30 days
6 RIDENOUR Bb CLARINET REF: TR 147 or Equal 4 No Bid
7 BUFFET Bb CLARINET REF: E11 or Equal 2 No Bid
8 SELMER BASS CLARINET REF: 1430P or Equal 1 $1,426.00 1426.00 14-30 days Selmer 1430LP
9 RIDENOUR BASS CLARINET REF: BC 147 or Equal 2 $1,550.00 3100.00 14-30 days Yamaha YCL221 11
10 VITO CONTRA- BASS CLARINET REF: 7182 or Equal 1 $3,430.00 3430.00 14-30 days
11 YAMAHA ALTO SAXOPHONE REF: YAS475 or Equal 2 $1,460.00 2920.00 14-30 days
12 YAMAHA ALTO SAXOPHONE REF: YAS-23 or Equal 3 $880.00 2640.00 14-30 days
13 YAMAHA TENOR SAX REF: YTS-23 or Equal 2 $1,080.00 2160.00 14-30 days
14 YAMAHA BARITONE SAX REF: YBS-52 or EQUAL 1 $3,580.00 3580.00 14-30 days
15 YAMAHA CORNET REF: YCR-2310 Il OR EQUAL 4 $530.00 2120.00 30-45 days
16 BACH TRUMPET REF: BACH 180S37 OR EQUAL 2 $1,825.00 3650.00 14-30 days
17 BACH CORNET REF: BACH 181 ML OR EQUAL 1 $1,790.00 1790.00 30-45 days
18 HOLTON FRENCH HORN REF: HOLTON 379 OR EQUAL 1 $2,201.00 2201.00 14-30 days
19 YAMAHA EUHPHONIUM REF: YEP-201 OR EQUAL 1 $1,040.00 1040.00 14-30 days
20 YAMAHA EUHPHONIUM REF: YEP-321S OR EQUAL 1 $1,415.00 1415.00 14-30 days
21 BACH TENOR TROMBONE REF: BACH TB301 OR EQUAL 2 $440.00 880.00 14-30 days
22 BACH TENOR TROMBONE REF: BACH 36 BO OR EQUAL 2 $2,040.00 4080.00 14-30 days
23 BACH TENOR TROMBONE REF: BACH 36 B OR EQUAL 2 $2,040.00 4080.00 14-30 days
24 BACH TENOR TROMBONE REF: BACH 42 B OR EQUAL 2 $2,040.00 4080.00 14-30 days
25 CERVENY TUBA REF: CBB 681-4 OR EQUAL 1 $3,540.00 3540.00 30-45 days
26 YAMAHA TUBA REF: YBB - 105WC OR EQUAL 2 $1,960.00 3920.00 14-30 days
27 KING SOUSAPHONE REF: 2370W OR EQUAL 2 $3,170.00 6340.00 30 days
28 KING SOUSAPHONE REF: KING 2350W OR EQUAL 1 $4,470.00 4470.00 30 days
29 KING SOUSAPHONE REF: 2350WSP OR EQUAL 1 $5,350.00 5350.00 30 days
30 MUSSER ORCH BELLS REF: MUSSER M645 OR EQUAL 1 $850.00 850.00 14-30 days
31 PEARL PERCUSSION KITS REF: PK800 OR EQUAL 6 $180.00 1080.00 14 days
32 YAMAHA CON BASS DRUM REF: CB640BFS7 OR EQUAL 1 $1,290.00 1290.00 30 days ‘Yamaha CB640BCS7
33 YAMAHA GLOCKENSPIEL REF: YG-250 OR EQUAL 1 $470.00 470.00 14 days
34 MC ADAMS METRONOME REF: 20X OR EQUAL 2 No Bid
35 DIGIMET DIGITAL METRONOME (OR EQUAL) 2 No Bid
36 PETERSONS STROBE TUNER REF: CS5000 Il OR EQUAL 1 $3,190.00 3190.00 30 days

%OFF CATALOG PRICE

3%

%OFF LIST PRICE

%OFF SHELF PRICE
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