
UNIT (CASE) PRICE EXT.PRICE NOTES UNIT PRICE EXT.PRICE NOTES UNIT PRICE EXT.PRICE NOTES

BREAD BAGS
A 40 CS POLYPROPYLENE CLEAR BAGS 1000/CASE NO BID NO BID NO BID

FLAVOR SEAL BAGS
A 50 CS FLAVORSEAL Bags  10" X 24" - 400/Case $100.71 $5,035.50 BB11-1024C NO BID $120.00 $4,800.00 500/CS
B 125 CS FLAVORSEAL Bags  10" X 30" - 400/Case $120.07 $15,008.75 BB11-1030C NO BID $114.00 $14,250.00
C 75CS COLD BAGS 5.25 X 10.25 5000/CASE NO BID $92.60 $2,315.00 NO BID
D 300CS OVENABLE MULTI VENT HOT BAGS 5000/CASE NO BID $278.35 $6,958.75 NO BID
E 180CS OVENABLE HOT BAGS 4.5X90 5000/CASE NO BID $265.00 $6,625.00 NO BID
F 50 RLS COLD TAPE NO BID $248.00 $2,480.00 96 ROLL/ PACK NO BID
G 50 RLS HOT TAPE NO BID $345.60 $3,456.00 96 ROLL/ PACK NO BID

1 10 CS PLAS-TIES Part #312B 2000' X 5/32 - 5/Case NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
2 5 CS LABEL Tape - 12/Case $123.00 $615.00 NO BID NO BID $162.00 $810.00
3 5 UNITS TIE-MATIC Machine NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
4 20 CS C & K CLIPS - 25,000/Case $443.75 $8,875.00 NO BID NO BID 456..25 $9,125.00

VENDORS 

SECTION II -   SUPPLIES: SPOOLS, TIES, & CLIPS

SECTION I - BAGS

          UNITED INDEPENDENT SCHOOL DISTRICT 
          FOOD BAGGING SUPPLIES 

          RFP NO. 051-2009

CARROLL MANUFACTURING & SALES EKON-O-PAC PAN SAVER 


