UNITED INDEPENDENT SCHOOL DISTRICT
RFP 028-2009
BAND EQUIPMENT

BROOK MAYS
CASCIO HILLJE MUSIC LONE STAR ELMO LOPEZ MUSIC
SECTION Il VENDOR UNIVER’\AAJS:\/éELODY INTERSTATE MUSIC CENTER PERCUSSION co MMI MUSIC MAN INC. NEMC (A) NEMC (B)
EST UNIT UNIT UNIT UNIT UNIT UNIT UNIT UNIT
ITEM MODEL / DESCRIPTION oTY NIT PRICI EXT PRICE EXT PRICE EXT PRICE EXT PRICE EXT PRICE EXT PRICE EXT PRICE EXT PRICE EXT
1 PEARL FLUTE REF; 665RBIRB or Equal 2 NO BID $696.00 | $1,392.00 NO BID NO BID $1,219.00 2,438.00 NO BID $640.00 $1,280.00 NO BID
2 YAMAHA PICCOLO REF: YPC32 or Equal 1 $400.00 $400.00 $462.00 $462.00 $465.00 $465.00 NO BID $1,315.00 1,315.00 $489.00 $489.00 $464.00 $464.00 $465.00 $465.00 $370.00 DNMS
3 BUFFET R13 Bb CLARINET REF: BC1131-5-0 or Equal 2 | $2,200.00 | $4,400.00 | $2,076.00 | $4,152.00 | $2,100.00 | $4,200.00 NO BID $3,100.00 | $6,200.00 | $1,952.00 | $3,904.00 | $1,999.00 | $3,998.00 | $3.938.00 | $7,876.00 NO BID
4 YAMAHA BASS CLARINET REF: YCL221 or Equal 2 | $1,500.00 | $3,000.00 1,391.00 | $2,782.00 1,429.00 | $2,858.00 NO BID $2,000.00 4,000.00 1,407.00 | $2,814.00 | $1,399.00 2,798.00 5,048.00 | $10,096.00 | $4,749.00 9,498.00
5 FOX OBOE REF: FOX 400 or Equal 2 | $5,000.00 | $10,000.00 | $4,680.00 | $9,360.00 | $5,000.00 | $10,000.00 NO BID $5,000.00 | $10,000.00 1,846.00 DNMS 34,672.00 9,344.00 34,072.00 8,144.00 34,685.00 9,370.00
6 FOX BASSOON REF: FOX IVor Equal 2 $4,400.00 | $8,800.00 | $4,149.00 | $8,298.00 | $4,395.00 | $8,790.00 NO BID $5,200.00 | $10,400.00 | $4,140.00 | $8,280.00 34,149.00 8,298.00 | $3,898.00 7,796.00 $4,173.00 8,346.00
7 YAMAHA ALTO SAX REF: YAS- 475 or Equal 2 $700.00 DNMS 1,320.00 | $2,640.00 | $1,350.00 | $2,700.00 NO BID $2,100.00 4,200.00 1,342.00 2,684.00 1,324.00 2,648.00 1,504.00 | $3,008.00 | $1,335.00 2,670.00
8 YANIGASAWA TENOR SAX REF: T901 SERIES or Equal 2 | $2570.00 | $5,140.00 | $2,189.00 | $4,378.00 NOBID NO BID $4,000.00 | $8,000.00 2,243.00 4,486.00 | $2,192.00 4,384.00 | $2,192.00 4,384.00 | $1,899.00 DNMS
9 BARITONE SAX REF: YBS- 52 or Equal 1 | $2,500.00 DNMS $3,269.00 | $3,269.00 | $3,350.00 | $3,350.00 NO BID $4,900.00 4,900.00 | $3,262.00 3,262.00 3,272.00 3,272.00 | $3,239.00 | $3,239.00 NO BID
10 YAMAHA TRUMPET - XENO REF: YTR833RG or Equal 3 NO BID 1,337.00 | $4,011.00 | $1,450.00 | $4,350.00 NO BID $2,500.00 7,500.00 1,347.00 4,041.00 | $1,333.00 | $3,999.00 | $1,335.00 4,005.00 | $1,409.00 | $4,227.00
11 HOLTON FRENCH HORN REF: H179 or Equal 4 | $2,800.00 | $11,200.00 | $2,406.00 | $9,624.00 NOBID NO BID $4,000.00 | $16,000.00 2,441.00 9,764.00 | $2,285.00 9,140.00 2,284.00 9,136.00 NO BID
12 BACH TROMBONE REF: 42 BO STRAD 4 | $2,108.00 | $8,432.00 1,795.00 | $7,180.00 NO BID NO BID $3,000.00 | $12,000.00 1,842.00 7,368.00 1,799.00 7,196.00 1,793.00 7,172.00 NO BID
13 YAMAHA EUPHONIUM REF: YEP321 or Equal 3 1,400.00 DNMS 1,602.00 | $4,806.00 | $1,635.00 | $4,905.00 NO BID $3,000.00 | $9,000.00 | $1,618.00 4,854.00 | $1,608.00 4,824.00 1,716.00 5,148.00 NO BID
14 BACH B TROMBONE REF: 50BL30 LACQUER OPEN WRAP STRA 2 3,400.00 | $6,800.00 | $2,924.00 | $5,848.00 NOBID NO BID $4,500.00 | $9,000.00 | $2,983.00 | $5,966.00 | $2,933.00 | $5,866.00 | $2,920.00 5,840.00 NO BID
15 CERVENY TUBA REF: CBB 6864 MR or Equal 3 $4,540.00 | $13,620.00 | $3,635.00 | $10,905.00 NO BID NO BID $5,000.00 | $15,000.00 NO BID NO BID 3,949.00 | $11,847.00 | $3,598.00 | $10,794.00
16 YAMAHA MARCHING F HORN REF: YHR- 302M EQUAL 3 NO BID 1,132.00 | $3,396.00 | $1,150.00 | $3,450.00 NO BID NOBID | $1,156.00 | $3,468.00 1,142.00 | $3,426.00 | $1,131.00 | $3,393.00 NO BID
17 YAMAHA MARCH BARITONE REF: MBH 1124 OR EQUAL 3 NO BID 1,358.00 | $4,074.00 | $1,345.00 | $4,035.00 NO BID NO BID $996.00 DNMS $1,299.00 | $3,897.00 | $1,166.00 | $3,498.00 NO BID
18 KING SOUSAPHONES REF: 2350W OR EQUAL 3 | $4,589.00 | $13,767.00 | $3,906.00 | $11,718.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID $4,021.00 | $12,063.00 3,534.00 | $10,602.00 | $3,509.00 | $10,527.00 NO BID
19 20" ADAMS PRO SERIES TIMP REF: ADM- PRKG- 20 OR EQUAL | 1 NO BID 1,986.00 | $1,986.00 NOBID | $1,865.38 $1,865.38 NO BID 1,934.00 1,934.00 1,941.00 1,941.00 1,757.00 1,757.00 | $1,516.00 DNMS
20 23" ADAMS PRO SERIES TIMP REF: ADM- PRKG- 23 OR EQUAL | 1 NO BID 2,086.00 | $2,086.00 NOBID 1,957.56 1,957.56 NOBID | $2,021.00 2,021.00 | $2,039.00 2,039.00 1,946.00 1,946.00 | $1,599.00 DNMS
21 26" ADAMS PRO SERIES TIMP REF: ADM- PRKG- 26 OR EQUAL | 1 NO BID 2,116.00 | $2,116.00 NOBID | $1,990.02 1,990.02 NO BID 2,044.00 2,044.00 | $2,068.00 2,068.00 1,974.00 1,974.00 1,671.00 DNMS
22 29" ADAMS PRO SERIES TIMP REF: ADM- PRKG- 29 OR EQUAL | 1 NO BID 2,327.00 | $2,327.00 NOBID 2,187.00 2,187.00 NO BID 2,278.00 2,278.00 2,273.00 2,273.00 2,179.00 2,179.00 | $1,860.00 DNMS
23 32" ADAMS PRO SERIES TIMP REF: ADM- PRKG- 32 OR EQUAL | 1 NO BID 2,388.00 | $2,388.00 NOBID 2,243.84 2,243.84 NO BID 2,343.00 2,343.00 | $2,332.00 2,332.00 | $2,239.00 2,239.00 | $1,998.00 DNMS
24 6.5" X 14" BLACK SWAMP CON SNARE REF: BLA- MS6514RD OR 1 | $1,530.00 | $1,530.00 NO BID NO BID $754.33 $754.33 NO BID $849.00 $849.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID
25 YAMAHA / DEAGAN 2.5 OCT SYMP BELLS REF: YAM- DG1590A{ 2 | $1,000.00 | DNMS $1,204.00 | $2,408.00 NOBID | $1,253.55 $2,507.10 NOBID | $1,284.00 | $2,568.00 | $1,221.00 | $2,442.00 | $1,240.00 | $2,480.00 NO BID
26 PEARL 5 PIEC VMX VISION D.SET W/ TERRACOTTAFINREF: P| 1 NO BID $782.00 $782.00 NO BID $908.55 $908.55 NO BID NO BID NO BID $639.00 $639.00 NO BID
27 PEARL DSET HARDWARE PACK REF: PEA- HWP1000 OR EQUAL 1 NO BID $367.00 $367.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $180.00 $180.00 NO BID
28 GIBRALTER EXT HEIGHT SNARE ST REF: GIB- 5606EX OR EQU] 1 NO BID $46.57 $46.57 NO BID $57.51 $57.51 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
29 ULTRA X TYPE STYLE KEYBOARD /BELL ST REF: KAM-KKS70| 2 NO BID NOBID NOBID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
30 YAMAHA 3.5 OCT ACOUSTALON XYLO REF: YAM- YXRD335C 1 NO BID 2,486.00 | $2,486.00 NOBID | $2,668.60 $2,668.60 NO BID 2,577.00 2,577.00 2,584.00 2,584.00 2,624.00 2,624.00 NO BID
31 YAMAHA 3.0 OCT SILVER STUDIO VIBES REF: YAM- YVRD2700] 1 NO BID 3,704.00 | $3,704.00 NOBID 3,912.42 3,912.42 NO BID 3,771.00 3,771.00 3,798.00 3,798.00 | $3,869.00 | $3,869.00 NO BID
32 YAMAHA 4.5 OCT RWOOD MARIMBA REF: YAM- YVRD2700C O] 1 |$12,000.00] $12,000.00 | $8,376.00 | $8,376.00 NOBID 8,834.84 8,834.84 NO BID 8,349.00 8,349.00 8,471.00 8,471.00 | $8,363.00 | $8,363.00 NO BID
33 8" PEARL P-HARMONIC CON TOM REF: PEA- PTA0808S OR EQYU 1 NO BID 167.00 167.00 NOBID 176.48 176.48 NO BID 174.00 174.00 168.00 168.00 156.00 156.00 NO BID
34 10" PEARL P-HARMONIC CON TOM REF: PEA-PTA1010SOREQ| 1 NO BID 182.00 182.00 NOBID 193.23 193.23 NO BID 197.00 197.00 182.00 182.00 169.00 169.00 NO BID
35 12" PEARL P-HARMONIC CON TOM REF: PEA-PTA1210SOREQ( 1 NO BID 206.00 206.00 NOBID 220.50 220.50 NO BID 209.00 209.00 206.00 206.00 193.00 193.00 NO BID
36 14" PEARL P-HARMONIC CON TOM REF: PEA-PTA1412SOREQ| 1 NO BID 246.00 246.00 NOBID 260.41 260.41 NO BID 246.00 246.00 242.00 242.00 228.00 228.00 NO BID
37 PEARL DOUBLE TOM STAND REF: PEA- T1000 OR EQUAL 2 NO BID 121.00 242.00 NOBID 117.97 235.94 NO BID 114.00 228.00 115.00 230.00 101.00 202.00 NO BID
38 40" ZILDJIAN ORCH SERIES GONG REF: ZIL-59312 OR EQUAL | 1 | $1,380.00 | $1,380.00 864.00 864.00 NOBID | $1,137.13 $1,137.13 NO BID 917.00 917.00 860.00 860.00 858.00 858.00 NO BID
39 ZILDJIAN GONG ST W/ WHEELS REF: ZIL- P0560 OR EQUAL 1 $180.00 $180.00 119.00 119.00 NO BID $163.46 $163.46 NO BID 139.00 139.00 126.00 126.00 117.00 117.00 NO BID
40 40" LUDWIG CON B DRUM REF: LUD- LECB40OXXWF-GOREQU{ 1 | $1,177.00 | $1,177.00 821.00 821.00 NOBID | $1,030.84 | $1,030.84 NO BID 794.00 794.00 751.00 751.00 $1,161.00 | $1,161.00 NO BID
41 LUDWIG SUSPENED CON B DRUM ST REF: LUD- LE788 OR EQU| 1 $639.00 $639.00 $446.00 446.00 NO BID 566.01 $566.01 NO BID 447.00 $447.00 408.00 5408.00 N/A NO BID NO BID
42 14" PEARL CHAMPIONSHIP M SNARE REF: PEA- FFX1412/A-166| 6 NO BID $471.00 | $2,826.00 NOBID 435.42 $2,612.52 NO BID 434.00 2,604.00 369.00 2,214.00 435.00 2,610.00 NO BID
43 PEARL CHAMPIONSHIP M SNARE CARRIER REF: PEA-RM-MV| 6 NO BID 249.00 1,494.00 NOBID 240.30 1,441.80 NO BID 227.00 1,362.00 238.00 1,428.00 228.00 1,368.00 NO BID
44 PEARL CHAMPIONSHIP M TENOR REF: PEA- PMT660234/A-166 (3 NO BID $1,027.00 | $3,081.00 NO BID 799.88 2,399.64 NO BID 981.00 2,943.00 936.00 2,808.00 969.00 2,907.00 NO BID
45 PEARL CHAMPIONSHIP M TENOR CARRIER REF: PEA- RM-M: 3 NO BID 297.00 891.00 NOBID 287.24 861.72 NO BID 289.00 867.00 285.00 855.00 273.00 819.00 NO BID
46 18" PEARL CHAMPIONSHIP M BASS DRUM REF: PEA- PBD1814/4 1 NO BID $449.00 449.00 NOBID 406.36 5406.36 NO BID 413.00 $413.00 364.00 364.00 404.00 $404.00 NO BID
47 20" PEARL CHAMPIONSHIP M BASS DRUM REF: PEA- PBD2014/4 1 NO BID $473.00 473.00 NOBID 433.65 $433.65 NO BID 443.00 $443.00 384.00 384.00 431.00 $431.00 NO BID
48 22" PEARL CHAMPIONSHIP M BASS DRUM REF: PEA- PBD2214/4 1 NO BID $483.00 483.00 NOBID 452.07 $452.07 NO BID 456.00 $456.00 506.00 506.00 441.00 $441.00 NO BID
49 24" PEARL CHAMPIONSHIP M BASS DRUM REF: PEA- PBD2414/4 1 NO BID 517.00 517.00 NOBID 490.13 $490.13 NO BID 499.00 $499.00 428.00 $428.00 476.00 $476.00 NO BID
50 28" PEARL CHAMPIONSHIP M BASS DRUM REF: PEA- PBD2814/4 1 NO BID 577.00 577.00 NOBID 556.69 556.69 NO BID 563.00 563.00 498.00 $498.00 532.00 532.00 NO BID
51 PEARL CHAMPIONSHIP M BASS DRUM CARRIER REF: PEA-RN 5 NO BID 231.00 | $1,155.00 NO BID 221.53 $1,107.65 NO BID 214.00 $1,070.00 224.00 $1,120.00 209.00 $1,045.00 NO BID
52 88-KEY KEYBOARD WORKSTATION SYNTH REF: KORG TR-88| 1 NO BID NOBID NOBID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
53 88-KEY KEYBOARD CASE W/ WHEELS REF: SKB-5820W OREQU 1 NO BID $288.00 $288.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
54 IBANEZ 4 STR BASS GUITAR REF: GSR200FM OR EQUAL 1 NO BID $219.00 $219.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
55 MUSICIANS GEAR DELUXE BASS GUITAR CASE REF MG540946| 1 NO BID NOBID NOBID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
56 PRO WIRED ULTIMATE FIELD PA SYSTEM REF: YAM-5000302q 1 NO BID NOBID NOBID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
57 11"&12" LATIN PERC ASPIRE WOOD CONGAS W/ ST REF: LP-1] 1 NO BID 284.00 284.00 NOBID 296.52 296.52 NO BID 267.00 267.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID
58 LATIN PERC MATADOR BONGO REF: LP-M201- RW OR EQUAL | 1 NO BID 113.00 113.00 NOBID 118.16 118.16 NO BID 129.00 129.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID
59 LATIN PERC BONGO STAND REF: LP-LP330 OR EQUAL 1 NO BID 104.00 104.00 NOBID 118.16 118.16 NO BID 113.00 113.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID
60 CONCERT CYMBAL CRADLE REF: GIB- 7614 OR EQUAL 1 NO BID $59.44 $59.44 NO BID $62.94 $62.94 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
61 PEARL BOOM CYMBAL STAND REF: PEA- B900 OR EQUAL 6 $80.00 $480.00 $55.93 335.58 NO BID $63.46 380.76 NO BID $56.00 336.00 $65.00 390.00 $47.00 282.00 NO BID
62 ZILDJIAN 13.25" K CUSTOM HI HAT CYMBALS REF: K12130REH 1 393.00 393.00 262.00 262.00 NOBID 256.28 256.28 NO BID 249.00 249.00 243.00 243.00 249.00 249.00 NO BID
63 ZILDJIAN 19" K MED THIN DARK CRASH CYMBAL REF: K0905{ 1 319.00 319.00 214.00 214.00 NOBID 208.54 208.54 NO BID 211.00 211.00 202.00 202.00 154.75 154.75 NO BID
64 ZILDJIAN 16" KMED THIN DARK CRASH CYMBAL REF: K0902 1 251.00 251.00 169.00 169.00 NOBID 164.72 164.72 NO BID 173.00 173.00 161.00 161.00 160.90 160.90 NO BID
65 ZILDJIAN 17" A CUSTOM MED CRASH CYMBALS REF: A20827Q 1 241.00 241.00 163.00 163.00 NOBID 158.76 158.76 NO BID 167.00 167.00 154.00 154.00 155.00 155.00 NO BID
66 ZILDJIAN 15" A CUSTOM BRILLIANT CRASH CYMBAL REF: A2| 1 199.00 199.00 136.00 136.00 NOBID 130.54 130.54 NO BID 134.00 134.00 129.00 129.00 129.00 129.00 NO BID
67 ZILDJIAN 22" K CUSTOM MED RIDE CYMBAL REF: K0967 ORE| 1 417.00 $417.00 277.00 277.00 NOBID 272.48 272.48 NO BID 267.00 267.00 261.00 261.00 263.00 263.00 NO BID
68 ZILDJIAN 20" CLASSIC ORCH SUSPEND CYMABAL REF: A0421{ 1 319.00 319.00 201.00 201.00 NOBID 210.52 210.52 NO BID 214.00 214.00 202.00 202.00 202.00 202.00 NO BID
69 ZILDJIAN 18" STADIUM MED PAIR CRASH CYMBALS REP: A044 5 475.00 | $2,375.00 282.00 | $1,410.00 NO BID 302.96 $1,514.80 NO BID 296.00 $1,480.00 296.00 $1,480.00 296.00 $1,480.00 NO BID
70 ZILDJAIN 20" SYMPHONIC VIENESE PAIR CRASH CYMBALSRY 1 543.00 $543.00 339.00 $339.00 NO BID 356.28 $356.28 NO BID 339.00 $339.00 338.00 $338.00 299.00 $299.00 NO BID

*DNMS = Does not meet specifications
**Three (3) vendors submitted a "No Bid"




UNITED INDEPENDENT SCHOOL DISTRICT

RFP 028-2009

BAND EQUIPMENT

NORTHEAST MUSIC PERIPOLE - WASHINGTON MUSIC | FREDERIC H WEINER | STEVE WEISS MUSIC WOODWIND AND
SECTION Il VENDOR INC BERGERAULT TAYLOR MUSIC INC. THE BAND SHOP CENTER INC INC BRASSWIND
EST UNIT UNIT UNIT UNIT UNIT UNIT UNIT UNIT
ITEM MODEL / DESCRIPTION ory| PrICE EXT PRICE EXT PRICE EXT PRICE EXT PRICE EXT PRICE EXT PRICE EXT PRICE EXT
1 PEARL FLUTE REF; 665RBIRB or Equal 2 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $749.00 $1,498.00 NO BID NO BID $780.00 $1,560.00
2 YAMAHA PICCOLO REF: YPC32 or Equal 1 $472.00 $472.00 NO BID $509.00 $509.00 NO BID $461.00 $461.00 $477.00 $477.00 NO BID $520.00 $520.00
3 BUFFET R13 Bb CLARINET REF: BC1131-5-0 or Equal 2 NOBID NOBID 2,044.00 34,088.00 NOBID 2,179.00 34,358.00 1,940.00 | $3,880.00 NO BID 2,410.00 4,820.00
4 YAMAHA BASS CLARINET REF: YCL221 or Equal 2 | $1,426.00 | $2,852.00 NO BID 1,525.00 | $3,050.00 NO BID 1,386.00 2,772.00 1,429.00 2,858.00 NOBID | $1,550.00 3,100.00
5 FOX OBOE REF: FOX 400 or Equal 2 NOBID NOBID 4,727.00 9,454.00 NO BID 4,679.00 | $9,358.00 54,695.00 | $9,390.00 NO BID 54,750.00 | $9,500.00
6 FOX BASSOON REF: FOX IVor Equal 2 NOBID NOBID 4,197.00 8,394.00 NO BID 4,144.00 |  $8,288.00 54,165.00 | $8,330.00 NO BID $4,500.00 | $9,000.00
7 YAMAHA ALTO SAX REF: YAS- 475 or Equal 2 | $1,361.00 | $2,722.00 NO BID 1,443.00 | $2,886.00 NO BID 1,316.00 2,632.00 1,349.00 2,698.00 NO BID 1,425.00 2,850.00
8 YANIGASAWA TENOR SAX REF: T901 SERIES or Equal 2 NOBID NOBID 2,439.00 34,878.00 NOBID 2,136.00 $4,272.00 | $2,299.00 4,598.00 NOBID | $2,510.00 | $5,020.00
9 BARITONE SAX REF: YBS- 52 or Equal 1 3,378.00 | $3,378.00 NO BID 3,474.00 3,474.00 NOBID $3,258.00 | $3,258.00 3,375.00 3,375.00 NO BID 3,450.00 3,450.00
10 YAMAHA TRUMPET - XENO REF: YTR833RG or Equal 3 1,479.00 | $4,437.00 NOBID NOBID NOBID 1,432.00 34,296.00 1,375.00 4,125.00 NO BID 1,450.00 4,350.00
11 HOLTON FRENCH HORN REF: H179 or Equal 4 2,541.00 | $10,164.00 NOBID 2,522.00 | $10,088.00 NO BID 2,230.00 | $8,920.00 | $2539.00 | $10,156.00 NO BID 2,750.00 | $11,000.00
12 BACH TROMBONE REF: 42 BO STRAD 4 NOBID NOBID 1,980.00 7,920.00 NOBID 1,751.00 7,004.00 | $1,890.00 7,560.00 NOBID | $2,100.00 8,400.00
13 YAMAHA EUPHONIUM REF: YEP321 or Equal 3 | $1,648.00 | $4,944.00 NO BID 1,744.00 | $5,232.00 NO BID 1,597.00 $4,791.00 | $1,699.00 5,097.00 NO BID 1,750.00 | $5,250.00
14 BACH B TROMBONE REF: 50BL30 LACQUER OPEN WRAP STRA 2 NOBID NOBID 3,246.00 6,492.00 NOBID 2,852.00 DNMS $3,050.00 6,100.00 NOBID | $3,225.00 6,450.00
15 CERVENY TUBA REF: CBB 6864 MR or Equal 3 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 4,149.00 | $12,447.00 NO BID NOBID | $3,500.00 | $10,500.00
16 YAMAHA MARCHING F HORN REF: YHR- 302M EQUAL 3 | $1,165.00 | $3,495.00 NO BID $1,255.00 | $3,765.00 NO BID 1,129.00 | $3,387.00 | $1,169.00 | $3,507.00 NOBID | $1,300.00 | $3,900.00
17 YAMAHA MARCH BARITONE REF: MBH 1124 OR EQUAL 3 | $1,488.00 | $4,464.00 NOBID NOBID NO BID 1,259.00 | $3,777.00 NO BID NOBID | $1,550.00 | $3,100.00
18 KING SOUSAPHONES REF: 2350W OR EQUAL 3 NO BID NO BID 4,222.00 | $12,666.00 NO BID 3,430.00 | $10,290.00 NO BID NO BID $4,300.00 | $12,900.00
19 20" ADAMS PRO SERIES TIMP REF: ADM- PRKG- 20 OR EQUAL | 1 NO BID NO BID 2,150.00 | $2,150.00 NO BID 2,002.00 | $2,002.00 NOBID | $9,704.00 | $9,704.00 2,075.00 2,075.00
20 23" ADAMS PRO SERIES TIMP REF: ADM- PRKG- 23 OR EQUAL | 1 NOBID NOBID 2,250.00 | $2,250.00 NOBID 2,105.00 | $2,105.00 NO BID $2,200.00 2,200.00
21 26" ADAMS PRO SERIES TIMP REF: ADM- PRKG- 26 OR EQUAL | 1 NOBID NOBID 2,285.00 | $2,285.00 NOBID 2,137.00 2,137.00 NO BID $2,250.00 2,250.00
22 29" ADAMS PRO SERIES TIMP REF: ADM- PRKG- 29 OR EQUAL | 1 NOBID NOBID 2,495.00 2,495.00 NOBID 2,359.00 | $2,359.00 NO BID 2,425.00 2,425.00
23 32" ADAMS PRO SERIES TIMP REF: ADM- PRKG- 32 OR EQUAL | 1 NOBID NOBID 2,555.00 | $2,555.00 NOBID 2,423.00 2,423.00 NO BID $2,525.00 2,525.00
24 6.5" X 14" BLACK SWAMP CON SNARE REF: BLA- MS6514RD OR 1 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 1,010.00 | $1,010.00 NO BID $695.00 DNMS NO BID
25 YAMAHA / DEAGAN 2.5 OCT SYMP BELLS REF: YAM- DG1590A{ 2 NO BID $1,443.00 | $2,886.00 | $1,314.00 | $2,628.00 NO BID 1,200.00 2,400.00 NOBID | $1,235.00 | $2,470.00 | $1,350.00 | $2,700.00
26 PEARL 5 PIEC VMX VISION D.SET W/ TERRACOTTAFINREF: P| 1 NO BID NO BID $822.00 $822.00 NO BID $869.00 $869.00 NO BID $720.00 $720.00 $800.00 $800.00
27 PEARL DSET HARDWARE PACK REF: PEA- HWP1000 OR EQUAL 1 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $299.00 $299.00 NO BID $380.00 $380.00 NO BID
28 GIBRALTER EXT HEIGHT SNARE ST REF: GIB- 5606EX OR EQU] 1 NO BID NO BID $72.00 $72.00 $54.00 $54.00 $65.00 $65.00 NO BID $58.00 $58.00 $50.00 $50.00
29 ULTRA X TYPE STYLE KEYBOARD / BELL ST REF: KAM-KKS70| 2 NO BID NO BID NO BID $39.00 $78.00 $47.00 $94.00 NO BID $48.00 $96.00 $25.00 DNMS
30 YAMAHA 3.5 OCT ACOUSTALON XYLO REF: YAM- YXRD335C 1 NOBID NOBID 2,694.00 2,694.00 NOBID 2,560.00 | $2,560.00 NOBID | $2,565.00 | $2,565.00 2,750.00 2,750.00
31 YAMAHA 3.0 OCT SILVER STUDIO VIBES REF: YAM- YVRD2700] 1 NOBID NOBID 4,082.00 34,082.00 NOBID 3,815.00 | $3,815.00 NO BID 3,799.00 | $3,799.00 34,150.00 4,150.00
32 YAMAHA 4.5 OCT RWOOD MARIMBA REF: YAM- YVRD2700C O] 1 NO BID NOBID $9,088.00 | $9,088.00 NOBID $8,626.00 | $8,626.00 NOBID | $8,063.00 DNMS $9,000.00 | $9,000.00
33 8" PEARL P-HARMONIC CON TOM REF: PEA- PTA0808S OR EQYU 1 NOBID NOBID 240.00 240.00 NOBID 169.00 169.00 NO BID $780.00 $780.00 200.00 200.00
34 10" PEARL P-HARMONIC CON TOM REF: PEA-PTA1010SOREQ| 1 NOBID NOBID 261.00 261.00 NOBID 184.00 184.00 NO BID NO BID 220.00 220.00
35 12" PEARL P-HARMONIC CON TOM REF: PEA-PTA1210SOREQ| 1 NOBID NOBID 297.00 297.00 NOBID 209.00 209.00 NO BID NO BID 240.00 240.00
36 14" PEARL P-HARMONIC CON TOM REF: PEA-PTA1412SOREQ| 1 NOBID NOBID 351.00 351.00 NOBID 247.00 247.00 NO BID NO BID 270.00 270.00
37 PEARL DOUBLE TOM STAND REF: PEA- T1000 OR EQUAL 2 NO BID NO BID 155.00 310.00 NO BID 135.00 270.00 NO BID 114.00 $228.00 120.00 240.00
38 40" ZILDJIAN ORCH SERIES GONG REF: ZIL-59312 OR EQUAL | 1 NO BID NO BID $1,149.00 | $1,149.00 | $1,300.00 | $1,300.00 | $1,063.00 | $1,063.00 NO BID 660.00 DNMS $1,075.00 | $1,075.00
39 ZILDJIAN GONG ST W/ WHEELS REF: ZIL- P0560 OR EQUAL 1 NO BID NO BID NO BID $180.00 $180.00 $1,063.00 | $1,063.00 NO BID 120.00 $120.00 120.00 120.00
40 40" LUDWIG CON B DRUM REF: LUD- LECB40XXWF-G OR EQU/ 1 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 720.00 DNMS NOBID | $1,350.00 | $1,350.00 950.00 950.00
41 LUDWIG SUSPENED CON B DRUM ST REF: LUD- LE788 OR EQU| 1 NO BID NO BID $544.00 $544.00 $599.00 $599.00 $431.00 $431.00 NO BID N/A NO BID 550.00 550.00
42 14" PEARL CHAMPIONSHIP M SNARE REF: PEA- FFX1412/A-166| 6 NOBID NOBID NOBID NOBID $470.00 $2,820.00 NO BID 360.00 2,160.00 NO BID
43 PEARL CHAMPIONSHIP M SNARE CARRIER REF: PEA-RM-MV| 6 NO BID NO BID $277.00 $1,662.00 NOBID 244.00 1,464.00 NO BID 238.00 1,428.00 NO BID
44 PEARL CHAMPIONSHIP M TENOR REF: PEA- PMT660234/A-166 ¢ 3 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $1,296.00 | $3,888.00 NO BID 810.00 2,430.00 NO BID
45 PEARL CHAMPIONSHIP M TENOR CARRIER REF: PEA- RM-M: 3 NOBID NOBID NOBID NOBID 399.00 1,197.00 NO BID 220.00 660.00 NO BID
46 18" PEARL CHAMPIONSHIP M BASS DRUM REF: PEA- PBD1814/4 1 NOBID NOBID NOBID NOBID $436.00 436.00 NO BID NET 355.00 NO BID
47 20" PEARL CHAMPIONSHIP M BASS DRUM REF: PEA- PBD2014/4 1 NOBID NOBID NOBID NOBID 5466.00 466.00 NO BID NET 375.00 NO BID
48 22" PEARL CHAMPIONSHIP M BASS DRUM REF: PEA- PBD2214/4 1 NOBID NOBID NOBID NOBID 3476.00 476.00 NO BID NET 385.00 NO BID
49 24" PEARL CHAMPIONSHIP M BASS DRUM REF: PEA- PBD2414/4 1 NOBID NOBID NOBID NOBID 512.00 512.00 NO BID NET $425.00 NO BID
50 28" PEARL CHAMPIONSHIP M BASS DRUM REF: PEA- PBD2814/4 1 NOBID NOBID NOBID NOBID 575.00 575.00 NO BID NET $475.00 NO BID
51 PEARL CHAMPIONSHIP M BASS DRUM CARRIER REF: PEA-RN 5 NO BID NO BID $255.00 $1,275.00 NO BID 255.00 $1,275.00 NO BID $219.00 $1,095.00 NO BID
52 88-KEY KEYBOARD WORKSTATION SYNTH REF: KORG TR-88| 1 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $1,499.00 | $1,499.00 NO BID NOBID | $1,450.00 | $1,450.00
53 88-KEY KEYBOARD CASE W/ WHEELS REF: SKB-5820W OREQY 1 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $399.00 $399.00 NO BID NO BID $350.00 $350.00
54 IBANEZ 4 STR BASS GUITAR REF: GSR200FM OR EQUAL 1 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $219.95 $219.95 NO BID NO BID $210.00 $210.00
55 MUSICIANS GEAR DELUXE BASS GUITAR CASE REF MG540946| 1 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $79.00 $79.00 NO BID NO BID $40.00 $40.00
56 PRO WIRED ULTIMATE FIELD PA SYSTEM REF: YAM-5000302d 1 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $4,795.00 | $4,795.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID
57 11""&12" LATIN PERC ASPIRE WOOD CONGAS W/ ST REF: LP- 1] 1 NO BID $299.70 $299.70 315.00 315.00 355.00 355.00 289.00 289.00 NO BID NO BID 260.00 DNMS
58 LATIN PERC MATADOR BONGO REF: LP-M201- RW OR EQUAL | 1 NO BID $120.95 $120.95 165.00 165.00 155.00 155.00 119.00 119.00 NO BID NO BID 120.00 $120.00
59 LATIN PERC BONGO STAND REF: LP-LP330 OR EQUAL 1 NO BID $69.95 DMNS 134.00 134.00 129.00 129.00 115.00 115.00 NO BID NO BID 110.00 $110.00
60 CONCERT CYMBAL CRADLE REF: GIB- 7614 OR EQUAL 1 NO BID NO BID $77.00 $77.00 $75.00 $75.00 $69.00 $69.00 NO BID $76.00 $76.00 $60.00 $60.00
61 PEARL BOOM CYMBAL STAND REF: PEA- B900 OR EQUAL 6 NO BID NO BID $83.00 498.00 NO BID $75.00 450.00 NO BID $60.00 360.00 $50.00 300.00
62 ZILDJIAN 13.25" K CUSTOM HI HAT CYMBALS REF: K12130REF 1 NOBID NOBID 295.00 295.00 377.00 377.00 282.00 282.00 NO BID 240.00 240.00 260.00 260.00
63 ZILDJIAN 19" K MED THIN DARK CRASH CYMBAL REF: K0905{ 1 NOBID NOBID 239.00 239.00 299.00 299.00 229.00 229.00 NO BID 196.00 196.00 210.00 210.00
64 ZILDJIAN 16" KMED THIN DARK CRASH CYMBAL REF: K0902 1 NOBID NOBID 188.00 188.00 231.00 231.00 180.00 180.00 NO BID 157.00 157.00 170.00 170.00
65 ZILDJIAN 17" A CUSTOM MED CRASH CYMBALS REF: A20827Q 1 NOBID NOBID 181.00 181.00 199.00 199.00 173.00 173.00 NO BID 150.00 150.00 165.00 165.00
66 ZILDJIAN 15" A CUSTOM BRILLIANT CRASH CYMBAL REF: A2| 1 NOBID NOBID 150.00 150.00 179.00 179.00 144.00 144.00 NO BID 127.00 127.00 140.00 140.00
67 ZILDJIAN 22" K CUSTOM MED RIDE CYMBAL REF: K0967 ORE| 1 NOBID NOBID 313.00 313.00 380.00 380.00 299.00 299.00 NO BID 253.00 253.00 270.00 270.00
68 ZILDJIAN 20" CLASSIC ORCH SUSPEND CYMABAL REF: A0421( 1 NOBID NOBID 239.00 239.00 299.00 299.00 205.00 205.00 NO BID 196.00 196.00 210.00 210.00
69 ZILDJIAN 18" STADIUM MED PAIR CRASH CYMBALS REP: A044 5 NO BID NO BID 355.00 $1,775.00 $427.00 $2,135.00 305.00 $1,525.00 NOBID | $1,415.00 | $7,075.00 310.00 $1,550.00
70 ZILDJAIN 20" SYMPHONIC VIENESE PAIR CRASH CYMBALSRf 1 NOBID NOBID $408.00 $408.00 519.00 $519.00 349.00 $349.00 NO BID $325.00 $325.00 350.00 $350.00

*DNMS = Does not meet specifications
**Three (3) vendors submitted a "No Bid"




