
VENDOR

1 GEMEINHARDT PICCOLO REF; 4WSSK or Equal 1 $1,675.00 $1,675.00 21 wk days $1,599.00 $1,599.00 2-4 Weeks
2 GEMEINHARDT FLUTE REF: 2SP or Equal 4 $321.00 $1,284.00 21 wk days $269.00 $1,076.00 2-4 Weeks
3 YAMAHA FLUTE YFL-461H  OR Equal 2 $1,275.00 $2,550.00 21 wk days $699.00 $1,398.00 1-3 Weeks
4 FOX OBOE REF: 330 or Equal 1 $3,311.00 $3,311.00 August $3,179.00 $3,179.00 2-4 Weeks
5 FOX BASSOON  REF: FOX 51 or Equal 1 $3,981.00 $3,981.00 21 wk days $3,739.00 $3,739.00 2-4 Weeks
6 RIDENOUR Bb CLARINET REF: TR 147 or Equal 4 No Bid No Bid $293.00 $1,172.00 2-4 Weeks Eastman ECL230
7 BUFFET Bb CLARINET REF: E11 or Equal 2 No Bid No Bid $649.00 $1,298.00 1-3 Weeks
8 SELMER BASS CLARINET REF: 1430P or Equal 1 $1,591.00 $1,591.00 21 wk days Selmer 1430 LP $1,209.00 $1,209.00 2-4 Weeks
9 RIDENOUR BASS CLARINET REF: BC 147 or Equal 2 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

10 VITO CONTRA- BASS CLARINET REF: 7182 or Equal 1 $3,591.00 $3,591.00 21 wk days Vito L7182 $3,279.00 $3,279.00 4-6 Weeks
11 YAMAHA ALTO SAXOPHONE REF: YAS475 or Equal 2 $1,675.00 $3,350.00 21 wk days $1,459.00 $2,918.00 1-3 Weeks
12 YAMAHA ALTO SAXOPHONE REF: YAS-23 or Equal 3 $1,101.00 $3,303.00 21 wk days $859.00 $2,577.00 1-3 Weeks
13 YAMAHA TENOR SAX REF: YTS-23 or Equal 2 $1,275.00 $2,550.00 21 wk days $1,079.00 $2,158.00 1-3 Weeks
14 YAMAHA BARITONE SAX REF: YBS-52 or EQUAL 1 $4,185.00 $4,185.00 21 wk days $3,599.00 $3,599.00 1-3 Weeks
15 YAMAHA CORNET REF: YCR-2310 II OR EQUAL 4 $675.00 $2,700.00 21 wk days $519.00 $2,076.00 1-3 Weeks
16 BACH TRUMPET REF: BACH 180S37 OR EQUAL 2 $1,972.00 $3,944.00 21 wk days $1,769.00 $3,538.00 2-4 Weeks
17 BACH CORNET REF: BACH 181 ML OR EQUAL 1 $1,972.00 $1,972.00 21 wk days $1,739.00 $1,739.00 2-4 Weeks
18 HOLTON FRENCH HORN REF: HOLTON 379 OR EQUAL 1 $2,475.00 $2,475.00 21 wk days $2,059.00 $2,059.00 2-4 Weeks
19 YAMAHA EUHPHONIUM REF: YEP-201 OR EQUAL 1 $1,275.00 $1,275.00 21 wk days $999.00 $999.00 1-3 Weeks
20 YAMAHA EUHPHONIUM REF: YEP-321S OR EQUAL 1 $1,875.00 $1,875.00 21 wk days $1,369.00 $1,369.00 1-3 Weeks
21 BACH TENOR TROMBONE REF: BACH TB301 OR EQUAL 2 No Bid No Bid $399.00 $798.00 2-4 Weeks
22 BACH TENOR TROMBONE REF: BACH 36 BO OR EQUAL 2 $2,275.00 $4,550.00 21 wk days $1,979.00 $3,958.00 2-4 Weeks
23 BACH TENOR TROMBONE REF: BACH 36 B OR EQUAL 2 $2,275.00 $4,550.00 21 wk days $1,979.00 $3,958.00 2-4 Weeks
24 BACH TENOR TROMBONE REF: BACH 42 B OR EQUAL 2 $2,275.00 $4,550.00 21 wk days $1,979.00 $3,958.00 2-4 Weeks
25 CERVENY TUBA  REF: CBB 681-4 OR EQUAL 1 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
26 YAMAHA TUBA REF: YBB - 105WC OR EQUAL 2 $2,095.00 $4,190.00 21 wk days $1,759.00 $3,518.00 1-3 Weeks
27 KING SOUSAPHONE REF: 2370W OR EQUAL 2 $3,390.00 $6,780.00 21 wk days $2,869.00 $5,738.00 2-4 Weeks
28 KING SOUSAPHONE  REF: KING 2350W OR EQUAL 1 $4,551.00 $4,551.00 21 wk days $4,098.00 $4,098.00 2-4 Weeks
29 KING SOUSAPHONE REF: 2350WSP OR EQUAL 1 $5,409.00 $5,409.00 21 wk days $4,898.00 $4,898.00 2-4 Weeks
30 MUSSER ORCH BELLS REF: MUSSER M645 OR EQUAL 1 $941.00 $941.00 21 wk days $899.00 $899.00 2-4 Weeks
31 PEARL PERCUSSION KITS REF: PK800 OR EQUAL 6 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
32 YAMAHA CON BASS DRUM REF: CB640BFS7 OR EQUAL 1 No Bid No Bid $1,359.00 $1,359.00 2-4 Weeks
33 YAMAHA GLOCKENSPIEL REF: YG-250 OR EQUAL 1 No Bid No Bid $519.00 $519.00 2-4 Weeks
34 MC ADAMS METRONOME REF: 20X OR EQUAL 2 No Bid No Bid $569.00 $1,138.00 2-4 Weeks
35 DIGIMET DIGITAL METRONOME  (OR EQUAL) 2 No Bid No Bid $945.00 $1,890.00 3-6 Weeks Digimet III
36 PETERSONS STROBE TUNER REF: CS5000 II OR EQUAL 1 No Bid No Bid $3,499.00 $3,499.00 2-4 Weeks

20-50%
20-50%

%OFF SHELF PRICE %OFF SHELF PRICE 20-50%

EXT. ETA
BRAND /MODEL 

PROPOSED; If left blank we will 
assume you are bidding the specified model

%OFF CATALOG PRICE
%OFF LIST PRICE

HILLJE MUSIC

%OFF LIST PRICE

MODEL / DESCRIPTION EST 
QTY

UISD       
PRICE

BRAND /MODEL 
PROPOSED; If left blank we will 

assume you are bidding the specified model

Band Equipment
United Indpendent School District

RFP 024-2011

ALAMO MUSIC CENTER

EXT.UISD       
PRICE ETA

ITEM

%OFF CATALOG PRICE
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Band Equipment
United Indpendent School District

RFP 024-2011

VENDOR

1 GEMEINHARDT PICCOLO REF; 4WSSK or Equal 1 $1,309.00 $1,309.00 30-60 Days $1,289.00 $1,289.00 7-10 Days
2 GEMEINHARDT FLUTE REF: 2SP or Equal 4 $205.00 $820.00 10-20 Days $198.99 $795.96 3 Days
3 YAMAHA FLUTE YFL-461H  OR Equal 2 $1,065.00 $2,130.00 10-30 Days
4 FOX OBOE REF: 330 or Equal 1 $3,299.00 $3,299.00 30-120 Days
5 FOX BASSOON  REF: FOX 51 or Equal 1 $3,925.00 $3,925.00 30-120 Days
6 RIDENOUR Bb CLARINET REF: TR 147 or Equal 4 No Bid No Bid
7 BUFFET Bb CLARINET REF: E11 or Equal 2 $759.00 $1,518.00 20-60 Days
8 SELMER BASS CLARINET REF: 1430P or Equal 1 $1,239.00 $1,239.00 20-30 Days
9 RIDENOUR BASS CLARINET REF: BC 147 or Equal 2 No Bid No Bid

10 VITO CONTRA- BASS CLARINET REF: 7182 or Equal 1 $3,155.00 $3,155.00 30-90 Days
11 YAMAHA ALTO SAXOPHONE REF: YAS475 or Equal 2 $1,421.00 $2,842.00 20-45 Days
12 YAMAHA ALTO SAXOPHONE REF: YAS-23 or Equal 3 $819.00 $2,457.00 20-30 Days
13 YAMAHA TENOR SAX REF: YTS-23 or Equal 2 $1,033.00 $2,066.00 20-30 Days
14 YAMAHA BARITONE SAX REF: YBS-52 or EQUAL 1 $3,501.00 $3,501.00 30-45 Days
15 YAMAHA CORNET REF: YCR-2310 II OR EQUAL 4 $496.00 $1,984.00 20-30 Days
16 BACH TRUMPET REF: BACH 180S37 OR EQUAL 2 $1,699.00 $3,398.00 20-45 Days
17 BACH CORNET REF: BACH 181 ML OR EQUAL 1 $1,653.00 $1,653.00 30-45 Days
18 HOLTON FRENCH HORN REF: HOLTON 379 OR EQUAL 1 $2,017.00 $2,017.00 20-45 Days
19 YAMAHA EUHPHONIUM REF: YEP-201 OR EQUAL 1 $988.00 $988.00 20-30 Days
20 YAMAHA EUHPHONIUM REF: YEP-321S OR EQUAL 1 $1,349.00 $1,349.00 20-45 Days
21 BACH TENOR TROMBONE REF: BACH TB301 OR EQUAL 2 $378.00 $756.00 20-30 Days
22 BACH TENOR TROMBONE REF: BACH 36 BO OR EQUAL 2 $1,897.00 $3,794.00 20-45 Days
23 BACH TENOR TROMBONE REF: BACH 36 B OR EQUAL 2 $1,897.00 $3,794.00 20-45 Days
24 BACH TENOR TROMBONE REF: BACH 42 B OR EQUAL 2 $1,897.00 $3,794.00 20-45 Days
25 CERVENY TUBA  REF: CBB 681-4 OR EQUAL 1 $3,463.00 $3,463.00 20-60 Days $3,459.00 $3,459.00 5 Days
26 YAMAHA TUBA REF: YBB - 105WC OR EQUAL 2 $1,736.00 $3,472.00 20-30 Days
27 KING SOUSAPHONE REF: 2370W OR EQUAL 2 $2,740.00 $5,480.00 30-90 Days
28 KING SOUSAPHONE  REF: KING 2350W OR EQUAL 1 $3,910.00 $3,910.00 30-60 Days
29 KING SOUSAPHONE REF: 2350WSP OR EQUAL 1 $4,481.00 $4,481.00 30-60 Days
30 MUSSER ORCH BELLS REF: MUSSER M645 OR EQUAL 1 $757.00 $757.00 20-45 Days
31 PEARL PERCUSSION KITS REF: PK800 OR EQUAL 6 $169.00 $1,014.00 30-60 Days Pearl PK900C
32 YAMAHA CON BASS DRUM REF: CB640BFS7 OR EQUAL 1 $1,235.00 $1,235.00 30-60 Days CB640BCS7
33 YAMAHA GLOCKENSPIEL REF: YG-250 OR EQUAL 1 $475.00 $475.00 20-30 Days YG250D
34 MC ADAMS METRONOME REF: 20X OR EQUAL 2 $685.00 $1,370.00 30-60 Days
35 DIGIMET DIGITAL METRONOME  (OR EQUAL) 2 No Bid No Bid
36 PETERSONS STROBE TUNER REF: CS5000 II OR EQUAL 1 $3,750.00 $3,750.00 30-45 Days

0% 20-80%
0% 20-80%

%OFF SHELF PRICE 0% %OFF SHELF PRICE

UISD       
PRICE

BRAND /MODEL 
PROPOSED; If left blank we will 

assume you are bidding the specified model

%OFF CATALOG PRICE %OFF CATALOG PRICE

ITEM
CASCIO INTERSTATE MUSIC K&S MUSIC

MODEL / DESCRIPTION EST 
QTY

UISD       
PRICE EXT. ETAEXT. ETA

BRAND /MODEL 
PROPOSED; If left blank we will 

assume you are bidding the specified model

%OFF LIST PRICE %OFF LIST PRICE
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Band Equipment
United Indpendent School District

RFP 024-2011

VENDOR

1 GEMEINHARDT PICCOLO REF; 4WSSK or Equal 1 $1,288.00 $1,288.00 10-15 Days
2 GEMEINHARDT FLUTE REF: 2SP or Equal 4 $202.50 $810.00 5-7 Days
3 YAMAHA FLUTE YFL-461H  OR Equal 2 $1,059.00 $2,118.00 7-10 Days
4 FOX OBOE REF: 330 or Equal 1 $2,889.00 $2,889.00 30-75 Days
5 FOX BASSOON  REF: FOX 51 or Equal 1 $3,449.00 $3,449.00 30-75 Days
6 RIDENOUR Bb CLARINET REF: TR 147 or Equal 4 No Bid No Bid
7 BUFFET Bb CLARINET REF: E11 or Equal 2 $750.00 $1,500.00 7-10 Days
8 SELMER BASS CLARINET REF: 1430P or Equal 1 $1,217.00 $1,217.00 10-15 Days
9 RIDENOUR BASS CLARINET REF: BC 147 or Equal 2 $1,094.00 $2,188.00 20-30 Day

10 VITO CONTRA- BASS CLARINET REF: 7182 or Equal 1 $3,032.00 $3,032.00 20-30 Day
11 YAMAHA ALTO SAXOPHONE REF: YAS475 or Equal 2 $1,413.00 $2,826.00 10-20 Days
12 YAMAHA ALTO SAXOPHONE REF: YAS-23 or Equal 3 $830.00 $2,490.00 7-10 Days
13 YAMAHA TENOR SAX REF: YTS-23 or Equal 2 $1,047.00 $2,094.00 7-10 Days
14 YAMAHA BARITONE SAX REF: YBS-52 or EQUAL 1 $3,479.00 $3,479.00 10-20 Days
15 YAMAHA CORNET REF: YCR-2310 II OR EQUAL 4 $503.00 $2,012.00 20-30 Day
16 BACH TRUMPET REF: BACH 180S37 OR EQUAL 2 $1,672.00 $3,344.00 5-7 Days
17 BACH CORNET REF: BACH 181 ML OR EQUAL 1 $1,624.00 $1,624.00 10-20 Days
18 HOLTON FRENCH HORN REF: HOLTON 379 OR EQUAL 1 $1,983.00 $1,983.00 7-10 Days
19 YAMAHA EUHPHONIUM REF: YEP-201 OR EQUAL 1 $983.00 $983.00 7-10 Days
20 YAMAHA EUHPHONIUM REF: YEP-321S OR EQUAL 1 $1,341.00 $1,341.00 7-10 Days
21 BACH TENOR TROMBONE REF: BACH TB301 OR EQUAL 2 $372.00 $744.00 7-10 Days
22 BACH TENOR TROMBONE REF: BACH 36 BO OR EQUAL 2 $1,866.00 $3,732.00 7-10 Days
23 BACH TENOR TROMBONE REF: BACH 36 B OR EQUAL 2 $1,866.00 $3,732.00 10-20 Days
24 BACH TENOR TROMBONE REF: BACH 42 B OR EQUAL 2 $1,866.00 $3,732.00 10-20 Days
25 CERVENY TUBA  REF: CBB 681-4 OR EQUAL 1 $3,393.00 $3,393.00 10-20 Days
26 YAMAHA TUBA REF: YBB - 105WC OR EQUAL 2 $1,726.00 $3,452.00 7-10 Days
27 KING SOUSAPHONE REF: 2370W OR EQUAL 2 $2,693.00 $5,386.00 7-10 Days
28 KING SOUSAPHONE  REF: KING 2350W OR EQUAL 1 $3,844.00 $3,844.00 10-15 Days
29 KING SOUSAPHONE REF: 2350WSP OR EQUAL 1 $4,626.00 $4,626.00 10-15 Days
30 MUSSER ORCH BELLS REF: MUSSER M645 OR EQUAL 1 $857.65 $857.65 7-14 Days $743.00 $743.00 20-30 Day
31 PEARL PERCUSSION KITS REF: PK800 OR EQUAL 6 $187.50 $1,125.00 7-30 Days $142.30 $853.80 10-15 Days
32 YAMAHA CON BASS DRUM REF: CB640BFS7 OR EQUAL 1 $1,483.22 $1,483.22 7-60 Days $1,225.00 $1,225.00 10-45 Days
33 YAMAHA GLOCKENSPIEL REF: YG-250 OR EQUAL 1 $2,958.00 $2,958.00 7-60 Days $693.00 $693.00 10-20 Days
34 MC ADAMS METRONOME REF: 20X OR EQUAL 2 No Bid No Bid
35 DIGIMET DIGITAL METRONOME  (OR EQUAL) 2 No Bid No Bid
36 PETERSONS STROBE TUNER REF: CS5000 II OR EQUAL 1 No Bid No Bid

0% 20-50%
5-60% 0-50%

%OFF SHELF PRICE %OFF SHELF PRICE

%OFF CATALOG PRICE %OFF CATALOG PRICE
%OFF LIST PRICE %OFF LIST PRICE

BRAND /MODEL 
PROPOSED; If left blank we will 

assume you are bidding the specified model

UISD       
PRICE EXT. ETA

BRAND /MODEL 
PROPOSED; If left blank we will 

assume you are bidding the specified model
ETAITEM

LONE STAR PERCUSSION N.E.M.C.

MODEL / DESCRIPTION EST 
QTY

UISD       
PRICE EXT.
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Band Equipment
United Indpendent School District

RFP 024-2011

VENDOR

1 GEMEINHARDT PICCOLO REF; 4WSSK or Equal 1 $1,479.00 1479.00 30 Days No Bid
2 GEMEINHARDT FLUTE REF: 2SP or Equal 4 $238.00 952.00 10 Days No Bid
3 YAMAHA FLUTE YFL-461H  OR Equal 2 $1,058.00 2116.00 10 Days No Bid
4 FOX OBOE REF: 330 or Equal 1 No Bid No Bid No Bid
5 FOX BASSOON  REF: FOX 51 or Equal 1 No Bid No Bid No Bid
6 RIDENOUR Bb CLARINET REF: TR 147 or Equal 4 No Bid No Bid No Bid
7 BUFFET Bb CLARINET REF: E11 or Equal 2 No Bid No Bid No Bid
8 SELMER BASS CLARINET REF: 1430P or Equal 1 $1,318.00 1318.00 30 Days No Bid
9 RIDENOUR BASS CLARINET REF: BC 147 or Equal 2 No Bid No Bid No Bid

10 VITO CONTRA- BASS CLARINET REF: 7182 or Equal 1 $3,369.00 3369.00 45 Days No Bid
11 YAMAHA ALTO SAXOPHONE REF: YAS475 or Equal 2 $1,453.00 2906.00 20 Days No Bid
12 YAMAHA ALTO SAXOPHONE REF: YAS-23 or Equal 3 $849.00 2547.00 15 Days No Bid
13 YAMAHA TENOR SAX REF: YTS-23 or Equal 2 $1,066.00 2132.00 15 Days No Bid
14 YAMAHA BARITONE SAX REF: YBS-52 or EQUAL 1 $3,828.00 3828.00 30 Days No Bid
15 YAMAHA CORNET REF: YCR-2310 II OR EQUAL 4 $517.00 2068.00 20 Days No Bid
16 BACH TRUMPET REF: BACH 180S37 OR EQUAL 2 $1,794.00 3588.00 30 Days No Bid
17 BACH CORNET REF: BACH 181 ML OR EQUAL 1 $1,749.00 1749.00 45 Days No Bid
18 HOLTON FRENCH HORN REF: HOLTON 379 OR EQUAL 1 $2,125.00 2125.00 30 Days No Bid
19 YAMAHA EUHPHONIUM REF: YEP-201 OR EQUAL 1 $1,011.00 1011.00 20 Days No Bid
20 YAMAHA EUHPHONIUM REF: YEP-321S OR EQUAL 1 $1,389.00 1389.00 20 Days No Bid
21 BACH TENOR TROMBONE REF: BACH TB301 OR EQUAL 2 $409.00 818.00 20 Days No Bid
22 BACH TENOR TROMBONE REF: BACH 36 BO OR EQUAL 2 $2,001.00 4002.00 30 Days No Bid
23 BACH TENOR TROMBONE REF: BACH 36 B OR EQUAL 2 $2,001.00 4002.00 30 Days No Bid
24 BACH TENOR TROMBONE REF: BACH 42 B OR EQUAL 2 $2,001.00 4002.00 30 Days No Bid
25 CERVENY TUBA  REF: CBB 681-4 OR EQUAL 1 No Bid No Bid No Bid
26 YAMAHA TUBA REF: YBB - 105WC OR EQUAL 2 $1,794.00 3588.00 20 Days No Bid
27 KING SOUSAPHONE REF: 2370W OR EQUAL 2 No Bid No Bid No Bid
28 KING SOUSAPHONE  REF: KING 2350W OR EQUAL 1 $8,490.00 8490.00 45 Days No Bid
29 KING SOUSAPHONE REF: 2350WSP OR EQUAL 1 $9,390.00 9390.00 45 Days No Bid
30 MUSSER ORCH BELLS REF: MUSSER M645 OR EQUAL 1 No Bid No Bid $1,474.00 $1,474.00 30-60 Days Bergerault #GV
31 PEARL PERCUSSION KITS REF: PK800 OR EQUAL 6 $193.00 1158.00 20 Days No Bid
32 YAMAHA CON BASS DRUM REF: CB640BFS7 OR EQUAL 1 No Bid No Bid No Bid
33 YAMAHA GLOCKENSPIEL REF: YG-250 OR EQUAL 1 No Bid No Bid $1,277.00 $1,277.00 30-60 Days Bergerault #GS
34 MC ADAMS METRONOME REF: 20X OR EQUAL 2 No Bid No Bid No Bid
35 DIGIMET DIGITAL METRONOME  (OR EQUAL) 2 No Bid No Bid No Bid
36 PETERSONS STROBE TUNER REF: CS5000 II OR EQUAL 1 No Bid No Bid No Bid

10% 25% +Shipping
30%

%OFF SHELF PRICE 5% %OFF SHELF PRICE

%OFF CATALOG PRICE %OFF CATALOG PRICE
%OFF LIST PRICE %OFF LIST PRICE

UISD       
PRICE EXT. ETA

BRAND /MODEL 
PROPOSED; If left blank we will 

assume you are bidding the specified model
ETA

BRAND /MODEL 
PROPOSED; If left blank we will 

assume you are bidding the specified model

ITEM
NORTH EAST MUSIC PERIPOLE BERGERAULT, INC

MODEL / DESCRIPTION EST 
QTY

UISD       
PRICE EXT.
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Band Equipment
United Indpendent School District

RFP 024-2011

VENDOR

1 GEMEINHARDT PICCOLO REF; 4WSSK or Equal 1 $1,289.00 $1,289.00 30 Days No Bid No Bid
2 GEMEINHARDT FLUTE REF: 2SP or Equal 4 $2,080.00 $8,320.00 30 Days No Bid No Bid
3 YAMAHA FLUTE YFL-461H  OR Equal 2 $1,076.00 $2,152.00 30 Days $795.00 $1,590.00 Immediate Tempest Model 600
4 FOX OBOE REF: 330 or Equal 1 $3,095.00 $3,095.00 30 Days $1,595.00 $1,595.00 30-60 Days Tempest Resin Oboe
5 FOX BASSOON  REF: FOX 51 or Equal 1 $3,675.00 $3,675.00 30 Days $3,495.00 $3,495.00 30-60 Days Tempest Maple Wood Bassoon
6 RIDENOUR Bb CLARINET REF: TR 147 or Equal 4 $573.00 $2,292.00 30 Days $495.00 $1,980.00 Immediate Tempest "Trek" Clarinet
7 BUFFET Bb CLARINET REF: E11 or Equal 2 $739.00 $1,478.00 30 Days $795.00 $1,590.00 Immediate Tempest Wood Clarinet
8 SELMER BASS CLARINET REF: 1430P or Equal 1 $1,222.00 $1,222.00 30 Days $1,595.00 $1,595.00 Immediate Tempest Bass Clarinet
9 RIDENOUR BASS CLARINET REF: BC 147 or Equal 2 No Bid No Bid $1,995.00 $3,990.00 30-60 Days Tempest Bass Clarinet Low C

10 VITO CONTRA- BASS CLARINET REF: 7182 or Equal 1 $3,029.00 $3,029.00 30 Days No Bid No Bid
11 YAMAHA ALTO SAXOPHONE REF: YAS475 or Equal 2 $1,422.00 $2,844.00 30 Days $1,095.00 $2,190.00 Immediate Tempest Alto Sax
12 YAMAHA ALTO SAXOPHONE REF: YAS-23 or Equal 3 $818.00 $2,454.00 30 Days $1,095.00 $3,285.00 Immediate Tempest Alto Sax
13 YAMAHA TENOR SAX REF: YTS-23 or Equal 2 $1,029.00 $2,058.00 30 Days $1,295.00 $2,590.00 Immediate Tempest Tenor Sax
14 YAMAHA BARITONE SAX REF: YBS-52 or EQUAL 1 $3,475.00 $3,475.00 30 Days $2,995.00 $2,995.00 30-60 Days Tempest Low A Bari Sax
15 YAMAHA CORNET REF: YCR-2310 II OR EQUAL 4 $516.00 $2,064.00 30 Days No Bid No Bid
16 BACH TRUMPET REF: BACH 180S37 OR EQUAL 2 $1,656.00 $3,312.00 30 Days $895.00 $1,790.00 Immediate Tempest Gabriel Trumpet
17 BACH CORNET REF: BACH 181 ML OR EQUAL 1 $1,625.00 $1,625.00 30 Days No Bid No Bid
18 HOLTON FRENCH HORN REF: HOLTON 379 OR EQUAL 1 $1,987.00 $1,987.00 30 Days $1,995.00 $1,995.00 30-60 Days Tempest F/Bb F- Horn
19 YAMAHA EUHPHONIUM REF: YEP-201 OR EQUAL 1 $990.00 $990.00 30 Days No Bid No Bid
20 YAMAHA EUHPHONIUM REF: YEP-321S OR EQUAL 1 $1,360.00 $1,360.00 30 Days $995.00 $995.00 30-60 Days Tempest 4 Valve Euphonium
21 BACH TENOR TROMBONE REF: BACH TB301 OR EQUAL 2 $386.00 $772.00 30 Days $795.00 $1,590.00 30-60 Days Tempest Tenor T-Bone
22 BACH TENOR TROMBONE REF: BACH 36 BO OR EQUAL 2 $1,873.00 $3,746.00 30 Days $1,195.00 $2,390.00 Immediate Tempset F Attachment T-Bone
23 BACH TENOR TROMBONE REF: BACH 36 B OR EQUAL 2 $1,873.00 $3,746.00 30 Days $1,195.00 $2,390.00 Immediate Tempset F Attachment T-Bone
24 BACH TENOR TROMBONE REF: BACH 42 B OR EQUAL 2 $1,873.00 $3,746.00 30 Days $1,195.00 $2,390.00 Immediate Tempset F Attachment T-Bone
25 CERVENY TUBA  REF: CBB 681-4 OR EQUAL 1 $3,298.00 $3,298.00 30 Days $3,495.00 $3,495.00 Immediate Tempest Rotory Tuba
26 YAMAHA TUBA REF: YBB - 105WC OR EQUAL 2 $1,733.00 $3,466.00 30 Days No Bid No Bid
27 KING SOUSAPHONE REF: 2370W OR EQUAL 2 $2,698.00 $5,396.00 30 Days No Bid No Bid
28 KING SOUSAPHONE  REF: KING 2350W OR EQUAL 1 $3,847.00 $3,847.00 30 Days $2,995.00 $2,995.00 30-60 Days Tempest Sousaphone
29 KING SOUSAPHONE REF: 2350WSP OR EQUAL 1 $4,629.00 $4,629.00 30 Days No Bid No Bid
30 MUSSER ORCH BELLS REF: MUSSER M645 OR EQUAL 1 $795.00 $795.00 30 Days No Bid No Bid
31 PEARL PERCUSSION KITS REF: PK800 OR EQUAL 6 $159.00 $954.00 30 Days No Bid No Bid
32 YAMAHA CON BASS DRUM REF: CB640BFS7 OR EQUAL 1 $1,236.00 $1,236.00 30 Days No Bid No Bid
33 YAMAHA GLOCKENSPIEL REF: YG-250 OR EQUAL 1 $499.00 $499.00 30 Days No Bid No Bid
34 MC ADAMS METRONOME REF: 20X OR EQUAL 2 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
35 DIGIMET DIGITAL METRONOME  (OR EQUAL) 2 $3,440.00 $6,880.00 30 Days No Bid No Bid
36 PETERSONS STROBE TUNER REF: CS5000 II OR EQUAL 1 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

0% 0%
0% 0%

%OFF SHELF PRICE N/A %OFF SHELF PRICE 0%

UISD       
PRICE EXT. ETA

BRAND /MODEL 
PROPOSED; If left blank we will 

assume you are bidding the specified model

%OFF CATALOG PRICE %OFF CATALOG PRICE

ETA
BRAND /MODEL 

PROPOSED; If left blank we will 
assume you are bidding the specified model

%OFF LIST PRICE %OFF LIST PRICE

ITEM
SAM ASH MUSIC TEMPEST MUSICAL

MODEL / DESCRIPTION EST 
QTY

UISD       
PRICE EXT.

Page 5 of 7



Band Equipment
United Indpendent School District

RFP 024-2011

VENDOR

1 GEMEINHARDT PICCOLO REF; 4WSSK or Equal 1 $1,425.00 $1,425.00 15-30 days $1,377.00 $1,377.00 15 Days
2 GEMEINHARDT FLUTE REF: 2SP or Equal 4 $279.00 $1,116.00 15-30 days $218.00 $872.00 10 Days
3 YAMAHA FLUTE YFL-461H  OR Equal 2 $1,200.00 $2,400.00 15-30 days No Bid No Bid
4 FOX OBOE REF: 330 or Equal 1 $3,147.00 $3,147.00 15-30 days $3,066.00 $3,066.00 30 days
5 FOX BASSOON  REF: FOX 51 or Equal 1 $3,600.00 $3,600.00 15-30 days $3,649.00 $3,649.00 90 Days
6 RIDENOUR Bb CLARINET REF: TR 147 or Equal 4 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
7 BUFFET Bb CLARINET REF: E11 or Equal 2 $899.00 $1,798.00 15-30 days $739.00 $1,478.00 30 Days BC2501F-2-0
8 SELMER BASS CLARINET REF: 1430P or Equal 1 $1,750.00 $1,750.00 15-30 days $1,211.00 $1,211.00 10 Days
9 RIDENOUR BASS CLARINET REF: BC 147 or Equal 2 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

10 VITO CONTRA- BASS CLARINET REF: 7182 or Equal 1 No Bid No Bid $3,028.00 $3,028.00 15 Days
11 YAMAHA ALTO SAXOPHONE REF: YAS475 or Equal 2 $1,999.00 $3,998.00 15-30 days $1,419.00 $2,838.00 15 Days
12 YAMAHA ALTO SAXOPHONE REF: YAS-23 or Equal 3 $1,300.00 $3,900.00 15-30 days $839.00 $2,517.00 15 Days
13 YAMAHA TENOR SAX REF: YTS-23 or Equal 2 $1,650.00 $3,300.00 15-30 days $1,058.00 $2,116.00 15 Days
14 YAMAHA BARITONE SAX REF: YBS-52 or EQUAL 1 $4,800.00 $4,800.00 15-30 days $3,484.00 $3,484.00 15 Days
15 YAMAHA CORNET REF: YCR-2310 II OR EQUAL 4 $800.00 $3,200.00 15-30 days $515.00 $2,060.00 15 Days
16 BACH TRUMPET REF: BACH 180S37 OR EQUAL 2 $2,010.00 $4,020.00 15-30 days $1,666.00 $3,332.00 15 Days
17 BACH CORNET REF: BACH 181 ML OR EQUAL 1 $1,999.00 $1,999.00 15-30 days $1,614.00 $1,614.00 15-60 Days
18 HOLTON FRENCH HORN REF: HOLTON 379 OR EQUAL 1 $2,000.00 $2,000.00 15-30 days $1,977.00 $1,977.00 15 Days
19 YAMAHA EUHPHONIUM REF: YEP-201 OR EQUAL 1 $1,800.00 $1,800.00 15-30 days $998.00 $998.00 15 Days
20 YAMAHA EUHPHONIUM REF: YEP-321S OR EQUAL 1 $2,000.00 $2,000.00 15-30 days $1,349.00 $1,349.00 15 Days
21 BACH TENOR TROMBONE REF: BACH TB301 OR EQUAL 2 $459.00 $918.00 15-30 days $385.00 $770.00 15 Days
22 BACH TENOR TROMBONE REF: BACH 36 BO OR EQUAL 2 $2,200.00 $4,400.00 15-30 days $1,866.00 $3,732.00 15 Days
23 BACH TENOR TROMBONE REF: BACH 36 B OR EQUAL 2 $2,200.00 $4,400.00 15-30 days $1,866.00 $3,732.00 15 Days
24 BACH TENOR TROMBONE REF: BACH 42 B OR EQUAL 2 $2,200.00 $4,400.00 15-30 days $1,866.00 $3,732.00 15 Days
25 CERVENY TUBA  REF: CBB 681-4 OR EQUAL 1 $3,990.00 $3,990.00 15-30 days No Bid No Bid
26 YAMAHA TUBA REF: YBB - 105WC OR EQUAL 2 $2,700.00 $5,400.00 15-30 days $1,744.00 $3,488.00 15 Days
27 KING SOUSAPHONE REF: 2370W OR EQUAL 2 $2,800.00 $5,600.00 15-30 days $2,696.00 $5,392.00 15 Days
28 KING SOUSAPHONE  REF: KING 2350W OR EQUAL 1 $3,950.00 $3,950.00 15-30 days $3,836.00 $3,836.00 15 Days
29 KING SOUSAPHONE REF: 2350WSP OR EQUAL 1 $4,725.00 $4,725.00 15-30 days $4,604.00 $4,604.00 15 Days
30 MUSSER ORCH BELLS REF: MUSSER M645 OR EQUAL 1 $999.00 $999.00 15-30 days $747.00 $747.00 15 Days
31 PEARL PERCUSSION KITS REF: PK800 OR EQUAL 6 $259.00 $1,554.00 15-30 days $188.00 $1,128.00 15 Days
32 YAMAHA CON BASS DRUM REF: CB640BFS7 OR EQUAL 1 $1,450.00 $1,450.00 15-30 days No Bid No Bid
33 YAMAHA GLOCKENSPIEL REF: YG-250 OR EQUAL 1 $699.00 $699.00 15-30 days No Bid No Bid
34 MC ADAMS METRONOME REF: 20X OR EQUAL 2 $900.00 $1,800.00 15-30 days $569.00 $1,138.00 15 Days
35 DIGIMET DIGITAL METRONOME  (OR EQUAL) 2 No Bid No Bid $628.00 $1,256.00 15 Days Digimet II indoor
36 PETERSONS STROBE TUNER REF: CS5000 II OR EQUAL 1 No Bid No Bid $3,273.00 $3,273.00 15 Days

30% 0%
30% 10-60%

%OFF SHELF PRICE 30% %OFF SHELF PRICE 0%

%OFF CATALOG PRICE %OFF CATALOG PRICE
%OFF LIST PRICE %OFF LIST PRICE

ETA
BRAND /MODEL 

PROPOSED; If left blank we will 
assume you are bidding the specified model

UISD       
PRICE EXT. ETAITEM

THE BAND SHOP TAYLOR MUSIC

MODEL / DESCRIPTION EST 
QTY

UISD       
PRICE EXT.

BRAND /MODEL 
PROPOSED; If left blank we will 

assume you are bidding the specified model
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Band Equipment
United Indpendent School District

RFP 024-2011

VENDOR

1 GEMEINHARDT PICCOLO REF; 4WSSK or Equal 1 $1,335.00 $1,335.00 30 Days $0.00 $0.00
2 GEMEINHARDT FLUTE REF: 2SP or Equal 4 $206.00 $824.00 30 Days $258.00 $1,032.00 10-45 Days
3 YAMAHA FLUTE YFL-461H  OR Equal 2 $1,054.00 $2,108.00 30 Days $1,142.00 $2,284.00 10-45 Days
4 FOX OBOE REF: 330 or Equal 1 $3,085.00 $3,085.00 30 Days $2,440.00 $2,440.00 10-45 Days
5 FOX BASSOON  REF: FOX 51 or Equal 1 $3,665.00 $3,665.00 30 Days $3,774.00 $3,774.00 10-45 Days
6 RIDENOUR Bb CLARINET REF: TR 147 or Equal 4 $256.00 $1,024.00 30 Days Jupiter 631NM $0.00 $0.00
7 BUFFET Bb CLARINET REF: E11 or Equal 2 $825.00 $1,650.00 30 Days BC2501F20 $862.00 $1,724.00 10-45 Days
8 SELMER BASS CLARINET REF: 1430P or Equal 1 $1,212.00 $1,212.00 30 Days $1,398.00 $1,398.00 10-45 Days
9 RIDENOUR BASS CLARINET REF: BC 147 or Equal 2 $992.00 $1,984.00 30 Days Jupiter 673 BN $0.00 $0.00

10 VITO CONTRA- BASS CLARINET REF: 7182 or Equal 1 $3,025.00 $3,025.00 30 Days $3,472.00 $3,472.00 20-60 Days
11 YAMAHA ALTO SAXOPHONE REF: YAS475 or Equal 2 $1,407.00 $2,814.00 30 Days $1,492.00 $2,984.00 10-45 Days
12 YAMAHA ALTO SAXOPHONE REF: YAS-23 or Equal 3 $823.00 $2,469.00 30 Days $888.00 $2,664.00 10-45 Days
13 YAMAHA TENOR SAX REF: YTS-23 or Equal 2 $1,038.00 $2,076.00 30 Days $1,118.00 $2,236.00 10-45 Days
14 YAMAHA BARITONE SAX REF: YBS-52 or EQUAL 1 $3,467.00 $3,467.00 30 Days $3,652.00 $3,652.00 10-45 Days
15 YAMAHA CORNET REF: YCR-2310 II OR EQUAL 4 $501.00 $2,004.00 30 Days $541.00 $2,164.00 10-45 Days
16 BACH TRUMPET REF: BACH 180S37 OR EQUAL 2 $1,665.00 $3,330.00 30 Days $1,918.00 $3,836.00 10-45 Days
17 BACH CORNET REF: BACH 181 ML OR EQUAL 1 $1,619.00 $1,619.00 30 Days $1,858.00 $1,858.00 20-60 Days
18 HOLTON FRENCH HORN REF: HOLTON 379 OR EQUAL 1 $1,975.00 $1,975.00 30 Days $2,262.00 $2,262.00 10-45 Days
19 YAMAHA EUHPHONIUM REF: YEP-201 OR EQUAL 1 $979.00 $979.00 30 Days $1,042.00 $1,042.00 10-45 Days
20 YAMAHA EUHPHONIUM REF: YEP-321S OR EQUAL 1 $1,336.00 $1,336.00 30 Days $1,428.00 $1,428.00 10-45 Days
21 BACH TENOR TROMBONE REF: BACH TB301 OR EQUAL 2 $370.00 $740.00 30 Days $434.00 $868.00 10-45 Days
22 BACH TENOR TROMBONE REF: BACH 36 BO OR EQUAL 2 $1,859.00 $3,718.00 30 Days $2,132.00 $4,264.00 10-45 Days
23 BACH TENOR TROMBONE REF: BACH 36 B OR EQUAL 2 $1,859.00 $3,718.00 30 Days $2,132.00 $4,264.00 10-45 Days
24 BACH TENOR TROMBONE REF: BACH 42 B OR EQUAL 2 $1,859.00 $3,718.00 30 Days $2,132.00 $4,264.00 10-45 Days
25 CERVENY TUBA  REF: CBB 681-4 OR EQUAL 1 $3,607.00 $3,607.00 30 Days $3,434.00 $3,434.00 20-60 Days
26 YAMAHA TUBA REF: YBB - 105WC OR EQUAL 2 $1,719.00 $3,438.00 30 Days $1,860.00 $3,720.00 10-45 Days
27 KING SOUSAPHONE REF: 2370W OR EQUAL 2 $2,683.00 $5,366.00 30 Days $3,118.00 $6,236.00 10-45 Days
28 KING SOUSAPHONE  REF: KING 2350W OR EQUAL 1 $3,829.00 $3,829.00 30 Days $4,428.00 $4,428.00 20-60 Days
29 KING SOUSAPHONE REF: 2350WSP OR EQUAL 1 $4,608.00 $4,608.00 30 Days $5,248.00 $5,248.00 20-60 Days
30 MUSSER ORCH BELLS REF: MUSSER M645 OR EQUAL 1 $779.00 $779.00 30 Days $860.00 $860.00 20-60 Days
31 PEARL PERCUSSION KITS REF: PK800 OR EQUAL 6 $147.00 $882.00 30 Days PK900C $0.00 $0.00 20-60 Days
32 YAMAHA CON BASS DRUM REF: CB640BFS7 OR EQUAL 1 $1,220.00 $1,220.00 30 Days $1,380.00 $1,380.00 20-60 Days
33 YAMAHA GLOCKENSPIEL REF: YG-250 OR EQUAL 1 $469.00 $469.00 30 Days $528.00 $528.00 20-60 Days
34 MC ADAMS METRONOME REF: 20X OR EQUAL 2 $639.00 $1,278.00 30 Days $0.00 $0.00 20-60 Days
35 DIGIMET DIGITAL METRONOME  (OR EQUAL) 2 $700.00 $1,400.00 30 Days $0.00 $0.00 20-60 Days
36 PETERSONS STROBE TUNER REF: CS5000 II OR EQUAL 1 $3,432.00 $3,432.00 30 Days $3,260.00 $3,260.00 10-45 Days

0-60% 3%
0-60% 0%

%OFF SHELF PRICE 0-60% %OFF SHELF PRICE 3%

UISD       
PRICE EXT. UISD       

PRICE

%OFF CATALOG PRICE %OFF CATALOG PRICE
%OFF LIST PRICE %OFF LIST PRICE

ITEM
WASHINGTON MUSIC CENTER

MODEL / DESCRIPTION EST 
QTY

BRAND /MODEL 
PROPOSED; If left blank we will 

assume you are bidding the specified model
EXT.

BRAND /MODEL 
PROPOSED; If left blank we will 

assume you are bidding the specified model

WOODWIND AND BRASSWIND

ETA ETA
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