UNITED INDEPENDENT SCHOOL DISTRICT

TIRES
RFP 023-2013

VENDORS
DESCRIPTION A To Z Tire & Battery, Inc. GCR Tire Centers Southern Tire Mart, LLC Wingfoot Commercial Tire Center
Bridgestone Discount: Egse:;nirD;E?_uzrg;/.
0% 10% Passenger & LT 20%; Med T 9 K 30%: OTI;Y Auto Radial & Light Truck Radial 48%; Unisteel
% DISCOUNT 0 ° Med Truck 25%; OTR  Lou [THEK S0 RLT D/139 30%; Med Commerical Radial 42%
- . Bias & Radial 32%;
Bias & Radial 32% . N
EST. Industrial 15%
QTY UNIT EXT UNIT EXT UNIT EXT UNIT EXT
9R22.5 $200.00 $20,000.00 $254.15 $25,415.00 $245.65 $24,565.00 No Bid
100
Brand Samson China Firestone USA FS560+/ USA N/A
10R22.5 $232.00 $23,200.00 $311.37 $31,137.00 $302.87 | $30,287.00 $323.00 | $32,300.00
100
Brand Samson China Firestone USA FS560+/ USA N/A Dunlop/ USA SP348
11R22.5 $251.00 $25,100.00 $301.11 $30,111.00 $288.61 $28,861.00 $343.62 | $34,362.00
100
Brand Samson China Firestone USA FS560+/ USA Dunlop/ USA SP348
225/70R19.5 $148.00 $14,800.00 $265.00 $26,500.00 $231.14 $23,114.00 $233.79 | $23,379.00
100
Brand Samson China Firestone USA FS560+/ USA Dunlop/ USA SP348
245/75R22.5 $286.00 | $28,600.00 $330.48 | $33,048.00 $325.98 | $32,598.00 $358.63 | $35,863.00
100
Brand Toyo Japan Bridgestone R250F USA BS R250F/ USA Goodyear/ USA/ G661
255/70R22.5 $197.00 $19,700.00 $274.28 $27,428.00 $261.78 $26,178.00 $327.78 | $32,778.00
100
Brand Samson China Firestone USA FS560+/ USA Goodyear/ USA/ G661
225/50R/17 $71.00 | $3,550.00 $103.59 $5,179.50 $99.40 | $4,970.00 $103.58 | $5,179.00
50
Brand Duro Taiwan Firestone USA FS WOI 500/ USA Goodyear/ USA/ Eag Sport
225/60R/16 $69.00 | $3,450.00 $85.76 $4,288.00 $90.31 | $4,515.50 $83.04 | $4,152.00
50
Brand Duro Taiwan Firestone USA FS FH PV41/ USA Goodyear/ USA/ Eag Sport
LTZi(S)gLS\I(?/lG $98.00 $4,900.00 $109.63 $5,481.50 $98.53 | $4,926.50 $125.91 | $6,295.50
50
Brand Pegasus China Firestone USA FS Trans HT/ USA Goodyear/ USA/ WRL HT E
235/55R/17 $78.00 | $3,900.00 $101.38 $5,069.00 $103.38 | $5,169.00 $114.21 | $5,710.50
50
Brand Duro Taiwan Firestone USA FS FH GTZ P/ USA Goodyear/ USA/ Eag Sport
LTZi(S)SLS\I(?/lG $105.00 $5,250.00 $111.80 $5,590.00 $111.80 | $5,590.00 $131.24 | $6,562.00
50
Brand Zeetex China Firestone USA FS Trans HT/ USA Goodyear/ USA/ WRL HT
LTZ;‘(S)QLSSMG $105.00 $5,250.00 $110.11 $5,505.50 $107.95 | $5,397.50 $135.92 | $6,796.00
50
Brand Zeetex China Firestone USA FS Trans HT/ USA Goodyear/ USA/ WRL HT E
LT245/;E$/17 10 $134.00 | $6,700.00 $120.64 $6,032.00 $118.12 | $5,906.00 $159.35 | $7,967.50
50
Brand Duro Taiwan Firestone USA FS Trans HT/ USA Goodyear/ USA/ WRL SRA




VENDORS

DESCRIPTION A To Z Tire & Battery, Inc. GCR Tire Centers Southern Tire Mart, LLC Wingfoot Commercial Tire Center
Bridgestone Discount: igse:;ni?;(i?_uzrg;/.
0% 10% Passenger & LT 20%; Med T 9 K 30%: OTD;Y Auto Radial & Light Truck Radial 48%; Unisteel
% DISCOUNT ° ° Med Truck 25%; OTR  Lou [THEK S0 RLT D/139 30%; Med Commerical Radial 42%
- . Bias & Radial 32%;
Bias & Radial 32% . N
EST. Industrial 15%
oTY UNIT EXT UNIT EXT UNIT EXT UNIT EXT
P265/70R/17 $105.00 $5,250.00 $112.82 $5,641.00 $110.82 $5,541.00 $133.90 $6,695.00
50
Brand MAXTRAC China Firestone USA FS Dest LE2/ USA Goodyear/ USA/ Assurance SL 113T
LTZ?SQBS/N $119.00 $5,950.00 $128.00 $6,400.00 $131.18 | $6,559.00 $168.38 | $8,419.00
50
Brand Zeetex China Firestone USA FS Trans HT/ USA Goodyear/ USA/ WRL SRA
P275-65R/18 $163.00 | $8,150.00 $115.56 $5,778.00 $165.25 | $8,262.50 $175.40 | $8,770.00
50
Brand Toyo USA Firestone USA FS Dest LE2/ USA Goodyear/ USA/ WRL SRA
LT275/65R/18 $182.00 | $9,100.00 $142.69 $7,134.50 $142.83 | $7,141.50 $178.91 | $8,945.50
50
Brand Toyo USA Bridgestone USA FS Trans HT/ USA Goodyear/ USA/ WRL SRA
7.00-15 $73.00 | $1,825.00 $78.00 $1,950.00 $75.60 | $1,890.00 No Bid |
25
Brand Hartland China Firestone USA Supermax M218/ China
7.50-16 $87.00 | $2,175.00 $85.00 $2,125.00 $93.82 | $2,345.50 No Bid |
25
Brand Hartland China Supermax Supermax M218/ China
18-8.50-8 $31.00 | $775.00 $43.00 | $1,075.00 $55.30 $1,382.50 No Bid |
25
Brand Duro Taiwan Carlisle Carlisle Links/ China
ST205/75R/15 $63.00 $1,575.00 $65.00 $1,625.00 $65.30 $1,632.50 $82.84 | $2,071.00
25
Brand Gladiartor China Triangle Omni Trail Radial / China Goodyear/ CAN/ MTHN TTC

Amount to be paid to UISD per discarded tire picked up by vendor

HEAVY DUTY TRUCK &
BUSES

$6.00 = 11R22.5; 245/75R22.5: 255/70R22.5

$5.00 = 9R22.5; 10R22.5; 225/70R19.5

$30.00 on 11R22.5

$50.00 11R225 if casing suitable for retreading

$15.00 10R225, 245/75R225 & 255/70R225 if
casings suitable for retreading

LIGHT DUTY TRUCKS &
BUSES

$3.00 all others

LT235/85R16 if casing suitable for retreading

Frequency of pick up

Monthly

Bi - Weekly

Weekly

Weekly During regular deliveries

Notes

No Charge on Passenger / Light Truck Tires

$60.00 Credit - Name Brand Virgin Casing
$35.00 Credit - off Brand Casing

$3.50 - Waste Tire - Passenger/ LT Tires

$5.00 - Waste Tire Fee - Med/ Heavy Truck Tires




