United Independent School District

Printing Services
RFP 007-2013

Brown Industries

Double Jcolors

Rabo Business

Weldon, Williams &

Kwik Kopy Printin Litho Business Forms Mendes Printin Rapidprint N
24 9 & Forms 2R Lick, Inc.
Vendor Accu-Print Adams Printing
% Off List Price 20% 0% 0% 1-50% 0% 0% 0% 0% 0% 0%
Shipping charges are not included in
proposed pricing.Shipping up to 100 will Reference to Item# 13: Discour|
be $50.00;Shipping up to 250 will be based on quantity of identical
Notes $100.00;Shipping up to 500# will be items. Plus shipping cost-Listed
$250.00;Shipping up to 1000 will be in catalog. Please call vendor
$230.00;Shipping up to 2000 will be for quote.
$325.00
Item #1 320
Printed Envelopes (Standard & Window)
Regular #10
Accu-Print Adams Printing Brown Industries Double Jcolors Kwik Kopy Printing Litho Business Forms Mendes Printing Rabo Business Forms Rapidprint Weldon, William & Lick ,
Vendors Inc.
. Total . Total . Total | Price Per Total . Total Price Per Total Price Per Total Price Per Total Price Per Total Price Per Total
EstQty Price Per Unit Price Per Unit Price Per Unit Unit Price Per Unit Unit Unit Unit Unit Unit
1000 0.0908 $ 90.80 No Bid No Bid $85.00 $85.00 No Bid No Bid $0.049 $49.00 $0.055 $55.00
5000 0.0466 $ 233.00 $77.00 $385.00 $60.00 $300.00 $60.15 $300.75 $0.030 $150.00 $0.05 $250.00
10000 0.0376 $ 376.00 $54.00 $540.00 No Bid No Bid $59.00 $590.00 $54.00 $540.00 $0.027 $270.00 No Bid $0.05 $500.00 No Bid
20000 0.0337 $ 674.00 $45.00 $900.00 $46.50 $930.00 $41.46 $829.20 $0.025 $500.00 $0.05 $1,000.00
50000 0.0304 $ 1,520.00 $35.00 $1,750.00 $35.00 $1,750.00 $32.69 $1,634.50 $0.025 | $1.250.00 $0.05 $2,500.00
50000+ 0.0205 $ 1.475.00 No Bid No Bid $35.00 $1,785.00 No Bid No Bid $0.025 | $1.275.00 No Bid No Bid
Quantity of 51,000 s the same as the
Shipping charges not included in pricing. 50,000 price per thousand:the next price
Notes
Call for quote. break is when the quantity reaches
65,000-price per unit will be $32.77.
WINDOW ENVELOPES |
Accu-Print Adams Printing Brown Industries Double Jcolors Kwik Kopy Printing Litho Business Forms Mendes Printing Rabo Business Forms Rapidprint Weldon, William & Lick ,
Vendors Inc.
Price Per Price Per Price Per Price Per Price Per Price Per
EstQty Price Per Unit Total Price Per Unit Total price perunit| Ot Unit Total Price Per Unit Total Unit Total Unit Total Unit Total Unit Total Unit Total
1000 $0.0933 $ 93.30 No Bid No Bid $95.00 $95.00 No Bid No Bid $0.049 $49.00 $0.065 $65.00
5000 $0.0489 $ 244.50 $96.00 $480.00 $61.50 $307.50 $63.15 $315.75 $0.035 $175.00 $0.06 $300.00
10000 $0.0403 $ 403.00 $62.00 $620.00 No Bid No Bid $61.00 $610.00 $55.65 $556.50 $0.030 $300.00 No Bid $0.06 $600.00 No Bid
20000 $0.0364 $ 728.00 $50.00 $1,000.00 $51.00 $1,020.00 $45.00 $900.00 $0.027 $540.00 $0.06 $1,200.00
50000 $0.0331 $ 1,655.00 $40.00 $2,000.00 $38.90 $1,945.00 $36.21 $1,810.50 $0.025 | $1.250.00 $0.06 $3,000.00
50000+ $0.0321 $ 1,605.00 No Bid No Bid $38.90 $1,983.90 No Bid No Bid $0.025 | $1.275.00 No Bid No Bid
Quantity of 51,000 s the same as the
Shipping charges not included in pricing. 50,000 price per thousand:the next price
Notes
Call for quote. break is when the quantity reaches
65.000-price per unit will be $36.08.
Special Window Envelopes #10
Accu-Print Adams Printing Brown Industries Double Jcolors Kwik Kopy Printing Litho Business Forms Mendes Printing Rabo Business Forms Rapidprint Weldon, William & Lick ,
Vendors Inc.
. Total . Total . Total | Price Per Total . Total Price Per Total Price Per Total Price Per Total Price Per Total Price Per Total
EstQty Price Per Unit Price Per Unit Price Per Unit Unit Price Per Unit Unit Unit Unit Unit Unit
1000 $0.3154 $ 315.40 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
5000 $0.0931 $ 46550 | $125.00 $625.00 No Bid No Bid
10000 $0.0806 $ 806.00 $85.00 $850.00 No Bid No Bid $78.00 $780.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
20000 $0.0763 $ 1,526.00 $63.00 $1,260.00 $51.00 $1,020.00
50000 $0.0646 $ 3,230.00 $50.00 $2,500.00 $38.90 $1,945.00
50000+ $0.0636 $ 3.180.00 No Bid No Bid $38.90 $1,983.90
Quantity of 51,000 s the same as the
Shipping charges not included in pricing. 50,000 price per thousand:the next price
Notes
Call for quote. break is when the quantity reaches
65.,000-price per unit will be $36.08.
6X9 Window Envelopes #10 Black Ink On White 24# Center Seam
Accu-Print Adams Printing Brown Industries Double Jcolors Kwik Kopy Printing Litho Business Forms Mendes Printing Rabo Business Forms Rapidprint Weldon, William & Lick ,
Vendors Inc.
. Total . Total . Total | Price Per Total . Total Price Per Total Price Per Total Price Per Total Price Per Total Price Per Total
EstQty Price Per Unit Price Per Unit Price Per Unit Unit Price Per Unit Unit Unit Unit Unit Unit
1000 $0.5022 $ 502.20 $0.56 $560.00 No Bid No Bid
5000 $0.1339 $ 669.50 |  $138.00 $690.00 165.00 $812.00
10000 $0.0975 $ 975.00 $83.00 $830.00 No Bid No Bid 97.50 $975.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
20000 $0.0793 $ 1,586.00 $56.00 $1,120.00 94.95 $1,899.00
50,000 $0.0527 $ 2,635.00 $46.70 $2,335.00 56.00 $2,800.00
50,000+ $0.0519 $ 2,595.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Note: Accu-Print Shipping charges not included in pricing. Call for quote.
28# White Catalog Envelope(No Window) 9 1/2 x 12 1/2. Print Front only. Black Ink. Logo prints on left side. Flap on right on Open-end envelope-folded flaps) peel and seal
Accu-Print Adams Printing Brown Industries Double Jcolors Kwik Kopy Printing Litho Business Forms Mendes Printing Rabo Business Forms Rapidprint Weldon, William & Lick ,
Vendors Inc.
Price Per Unit Total Price Per Unit Total . Total | Price Per Total . Total Price Per Total Price Per Total Price Per Total Price Per Total Price Per Total
EstQty Price Per Unit Unit Price Per Unit Unit Unit Unit Unit Unit
5,000 $901.68 $ 901.68 $0.39 $192500 | $222.02 $1,110.10 011 550.00
10,000 $1,644.04 $ 1,644.04 No Bid No Bid No Bid $0.25 $2545.00 | $194.85 $1,948.50 0.10 950.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
20,000 $2,962.53 $ 2,962.53 $0.20 $3999.00 | $187.41 $3,748.20 0.09 1,800.00
25,000+ $3519.97 $ 3519.97 $0.02 $4,035.00 No Bid No Bid 0.09 2,250.00

Note: Accu-Print Shipping charges not included in pricing. Call for quote.



Item # 2

Tax Statements
Tax Statement 24# Bond Black, Red & Blue Ink

vend Accu-Print Adams Printing Brown Industries Double Jcolors Kwik Kopy Printing Litho Business Forms Mendes Printing Rabo Business Forms Rapidprint Weldon, William & Lick,Inc.
endor
Price Per Price Per Price Per Price Per Price Per Price Per Price Per Price Per
Est Qty ] Price Per Unit Total Price Per Unit| Total Unit Total Unit Total Unit Total Unit Total Unit Total Unit Total Unit Total Unit Total
85,000 $0.0394 $ 3,349.00 $21.76 $1,849.60 $33.24 $2,825.40 $29.75 $2,528.75 $19.90 $1,691.50
90,000 $0.0391 $ 3,519.00 $22.23 $2,000.70 $34.28 $3,085.20 No Bid No Bid $19.76 $1,778.40
95,000 $0.0388 $ 3,686.00 $21.85 $2,075.75 No Bid No Bid $34.00 $3,230.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid $19.53 $1,855.35 No Bid No Bid
100,000 $0.0386 $ 3,860.00 No Bid No Bid $33.50 $3,350.00 $27.46 $2,746.00 $19.35 $1,935.00
105,000+ $0.0384 $4,032.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $19.23 $2,019.15
Note: Accu-Print Shipping charges not included in pricing. Call for quote.
Item #3
Carbonless Continous Forms
Purchase Order 6-Part Purchase Order 2 Color Ink Continuous Feed
Vendors - .
Accu-Print Adams Printing Brown Industries Double Jcolors Kwik Kopy Printing Litho Business Forms Mendes Printing Rabo Business Forms Rapidprint Weldon, William & Lick,
Est. Qty Inc.
Price Per Price Per Price Per Price Per Price Per Price Per Price Per Price Per
6 Part Price Per Unit Total Price Per Unit] TOTAL Unit TOTAL Unit TOTAL Unit TOTAL Unit TOTAL Unit TOTAL Unit TOTAL Unit TOTAL Unit TOTAL
5000 $304.00 $1,520.00 $292.50 $1,462.50
10000 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $224.00 $2,240.00 No Bid No Bid $186.92 $1,869.20 No Bid No Bid
15000 $205.00 $3,075.00 $175.00 $2,625.00
RECIEPT BOOK 3 NCR COPIES WHITE, Canay YELLOW, AND PINK 4 TO A PAGE 200 SHEETS PER BOOK
Vendors
Accu-Print Adams Printing Brown Industries Double Jcolors Kwik Kopy Printing Litho Business Forms Mendes Printing Rabo Business Forms Rapidprint Weldon, William & Lick,
Est. Qty Inc.
Price Per Price Per Price Per Price Per Price Per Price Per Price Per Price Per
3 Part Price Per Unit Total Price Per Unit Total Unit Total Unit Total Unit Total Unit Total Unit Total Unit Total Unit Total Unit TOTAL
50 BOOKS $34.11 $1,705.50 $36.74 $1,837.00 $17.80 $890.00
75 BOOKS . 28.89 2,166.75 . . 32.24 2,418.00 . . 13.98 1,048.50 . .
No Bid $ $ No Bid No Bid $ S No Bid No Bid $ $ No Bid No Bid
100 BOOKS $25.90 $2,590.00 $30.24 $3,024.00 $11.98 $1,198.00
100+BOOKS] No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $10.27 $ 1,540.00
Notes: 150 bks=1,540.00
Small Purhcase Orders
Vendors il f
st Ony Accu-Print Adams Printing Brown Industries Double Jcolors Kwik Kopy Printing Litho Business Forms Mendes Printing Rabo Business Forms Rapidprint Weldon, V‘II'”'am & Lick,
- nc.
Price Per Price Per Price Per Price Per Price Per Price Per Price Per Price Per
QTY Price Per Unit Total Price Per Unit| Total Unit Total Unit Total Unit Total Unit Total Unit Total Unit Total Unit Total Unit TOTAL
1000 $0.29 $290.00 $196.00 $196.00 $0.20 $200.00 $206.00 $206.00
2500 No Bid $168.00 $420.00 No Bid No Bid $167.20 $418.00 No Bid $0.128 $320.00 $154.00 $385.00 No Bid No Bid
5000 $150.00 $750.00 $159.60 $798.00 $0.10 $500.00 $108.53 $542.65




Iltem # 4

Laser Checks-Security Features
Laser Check 11" 24# Maroon

United Independent School District

Printing Services
RFP 007-2013

Weldon, William & Lick,

Accu-Print Adams Printing Brown Industries Double Jcolors Kwik Kopy Printing . . Mendes Printing Rabo Business Forms Rapidprint
Vendors Litho Business Forms Inc.
Price Per Price Per Price Per Price Per Price Per Price Per Price Per Price Per Price Per Price Per
Est Qty Unit Total Unit Total Unit Total Unit Total Unit Total Unit Total Unit Total Unit Total Unit Total Unit Total
10,000 No Bid No Bid $39.90 $399.00
15,000 No Bid $125.50 $1,852.50 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $34.95 $524.25 No Bid No Bid
20,000 $95.00 $1,900.00 $32.75 $655.00
25,000 $81.00 $2,025.00 $27.96 $699.00
Item#4 must be
purchased with Item#5
Notes: Zfold
Payroll: Laser Check 11" blank check-stock-Maroon pressure
seal Z fold.
. L . . . L . . Weldon, William & Lick,
Vendors Accu-Print Adams Printing Brown Industries Double Jcolors Kwik Kopy Printing Litho Business Forms Mendes Printing Rabo Business Forms Rapidprint Inc.
Price Per Price Per Price Per Price Per Price Per Price Per Price Per Price Per Price Per Price Per
Est Qty Unit Total Unit Total Unit Total Unit Total Unit Total Unit Total Unit Total Unit Total Unit Total Unit Total
5,000 No Bid No Bid $194.60 $973.00
10.000 No Bid $125.00 | $1,250.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $11650 | $1,165.00 No Bid No Bid
15,000 $95.00 $1,425.00 $88.00 $1,320.00
20,000 $81.00 $1,620.00 $71.00 $1,420.00
ltem #5
Laser Checks-No Security Features/Voucher
Laser Check 11" 24# Maroon Direct Deposit Form/Voucher Pressure Seal Z Fold
Accu-Print Adams Printing Brown Industries Double Jcolors Kwik Kopy Printing . . Mendes Printing X Rapidprint WEitem, Willlerm & Lfelx,
Vendors Litho Business Forms Rabo Business Forms Inc.
Price Per Price Per Price Per Price Per Price Per Price Per Price Per Price Per Price Per Price Per
Est Qty Unit Total Unit Total Unit Total Unit Total Unit Total Unit Total Unit Total Unit Total Unit Total Unit Total
5,000 $140.00 $700.00 $194.60 $973.00
10,000 No Bid $85.00 $850.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $116.50 $1,165.00 No Bid No Bid
15,000 $63.33 $949.95 $88.00 $1,320.00
20,000 $52.50]  $1,050.00) $71.00 | $1,420.00
Iltem #6
IRS Form
1099 M Blank Pressure Seal Form
. L " . . L . . Weldon, William & Lick,
Vendor Accu-Print Adams Printing Brown Industries Double Jcolors Kwik Kopy Printing i ey t— Mendes Printing T - — Rapidprint -
Price Per Price Per Price Per Price Per Price Per Price Per Price Per Price Per Price Per Price Per
Est Qty Unit Total Unit Total Unit Total Unit Total Unit Total Unit Total Unit Total Unit Total Unit Total Unit Total
250 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
500 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $70.10 | $70.10 No Bid No Bid
750 $0.20 $150.00 No Bid No Bid
1,000 $0.21 $210.00 $115.90 $115.90
W2 Blank Pressure Seal Form
. L " . . L . . Weldon, William & Lick,
Vendor Accu-Print Adams Printing Brown Industries Double Jcolors Kwik Kopy Printing i ey t—. Mendes Printing e iy - t— Rapidprint -
Price Per Price Per Price Per Price Per Price Per Price Per Price Per Price Per Price Per Price Per
Est Qty Unit Total Unit Total Unit Total Unit Total Unit Total Unit Total Unit Total Unit Total Unit Total Unit Total
3,000 $183.00 $549.00 $116.63 $349.89
6,000 No Bid $152.50 $915.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $99.98 $599.88 No Bid No Bid
9,000 $146.67 $1,320.03 $93.32 $839.88




Item #7

United Independent School District
Printing Services

Promotional Departmental 2 Pocket Folder W/Double Sided Layered Inserts

RFP 007-2013

: o . . e Litho Business L X . Weldon, William & Lick,
Vendors Accu-Print Adams Printing Brown Industries Double Jcolors Kwik Kopy Printing Forms Mendes Printing Rabo Business Forms Rapidprint ™~
Price Per| Price Price Per| Price Price Per Price Per Price Price Per Price Per Price Per
Qty Unit Total Per Unit] Total Unit Total Per Unit | Total Unit Total Unit Total | Per Unit Total Unit Total Unit Total Unit Total
100 $11.9079] $1,190.79
500 $4.4007 | $2,200.35 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
1000 $2.2569 | $2,256.90
Note: Accu-Print Shipping charges not included in pricing. Call for quote.
Item #8
Brochures And Vouchers
Trifold Brochures 8.5 X 11 W 100# Gloss Text, CMYK(Full color), Aqueous coating both sides with bleeds.
Accu-Print Adams Printing Brown Industries Double Jcolors Kwik Kopy Printing (LD Essiiness Mendes Printing Rabo Business Forms Rapidprint Wt tem, Wil & (il
Vendors Forms Inc.
Price Per| Price Price Per| Price Price Per Price Per Price Price Per Price Per Price Per
Qty Unit Total Per Unit] Total Unit Total Per Unit | Total Unit Total Unit Total | Per Unit Total Unit Total Unit Total Unit Total
500 $0.36 $180.00 $672.85 $672.85 $0.49 $245.00
1000 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $0.23 $230.00 No Bid No Bid $698.72 $698.72 $0.27 $270.00 No Bid
5000 $0.12 $600.00 $175.60 $878.00 $0.16 $800.00
Bifold(Two-Fold) Brochures 8.5H x 11 W 100# Gloss Text, CMYK(Full color), Aqueous coating both side with bleeds.
Titho Business Weldon, William & LIcK, |
Vendors Accu-Print Adams Printing Brown Industries Double Jcolors Kwik Kopy Printing Forms Mendes Printing Rabo Business Forms Rapidprint Inc.
Price Per| Price Price Per| Price Price Per Price Per Price Price Per Price Per Price Per
Qty Unit Total Per Unit] Total Unit Total Per Unit | Total Unit Total Unit Total | Per Unit Total Unit Total Unit Total Unit Total
500 $0.36 $180.00 $672.85 $672.85 $0.49 $245.00
1000 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $0.23 $230.00 No Bid No Bid $698.72 $698.72 $0.27 $270.00 No Bid
5000 $0.12 $600.00 $175.60 $878.00 $0.16 $800.00
Vouchers 8.5 X 11 24# Watermark Stock With Control Number
i e K K . Litho Business . K . Weldon, William & Lick,
Vendors Accu-Print Adams Printing Brown Industries Double Jcolors Kwik Kopy Printing B Mendes Printing Rabo Business Forms Rapidprint .
Price Per| Price Price Per| Price Price Per Price Per Price Price Per Price Per Price Per
Qty Unit Total Per Unit] Total Unit Total Per Unit | Total Unit Total Unit Total | Per Unit Total Unit Total Unit Total Unit Total
5000 $90.00 | $450.00 $50.00 | $250.00 $99.00 $495.00
10000 No Bid $67.50 | $675.00 No Bid No Bid $44.00 $440.00 No Bid No Bid $66.90 $669.00 No Bid No Bid
15000 $55.00 | $825.00 $37.73 $565.95 $55.40 $831.00
Item #9 Graduation Tickets And Brochures
Graduation Tickets For AHS, UHS, USHS, LBJ (8 Color Tickets)
i . i i . Litho Business . i L Weldon, William & Lick,
Vendor Accu-Print Adams Printing Brown Industries Double Jcolors Kwik Kopy Printing Forms Mendes Printing Rabo Business Forms Rapidprint Inc.
Price Per Price Price Per Price Price Per Price Per Price Price Per Price Per Price Per
Est Qty Unit Total Per Unit] Total Unit Total Per Unit | Total Unit Total Unit Total Per Unit Total Unit Total Unit Total Unit Total
8000 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $0.03 $240.00 No Bid $0.07]  $560.00 No Bid




United Independent School District
Printing Services

Graduation Programs For AHS, UHS, USHS, LBJHS 14 pt., 80# Gloss Color Programs

RFP 007-2013

Vendor

Accu-Print

Adams Printing

Brown Industries

Double Jcolors

Kwik Kopy Printing

Litho Business
Forms

Mendes Printing

Rabo Business Forms

Rapidprint

Weldon, William & Lick,

Inc.

Est Qty

Price Per

Unit Total

Price
Per Unit

Total

Price Per
Unit

Total

Price
Per Unit

Total

Price Per

Unit Total

Price Per
Unit

Total

Price
Per Unit

Total

Price Per
Unit

Total

Price Per
Unit

Total

Price Per
Unit

Total

2,000 (20
page
program)

$1.4024 | $2,804.80

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

$1.02 _ ]$2,040.00

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

$1.99

$3,980.00

No Bid

2,000 (24
page
program)

$1.7763 | $3,552.60

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

$1.04 ]$2,080.00

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

$1.99

$3,980.00

No Bid

2,000 (28
page

$1.8544 | $3,708.80

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

$1.26  ]$2,520.00

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

$2.09

$4,180.00

No Bid

2,000 (32
page
program)

$2.1086 | $4,217.20

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

$1.51 ]$3,020.00

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

$2.09

$4,180.00

No Bid

2,500 (20
page
program)

$1.1898 | $2,974.64

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

$0.87  1$2,175.00

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

$1.79

$4,475.00

No Bid

2,500 (24
page
program)

$1.5046 | $3,761.50

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

$0.92 ] $2,300.00

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

$1.79

$4,475.00

No Bid

2,500 (28
page
program)

$1.5608 | $3,902.00

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

$1.07 _ ]$2,675.00

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

$1.89

$4,725.00

No Bid

2,500 (32
page
program)

$1.7742 | $4,435.50

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

$1.29 ]$3,225.00

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

$1.89

$4,725.00

No Bid

3,000(20
page
program)

$1.0460 | $3,138.00

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

$0.77 ]$2,310.00

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

$1.59

$4,770.00

No Bid

3,000(24
page
program)

$1.3170 | $3,951.00

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

$0.83 | $2,490.00

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

$1.59

$4,770.00

No Bid

3,000(28
page
program)

$1.3675 | $4,102.50

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

$0.96 | $2,880.00

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

$1.69

$5,070.00

No Bid

3,000(32
page
program)

$1.5594 | $4,678.20

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

$1.16 | $3,480.00

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

$1.69

$5,070.00

No Bid

Note: Accu-Print Shipping charges not included in pricing. Call for quote.




United Independent School District

Printing Services
RFP 007-2013
Item #10
Public Relations - UISD Calendar
Accu-Print Adams Printi Brown Industri Double Jcol Kwik Kopy Printi Mendes Printi Rapidprint SR, BT & LS
VENDORS ccu-Prin ams Printing rown Industries ouble Jcolors wik Kopy Printing LR Eeess Foms endes Printing | o 5 ciness Forms apidprin e
Price Per Price Per Price Per Price Per Price Per Price Per Price Per Price Per Price Per Price Per
Qty Unit Total Unit Total Unit Total Unit Total Unit Total Unit Total Unit Total Unit Total Unit Total Unit Total
250 $5.2728 | $1,318.20 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid NoBid ] NoBid No Bid
500 $4.8561 | $2,428.05 $6.73 $3,365.00
Item #11
Public Relations -Publication
. _— . . . i —— Weldon, William & Lick,
Vendors Accu-Print Adams Printing Brown Industries Double Jcolors Kwik Kopy Printing 1T Bsess Eais Mendes Printing R B e Rapidprint e,
Price Per Price Per Price Per Price Per Price Per Price Per Price Per Price Per Price Per Price Per
Qty Unit Total Unit Total Unit Total Unit Total Unit Total Unit Total Unit Total Unit Total Unit Total Unit Total
100 $3.5910 | $359.10 $5.46 $546.00 No Bid No Bid
500 $2.2270 | $1,113.50 No Bid No Bid No Bid $2.56 $1,280.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid $3.18 $1,590.00 No Bid
1000 $2.0784 | $2,078.40 $1.59 $1,590.00 $1.98 $1,980.00
Item #12
Athletics - Roll Of Tickets For Student And Adult?
Accu-Print Adams Printi Brown Industri Double Jcol Kwik Kopy Printi Mendes Printi SR, BT & LS
Vendors ceu-Frn ams Frinting rown inustries ouble Jeofors Wik Ropy Frinting Litho Business Forms enaes Frinting | paho Business Forms Rapidprint Inc.
Price Per Price Per Price Per Price Per Price Per Price Per Price Per Price Per Price Per Price Per
Qty Unit Total Unit Total Unit Total Unit Total Unit Total Unit Total Unit Total Unit Total Unit Total Unit Total
1ROLL $224.32 224.32
10 ROLLS 33.14 331.40
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $ $
20 ROLLS $22.52 $450.40
50 + ROLLS $16.75 $837.50




Item #13

Public Relations - Helping Hands Pin

Vendors Accu-Print Adams Printing Brown Industries Double Jcolors Kwik Kopy Printing 1T DS Eaims Mendes Printing R BV e Rapidprint Weldon, \Allr':!am & Lick,
Price Per Price Per Price Per Price Per Price Per Price Per Price Per Price Per Price Per Price Per
Qty Unit Total Unit Total Unit Total Unit Total Unit Total Unit Total Unit Total Unit Total Unit Total Unit Total
25
50
75
100
150
200 No Bid No Bid Call vendor to order No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
from Catalog.
250
300
350
400
450
500 +
Item #14
Tax Office - Laser Check - Refund Check
Vendors Accu-Print Adams Printing Brown Industries Double Jcolors Kwik Kopy Printing Litho Business Forms Mendes Printing Rabo Business Forms Rapidprint e e \I\I/:Llam & Lt
Price Per Price Per Price Per Price Per Price Per Price Per Price Per Price Per Price Per Price Per
Qty Unit Total Unit Total Unit Total Unit Total Unit Total Unit Total Unit Total Unit Total Unit Total Unit Total
500 $600.00] $600.00| No Bid No Bid $275.00] $275.00
1000 No Bid $650.00] $650.00) No Bid No Bid 0.54 $540.00 No Bid No Bid $275.00] $275.00 No Bid No Bid
1500 $466.67] $700.00 0.37 $555.00 1.9666] $295.00




