UNITED INDEPENDENT SCHOOL DISTRICT

CORE NETWORK & E-MAIL UPGRADE & NETWORK MAINTENANCE (E-RATE 13)

RFP 077-2009

Section |. Network Equipment Maintenance

. Netsync
ATET | | rvaing | Nework [ S0" 0T
Vendor Solutions y ’
$843,344.95 $747,111.01 $715,873.92 NO BID

Smartnet Maintenance




UNITED INDEPENDENT SCHOOL DISTRICT

CORE NETWORK & E-MAIL UPGRADE & NETWORK EQUIPMENT
RFP 077-2009

EXCHANGE EMAIL CONVERSION

Insight Netsync Network Sequel Data Systems,
VENDOR AT&T Networking Solutions Inc
DESCRIPTION QTY PUr?zlte Total I:L,Jr?éte Total I:L,Jr?éte Total Unit Price Total
Enclosure / Chassis 1 $46,912.96 | $46,912.96
Half-Height Blade Servers to host ESX 2 $7,319.14 | $14,638.28
Half-Height Blade Servers Unified/ Integrated 5
Communications $6,443.14 | $12,886.28
Storage Array (Option 1) EVA4400 1 $123,019.00| $123,019.00
Storage Array (Option 2) EVA6400 1 $146,800.10( $146,800.10
Storage Array (Option 3) EVA8400 1 $185,161.00| $185,161.00
MS Exchange Server Enterprise 1 NO BID NO BID NO BID $3,460.22 | $3,460.22
MS Exchange Server Enterprise User CAL 1500 $28.70 $43,050.00
VMEP- Academic VM Infrastructure Enterprise 1
4 for 2 processors $4,618.00 | $4,618.00
MS Datacenter 2008 1 $2,054.11 | $2,054.11
Integration Service 1 $22,400.00 | $22,400.00

list other items that may not been considered In
the RFP on Company Letterhead

See Attached SOW




A. DATA CORE UPGRADE

UNITED INDEPENDENT SCHOOL DISTRICT
CORE NETWORK & E-MAIL UPGRADE & NETWORK EQUIPMENT MAINTENANCE (ERATE 13)

RFP 077-2009

VENDOR AT & T INSIGHT NETWORKING NETSYNC NETWORK SOLUTIONS SEQUEL DATA SYSTEM
DESCRIPTION UNIT PRICE JUNIT INSTALL TOTAL UNIT PRICE JUNIT INSTALL TOTAL UNIT PRICE JUNIT INSTALL TOTAL UNIT PRICE__| UNIT INSTALL TOTAL
TOTAL $1,297,053.52 $623,287.50 $617,454.00 NO BID NOBID NO BID
B. VOICE CORE UPGRADE 7.1.X & INTEGRATED MESSAGING

VENDOR AT & T INSIGHT NETWORKING NETSYNC NETWORK SOLUTIONS SEQUEL DATA SYSTEM
DESCRIPTION UNIT PRICE JUNIT INSTALL TOTAL UNIT PRICE JUNIT INSTALL TOTAL UNIT PRICE [UNIT INSTALL TOTAL UNIT PRICE__| UNIT INSTALL TOTAL
TOTAL $779,771.94 $507,191.78 $499,428.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID
C. VIDEO CORE UPGRADE

VENDOR AT & T INSIGHT NETWORKING NETSYNC NETWORK SOLUTIONS SEQUEL DATA SYSTEM
DESCRIPTION UNIT PRICE JUNIT INSTALL TOTAL UNIT PRICE JUNIT INSTALL TOTAL UNIT PRICE JUNIT INSTALL TOTAL UNIT PRICE__| UNIT INSTALL TOTAL
TOTAL $334,447.00 $295,935.45 $368,622.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID
BONDING

VENDOR AT & T INSIGHT NETWORKING NETSYNC NETWORK SOLUTIONS SEQUEL DATA SYSTEM
BONDING INCLUDED $17,830.18 INCLUDED NOT APPLICABLE

VENDOR AT & T INSIGHT NETWORKING NETSYNC NETWORK SOLUTIONS SEQUEL DATA SYSTEM
DESCRIPTION UNIT PRICE JUNIT INSTALL TOTAL UNIT PRICE JUNIT INSTALL TOTAL UNIT PRICE JUNIT INSTALL TOTAL UNIT PRICE__| UNIT INSTALL TOTAL
GRAND TOTAL $2,411,272.46 $1,444,244.91 $1,485,504.00 NO BID NOBID NO BID




