UNITED INDEPENDENT SCHOOL DISTRICT
RFP 2012-069

District Wide Publications

Taredo Morning | Laredo Morning Tiberty Press Tiberty Press Rabo Business
Vendors| Adams Printing Times (Option 1) | Times (Option 2) (Option 1) (Option 2) Marketing Depot Princo Solutions Rapidprint Sledge Media

Est.
Description Quantity Price Price Price Price Price Price Price Price Price Price
Brochures - Department Brochures, Program Brochures, etc.
*8.5x11
:::: ;’;Z;"" Both Sides 500 $240.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $440.00 $110.00 $675.00 $175.81 $300.00
*Tri-Fold Brochure Format
*100 Ib Gloss Book with aqueous coating both sides
Flyers - For Departments and Programs, etc. 500
*8.5X 11 $250.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $390.00 $96.00 $815.00 $153.41 $215.00
*Full Color on Both Sides 1000
*Full Bleed $270.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $410.00 $105.00 $845.00 $163.97 $250.00
*1001b Gloss Book with aqueous coating both sides 5000 . . . .

$640.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $1,220.00 $300.00 $995.00 $486.67 $360.00
Flyers - For Departments and Programs, etc. 500
*11x17 $370.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $790.00 $195.00 $849.00 $275.07 $400.00
*Full Color on Both Sides 1000
*Full Bleed $410.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $860.00 $215.00 $890.00 $319.22 $435.00
*1001b Gloss Book with aqueous coating both sides 5000
$870.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $2,540.00 $635.00 $1,190.00 $950.62 $785.00

Postcards - Birthday Cards 56
*4x6 $140.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $150.00 $37.50 $1,290.00 $70.34 $88.00
*Full Color on Both Sides 1000
*Full Bleed $190.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $180.00 $45.00 $1,390.00 $82.33 $100.00
*15-Pt. Card Stock 2500
*Gloss Finish $270.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $300.00 $75.00 $1,495.00 $140.85 $165.00
Postcards - Birthday Cards %59
5x7 $170.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $210.00 $51.00 $1,395.00 $92.00 $125.00
*Full Color on Both Sides 1000
*Full Bleed $225.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $240.00 $60.00 $1,495.00 $108.23 $150.00
*15-Pt. Card Stock 2500
*Gloss Finish $310.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $430.00 $107.50 $1,695.00 $191.54 $245.00
Postcards - Birthday Cards -
*8.5x11 $210.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $460.00 $115.00 $1,495.00 $183.41 $175.00
*Full Color on Both Sides 1000
*Full Bleed $250.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $560.00 $140.00 $1,595.00 $223.06 $225.00
*15-Pt. Card Stock 2500
*Gloss Finish $340.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $1,280.00 $320.00 $1,995.00 $511.60 $355.00
Posters 250
*11x17 $320.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $595.00 $150.51 $275.00
*Full Color 500
*Full Bleed $370.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $850.00 $210.00 $650.00 $294.18 $315.00
*100# Gloss Book 1000
*Gloss Finish $425.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $890.00 $220.00 $695.00 $330.21 $465.00
Posters 250
*18x24 $525.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $599.00 $247.50 $485.00
*Full Color 500
*Full Bleed $550.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $1,495.00 $375.00 $649.00 $522.69 $550.00
*100# Gloss Book 1000
*Gloss Finish $670.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $1,920.00 $480.00 $779.00 $719.62 $700.00
Posters 10
*11"x17" No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $175.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
*Full Color 25
*Full Bleed No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $260.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
*1004# Gloss Book 50
*Gloss Finish No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $325.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

G No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $490.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

= No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $650.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid




RFP 2012-069

District Wide Publications

Taredo Morning Taredo Morning Tiberty Press Tiberty Press Rabo Business
Vendors| Adams Printing Times (Option 1) Times (Option 2) (Option 1) (Option 2) Marketing Depot Princo Solutions Rapidprint Sledge Media
Est.
Description Quantity Price Price Price Price Price Price Price Price Price Price
Posters 250 ) ) . . ) ) . . ) )
*24"x36" No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
*

Full Color 500 ) . . . ) ) . . ) .
*Full Bleed No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
*100# Gloss Book
e 210% 500 1000 ) ! . . . . . . ' '

Gloss Finish No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Posters 10 ) ) . . ) . . ) i
*24"x36" No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $420.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
*

Full Color 25 » ) ) ) » ) ) _ )
*Full Bleed No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $760.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
*

1

00# G!o.ss Book 50 ) ) ) ) ) ) ) ) )
*Gloss Finish No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $1,030.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
7
5 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $1,550.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
100 ) ' . . ) . . ) '
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $2,060.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Posters 250 , A . . , A . . , A
*36"x48" No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
*

Full Color 500 ) i . . ) i . . ) i
*Full Bleed No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
*100# Gloss Book
N 088 Bo0 1000 _ _ ) ! ) ’ ) ' ) '

Gloss Finish No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Posters 10 ) ) . . ) . . ) )
*36"x48" No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $550.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
*

Full Color 25 ) i . ‘ ) . . ) i
*Full Bleed No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $990.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
*

100# G!o.ss Book 50 ) ) . ‘ ) . . ) )
*Gloss Finish No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $1,340.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

75 . . . . . . . . .
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $2,020.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
100 . . . . . . . . .
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $2,680.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Posters 250 ) ) : ) : ) ' . ;
*18"x24" $525.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
*

Full Color 500 . ) X . . . " ;
*Full Bleed $550.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $1,490.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
*

100# paper 1000 . ) X . . " n i

$670.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $1,920.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Posters 10 ) ) . . ) . . ) )
*18"x24" No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $260.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
*

Full Color 25 » ) ) ) » ) ) ) )
*Full Bleed No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $415.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
*

1

00# paper 50 ) ! ) ) ) . ! ' !
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $560.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

75 . . . . . . . . .
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $840.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

100 . " . . . . . " .
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $1,120.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid




RFP 2012-069
District Wide Publications

Taredo Morning | Laredo Morning Tiberty Press Tiberty Press Rabo Business
Vendors| Adams Printing Times (Option 1) | Times (Option 2) (Option 1) (Option 2) Marketing Depot Princo Solutions Rapidprint Sledge Media
st
Description Quantity Price Price Price Price Price Price Price Price Price Price
Programs/Calendar - Employee Banquet, Administrative Calendar, etc. 4 Pages - $985 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 4 pages - $582.40 4 pages - $1,950
*Cover and Back Cover 100# UV Coating 500 8 Pages - $1,140 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 8 pages - $851.20 | 8 pages - $2,250
*60# or 80# Gloss Text 24 Pages - $1,800 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 24 pages - $1,838.40] 24 pages - $3,800
*Saddle Stitched 36 Pages - $2,350 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 36 pages - $2,579.20 36 pages - $4,900
*Full Color 4 Pages - $1,120 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 4 pages - $932.80 4 pages - $2,360
*Full Bleed 1000 8 Pages - $1,385 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 8 pages - $1,382.40| 8 pages - $2,715
*8.5x11 (8 3/8 x 10 7/8 is acceptable) 24 Pages - $1,995 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 24 pages - $3,094.40 24 pages - $4,650
*4 pages, 8 pages, 24 pages & 36 pages. Please Quote each. 36 Pages - $2,695 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 36 pages - $4,379.20| 36 pages - $5,975
Magazine - Parent Connection (District will print this on average 3 4 Pages - $2,299 plus
times/year) District reserves the right to change frequency. 4 Pages - $6,100 4 Pages - $2,150 4 Pages - $2,475 4 Pages - $4,800 4 Pages - $5,000 No Bid No Bid freight 4 pages - $3,891.20 No Bid
*Cover and Back Cover 100# UV Coating 20,000 | 8 Pages - $8,625 8 Pages - $3,675 8 Pages - $4,300 8 Pages - $5,600 8 Pages - $5,900 No Bid No Bid No Bid 8 pages - $6,216.00 No Bid
*60# or 80# Gloss Text 24 Pages - $12,600 | 24 Pages - $8,300 | 24 Pages-$9,280 | 24 Pages - $9,400 | 24 Pages - $11,900 No Bid No Bid No Bid D4 pages - $11,422.4¢ No Bid
*Saddle Stitched 36 Pages - $16,900 | 36 Pages - $10,200 | 36 Pages - $11,600 | 36 Pages - $12,300 | 36 Pages - $14,300 No Bid No Bid No Bid 6 pages - $14,251.2 No Bid
4 Pages - 52,499 plus
*Full Color 4 Pages - $6,710 4 Pages - $2,250 4 Pages - $2,600 4 Pages - $5,100 4 Pages - $5,300 No Bid No Bid freight 4 pages - $4,102.40 No Bid
*Full Bleed; collate, stitch, fold and trim 22,000 | 8 Pages-$9,100 8 Pages - $3,850 8 Pages - $4,500 8 Pages - $5,900 8 Pages - $6,200 No Bid No Bid No Bid 8 pages - $6,516.80 No Bid
*8.5x11 (8 3/8 x 10 7/8 is acceptable) 24 Pages - $13,800 | 24 Pages - $8,700 | 24 Pages - $9,750 | 24 Pages - $9,900 | 24 Pages - $11,200 No Bid No Bid No Bid D4 pages - $11,984.0 No Bid
*Number of Pages: 4 pages, 8 Pages, 24 Pages, 36 Pages. 36 Pages - $17,300 | 36 Pages - $10,650 | 36 Pages - $12,150 | 36 Pages - $12,900 | 36 Pages - $14,300 No Bid No Bid No Bid 6 pages - $14,948.8 No Bid
4 Pages - $2,659 plus
4 Pages - $7,300 4 Pages - $2,350 4 Pages - $2,750 4 Pages - $5,400 4 Pages - $5,500 No Bid No Bid freight 4 pages - $4,331.20 No Bid
24000 8 Pages - $9,850 8 Pages - $4,025 8 Pages - $4,725 8 Pages - $6,200 8 Pages - $6,600 No Bid No Bid No Bid 8 pages - $6,833.60 No Bid
24 Pages - $14,700 | 24 Pages - $9,150 | 24 Pages - $10,275 | 24 Pages - $10,400 | 24 Pages - $12,900 No Bid No Bid No Bid b4 pages - $12,632.0 No Bid
*Design: Camera ready (PDF Document) 36 Pages - $19,650 | 36 Pages - $11,250 | 36 Pages - $12,850 | 36 Pages - $13,700 | 36 Pages - $16,200 No Bid No Bid No Bid 6 pages - $15,812.8 No Bid
Directory/Booklets - (Phone Directory, Bus Routes, etc.) 4 Pages - $920 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 4 Pages - $410 No Bid No Bid 4 Pages - $360 No Bid
*70lb white paper (not glossy) 500 8 Pages - $995 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 8 Pages - $780 No Bid No Bid 8 pages - $610 No Bid
12 Pages - $1,025 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 12 Pages -$1,040 No Bid No Bid 24 pages - $780 No Bid
*Saddle Stitched 58 Pages - $3,075 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 60 Pages - 5,632 No Bid No Bid 58 pages - $980 No Bid
*Black Ink 4 Pages - $1,075 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 4 Pages - $440 No Bid No Bid 4 Pages - $460 No Bid
*11x17 Folded to 8.5x11 700 8 Pages - $1,120 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 8 Pages - $860 No Bid No Bid 8 pages - $720 No Bid
12 Pages - $1,225 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 12 Pages - $1,140 No Bid No Bid 24 pages - $890 No Bid
*4 pages, 8 pages, 12 pages and 58 pages (Final Size 8.5x11) 58 Pages - $3,510 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 60 Pages - $6,100 No Bid No Bid 58 pages - $960 No Bid
Tickets - (Graduation, Employee Banquet, etc.)
*2.25x5.5
*Full Color . X X . X
*1 side only 24,000 $1,300.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $860.00 $1,350.00 No Bid $2,200.00 $4,500.00
*Numbered

*15pt card stock




RFP 2012-069
District Wide Publications

Taredo Morning | Laredo Morning Tiberty Press Tiberty Press Rabo Business
Vendors| Adams Printing Times (Option 1) | Times (Option 2) (Option 1) (Option 2) Marketing Depot Princo Solutions Rapidprint Sledge Media
st
Description Quantity Price Price Price Price Price Price Price Price Price Price
Graduation Booklets 20 Pages - 53,050 No Bid No Bid 20 Pages - 53,600 N/A 20 Pages - 55,370 No Bid No Bid 20 pages - No Bid
24 Pages - $3,250 No Bid No Bid 24 Pages - $3,700 N/A 24 Pages - $5,580 No Bid No Bid 24 pages - No Bid
4oy 28 pages -
*5.5x8.5 28 Page - $3,470 No Bid No Bid 28 Page - $3,900 N/A 28 Pages - $7,100 No Bid No Bid $5,233.60 No Bid
*Cover and Back Cover 100# UV Coating 20 Pages - $3,650 No Bid No Bid 20 Pages - $4,000 N/A No Bid No Bid 20 pages - No Bid
S0 24 Pages - $3,800 No Bid No Bid 24 Pages - $4,100 N/A No Bids No Bid No Bid 24 pages - No Bid
! 28 pages -
*Full Color 28 Page - $4,085 No Bid No Bid 28 Page - $4,400 N/A No Bid No Bid $5,876.80 No Bid
20 pages -
*Full Bleed 20 Pages - $4,585 No Bid No Bid 20 Pages - $4,300 20 Pages - $8,040 No Bid No Bid $4,558.40 No Bid
2,000 24 pages -
¢ 24 Pages - $4,975 No Bid No Bid 24 Pages - $4,500 24 Pages - $8,420 No Bid No Bid $5,988.80 No Bid
28 pages -
*Inside Pages: 60# Gloss Text 28 Page - $5,240 No Bid No Bid 28 Page - $4,900 28 Pages - $13,480 No Bid No Bid $6,342.40 No Bid
20 pages -
20 Pages - $4,950 No Bid No Bid 20 Pages - $4,600 20 Pages - $10,000 No Bid No Bid $4,932.80 No Bid
10,000 24 pages -
*Saddle Stitched ! 24 Pages - $5,220 No Bid No Bid 24 Pages - $4,800 24 Pages - $10,520 No Bid No Bid $6,420.80 No Bid
28 pages -
*20 Pages, 24 Pages, 28 Pages. 28 Page - $5,630 No Bid No Bid 28 Page - $5,300 28 Pages - $13,480 No Bid No Bid $6,865.60 No Bid
Activity Book (2nd Graders)
*60lb White Paper (not Glossy)
:;‘I’;’Ci' Ii':d'”g 6,000 No Bid No Bid No Bid $15,000.00 $15,000.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
*8.5x11
*100 Pages
Bookmarks
*2x6 $230.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $210.00 $50.00 No Bid $93.38 $85.00
*15pt card stock 1,000
*UV Coating
*Full Color on Both Sides $300.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $470.00 $115.00 No Bid $209.93 $180.00
*Full Bleed 5,000

Notes|

60# Paper for Parent
Connection Magazine

80# Paper for Parent
Connection Magazine

60# Paper for Parent
Connection Magazine

80# Paper for Parent
Connection Magazine

*Bidding 17x24
instead of 18x24
where applicable.
Bidding 24x34"instead
of 24x36 where
applicable.




RFP 2012-069
District Wide Publications

Adams Laredo Morning Marketing Rabo Business
Vendors Printing Times Liberty Press Depot Princo Solutions Rapidprint | Sledge Media

Catalog Discount 5% 0% 0% 0% 0% 0% 0% 0%




