United Independent School District
Safety Equipment & Supplies
RFP 2012-060

Vendor Ace Bolt & Screw Co. Conney Safety eSafety Supplies, Inc. Fisher Science
Section I: Percentage Discounts
% Off catalog price No Bid (Website) 25% 0% 18%
% Off list price No Bid No Bid 0% 18%
% Off shelf price No Bid No Bid 0% No Bid
Section II: Supplies
Ace Bolt & Screw Co.
Vendor Conney Safety eSafety Supplies, Inc. Fisher Science
Option 1 Option 2
Items Description Unit Price | Brand | Unit Price Brand Unit Price Brand Unit Price Brand Unit Price Brand
Medium $29.77 $24.76 $9.50 N.Y. Orthopedics 11706 - (EA) $9.28 $18.33 |OK1-MFG 1913019608
Large $30.25 $24.76  |Proflex $9.50 N.Y. Orthopedics 11707 - (EA) $9.28 $9.23 OK1-MFG 19816280
Back support belts Economy Ergodyne
without suspenders XL large $30.25 $21.30 [Back $9.50 N.Y. Orthopedics 11708 - (EA) $9.28 #E5711093 $9.23  |OK1-MFG 19816279
Support
XX Large $29.77 $18.00 $9.50 N.Y. Orthopedics 11709 - (EA) $9.28 $19.31 |OK1-MFG 191301960E
XXX Large No Bid No Bid $9.50 TBD - (EA) $9.28 $18.33 |OK1-MFG 191301960F
Medium - Cloth-canvas No Bid $5.18  |Direct Safety 10720 - (EA) $0.54 [RadNOT/HRADGA0ST| o, oq  |Protective Industrial
100 19046136 - (12 pk)
Large — Cloth-canvas $0.82 $5.25  |Direct Safety 10800 - (EA) s0.54 |Radnor/#RADBAOST] ¢, o  |West Chester Marketing
Work gloves No Bid 593 19097470 - (12 pk)
Medium — Leather —with safety cuff, No Bid $1.11 Direct Safety 34106 - (EA) $1.26 Radnor/#RAD64057 $28.94 Wells Lamont 19048688 -
leather palm 593 (12 pk)
Large — Leather with safety cuff, leather $2.18 $1.11 Direct Safety 34107 - (EA) $1.26 Radnor/#RAD64057| $41.22 Protective Industrial
palm : : ¥ : 593 : 19046134 - (12 pk)
Direct Safety Dakota 59142 - Rad #RAD64051]
Safety glasses eye Clear $1.38 No Bid $0.67 E'/r:c atety Lakota $0.76 ngnor/ $3.66 |Sperian 191600217 - (EA)
protection, frameless — (EA)
one piece Tinted — Dark- grey smoke $1.65 $6.34 $0.67 ?E':“ Safety Dakota 59144 - $0.76 sgg"‘”/”RADGAOSl $4.06 |Sperian 1916002178 - (EA)
73421 (EA) Crews/MCK Radnor/#RAD64051|
Clear $1.46 $2.05 Head 1d tel $3.16 710 $12.82 |3M 19040051
Safety face shields No Bid eadgear sold separately
Tinted $1.65 $2.68  |181541 (EA) $3.50 sgg"‘”/”RADGAOSl $7.55  |Sperian 190881117
Hard hat White standard hat $10.23 No Bid $2.84 izramex 174669 - (EA) Caseof | o7 49 ggﬁ””/ HRADBA0SI| o5 65 |3m 17623308
Ear plugs 100 / box (NRR of 32) $26.77 $28.79 1410 |DirectSafety (Corded) 76780~ | g g  [Howard Leight / $21.02 [3M 191300466
(EA) Box of 100 [#HLIMAX-1
Direct Safety 75559 (EA) Box of X
Dust mask 100 / box $3.25 50 $58.80 |3M/#3MR8210 $68.25 |Sperian 19999402
Caution tape roll $10.16 $6.05  |Direct Safety 83879 - (EA) $6.04 |Radnor/#RADEAOSS] o 1o |North 19170117 1000 Ft
720 (EA)
O ix/#OCC8
Neck shade Standard White Elastic Head Band Style $1.88  |Occunomix 155151 Khaki- (EA)]  $5.33 9;;‘0";'“”‘/ $11.41 [Occunomix 19520301
No Bid
. Chicago Protective .
Chain saw chaps Marmac Brand X Large 38”length $71.46 Elvex 39" 13735 - (EA) $110.60 4CB2260036 $195.88 |[Steel Grip 19819707
No Bid
Justrite/ .
Safety gas can 5 gallon type 2 %” flex nozzle $54.75 Eagle 79606 - (EA) 7/8 Spout $30.37 $103.27 |Justrite 17179E
vE garontype e (EA) 7/8 Sp |#/TR7150100
Safety gas can 2 gallon type 2 11/32” flex nozzle $53.22  |Eagle 79605 - (EA) 7/8 Spout s26.90 [ustrite/ $102.66 |lustrite 17179D
#JTR7120100
Safety gas can 3 gallon type 2 3/4” flex nozzle No Bid $29.82 lustrite/ $102.07 |Justtite 17179A
|#JTR7125100
31% Off Fisher Science Education
Notes
2012 Catalog




United Independent School District
Safety Equipment & Supplies
RFP 2012-060

Mirage Operations LLC dba Napa Auto

Vendor Gulf Coast Paper Magid Glove & Safety MFG. Co Products Unlimited, Inc.
! P gl v v & Truck Parts u m
Section |: Percentage Discounts
% Off catalog price 25% 0% No Bid 10-15%
% Off list price 25% 20% Magid - 10% Branded 9% 0%
% Off shelf price 25% No Bid 0%

Section II: Supplies

Mirage Operations LLC dba Napa Auto

Vendor Gulf Coast Paper Magid Glove & Safety MFG. Co & Truck Parts Products Unlimited, Inc.
Items Description Unit Price Brand Unit Price Brand Unit Price Brand Unit Price Brand
Medium $10.00 $14.58 $17.99 $14.59
Large $10.00 $14.58 $19.88 $14.59
Back support belts
without suspenders XL large $10.00 Pyramex $14.58 Valeo VLP6 $19.88 SAS $14.59 Valeo-
XX L 10.30 14.58 14.59
aree s ¢ No Bid s
XXX Large $10.30 No Bid $14.59
Medium — Cloth-canvas $0.55 $4.80 |Magid #T92C -( DZ) $2.69 $0.60
Large — Cloth-canvas $0.55 $4.90 |Magid #T92 - (DZ) $2.69 $0.60
Work gloves PR — Anchor n N Balkane Radnor
Medium — Leather —with safety cuff, $1.60 $13.15 Magid #TB725EL $6.79 $1.41
leather palm (D7)
Large — Leather with safety cuff, leather $1.60 $13.15 Magid #TB725E - $6.79 $1.41
palm (DZ)
Magid #Y10CFC -
Safety glasses eye Clear $2.07 |Derby-C-3500-C $0.96 Ezg' $3.69 $0.83
protection, frameless — (EA) SAS Radnor
one piece Tinted — Dark- grey smoke $2.07 |Derby-C-3500-G $1.20 :\gz)g'd H#Y10GFGY - $3.89 $0.83
Magid
Clear $1.12 $8.20 $28.07 $3.48 Radnor
Safety face shields American Packing #IHG7RK8154 - (EA) SAS
Tinted $1.90 $10.26 :\:;)Ar)th H#WVSN - No Bid $10.26 Jackson
Hard hat White standard hat $19.82 [MSA $11.57 [MSA #475358 - (EA)| $12.69 SAS $5.39 Radnor
Ear plugs 100 / box (NRR of 32) $21.95 |Howard Leight $1200 |Magid 31HP32- $66.00 SAS - 200 Count $16.81 Howard Leight
100/Box (BX)
Magid #IR1930N95
Dust mask 100 / box $62.50 |100/Box $7.48 (B;)g' $13.76  [SAS $97.35 Radnor
Caution tape roll $6.80 |Iron Wear $7.11 {T:p“?pe #BT300- $12.99 SAS $6.75 Radnor
o
Neck shade Standard White Elastic Head Band Style $9.37  |MSA $5.58 Occunomix
No Bid
Chain saw chaps Marmac Brand X Large 38”length No Bid $112.10 Chicago
No Bid
Safety gas can 5 gallon type 2 %” flex nozzle $38.95 |Safe-T-Way $122.57 Balkine $60.13 Justrite
Safety gas can 2 gallon type 2 11/32” flex nozzle $34.25 (Safe-T-Way $58.71 Justrite
No Bid
Safety gas can 3 gallon type 2 3/4” flex nozzle No Bid $60.13 Justrite

Notes




