UNITED INDEPENDENT SCHOOL DISTRICT
ARCHITECTURAL SIGNS
RFP 2012-059

VENDORS Identity Management Indoff, Inc. Rocal, Inc. SA-SO Signs Plus Vulcan Signs
SECTION I: PERCENTAGE DISCOUNTS
% OFF CATALOG PRICE 0% 2% 0% 10% 0% 0%
% OFF LIST PRICE 0% 0% 0% 0% 0% 0%
% OFF SHELF PRICE 0% 0% 0% 0% 0% 0%
SECTION II: INDICATIVE ALUMINUM SIGNS
Item Description ;i; Unit Price Ext. Price Unit Price Ext. Price | Unit Price | Ext.Price | UnitPrice | Ext.Price | Unit Price | Ext. Price | Unit Price | Ext. Price
12"x1g |12 X 18" Blue Parking Reserved Permit Required aluminum & 75 $25.81 $1,935.75 | $15.00 | $1,125.00 | $9.98 $748.50 $10.06 | $754.50
.063 thickness
12"X18" |[12" x 18" No Parking Aluminum .063 75 $25.81 $1,935.75 $15.00 $1,125.00 $9.98 $748.50 $10.06 $754.50
12"X18" |12" x 18" Reserved Parking (asst. principal, staff, ..etc.) 75 $25.81 $1,935.75 $15.00 $1,125.00 $9.98 $748.50 $11.14 $835.50
1g'x1g" |18 X 18" Custom Sign, 2 Color, Aluminum & .063 thickness 20 $49.63 $992.60 $44.00 | $880.00 | $1496 | $299.20 $17.26 | $345.20
(emergency)
18"X24" |3 Color wording Text Bilingual, Aluminum .080 50 $72.96 $3,648.00 $44.00 $2,200.00 $19.95 $997.50 $32.00 $1,600.00
Warning Sign (Front Premises)
24"x30" ]24" X 30" Speed Limit 5 EG ALUM (0.080) 50 $87.00 $6,525.00 $60.00 $4,500.00 $33.25 $2,493.75 $36.88 $2,766.00
24" Stop Diamond Grade Face Replacement . .
Material Specifications:2 layers of reflective Sheeting No Bid No Bid
1st layer OF WHITE DIAMOND GRADE 3990
24" 2nd layer consisting in Electro cut easy-film RED 40 $132.07 $5,282.80 $84.00 $3,360.00 $38.72 | $1,548.80 $40.52 $1,620.80
SERIES 1172 "no silkscreen"
Aluminum .080
This combination allow up to 15 Years warranty
Post 12 GA .
Post 12 GA 11 FT galvanized 150 $30.86 $4,629.00 $59.00 $8,850.00 $20.45 $3,067.50
1P No Bid
:;t(r:'ljc?;z Extruded Aluminum Bracket (For rounded sign post) 300 $7.86 $2,358.00 $15.00 $4,500.00 $5.00 $1,500.00




UNITED INDEPENDENT SCHOOL DISTRICT
ARCHITECTURAL SIGNS
RFP 2012-059

VENDORS Identity Management Indoff, Inc. Rocal, Inc. SA-SO Signs Plus Vulcan Signs
SECTION Ill: MESSAGE MARQUEE AND LETTERING
Est.
Item Description aty Unit Price Ext. Price Unit Price Ext. Price | Unit Price | Ext. Price | Unit Price [ Ext. Price | Unit Price | Ext. Price | Unit Price | Ext. Price
Set of Word panel black vinyl 4” tall 30 $7.14 $571.20
Sign copy |Set of Word panel black vinyl 6” tall 80 $10.00 $800.00 No Bid
lettering |Set of Word panel black vinyl 8” tall 80 $12.86 $1,028.80
Set of Word panel black vinyl 10” tall 30 $15.71 $1,256.80 No Bid
Set of Solar grade, vacuum formed, 5’X10’, Custom logo, 3M Vinyl or
Marquee equal 2 $1,610.75 $3,221.50 $2.00 $4.00
Sign Faces q
5'X10’, Double sided aircraft grade structural aluminum, powder
coated finish, internal finish, internal illumination, vandal
covers, cowling, custom symbol, 3-M or equal graphics, 520
letters Sign Delivery $6,700 +
$5,877.26 $5,877.26 Installation $3,000 =
Capacity to post messages with plastic lettering. Should have e e $9,700 Power of
the school mascot in the logo identification section which will School
Mal_'quee be provided at the time of order. Signage sits on a double 1
Sign square metal pipe foundation or equal.
Include any costs associated with installation. . . .
No Bid No Bid No Bid
(Warranty)
. Lifetime of Purchasing
Warranty for structure / warranty cabinet 1Year . L
No Bid Organization
Structure and Cabinet
Sign Cabinet: welded aluminum frame with color choice,
internally lit with fluorescent bulbs,
Structure: 8 x 2’ wide pedestal with aluminum skin and steel
support sits on a double square metal pipe foundation, with LED Sign $17, 688
concrete footer. Delivered & Installed
LED Message Unit: color format, communication- wireless Ethernet/ $22,382.10 | $22,382.10 =$22,088 . School
Marquee |PC operated software with wireless antennas ready. Dimensions 1 Provides power to
Sign approx. 2'x1” x 7’x4”; matrix approx. 32 x 112; pitch / resolution: sign & internal cable.

approx. 20 mm/ .8”.
or equal.
Include any costs associated with installation.

Warranty for structure / warranty LED - cabinet

Labor rate for installation of marquee

5Year /1 Year

Life time / 5 Years

$4,400.00




UNITED INDEPENDENT SCHOOL DISTRICT
ARCHITECTURAL SIGNS

RFP 2012-059

VENDORS

Identity Management Indoff, Inc. Rocal, Inc. SA-SO Signs Plus Vulcan Signs
SECTION IV: ARCHITECTURAL ALUMINUM LETTERING
s Est.
Description Qiy Unit Price Ext. Price Unit Price Ext. Price | Unit Price | Ext. Price | Unit Price] Ext.Price | Unit Price | Ext. Price | Unit Price | Ext. Price

4” Uppercase, standard font, baked enamel 50 $21.56 $1,078.00 $37.50 $1,875.00

8” Uppercase, standard font, baked enamel 50 $32.30 $1,615.00 No Bid No Bid $63.88 $3,194.00 No Bid No Bid

12” Uppercase, standard font, baked enamel 50 $54.56 $2,728.00 $94.63 $4,731.50

16” Uppercase, standard font, baked enamel 50 $101.70 $5,085.00 $156.19 | $7,809.50

Notes

Post Gal. 10 Ft.

Supplier only does not
install.

All Cast Baked Enamel
Letters for section IV

Deviation for dry
powder paint
application with liquid
premier quality panit.
For incidental
scratches that may
occur over the years,
Sign Plus will provide
touch up paint, brush
& instruction.

Deviation for grahics
from 3M viynyl sticker
Second surface
graphics through
state of the art spray
process equipment &
skilled labor, Graphics
will be protected
behind solar grade
polycarbonate that
has Lifetime of the
purchsing
organization
warranty.

Bid 12'-2 3/8 OD Post 16
Gauge / Vulvan Post
Clamp - Item Number
222491-501, which is
supplied in packs of 2. /
High Intensity sheeting
on signs, to meet the 10
year warranty specs.






