United Independent School District
HVAC EQUIPMENT & SUPPLIES

RFP 2012-056

Interline
Vi Ai Refri; Inc. | Inc. R & M Ref. I Tex-Air Fil
endor irgas Refrigerants,Inc. Coolgas,Inc Brands,Inc.dba/Sexauar & ef. Supply ex-Air Filters
SECTION I. PERCENTAGE DISCOUNT
Description
% Off Catalog Price 0% Call Vendor 20% May 2012 List Price 70% 45%
% Off List Price 0% Call Vendor 0% 80% NA
% Off Shelf Price 0% NA 0% 40% NA
SECTION Il. SUPPLIES
Vendor Airgas Refrigerants,Inc. Coolgas,Inc Interline R & M Ref. Suppl Tex-Air Filters
8 8 e 8as,Inc. Brands,Inc.dba/Sexauar - Supply
. L Manufacturer ) Brand & B Brand & . Brand & B Brand & ) Brand &
Item# | Unit Description MFG. Number Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost
or Equal Item # Item # Item # Item # Item #
1 EA _[Run Capacitor 35/5, MFD, 5% 370 VAC Global 2227-35/5X370 $12.10 Global or =
2 EA _|Run Capaciotr 25 MFD, 5% 370VAC Global 2212-25X370 $12.00 Global or =
3 EA _|Run Capacitor 35/5 mfd, 440VAC Mars 85744-12185 $12.10 Global or =
4 EA [Contactor 3 pole, 40FLA, 50A, 600VAC coil 24VAC Fasco H340A $38.00 Fasco No Bid
5 EA _[Contactor 2 pole, 30A- coil 120VAC Mars 685744-91322 $7.90 Mars
6 EA |Contactor 3 pole, 40A-600V, coil-120V Ben'sha\/\{/ RSC-32GAC120/ NA NA
Service First GTR02099
7 GAL _|Coil Cleaner Non Acid Virginia AKF1 $15.60 Virginia
8 EA _|Liquid line filter dryer, 3/8 SWEAT Parker 163S $12.10 Equal See Note
9 EA _|Liquid line filter dryer, 1/2 ODF Solder Parker 164S . . $14.80 Equal See Note
10 EA_|Liquid Line filter dryer, 5/8 ODF Solder Parker 1655 No Bid No Bid $15.40 Equal See Note
1 EA Transformer 40VA PR1 120/208/240V SEC 24V- Smart Electric SE403 $16.80 Equal
Footmount
- No Bid
12 EA |Fan Relay - SPNO/SPNC - 12A.cont 120vac-coil 24vac | Global/ Zettler GFRSffB/;jAZ9OO $7.20 Global
13 EA _|[Silver Brazing Alloy .050"x 1/8 sticks Harris 61035 *$124.10 Harris
14 EA [HVAC foil tape Shurtape AF100 $6.98 Nashva
Electric motor 1HP, 1100rpm 380-415/460v-1ph 2.5 .
1 EA A. th F48B20A 20.11 F
5 amps, 50/60Hz, frame 48Y shaft 0.5x3.1 flats Osmi 8B20A05 $320.10 asco No Bid
16 EA Blower motor 3/4hps, 1075rpm 3Spd, 227volts, 1PH, Dayton 6GC94G $199.80 Fasco
3.3amps, 60Hz, frame 48YZ (D970)
17 cyL Gas refr!gerant R-22, 30lbs cylinder Honeywell Genetron22 $358.50 See Note $29p.00/cy| *See note *$345.00 Varies
Chlorodifluorometone inder
18 EA Dual element fuse FNM 6/10 Fusetron Fuses FNM-6
IR 35amp, 250vac & IR10Kamp, 125vac . .
Dual element low peak fuse Cooper No Bid No Bid NA
19 EA LPS-RK-30SP

600vac & 300VDC

Bussmann




United Independent School District
HVAC EQUIPMENT & SUPPLIES

RFP 2012-056

Vendor Airgas Refrigerants,Inc. Coolgas,Inc. Interline R & M Ref. Suppl Tex-Air Filters
8 & e gas,Inc. Brands,Inc.dba/Sexauar - Supply
Unit Cost Brand & Unit Cost Brand & ltem Unit Cost Brand & Unit Cost Brand & ltem Unit Cost Brand &
Item # # Item # # Item #
20 EA [Compressor Starter $8.10 Varies-41
21 EA |Evaporator Motor $8.95 Varies-99
22 EA [Dual Voltage Evaporator Motor $14.00 Varies-675
23 EA [Ice Machine Thick Control $45.24 Mang‘goc'
24 EA |lce Machine Water Inlet Valve $52.26 Mar[‘;;i‘;'oc'
. Manitowoc-
25 EA | Ice Machine Dump Valve $51.48 00176
26 EA |Timer (Replacement Kit only) $62.98 | Vvaries-4520m
27 EA |Defrost Limit Control $2.20 Varies-45
28 EA | 8hr Defrost Timer $11.10 Varies
29 EA |High Limit Switches (Coolers/Freezers) . . $14.08 Varies
30 EA |Replacement Compressors No Bid No Bid $161.10 | Varies-4440
31 EA |Complete Evaporator System $989.10 | Varies-AE320
. $54.00/$72.4 .
No Bid No Bid
32 EA | Motors i 0/Evap/Cond Fasco
33 EA | Fan Cycle $57.80 | Varies 6166
34 EA | Remote Thermometer $19.90 | Copper 4220
35 EA |Replacement V-Belts $2.80/3.10/ | Varies-
$4.40 210/260/310
36 EA |Exhaust Fan Systems $2,340.00 | Loren Look
37 EA |Filter Driers $8.40/5$9.90/ Varies
$12.00 32/52/83
38 EA |Control Board Ice Machine $298.40 Ma;gfgwc
299.00
39 EA |Freon (22) **$11.95/Ib | See Note 3 K See Note *345.00 Varies
/cylinder*
$95.00 )
40 EA |Freon (134A) **$4.89/Ib | See Note K See Note *198.00 Varies
/cylinder
$96.00 )
41 EA |Freon (404A) **$5.79/Ib | See Note X See Note *196.00 Varies
/cylinder




United Independent School District

HVAC EQUIPMENT & SUPPLIES
RFP 2012-056

Interline

Vendor Airgas Refrigerants,Inc. Coolgas,Inc. R & M Ref. Suppl Tex-Air Filters
& & e Brands,Inc.dba/Sexauar PPl
42 EA [High Temperature Wire (10ga) $27.10 MA Line
43 EA [High Temperature Wire (12ga) $39.40 MA Line
44 EA |[Evaporator Coil AE120B $754.54 Russel
. Manitowoc
45 EA |Expansion Valve $110.40 76225
. Manitowoc
46 EA |Solenoid Valve $56.40 0448
47 EA |Starter Capacitor Kit $14.10 Varies 600
48 EA |Acid Cleaner $15.60 Virginia
49 EA |Defrost Heaters No Bid No Bid No Bid $70.28 BOh:;)él‘)gmal No Bid
50 EA |Defrost Time/Fan Delay $57.34 Varies
51 EA |3-N-1 Kick Stark for compressor $8.90 Varies
52 EA |Contactors $18.40/$34.2|  Fasco 3p
0 40A/3pSDA
53 EA |T6054- Thermostat $84.20 Honeywell
54 EA |lce Maker Part Water Level $32.40 Malnllg;‘;'oc
. . Manitowoc
55 EA |Bin Switch $42.60 01483
Free Delivery 1-3 Days
A.R.O.(Emergencies sooner).
*Brands we supply: ARKEMA-
"Forane",DUPONT-
"Freon/Isceon/Suva",HONEYWE|
LL-"Genetron",MEXICHEM-
"Klea",AIRGAS-"Aspen/Refron" *Refri " Jisted
**With the lack of Cylinder size © r}geran prices fisted are
. subject to change. Please
as well as an estimated tact Coolgas for updated See enclosed price list for
Notes: quantity determination, the con & P *Subject to change with markest. P

following sizes and figures have
been provided based on the
average sizes purchased by
similar consumers: R2230-
$358.50;R22125-
$1493.75;R134A30-
$146.70;R134A125-
$611.25;R404A24-
$138.96;R404A100-$579.00

pricing. Coolgas pays freight.
Pallet quantity is (40) cylinders
per order.

filters.




