United Independent School District
Maintenance & Repairs of Multimedia Cabling
RFP 2012-039

Vendor M-1 NETWORKS
Description Cat 6 Cat 6a 10gig 6st fiber
Cable Run <100ft interior condwt_prowded. $70.00 $145.00 $680.00
Complete end to end solution
Cable Run <100ft OSP. _ Complete $85.00 No Bid $600.00
end to end solution
Cable Run 100<200ft interior condglt provided. $115.00 $198.00 $600.00
Complete end to end solution.
Cable Run 100<200ft OS.P' $130.00 No Bid $800.00
Complete end to end solution.
Cable Run 200<300ft interior condglt provided. $125.00 $245.00 $980.00
Complete end to end solution.
Cable Run 200<300ft OSP. . Complete $140.00 No Bid $980.00
end to end solution.
Price per ft>300ft interior $0.45 $0.85 $0.90
Price per ft>300ft OSP $0.45 No Bid $1.20
8ft runway with junction box anchored to wall $19.00 $19.00 No Bid
48 port Leviton Modular Patch Panel $295.00 $475.00 No Bid




