
RFP 2012-030
Counseling and Testing Materials/Teaching Aids

 Counseling & Testing Materials - Catalog Discount

Vendors
Ace 

Educational
Books-A-

Million
Brodhead 

Garrett
Constructive 
Playthings

Destiny 
Learning Dynastudy EAI 

Education
ECS 

Learning
% Off catalog price 0% 0% 0% 0% 0% 0% 0% 0%

% Off shelf price 0% 0% 0% 0% 0% 0% 0% 0%

% Off list price 0% 0% 0% 0% 0% 0% 0% 0%

Vendors
Education 

Plus
ETA 

hand2mind
Fisher Science 

Education Flaghouse Fun and 
Function Imagine James 

Stanfield
Jarrett 

Publishing

% Off catalog price 0% 0% 0% 10% 5% 5% 0% 0%
% Off shelf price 0% 0% 0% 0% 0% 5% 0% 0%

% Off list price 0% 0% 0% 0% 0% 0% 0% 0%

Vendors

Hawthrone Ed 
Services Kamico Keystone Lakeshore Learning 

Zone
Marco 

Products Mindware
National 

Center for 
Youth Issues

% Off catalog price 0% 0% 5% 5% 15%
5%,10%,  

15% 0% 5%
% Off shelf price 0% 0% 5% 5% 0% No Bid 0% No Bid

% Off list price 0% 0% 5% 5% 0% No Bid 0% No Bid

Vendors

National 
School 

Products
Novel Units Nasco Oriental 

Company

Pacific 
Northwest 
Publishing

PCI 
Education

Perfection 
Learning 

Corp.

Postive 
Action

% Off catalog price 10% 0% 10-20% 0% 0% 5,7 or 10% 0% 0%
% Off shelf price No Bid No Bid 0% 0% 0% 5,7 or 10% 0% 0%

% Off list price No Bid 0% 0% 0% 0% 5,7 or 10% 0% 0%

Vendors
Postive 

Promotions
Really Good 

Stuff
Renaissance  

Learning
Rifton 

Equipment
School 

Specialty Science Kit
Shiffler 

Equipment 
Sales

Smart 
Promotional

% Off catalog price 5% 0% 0% 0%

15%supplies/   
25% 

fur.&equip. 15%* 0% 10%
% Off shelf price 0% 0% 0% 0% 0% No Bid 0% 10%

% Off list price 0% 0% 0% 0% 0% No Bid 0% 10%

Vendors

Social Studies 
School 
Service

Super Duper Textbook 
Warehouse

The Trevor 
Romain Co.

Wards 
Natural 
Science

Zaner-
Bloser

% Off catalog price 0% 0% 0% 10% 0% 0%
% Off shelf price 0% 0% 0% 10% 0% 0%

% Off list price 0% 0% 38% 10% 0% 0%
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Counseling and Testing Materials/Teaching Aids

Category 2 - Teaching Aids-
Catalog Discount

Vendor Name

% Off catalog price

% Off shelf price

% Off list price

Vendor Name

% Off catalog price

% Off shelf price

% Off list price

Vendor Name Flaghouse

% Off catalog price

% Off shelf price

% Off list price

Vendor Name
% Off catalog price

% Off shelf price

% Off list price

Vendor Name
% Off catalog price

% Off shelf price

% Off list price

Vendor Name

% Off catalog price

% Off shelf price

% Off list price

Vendor Name
% Off catalog price

% Off shelf price

% Off list price

Vendor Name
% Off catalog price

% Off shelf price

% Off list price

Vendor Name
% Off catalog price

% Off shelf price

% Off list price

Vendor Name
% Off catalog price

% Off shelf price

% Off list price

Ace Educational Supplies Books-A-Million Brodhead Garrett Constructive Playthings Destiny Learning

10% No Bid

10%discount on all General Brodhead 

Garrett except Woodworker's Supply 

Section

5% 10%Pearson/5%Leapfrog

0% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

0% 10-40% off retail price No Bid No Bid No Bid

Dynastudy EAI Education ECS Learning Systems Education Plus ETA Hand2mind

0% 15% with exceptions

0% Possible large volume discounts 

please call. 

Website:www.ecslearningsystems.com

;also eCatalog

0%

10% on Math & Science combined 

catalogs Literacy 

catalogs.CSCOPE, Custom Kits, 

sale items & PD are excluded.

NA No Bid NA 0% No Bid

NA No Bid 0% 0% No Bid

Fisher Science Education Fun and Function Hawthorne Ed Services Imagine
31% As per your US Communities 

Agreement
10% 5% 0% 5%

No Bid No Bid No Bid 0% 5%

31% No Bid No Bid 0% NA

James Stanfield Jarrett Publishing Kamico Keystone Books & Media Lakeshore
0% 0% 0% 5% Additional 5%

0% 0% 0% 5% Additional 5%

0% 0% 0% 5% Additional 5%

Learning Zone Marco Mindware National Center for Youth 
Issues

National School Products
15% Free shipping over $75 5,10, &15% catalog list discount 5% 10%

No Bid NA No Bid No Bid No Bid

No Bid NA No Bid No Bid No Bid

Novel Units Nasco Oriental Trading Co. Pacific Northwest 
Publishing

PCI Education

0% 10-20% 5% 0% 5,7,10%

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 5,7,10%

0% No Bid No Bid No Bid 5,7,10%

Notes

No discount under $1,500;$1,500-

2,499.99=5%off subtotal;$2,500-

4,999.99=7%off subtotal;$5,000-

9,999.99=10%subtotal;$10,000 

and up contact bid coordinator

*30% off current list price is 

already reflected in catalog & 

website pricing. Perfection 

Learning publications are excluded 

from discount.

Perfection Learning Postive Action Postive Promotion Really Good Stuff Renaissance Learning
No Bid 15% 5% 3-15%Volume Discount 0% Volume dis.may apply

No Bid 15% 0% No Bid No Bid

30%* 15% 0% No Bid No Bid

Rifton Equipment School Specialty Science Kit Shiffler Equipment Sales Smart Promotional
25% 15%supplies/25%furniture&equip

ment

15% 5% 10%

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 10%

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 10%

Social Studies School Service Super Duper Textbook Warehouse The Trevor Romain Co. Ward's Natural Science
0% 0% 0% 10% 15%

No Bid No Bid 0% 10% No Bid

No Bid No Bid No Bid 10% No Bid

Zaner-Bloser
0%

No Bid

No Bid
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Category 2-Teaching Aids
Vendor Name

Description Price Item Number and 
Brand Proposed Price Item Number and 

Brand Proposed Price Item Number and 
Brand Proposed Price Item Number and 

Brand Proposed Price Item Number and 
Brand Proposed

Colonial America Posters $9.99 EP3050 Edupress $0.00 Only available in Stores $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid

Time Chart: The History of 

Europe
$9.75

MCA004 McDonald 

Doug/History of World
$0.00 Only available in Stores $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid

Lessons of Vietnam War $0.00 No bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid

Giant Puzzle map of U.S. $14.99 LCI3797 Melissa Doug $0.00 Only available in Stores $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid

Political U.S. Wall Map $7.99 UNI 12489 UNIVERSITY $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid

DVD• Uncle Tom's Cabin $0.00 No bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid

DVD• The Civil War $0.00 No bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid

DVD Schindler's List $0.00 No bid $11.98 25192133688 $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid

Student Activity Books $5.99

SC520085 Scholastic-This 

is first book in series of 48 

books see pg. 56.

$0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 Pearson Supplemental

Special Equipment for 

Exceptional Kids
Varies Pages:260-276 $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 Leapfrog School

Teaching Aids for Exceptional 

Kids
Varies Pages:260-276 $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid

Notes

Vendor Name

Description Price Item Number and 
Brand Proposed Price Item Number and 

Brand Proposed Price Item Number and 
Brand Proposed Price Item Number and 

Brand Proposed Price Item Number and 
Brand Proposed

Colonial America Posters $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid

Time Chart: The History of 

Europe
$0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid

Lessons of Vietnam War $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid

Giant Puzzle map of U.S. $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid

Political U.S. Wall Map $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid

DVD•]Uncle Tom's Cabin $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid

DVD•]The Civil War $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid

DVD•]Schindler's List $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid

Student Activity Books $0.00 See Catalog $0.00 No Bid $0.00 See catalog & website $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid

Special Equipment for 

Exceptional Kids
$0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 See catalog & website $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid

Teaching Aids for Exceptional 

Kids
$0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 See catalog & website $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid

Notes

Ace Educational Supplies Books-A-Million Brodhead Garrett Constructive Playthings Destiny Learning

Free shipping & 10% discount on 

orders over $50 from Catalog or 

Website. 

2012 shipping rate of 15% of order 

after applicable discount.
Discount is only for the catalog.

Dynastudy EAI Education ECS Learning Systems Education Plus ETA hand2mind

See attached letter in reference to 

Shipping & Handling charges.

Reference BID#2012-030 on all 

POs.EAI is a manufacturer & 

distributor of over 6,000 

educational products, with 

emphasis on 

math,science,reading,Language 

Arts, and teacher resources. We 

also build customized kits to 

emulate math programs.

*STAAR MASTER series prices are in 

our catalog & on our 

website:www.ecslearningsystems.com,

Also eCatalogs. We are Sole Source 

for STAAR MASTER BOOKS. See 

attached letter for shipping & other.

See attached Price List for 

Mastering Grade 5 Science(state 

adopted) Test Banks

*This offer includes ETA 

hand2mind Sole Source materials 

previously excluded from catalog 

discount. These items contain a P 

in the 3rd position of the item 

number, i.e. XXP-XXXX. See 

attached letter in reference to 

shipping,warranty& returns and 

discounts & pricing.
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Vendor Name

Description Price Item Number and 
Brand Proposed Price Item Number and 

Brand Proposed Price Item Number and 
Brand Proposed Price Item Number and 

Brand Proposed Price Item Number and 
Brand Proposed

Colonial America Posters $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid

Time Chart: The History of 

Europe
$0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid

Lessons of Vietnam War $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid

Giant Puzzle map of U.S. $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid

Political U.S. Wall Map $89.10 S94949 $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid

DVD•]Uncle Tom's Cabin $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid

DVD•]The Civil War $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid

DVD•]Schindler's List $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid

Student Activity Books $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid

Special Equipment for 

Exceptional Kids
$0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 Entire Catalo-5% $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid

Teaching Aids for Exceptional 

Kids
$0.00 No Bid $44.95 EG# L 34410 pg.146 $0.00 Entire Catalo-5% $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid

Notes

Vendor Name

Description Price Item Number and 
Brand Proposed Price Item Number and 

Brand Proposed Price Item Number and 
Brand Proposed Price Item Number and 

Brand Proposed Price Item Number and 
Brand Proposed

Colonial America Posters $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid

Time Chart: The History of 

Europe
$0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid

Lessons of Vietnam War $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid

Giant Puzzle map of U.S. $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid

Political U.S. Wall Map $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid

DVD•]Uncle Tom's Cabin $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid

DVD•]The Civil War $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid

DVD•]Schindler's List $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid

Student Activity Books $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid

Special Equipment for 

Exceptional Kids
$0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid

Teaching Aids for Exceptional 

Kids
$0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid

Note

Fisher Science Education Flaghouse Fun and Function Hawthrone Ed Services Imagine

See attached United ISD, Tx, 2012-

2013 Science Pricing Agreement. US 

Communities Contract # 08-04026

James Stanfield Jarrett Publishing Kamico Keystone Books & Media Lakeshore

Additional 5%+
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Vendor Name

Description Price Item Number and 
Brand Proposed Price Item Number and 

Brand Proposed Price Item Number and 
Brand Proposed Price Item Number and 

Brand Proposed Price Item Number and 
Brand Proposed

Colonial America Posters $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid

Time Chart: The History of 

Europe
$0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid

Lessons of Vietnam War $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid

Giant Puzzle map of U.S. $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid

Political U.S. Wall Map $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid

DVD•]Uncle Tom's Cabin $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid

DVD•]The Civil War $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid

DVD•]Schindler's List $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid

Student Activity Books $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid

Special Equipment for $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid

Teaching Aids for Exceptional 

Kids
$0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 Catalog pricing $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid

Vendor Name

Description Price Item Number and 
Brand Proposed Price Item Number and 

Brand Proposed Price Item Number and 
Brand Proposed Price Item Number and 

Brand Proposed Price Item Number and 
Brand Proposed

Colonial America Posters $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 See catalog for pricing

Time Chart: The History of 

Europe
$0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 See catalog for pricing

Lessons of Vietnam War $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 See catalog for pricing

Giant Puzzle map of U.S. $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 See catalog for pricing

Political U.S. Wall Map $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 See catalog for pricing

DVD•]Uncle Tom's Cabin $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 See catalog for pricing

DVD•]The Civil War $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 See catalog for pricing

DVD•]Schindler's List $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 See catalog for pricing

Student Activity Books
See 

Catalog
See Catalog/website $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 See catalog for pricing

Special Equipment for 

Exceptional Kids
$0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 See catalog for pricing

Teaching Aids for Exceptional 

Kids

See 

Catalog
See Catalog/website $0.00 No Bid Vaires Hands on Fun $0.00 No Bid $0.00 See catalog for pricing

Notes Possible large volume discounts; 

please call.

Learning Zone Marco Mindware National Center for Youth National School Products

Notes
15%off& free shipping(for $75+ 

orders;otherwise actual 

charges);Furniture/equipment/rugs: 

10%& actual shipping charges

Novel Units Nasco Oriental Trading Co. Pacific Northwest PCI Education

Please call vendor in reference to 

the Discounts.$50 Minimum order 

requirement;Nasco pays shipping 

except for live or hazardous 

materials and items.

Standard 15% shipping/handling 

fee with an $8.00 minimum charge.
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Vendor Name

Description Price Item Number and 
Brand Proposed Price Item Number and 

Brand Proposed Price Item Number and 
Brand Proposed Price Item Number and 

Brand Proposed Price Item Number and 
Brand Proposed

Colonial America Posters $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid

Time Chart: The History of 

Europe
$0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid

Lessons of Vietnam War $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid

Giant Puzzle map of U.S. $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid

Political U.S. Wall Map $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid

DVD•]Uncle Tom's Cabin $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid

DVD•]The Civil War $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid

DVD•]Schindler's List $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid

Student Activity Books $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid

Special Equipment for 

Exceptional Kids
$0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid

Teaching Aids for Exceptional 

Kids
$0.00 No Bid $150.00

3408Postive Action 

Counselor's kit
$0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid

Notes

Vendor Name

Description Price Item Number and 
Brand Proposed Price Item Number and 

Brand Proposed Price Item Number and 
Brand Proposed Price Item Number and 

Brand Proposed Price Item Number and 
Brand Proposed

Colonial America Posters $0.00 No Bid $0.00 See catalog $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid

Time Chart: The History of 

Europe
$0.00 No Bid $0.00 See catalog $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid

Lessons of Vietnam War $0.00 No Bid $0.00 See catalog $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid

Giant Puzzle map of U.S. $0.00 No Bid $0.00 See catalog $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid

Political U.S. Wall Map $0.00 No Bid $0.00 See catalog $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid

DVD•]Uncle Tom's Cabin $0.00 No Bid $0.00 See catalog $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid

DVD•]The Civil War $0.00 No Bid $0.00 See catalog $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid

DVD•]Schindler's List $0.00 No Bid $0.00 See catalog $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid

Student Activity Books $0.00 No Bid $0.00 See catalog $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid

Special Equipment for 

Exceptional Kids
Varies

Rifton Equipment catalog 

all products
$0.00 See catalog $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid

Teaching Aids for Exceptional 

Kids
$0.00 No Bid $0.00 See catalog $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid

Notes

Perfection Learning Postive Action Postive Promotion Really Good Stuff Renaissance Learning

The 30% is already reflected on the 

catalog & website list price.

See attached catalog list

Prices range from 3-15% off 

regular pricing, on any order over 

$30(merchandise total) where 

indicated in print catalogs.Call 

Vendor for shipping charges.

*Volume discounts may apply to 

your order(s).

Rifton Equipment School Specialty Science Kit Shiffler Equipment Sales Smart Promotional

See Catalog & Attached letter

*shipping charges are absorb, except 

on live materials, hazardous materials 

items require to ship via motor freight, 

& items requested for overnight or two 

day delivery on orders over $200

Pricing reflect most current 

prices at time fo receipt of 

PO,please call for special 

pricing&qty discount. A $25 

minimum order requirement.
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Vendor Name

Description Price Item Number and 
Brand Proposed Price Item Number and 

Brand Proposed Price Item Number and 
Brand Proposed Price Item Number and 

Brand Proposed Price Item Number and 
Brand Proposed

Colonial America Posters $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid

Time Chart: The History of 

Europe
$0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid

Lessons of Vietnam War $13.47 CZ102 student guide $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid

Giant Puzzle map of U.S. $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid

Political U.S. Wall Map $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid

DVD•]Uncle Tom's Cabin $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid

DVD•]The Civil War $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid

DVD•]Schindler's List $19.98 MCA172DV $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid

Student Activity Books $0.00 No Bid $0.00 Catalog Price $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid

Special Equipment for 

Exceptional Kids
$0.00 No Bid $0.00 Catalog Price $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid

Teaching Aids for Exceptional $0.00 No Bid $0.00 Catalog Price $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid

Note

Vendor Name

Description Price Item Number and 
Brand Proposed

Colonial America Posters $0.00 No Bid

Time Chart: The History of 

Europe
$0.00 No Bid

Lessons of Vietnam War $0.00 No Bid

Giant Puzzle map of U.S. $0.00 No Bid

Political U.S. Wall Map $0.00 No Bid

DVD•]Uncle Tom's Cabin $0.00 No Bid

DVD•]The Civil War $0.00 No Bid

DVD•]Schindler's List $0.00 No Bid

Student Activity Books $0.00 No Bid

Special Equipment for 

Exceptional Kids
$0.00 No Bid

Teaching Aids for Exceptional 

Kids
$0.00 No Bid

Note

The Trevor Romain Co. Ward's Natural Science

Reference on PO Quote#C205686-

999.No discount on Vernier LabPro 

Probes & Sensors,RED Brand 

Probes&Sensors & Bio-Rad Brand 

products. Free shipping. Please 

call Vendor in reference for 

shipping charges for 

Living/perishable & Hazardous 

items.

Zaner-Bloser

Social Studies School Service Super Duper Textbook Warehouse

Catalog pricing is already discounted 

25% off retail.

All discounts are already noted in 

catalogs & on-lin;Shipping/Handling 

will be billed at 12% with a $4.00 

minimum.

Standard shipping in the US and 

Canada is always free.The 

customer is responsible for 

expedited shipping charges.All 

orders  must be a minimum of 

$20. Reference SD2012;Catalog 

prices will be in effect thru Dec. 

3,2012.
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