
% Discount - 

Parts
Labor Rate

0-10% $70

0-10% $70

Vendor

Description

SPARK PLUG 50-SP0630 15901010630 EA

AIR FILTER 50-AF0360 A226000360 EA

CARBURATOR 50-C1170 A021001170 EA

GROMMET, FUEL 50-FG5930 13211555930 EA

FILTER, FUEL 50-FF9830 13120519830 EA

VENT ASSEMBLY 50-VA0030 A356000030 EA

CAP ASSEMBLY 50-CA5530 1310045530 EA

DRUM CLUTCH 50-DC0181 A556000181 EA

CLUTCH ASSEMBLY 50-CA2481 P021002481 EA

STARTER ASSEMBLY 50-SA0190 A051000190 EA

SPRING,REWIND 50-ERS6310 17722006310 EA

SHIELD ASSEMBLY,METAL 50-SAM3532 69900023530 EA

CABLE, THROTTLE 50-SAM3532 U430000340 EA

SWITCH, IGNITION 50-IS0240 A440000240 EA

HOOK ASSEMBLY 50-HA5230 30120005230 EA

FILTER, AIR 50-AF8360 13030508360 EA

CARBURATOR 50-C0810 A021000810 EA

SPARK PLUG-BPM-8Y 50-CJ8Y 15901019380 EA

HIP MOUNT THROTTLE 

CONTROL
50-TC0109 900109 EA

CARBURATOR 50-C1870 A021001870 EA

FILTER, AIR 50-AF0410 A226000410 EA

PUMP, FUEL 50-FP9130 12318139130 EA

CARBURATOR 50-C1200 A021001200 EA

GUIDE BAR 55-12BAR 12A0CD3744 EA

CHAIN 55-12CHAIN M91UX44G EA

TUNE UP KIT 50-TK0074 90074 EA

No Bid

United Independent School District

N/A

N/A

N/A

N/A

Vendor

Description of Service by Equipment Type

Small Engine Parts & Supplies

RFP 2012-019

ECCO BLOWER

ECCO BRUSH CUTTER

 Neuhaus LCO

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

UISD Item Number
Brand Name / Item 

#

Unit of 

Measure

Do you charge for inspecting equipment and or providing repair/parts estimates?  

Pickup / Delivery Charges (if any):

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No  

No pick up

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

ECCO POWER PRUNER

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

 Neuhaus LCO

ASAP

30 days

30 days

Response Time for Repairs

Warranty on Labor for Repairs

Warranty on Parts

“Snapper” Riding Mowers and Push Mowers.

“John Deere” Ride on Mowers, Weed Eaters, and Leaf Blowers

“SCAG” Tiger Ride on Mowers. 

“STIHT” Chainsaws 

“Echo” Weed Eaters, Power Pruners, and Leaf Blowers

Other Equipment Parts and Supplies



United Independent School District

Vendor

Small Engine Parts & Supplies

RFP 2012-019

 Neuhaus LCO

SPARK PLUG 50-SP8938 M138938 EA

OIL FILTER 50-AF7423 AM107423 EA

FUEL FILTER 50-FF6304 AM116304 EA

CLUTCH-PTO 50-C5800 TCA15800 EA

BELT 50-VB6036 TCU16036 EA

SWITCH-PTO 50-PTO8802 AM118802 EA

V-BELT 50-UB6026 TCU16026 EA

SPINDLE 50-SA1058 TCA51058 EA

DEFLECTOR 50-DL4305 M134305 EA

BLADE 50-B5882 TCU15882 EA

CAP 50-C5582 M135582 EA

CLUTCH 50-C2522 TCA12522 EA

V-BELT 50-VB6495 TCU16495 EA

WHEEL KIT 50-WK3602 AM133602 EA

GUARD 50-C8244 AM128244 EA

AIR FILTER-PRIMARY 50-AFP1747 MIU11747 EA

AIR FILTER-SECONDARY 50-AFS1748 MIU11748 EA

V-BELT 50-UB6910 TCU26910 EA

ECCO WEEDEATERS

OIL 50-OIL10W40 10W40 EA

WEEDEATER HEAD 50-VP30 21560070 EA

WEEDEATER LINE 50-WL105 9302227 RLL

WEEDEATER HEADCAP 50-WS3800 X472000050 EA

TWO CYCLE OIL 50-E02C 7813198015 EA

$5.25

JONH DEERE TRACTOR

No Bid

$29.95

$182.00

$7.45

$27.52

$5.98

$8.38

$6.37

$312.00

$108.14

$31.88

No Bid

No Bid

$14.05

$95.48

$4.44 (TY26674)

No Bid

$312.00

$64.08

$21.34

$78.50

$14.05


