United Independent School District
Tabulation for RFP 2012-018 Construction Supplies

Vendor| Dr. Ike's Home Centers Lowe's Home Center
Number Item Number Description Unit of Unit Price Brand Name / Unit Price Brand Name /
Measure ltem # ltem #
1 40-11214 LUMBER 1x12x 14 EA $23.00 $17.00 88943
2 40-11216C LUMBER, 1 x 12 x 16 CEDAR EA No bid $37.41 88943
3 40-1216C LUMBER, 1 x 2 x 16 CEDAR EA $4.80 $6.54 95484
4 40-128 LUMBER, 1x2x 8 EA $1.80 $4.25 1408
5 40-1410 LUMBER, 1 x 4 x 10 CEDAR EA $5.75 $5.98 7581
6 40-1610 LUMBER, 1 x 6 x 10 CEDAR EA $8.90 $8.75 952
7 40-1810 LUMBER, 1 x 8 x10 EA $8.75 $10.31 963
8 40-1816C LUMBER, 1 x 8 x 16 CEDAR EA $8.90 $32.62 44908
9 40-2068W DOOR, SOLID WOOD 2.0 x 6.8 EA No bid $140.00 88943
10 40-21212 LUMBER, 2 x 12 x 12 EA $21.00 $17.60 84710
11 40-21216 LUMBER, 2 x 12 x 16 EA $29.00 $24.24 86156
18 40-2480W DOOR, WOOD 24 x 80 EA $32.00 door only $140.00 88943
19 40-2610 LUMBER, 2 x 6 x 10 EA $7.99 $5.62 3110
20 40-2616 LUMBER, 2 x 6 x 16 EA $11.99 $9.18 33789
21 40-2616T LUMBER, TREATED 2 x 6 x 16 EA $13.99 $8.97 90297
22 40-2810 LUMBER 2x8x10 EA $7.99 $7.40 76855
23 40-2816 LUMBER 2x8x16 EA $13.99 $12.37 77081
24 40-2816T LUMBER, TREATED 2 x 8 x 16 EA $14.99 $15.97 201519
25 40-2818 LUMBER, 2x8x18 EA $15.99 $16.00 5177
26 40-3068M DOOR, METAL 30 x 68 EA $115.00 door only 36x80 $1,250.00 88943
27 40-3068W DOOR, WOOD 30 x 68 EA $37.00 door only 36x80 $160.00 88943
28 40-3680W DOOR, WOOD 36 x 68 EA $37.00 door only 36x80 $160.00 88943
29 40-4196 SEALER, ASPHALT-CONCRETE LIQUA- EA No bid $16.96 223511
30 40-4410T LUMBER 4 x 4 x 10' TREATED EA $12.99 $12.27 1467
31 40-448T LUMBER, TREATED 4 x 4 x 8' EA $8.99 $6.97 201596
32 40-BWO01 TIE WIRE [ROLLS] RLL $4.99 $4.55 12148
42 40-CRM80 READY MIX 80 LBS. BAG $3.75 $3.45 10385
43 40-CT2983 TILE, CEILING 2 x 4 FIBERGLASS BX No bid $36.34 54195
44 40-CT584 TILE, CEILING 2x 2 BX $35.56 40684
45 40-DS36 DOOR SWEEP, ALUMINUM 36" EA $15.99 $9.97 61230
46 40-DS602 SCREW, DRYWALL 6 x 2 LB $4.99 $6.47 112594
47 40-DS61 SCREW, DRYWALL 6x1 LB $4.99 $6.47 112597
73 40-NC08 NAIL, #8 COMMON LB $3.99 $3.47 69122
82 40-QS25 FLOOR LEVELER, PATCHING COMPOUND 25# BAG No bid $14.87 3174
83 40-RF02 ROOF FLASHING 1"-2" EA $2.99 roof edge mill $6.45 200333
84 40-RF30 FELT, ROOFING #30 EA $21.00 $20.50 10308
85 40-RF34 ROOF FLASHING 3-4" EA No bid $6.45 200334
86 40-SCT40 TEXTONE, CEILING SPRAY EA $9.99 | $13.99 11138
87 40-SF350 SNAKE FENCE 36" X 50' RLL No bid $90.20 251161
88 40-SHO3 SHINGLES, ROOF PKG $29.00 | $23.95 14613
107 40-TMG22 THINSET, MORTAR BAG $25.98 43958
108 40-VT615 TILE VINYL SPEARMINT BX $40.00
109 40-VT785 TILE, VINYL CIRRAS BX $40.00
110 40-VT862 TILE, VINYL WHITE CLOUD BX $40.00
111 40-VT873 TILE, VINYL SAND DUNE BX $40.00
112 40-VT874 TILE, VINYL DESERT HAZE BX $40.00
113 40-VT957 TILE, VINYL FIELDSTONE BX $40.00
114 40-VTD042 CERAMIC TILE D042 BX
115 40-VTD156 CERAMIC TILE D-156 BX No bid
116 40-VTD178 CERAMIC TILE D178 BX No bid
117 40-VTD343 CERAMIC TILE D343 BX
118 40-VTD452 CERAMIC TILE D452 BX
119 40-VTILE TILE VINYL BX $40.00 |AZr0k
120 40-VTMRT1 MARAZZ| PORCELAIN TILE MRT-1 BX No bid
121 40-VTMRT3 MARAZZ| PORCELAIN TILE MRT3 BX
122 40-W3X3 WINDOWS FOR PORTABLES EA $95.00 8576
123 40-WB9648 WHITE BOARD $13.05 16605
124 40-WER14X10 ROUND ROD, %" x 10 EA $11.99 11/4x18 $15.70 3584
125 40-WM4X50 WIRE MESH RLL $220.00 $107.00 12142
126 40-WP48 PANELING EA No bid $13.34 86415
127 40-WS14 WEATHERSTRIP EA $10.97 67215
128 60-11249 TWINE, NYLON RLL $10.99 | $8.48 33814
129 60-42100 WEATHERSTRIP 3' X 6' No bid $10.97 67215
130 60-CH14 CHAIN 1/4" FEET $3.99 $2.94 348253
131 60-CR3208 CHAULK LINE REFILL EA $6.99 $7.97 104300
132 60-F1212 FOAM SEALANT SPRAY CAN EA $4.99 $3.42 13617
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133 60-GS12 SPRAY GREASE TUBE $6.99 spray can $3.97 36389
134 60-HCB12 BLADE, CONCRETE 12" EA No bid $6.20 127429
138 60-HS78 HOLE SAW 7/8" EA $16.99 | $9.67 348125
139 60-HSB24 BLADE HACKSAW EA $3.48 21441
140 60-MCW12 BLADE CARBIDE 12" EA $49.98 73714
141 60-NYS04 STRAP NYLON 4" EA $3.61 76021
142 60-NYS06 STRAP NYLON 6" EA $5.53 76023
143 60-NYS12 STRAP NYLON 12" EA $2.43 230987
144 60-NYS14 STRAP NYLON 14" EA No bid $2.79 241181
145 60-NYS21 STRAP NYLON 21" EA $6.54 292681
146 60-NYS28 STRAP NYLON 28" EA No bid
147 60-NYS36 STRAP NYLON 36" EA $8.20 | 292683
148 60-NYS45 STRAP NYLON 45" EA No bid
150 60-SB714 BLADE SAW 7 1/4" EA $7.98 59744
167 61-CB993 ADHESIVE COVE BASE (1-GAL) EA $23.99 | $23.88 346877
168 61-CBA2100 ADHESIVE COVE BASE (4-GAL) EA No bid $84.00 346877
169 61-CFLAO1 CONCRETE ADDITIVE GAL. EA $26.00 $15.58 10428
170 61-COCEO1 CONTACT CEMENT (GAL.) EA $27.00 $29.98 41163
171 61-COCE32 CONTACT CEMENT (QT.) EA $14.99 $13.97 41159
172 61-JC02 JOINT COMPOUND SHEETROCK BX $9.99 $7.37 18111
177 61-SD05 CEMENT, ROOF SILVER DOLLAR EA No bid $62.00 12035
186 62-21691 SANDING BELT 3" X 21" EA $9.99 $4.98 195398
187 62-51503 TAPE MASKING 3" RLL $12.99 $9.98 386170
188 62-9001NA SANDPAPER FINE 150 SHEET $0.71 $3.98 251043
189 62-9002NA SANDPAPER MEDIUM 100 SHEET $0.71 $3.98 251044
190 62-9038NA SANDPAPER COARSE 60 FOR WO SHEET $0.71 $3.98 251252
194 63-H5M520 ANCHOR PLASTIC #14-16 X 1 PKG $4.89 $12.98 274654
195 63-PAK14 ANCHOR KIT PLASTIC PKG $14.95 $12.50 326636
196 63-SH3830 ANCHOR WEDGE 3/8 X 3 EA $2.25 $1.58 63551
197 63-W3805 ANCHOR WEDGE 3/8 X 5 EA $2.99 $1.97 63802
198 63-WA12334 ANCHOR WEDGE 1/2 X 3 3/4 EA $1.96 63683
199 63-WA12412 ANCHOR WEDGE 1/2 X 4 1/2 EA $2.24 79554
200 63-WA12512 ANCHOR WEDGE 1/2 X 51/2 EA No bid $4.87 40208
201 63-WA38334 ANCHOR WEDGE 3/8 X 3 3/4 EA $1.73 63642
202 63-WA58414 ANCHOR WEDGE 5/8 X 4 1/4 EA $2.63 79527
203 64-CTDNE TAPE CAUTION DO NOT ENTER RLL $10.99 300'x3" $11.98 158674
204 CHICKEN WIRE 2"x50" EACH $14.99 2"x36"x50' $8.27 92283
205 HINGES, 4 %" x 41" EACH No bid $9.96 4469
% off Catalog Price 0% 5%
% off Shelf Price 5% 5%
% off List Price 0% 5%
48 hours for in stock items / 2
Est. Delivery Time| weeks after PO has been 7-30 days
received for special orders
Due to the instable pricing in
Notes| lumber prices will be good only
for 3 months.




