UNITED INDEPENDENT SCHOOL DISTRICT
HVAC EQUIPMENT & SUPPLIES
RFP 2010-065

VENDORS
AIRGAS REFRIGERANTS COOLGAS INTERLINE BRANDS INSCO DISTRIBUTING R&M REFRIGERATION
PERCENTAGE DISCOUNTS
% Off Catalog Price 0% 0% 15% 5% 70%
% Off List Price 0% 0% - 50% 80%
% Off Shelf Price 0% 0% - 5% 40%
DESCRIPTION Unit | Unit Cost I Brand & Item # | Unit Cost I Brand & Item # | Unit Cost Brand & Item # Unit Cost Brand & Item # Unit Cost Brand & Item #
Run Capacitor 35/5, MFD, 5% 370 VAC EA $17.01 $7.58 $6.10 Global
Run Capaciotr 25 MFD, 5% 370VAC EA $11.49 $3.57 $3.80 Global
Run Capacitor 35/5 mfd, 440VAC EA $19.64 $9.83 $7.53 Global
Contactor 3 pole, 40FLA, 50A, 600VAC coil 24VAC | EA no bid $25.51 $17.80 Fasco
Contactor 2 pole, 30A- coil 120VAC EA $9.38 eaton c25 bnb230A $20.08 $4.94 Fasco
Contactor 3 pole, 40A-600V, coil-120V EA no bid $25.51 $17.80 Fasco
Coil Cleaner Non Acid GAL $11.78 diversitch 8P $16.23 $12.08 Virginia
Liquid line filter dryer, 3/8 SWEAT EA $14.54 033124-163 $16.32 $12.99 Parker
Liquid line filter dryer, 1/2 ODF Solder EA 6 bid $17.83 $14.90 Parker
Liquid Line filter dryer, 5/8 ODF Solder EA $18.45 $12.98 Parker
3 no bid no bid
Transformer 40VA PR1 120/208/240V SEC 24V- EA $15.76 honeywell AT $5.97 $4.97 Smart
Footmount 140A1018
Fan Relay - SPNO/SPNC - 12A.cont 120vac-coil
an Relay / con vac-col EA $5.18 $5.96 Global
24vac no bid
Silver Brazing Alloy .050"x 1/8 sticks EA $75.07 *$55.01 Harris
HVAC foil tape EA $29.47 |covalenee 3240024500] $12.46 $5.10 Naushua
Electric motor 1HP, 1100rpm 380-415/460v-1ph 2.5 EA $475.22 MOT09375 $197.40 AO Smith
amps, 50/60Hz, frame 48Y shaft 0.5x3.1 flats no bid i :
Blower motor 3/4hps, 1075rpm 3Spd, 227volts, EA $248.20 9605A $155.30 Fasco
1PH, 3.3amps, 60Hz, frame 48YZ
Gas refrigerant R-22, 30lbs cylinder . * .
: CYL $179.95 see note below call for quote $195.47 national 30R-22 $175.82 6550136 $162.00 Varies
Chlorodifluorometone
N
amp, vac amp, vac no bid no bid no bid
Dual element low peak fuse
EA $15.86 $465,182.00 $1.62

600vac & 300VDC




VENDORS AIRGAS REFRIGERANTS COOLGAS INTERLINE BRANDS INSCO DISTRIBUTING R&M REFRIGERATION
DESCRIPTION Unit | Unit Cost I Brand & Item # Unit Cost I Brand & Item # | Unit Cost Brand & Item # Unit Cost I Brand & Item # Unit Cost Brand & Item #
Compressor Starter EA $17.68 443341 sealed unit no bid $6.49 varies - 41
parts spp75
Evaporator Motor EA $64.59 | GE 3583 $7.27 varies - 99
Dual Voltage Evaporator Motor EA no bid $12.90 varies - 675
Ice Machine Thick Control EA $37.44 Manitow - 1996
Ice Machine Water Inlet Valve EA $51.99 | Scotsman 7035035 $46.80 Manitow - 0112
Ice Machine Dump Valve EA no bid no bid $46.80 Manitow - 00176
Timer (Replacement Kit only) EA $62.98 varies - m4520
Defrost Limit Control EA $41.48 | 6940280 $1.79 varies - 45
8hr Defrost Timer EA no bid $9.20 varies - wp8
High Limit Switches (Coolers/Freezers) EA $41.48 | 6940280 $12.10 varies
. 406806 nordyne
Replacement Compressors EA no bid $350.73 coneland 914933 $130.80-$387.00 varies - 4440/4476
Complete Evaporator System EA no bid no bid $972.10 varies - AE320
464713 a o smith
Motors EA $78.07 | feel016 $51.83/$72.08 Fasco - 1125/471
Fan Cycle EA no bid $16.06 Global GFC 340 $54.47 varies - 6166
Remote Thermometer EA $6.59 | S30I30sealedunit | ooy or | \eiss 205D-Fs $17.10 )
parts st03 varies - 4220
465362 e james + co
Replacement V-Belts EA 5388 3L150 no bid $2.10/53.10/$3.90 varies - 210/260/310
Exhaust Fan Systems EA $80.25 466233 brown 509 $1,989.80 Loren Cook
. . 468096 parker sld-8-
Filter Driers EA 6 bid $26.91 couhh $12.46 Sporlan C-052S $7.56/$9.01/$11.23 varies - 032/052/083
Control Board Ice Machine EA no bid $218.88 | Scotsman 7035235 $262.82 varies - 0619
465334 national *
Freon (22) EA $179.75 $195.47 30r-22 $175.82 Dupont $162.00 varies - R22
465339 national *
Freon (134A) EA $198.75 see note below $389.61 30r1348 $202.35 Dupont $187.00 varies - R1349
465336 national *
Freon (404A) EA $194.75 $316.68 24r404a $248.22 Dupont $199.80 varies - RA049
High Temperature Wire (10ga) EA $24.73 MA Line
High Temperature Wire (12ga) EA $37.58 MA Line 2512NG
Evaporator Coil AE120B EA no bid no bid $677.30 Russell - AE 120B
Expansion Valve EA $75.17 Spolan EBFV-AA-C $92.10 varies - 762251
Solenoid Valve EA $35.64 Sporlan A3513 $46.80 varies - 0448
Starter Capacitor Kit EA $26.53 5-2-1 CSRU1 $14.10 varies - 600
Acid Cleaner EA $16.47 | (red) 443846 $12.54 Rector Seal $12.08 —_
1o bid diversitech 8r 687598050909 Virginia KMP AK 1
Defrost Heaters EA no bid $70.28 varies - 4760
Defrost Time/Fan Delay EA no bid $46.00 6940272 $57.34 varies
3-N-1 Kick Stark for compressor EA $9.98 Supco RCO 410 $6.49 varies - 410
468586 eaton
Contactors EA $8.45 | 25cnb130t $8.95 Global GCL4161 $17.80/$29.26 Fasco - 3p40R/3p50a
T6054- Thermostat EA $26.00 White Rogers $62.92 Honeywell - T 6054
Ice Maker Part Water Level EA no bid no bid $26.52 Manitowac - 11293
Bin Switch EA $121.99 | Scotsman 7035050 $37.44 Manitowac - 01483
the brands that they supply are | please contact coolgas for all
Arkeme "Forane", Dupont pricing on all refrigerant gases
"Freon", "Isceon" & "Suva", (brands vary but all meet brands and item numbers may vary based on
NOTES Honeywell "Genetron", ARI700 specs) - they always |line #48 must order in multiples of 4] none best availability and pricing by manufacturers.
Mexichem (formally Ineos)  ]pay the frieght and has produc] *prices subject to changes based on markets.
"Klea", Refron "Refron" & Airgas in stock ready to ship -
"Aspen" approved vendor on BuyBoard

ONE (1) VENDOR SUBMITTED A NO BID




