UNITED INDEPENDENT SCHOOL DISTRICT
PRINTING SERVICES
RFP # 2010-061

VENDOR

% OFF LIST PRICE 0% 0% 0% 0% 0% 0% 0% 0% 0%
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UNITED INDEPENDENT SCHOOL DISTRICT
PRINTING SERVICES
RFP 2010-061

ITEM #1

CARBONLESS BUSINESS FORMS

VENDORS

1PART

QTY 500 1 SIDED 2 SIDED J1SIDED | 2 SIDED 1 SIDED 2 SIDED J1SIDED| 2 SIDED§ 1 SIDED 2 SIDED J1SIDED| 2 SIDED 1 SIDED 2 SIDED J1SIDED |2 SIDED} 1 SIDED |2 SIDED
8.5X11 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $45.67 $83.81 NoBid | NoBid | $ 45.00 | $ 65.00 | No Bid | No Bid $34.32 $62.33 No Bid | No Bid ] No Bid | No Bid
8.5X14 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $48.87 $87.10 NoBid | NoBid | $ 55.00 | $ 75.00 | No Bid | No Bid $37.35 $64.22 No Bid | No Bid ] No Bid | No Bid
8.5X5.5 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $38.37 $72.45 NoBid | NoBid | $ 30.00 | $ 40.00 § No Bid | No Bid $27.94 $40.64 No Bid | No Bid J No Bid | No Bid
QTY 1000

8.5X11 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $60.31 $106.54 NoBid | NoBid | $ 75.00 | $ 90.00 § NoBid | No Bid $45.39 $80.59 No Bid | No Bid J No Bid | No Bid
8.5X14 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $66.69 $113.11 NoBid | NoBid | $ 90.00 | $ 105.00 § No Bid | No Bid $57.79 $101.31 No Bid | No Bid |} No Bid | No Bid
8.5X5.5 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $45.67 $83.81 NoBid | NoBid | $ 45.00 | $ 55.00 | No Bid | No Bid $37.40 $64.14 No Bid | No Bid J No Bid | No Bid
QTY 5000

8.5X11 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $177.39 $288.81 NoBid | NoBid §$ 290.00|$ 350.00 ) NoBid | NoBid $162.25 $276.23 No Bid | NoBid § NoBid | NoBid
8.5X14 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $209.32 $322.06 NoBid | NoBid §$ 350.00|$ 415.00) NoBid | NoBid $197.05 $326.50 No Bid | NoBid § NoBid | NoBid
8.5X5.5 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $104.21 $174.73 NoBid | NoBid §$ 17500($ 215.00] NoBid | NoBid $111.94 $187.26 No Bid | NoBid | NoBid | NoBid
QTY 10,000

8.5X11 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $292.49 $452.85 NoBid | NoBid §$ 475.00|$ 570.00 ) NoBid | NoBid $250.74 $412.23 No Bid | NoBid § NoBid | NoBid
8.5X14 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $356.35 $519.36 NoBid | NoBid §$ 550.00|$ 650.00 NoBid | NoBid $329.55 $534.66 No Bid | NoBid § NoBid | NoBid
8.5X5.5 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $178.76 $270.47 NoBid | NoBid §$ 330.00($ 390.00f NoBid | NoBid $162.25 $276.23 No Bid | No Bid ] NoBid | No Bid
VENDORS

2 PART

QTY 500 1 SIDED 2 SIDED |} 1SIDED | 2 SIDED 1 SIDED 2 SIDED J1SIDED| 2 SIDED§ 1 SIDED 2 SIDED J1SIDED| 2 SIDED 1 SIDED 2 SIDED J1SIDED |2 SIDED} 1 SIDED |2 SIDED
8.5X11 $ 65.00 | $ 85.00 | No Bid No Bid $88.35 $135.33 NoBid | NoBid |'$ 80.00 $96.00 No Bid | No Bid $57.15 $82.55 No Bid | No Bid § No Bid [ No Bid
8.5X14 $ 86.00 | $ 125.00 ] No Bid No Bid $96.34 $143.54 NoBid | NoBid |'$ 90.00 | $ 109.00 § NoBid | No Bid $68.58 $91.44 No Bid | No Bid § No Bid [ No Bid
8.5X5.5 $ 49.00 [ $ 70.00 | No Bid No Bid $59.70 $98.21 NoBid | NoBid |'$ 54.00 | $ 65.00 | NoBid | No Bid $43.18 $54.61 No Bid | No Bid | No Bid [ No Bid
QTY 1000

8.5X11 $ 99.00 | $ 140.00 ] No Bid No Bid $145.67 $209.57 NoBid | NoBid §$ 13500 $160.00 No Bid | No Bid $100.33 $120.65 No Bid | NoBid | No Bid | No Bid
8.5X14 $ 116.00 | $ 155.00 ] No Bid No Bid $161.63 $226.00 NoBid | NoBid §$ 160.00($ 185.00 ) NoBid | NoBid $137.16 $152.40 No Bid | NoBid | No Bid | No Bid
8.5X5.5 $ 65.00 | $ 80.00 | No Bid No Bid $88.35 $135.33 NoBid | NoBid |'$ 96.00 | $ 115.00 J NoBid | No Bid $68.58 $93.98 No Bid | NoBid | No Bid | No Bid
QTY 5000

8.5X11 $ 520.00 [ $ 570.00 ] No Bid No Bid $459.00 $569.00 NoBid | NoBid §$ 390.00 [ $480.00 No Bid [ No Bid $381.25 $593.75 No Bid | NoBid | NoBid | No Bid
8.5X14 $ 580.00 [ $ 690.00 | No Bid No Bid $690.00 $900.35 NoBid | NoBid §$ 480.00|$ 570.00f NoBid | NoBid $450.00 $600.00 No Bid | NoBid | NoBid | No Bid
8.5X5.5 $ 270.00 [ $ 425.00 ] No Bid No Bid $317.61 $432.75 NoBid | NoBid | $ 28500 |$ 339.00] NoBid | NoBid $200.00 $281.25 No Bid | NoBid | NoBid | No Bid
QTY 10,000

8.5X11 $ 730.00 [ $ 780.00 ] No Bid No Bid $759.00 $859.00 NoBid | NoBid §$ 700.00 [ $840.00 No Bid [ No Bid $662.50 $825.00 No Bid | No Bid | NoBid | No Bid
8.5X14 $ 781.00 | $ 850.00 ] No Bid No Bid $869.00 $969.00 NoBid | NoBid §$ 800.00 ($ 990.00 § NoBid | NoBid $800.00 $887.50 No Bid | No Bid | NoBid | No Bid
8.5X5.5 $ 340.00 [ $ 435.00] NoBid No Bid $649.00 $749.00 NoBid | NoBid | $ 465.00($ 600.00 ] NoBid | NoBid $356.25 $456.25 No Bid | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid
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VENDORS

Litho Business

Rabo Business

Thompson Print

Weldon, Williams

3 PART Adams Printing Brown Industries Kwik Kopy Forms Mendes Printing Forms Rapid Print Solutions & Lick, Inc.
QTY 500 1 SIDED 2 SIDED 1 SIDED | 2 SIDED 1 SIDED 2 SIDED J1SIDED| 2 SIDED 1 SIDED 2 SIDED |1 SIDED| 2 SIDED 1 SIDED 2 SIDED j1SIDED |2 SIDED} 1 SIDED |2 SIDED
8.5X11 $ 75.00 | $ 125.00 § No Bid No Bid $117.01 $172.45 No Bid No Bid | $ 90.00 $110.00 No Bid No Bid $88.90 $104.14 No Bid | No Bid | No Bid No Bid
8.5X14 $ 95.00 | $ 140.00 § No Bid No Bid $132.97 $188.88 No Bid NoBid §$ 110.00| $ 130.00 J No Bid No Bid $99.06 $125.73 No Bid | No Bid | No Bid No Bid
8.5X5.5 $ 55.00 | $ 95.00 § No Bid No Bid $78.05 $116.78 No Bid No Bid | $ 66.00 | $ 79.00 § No Bid No Bid $53.34 $68.58 No Bid | No Bid | No Bid No Bid
QTY 1000

8.5X11 $ 125.00 | $ 175.00 § No Bid No Bid $ 20298 | $ 283.82] NoBid NoBid §$ 120.00 $144.00 No Bid NoBid | $ 138.43 | $ 156.21 | NoBid | NoBid | No Bid No Bid
8.5X14 $ 155.00 | $ 200.00 § No Bid No Bid $ 23491 | $ 316.78 ) No Bid NoBid | $ 145.00|$ 174.00 | No Bid NoBid | $ 156.21 | $ 215.90] NoBid | NoBid | No Bid No Bid
8.5X5.5 $ 75.00 | $ 110.00 § No Bid No Bid $ 123.01 | $ 172.45] No Bid No Bid | $ 87.00 | $ 100.00 | No Bid NoBid | $ 101.60 | $ 127.00 ] No Bid | NoBid | No Bid No Bid
QTY 5000

8.5X11 $ 550.00 [ $ 645.00 § No Bid No Bid $ 665.00 | $ 775.00 § No Bid NoBid §$ 550.00 $660.00 No Bid NoBid | $ 550.00 | $ 637.50] NoBid | NoBid | No Bid No Bid
8.5X14 $ 565.00 [ $ 750.00 § No Bid No Bid $ 739.00 [ $ 849.00 § No Bid NoBid | $ 660.00|$ 760.00 | No Bid No Bid | $ 637.50 | $ 787.50 ] NoBid | NoBid | No Bid No Bid
8.5X5.5 $ 340.00 [ $ 450.00 § No Bid No Bid $ 496.89| $ 631.07 f NoBid NoBid §$ 396.00|$ 475.00 | No Bid NoBid § $ 325.00 | $ 450.00 ] NoBid | NoBid | No Bid No Bid
QTY 10,000

8.5X11 $ 765.00 | $ 835.00 | No Bid No Bid $ 1,020.00 | $ 1,129.00 § No Bid NoBid §$ 1,000.00 | $1,200.00 No Bid NoBid | $ 1,012.50 [ $ 1,137.50 } NoBid | No Bid § No Bid No Bid
8.5X14 $ 985.00 [ $ 1,069.00 § No Bid No Bid $ 1,739.00 | $ 1,259.00 § No Bid NoBid §$ 1,200.00 | $ 1,440.00 | No Bid NoBid | $ 1,118.75| $ 1,237.50 ] NoBid | No Bid § No Bid No Bid
8.5X5.5 $ 520.00 [ $ 735.00 | NoBid No Bid $ 895.00 [ $ 995.00 § No Bid NoBid |$ 720.00|$ 864.00 ] No Bid NoBid | $ 543.75|$ 668.75] NoBid | NoBid | No Bid No Bid
VENDORS Litho Business Rabo Business Thompson Print | Weldon, Williams
4 PART Adams Printing Brown Industries Kwik Kopy Forms Mendes Printing Forms Rapid Print Solutions & Lick, Inc.
QTY 500 1 SIDED 2 SIDED 1 SIDED | 2 SIDED 1 SIDED 2 SIDED |1 SIDED| 2 SIDED 1 SIDED 2 SIDED |1 SIDED| 2 SIDED 1 SIDED 2 SIDED 1 SIDED |2 SIDED§ 1 SIDED |2 SIDED
8.5X11 $ 95.00 | $ 165.00 | No Bid No Bid $ 150.15| $ 210.58 | No Bid No Bid $149.00 $178.00 No Bid No Bid | $ 113.03| $ 146.05] NoBid | NoBid | No Bid No Bid
8.5X14 $ 110.00 | $ 180.00 § No Bid No Bid $ 182.08 | $ 243.44 ] No Bid No Bid $178.00 $214.00 No Bid No Bid | $ 127.00 | $ 165.10] No Bid | NoBid | No Bid No Bid
8.5X5.5 $ 60.00 | $ 110.00 | No Bid No Bid $ 9459 | $ 139.82 | No Bid No Bid $105.00 $128.00 No Bid No Bid | $ 82.55| $ 120.65] NoBid | NoBid J No Bid No Bid
QTY 1000

8.5X11 $ 160.00 | $ 230.00 | No Bid No Bid $ 269.25 | $ 360.21 § No Bid No Bid $225.00 $270.00 No Bid No Bid | $ 213.36 | $ 260.35] NoBid | NoBid | No Bid No Bid
8.5X14 $ 195.00 | $ 275.00 | No Bid No Bid $ 33111 | $ 426.25] No Bid No Bid $270.00 $324.00 No Bid No Bid | $ 228.60 | $ 266.70] NoBid | NoBid | No Bid No Bid
8.5X5.5 $ 90.00 | $ 140.00 | No Bid No Bid $ 158.15| $ 218.58 | No Bid No Bid $162.00 $194.00 No Bid No Bid | $ 132.08 | $ 171.45] NoBid | NoBid | No Bid No Bid
QTY 5000

8.5X11 $ 920.00 [ $ 995.00 § No Bid No Bid $ 820.00 [ $ 939.00 § No Bid No Bid $625.00 $750.00 No Bid No Bid | $ 76250 | $ 900.00 | NoBid | NoBid | No Bid No Bid
8.5X14 $ 940.00 [ $ 998.00 | No Bid No Bid $ 949.00 | $ 1,059.00 § No Bid No Bid $750.00 $900.00 No Bid NoBid | $ 887.50| $ 1,025.00 ] NoBid | No Bid J No Bid No Bid
8.5X5.5 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 655.00 [ $ 769.00 | No Bid No Bid $450.00 $540.00 No Bid NoBid | $ 43125 $ 556.25] NoBid | NoBid ] No Bid No Bid
QTY 10,000

8.5X11 $ 1,430.00 [ $ 1,540.00 § No Bid No Bid $ 1,295.00 | $ 1,425.00 § No Bid No Bid $1,060.00 $1,275.00 No Bid NoBid | $ 1,331.25 [ $ 1,456.25 ] NoBid | No Bid |} No Bid No Bid
8.5X14 $ 1,498.00 [ $ 1,730.00 | No Bid No Bid $ 1,549.00 | $ 1,649.00 | No Bid No Bid $1,275.00 $1,500.00 No Bid NoBid | $ 1,418.75| $ 1,556.25 | No Bid | No Bid No Bid No Bid
8.5X5.5 $ 995.00 [ $ 1,104.00 | No Bid No Bid $ 1,089.00 | $ 1,225.00 | No Bid No Bid $765.00 $920.00 No Bid NoBid | $ 74375 $ 875.00] NoBid | NoBid | No Bid No Bid
VENDORS Litho Business Rabo Business Thompson Print | Weldon, Williams
5 PART Adams Printing Brown Industries Kwik Kopy Forms Mendes Printing Forms Rapid Print Solutions & Lick, Inc.
QTY 500 1 SIDED 2 SIDED 1 SIDED | 2 SIDED 1 SIDED 2 SIDED |1 SIDED| 2 SIDED 1 SIDED 2 SIDED |1 SIDED| 2 SIDED 1 SIDED 2 SIDED 1 SIDED |2 SIDED§ 1 SIDED |2 SIDED
8.5X11 $ 150.00 [ $ 195.00 | No Bid No Bid $ 189.90 [ $ 258.22 | No Bid No Bid $150.00 $180.00 No Bid NoBid | $ 139.70 | $ 190.50 | NoBid | NoBid J No Bid No Bid
8.5X14 $ 190.00 [ $ 250.00 § No Bid No Bid $ 221.83 | $ 291.08 | No Bid No Bid $180.00 $215.00 No Bid No Bid | $ 170.18 | $ 220.98 | NoBid | NoBid J No Bid No Bid
8.5X5.5 $ 115.00 [ $ 140.00 § No Bid No Bid $ 116.50 [ $ 165.65 ] No Bid No Bid $108.00 $129.00 No Bid No Bid | $ 87.63| $ 113.03] NoBid | NoBid J No Bid No Bid
QTY 1000

8.5X11 $ 220.00 [ $ 350.00 § No Bid No Bid $ 34876 | $ 455.78 ] NoBid No Bid $270.00 $320.00 No Bid No Bid | $ 22225 $ 273.05] NoBid | NoBid | No Bid No Bid
8.5X14 $ 325.00 [ $ 375.00 § No Bid No Bid $ 41262 | $ 521.89 ] No Bid No Bid $320.00 $385.00 No Bid No Bid | $ 266.70 | $ 317.50] NoBid | NoBid | No Bid No Bid
8.5X5.5 $ 150.00 | $ 198.00 | No Bid No Bid $ 199.90 | $ 268.22 | No Bid No Bid $190.00 $230.00 No Bid No Bid | $ 158.75| $ 215.90] NoBid | NoBid | No Bid No Bid
QTY 5000

8.5X11 $ 910.00 [ $ 998.00 § No Bid No Bid $ 999.00 | $ 1,115.00 § No Bid No Bid $1,165.00 $1,395.00 No Bid No Bid | $ 937.50 | $ 1,062.50 | No Bid | NoBid | No Bid No Bid
8.5X14 $ 1,210.00 [ $ 1,300.00 § No Bid No Bid $ 1,089.00 | $ 1,199.00 § No Bid No Bid $1,395.00 $1,675.00 No Bid NoBid | $ 1,100.00 [ $ 1,225.00 ] NoBid | No Bid § No Bid No Bid
8.5X5.5 $ 680.00 [ $ 825.00 ] No Bid No Bid $ 795.00 [ $ 910.00 § No Bid No Bid $840.00 $1,000.00 No Bid NoBid | $ 57500 $ 687.50] NoBid | NoBid | No Bid No Bid
QTY 10,000

8.5X11 $ 1,570.00 [ $ 1,700.00 § No Bid No Bid $ 1,635.00 | $ 1,765.00 § No Bid No Bid $1,980.00 $2,375.00 No Bid NoBid | $ 1,500.00 | $ 1,812.50 ] NoBid | No Bid § No Bid No Bid
8.5X14 $ 1,820.00 [ $ 1,980.00 § No Bid No Bid $ 1,889.00 | $ 2,019.00 § No Bid No Bid $2,375.00 $2,850.00 No Bid NoBid | $ 2,062.50 | $ 2,312.50 ] NoBid | No Bid |} No Bid No Bid
8.5X5.5 $ 1,180.00 [ $ 1,250.00 § No Bid No Bid $ 1,345.75 | $ 1,479.00 | No Bid No Bid $1,425.00 $1,710.00 No Bid NoBid | $ 1,112.50 [ $ 1,362.50 ] NoBid | No Bid § No Bid No Bid
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VENDORS

Litho Business

Rabo Business

Thompson Print

Weldon, Williams

6 PART Adams Printing Brown Industries Kwik Kopy Forms Mendes Printing Forms Rapid Print Solutions & Lick, Inc.
QTY 500 1 SIDED 2 SIDED 1 SIDED | 2 SIDED 1 SIDED 2 SIDED |1 SIDED| 2 SIDED 1 SIDED 2 SIDED |1 SIDED| 2 SIDED 1 SIDED 2 SIDED [ 1 SIDED |2 SIDED} 1 SIDED |2 SIDED
8.5X11 $ 225.00 [ $ 250.00 § No Bid NoBid §$ 221.67[$ 297.64 ] No Bid NoBid §$ 180.00| $ 215.00 ] No Bid NoBid | $ 17272 $ 210.82] NoBid | NoBid | No Bid No Bid
8.5X14 $ 295.00 [ $ 280.00 § No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid NoBid §$ 215.00|$ 259.00 ] No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid | No Bid | No Bid No Bid
8.5X5.5 $ 180.00 | $ 240.00 | No Bid NoBid §$ 132.35|$ 173.04 ] No Bid NoBid §$ 129.00| $ 155.00 ] No Bid NoBid | $ 11684 $ 146.05] NoBid | NoBid | No Bid No Bid
QTY 1000

8.5X11 $ 280.00 [ $ 320.00 § No Bid NoBid §$ 41830 $ 546.92 ] No Bid NoBid §$ 300.00|$ 365.00 ] NoBid NoBid | $ 25781 % 295.91] NoBid | NoBid ] No Bid No Bid
8.5X14 $ 298.00 [ $ 350.00 § No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid NoBid §$ 365.00|$ 440.00 ] No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid | No Bid | No Bid No Bid
8.5X5.5 $ 190.00 | $ 235.00 | No Bid NoBid §$ 233.67[$ 285.00J No Bid NoBid §$ 219.00|$ 260.00 ] No Bid NoBid § $ 19177 $ 241.30] NoBid | NoBid | No Bid No Bid
QTY 5000

8.5X11 $ 1,070.00 [ $ 1,140.00 § No Bid NoBid § $ 1,119.00 [ $ 1,229.00 | No Bid No Bid §$ 1,380.00 | $ 1,650.00 ] No Bid NoBid | $ 1,121.25| $ 1,246.25 ] NoBid | No Bid |} No Bid No Bid
8.5X14 $ 1,220.00 [ $ 1,415.00 § No Bid NoBid §J $ 1,299.00 [ $ 1,409.00 § No Bid No Bid §$ 1,650.00 | $ 1,985.00 ] No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid | No Bid § No Bid No Bid
8.5X5.5 $ 735.00 | $ 800.00 § No Bid NoBid §$ 959.00 No Bid NoBid §$ 990.00 | $ 1,190.00 } No Bid NoBid | $ 74625 $ 871.25] NoBid | NoBid | No Bid No Bid
QTY 10,000

8.5X11 $ 1,730.00 | $ 1,950.00 | No Bid NoBid § $ 1,929.00 [ $ 2,049.00 | No Bid No Bid §$ 2,350.00 | $ 2,800.00 } No Bid NoBid | $ 1,937.50 [ $ 2,187.50 ] NoBid | No Bid § No Bid No Bid
8.5X14 $ 2,280.00 | $ 2,485.00 | No Bid NoBid § $ 2,219.00 [ $ 2,339.00 | No Bid No Bid §$ 2,800.00 | $ 3,370.00 } No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid | No Bid § No Bid No Bid
8.5X5.5 $ 1,220.00 | $ 1,350.00 | No Bid NoBid | $ 1,649.00 [ $ 1,659.00 | No Bid NoBid | $ 1,680.00 | $ 2,000.00 |} No Bid NoBid | $ 1,202.50 | $ 1,452.50 ] NoBid | NoBid | No Bid No Bid
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UNITED INDEPENDENT SCHOOL DISTRICT
PRINTING SERVICES
RFP 2010-061

ITEM #2
PRINTED ENVELOPES (STANDARD & WINDOW)
Regular #10
Thompson Print Weldon, William, &
VENDORS Adams Printing Brown Industries Kwik Kopy Litho Business Forms Mendes Printing Rabo Business Forms Rapid Print Solutions Lick
PRICE PER PRICE PRICE PRICE PER PRICE PER PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE
EST QTY UNIT TOTAL PERUNIT| TOTAL |PERUNIT| TOTAL UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL |PERUNIT| TOTAL |PERUNIT| TOTAL |PERUNIT| TOTAL |PERUNIT| TOTAL
1000 $49.00 $ 49.00 No Bid No Bid $65.00 $65.00 No Bid No Bid $55.000 $55.00 No Bid No Bid $48.45 $48.45 $63.23 $63.23 No Bid No Bid
5000 $40.00 $ 200.00 No Bid No Bid $50.00 $250.00 No Bid No Bid $30.000 $150.00 No Bid No Bid $42.85 $214.25 $35.94 $179.20 No Bid No Bid
10000 $30.00 $ 300.00 No Bid No Bid $43.00 $430.00 $41.750 $417.50 $27.000 $270.00 No Bid No Bid $42.80 $428.00 $30.35 $303.35 No Bid No Bid
20000 $29.00 $ 580.00 No Bid No Bid $33.65 $673.00 $38.340 $766.80 $25.000 $500.00 No Bid No Bid $35.48 $709.50 $30.35 $607.00 No Bid No Bid
50000 $29.00 $ 1,450.00 No Bid No Bid $30.40 $1,520.00 $31.730 | $1,586.50] $25.000 | $1,250.00] No Bid No Bid $34.16 $1,708.00 $26.41 $1,320.50 No Bid No Bid
50000+ $27.00 $ 1,350.00 No Bid No Bid $27.71 $2,078.25 No Bid No Bid $20.000 | $1,000.00] No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $22.85 $1,142.50 No Bid No Bid
WINDOW ENVELOPES
PRICE PER PRICE PRICE PRICE PER PRICE PER PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE
EST QTY UNIT TOTAL PER UNIT TOTAL PER UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL |PERUNIT| TOTAL |JPERUNIT| TOTAL PERUNIT| TOTAL |PERUNIT| TOTAL
1000 $50.00 $ 50.00 No Bid No Bid $72.00 $72.00 No Bid No Bid $55.000 $55.00 No Bid No Bid $49.25 $49.25 $68.56 $68.56 No Bid No Bid
5000 $49.00 $ 245.00 No Bid No Bid $55.00 $275.00 No Bid No Bid $34.000 $170.00 No Bid No Bid $43.65 $218.24 $40.40 $202.00 No Bid No Bid
10000 $39.00 $ 390.00 No Bid No Bid $47.00 $470.00 $45.920 $459.20 $32.000 $320.00 No Bid No Bid $43.60 $435.98 $33.71 $337.10 No Bid No Bid
20000 $38.00 $ 760.00 No Bid No Bid $38.50 $770.00 $42.210 $844.20 $30.000 $600.00 No Bid No Bid $36.27 $725.46 $33.71 $674.20 No Bid No Bid
50000 $37.00 $ 1,850.00 No Bid No Bid $33.79 $1,689.50 $35.210 | $1,760.50] $30.000 | $1,500.00] No Bid No Bid $34.96 $1,747.90 $30.54 $1,527.00 No Bid No Bid
50000+ $35.00 $ 1,750.00 No Bid No Bid $31.00 $2,325.00 No Bid No Bid $25.000 | $1,250.00] No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $28.06 $1,403.00 No Bid No Bid
CATALOG ENVELOPES
PRICE PER PRICE PRICE PRICE PER PRICE PER PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE
EST QTY UNIT TOTAL PER UNIT TOTAL PER UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL JPERUNIT| TOTAL |PERUNIT| TOTAL PERUNIT| TOTAL |PERUNIT| TOTAL
1000 NO BID NO BID No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 167.80 167.80 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
5000 $261.20 $ 1,306.00 No Bid No Bid 281.00 $ 1,405.00 350.000 1,750.00 No Bid No Bid 162.20 811.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
10000 $157.20 $ 1,572.00 No Bid No Bid 171.00 $ 1,710.00 225.000 2,250.00 No Bid No Bid $162.15 | $1,621.50 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
20000 $154.05 $ 3,081.00 No Bid No Bid 166.90 $ 3,338.00 170.000 3,400.00 No Bid No Bid $154.83 | $3,096.50 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
50000 NO BID NO BID No Bid No Bid 115.00 $ 5,750.00 140.000 7,000.00 No Bid No Bid $153.51 | $1,675.50 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
50000+ NO BID NO BID No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid Call for Quote 125.000 6,250.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
SPECIAL WINDOW ENVELOPES #10
PRICE PER PRICE PRICE PRICE PER PRICE PER PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE
EST QTY UNIT TOTAL PER UNIT TOTAL PER UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL JPERUNIT| TOTAL |PERUNIT| TOTAL |JPERUNIT| TOTAL |PERUNIT| TOTAL
1000 NO BID NO BID No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $101.35 $253.38 No Bid No Bid
5000 NO BID NO BID No Bid No Bid $102.00 | $ 510.00 No Bid No Bid $87.000 $435.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $58.85 $294.25 No Bid No Bid
10000 $95.30 $ 955.00 No Bid No Bid $63.50 $ 635.00 $51.720 $517.20 $68.000 $680.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $46.84 $468.40 No Bid No Bid
20000 $56.95 $ 1,139.00 No Bid No Bid $53.95 $ 1,079.00 | $47.231 $944.60 $60.000 | $1,200.00] No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $46.84 $936.80 No Bid No Bid
50000 $42.67 $ 2,133.50 No Bid No Bid $41.10 $ 2,055.00 $38.691 | $1,934.00] $50.000 | $2,500.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $30.26 $1,513.00 No Bid No Bid
50000+ NO BID NO BID No Bid No Bid $38.32 $ 2,874.00 No Bid No Bid $40.000 | $2,000.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $30.26 $1,513.00 No Bid No Bid
6X9 WINDOW ENVELOPES #10 BLACK INK ON WHITE 24# CENTER SEAMS
PRICE PER PRICE PRICE PRICE PER PRICE PER PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE
EST QTY UNIT TOTAL PER UNIT TOTAL PER UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL |PERUNIT| TOTAL |PERUNIT| TOTAL |PERUNIT| TOTAL [|PERUNIT| TOTAL
1000 NO BID NO BID No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $93.37 $93.37 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
5000 $136.00 $  680.00] NoBid No Bid $145.00 | $725.00 $140.00 | $700.00 | NoBid No Bid $87.77 | $438.85 | NoBid No Bid No Bid No Bid
10000 $80.50 $ 805.00 No Bid No Bid $86.60 $866.00 $125.00 | $1,250.00] No Bid No Bid $87.72 $877.20 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
20000 $79.40 $ 1,588.00 ] NoBid No Bid $85.25 | $1,715.00 $170.000 | $1,700.00] No Bid No Bid $80.40 | $1,607.90 | No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
50000+ $46.00 $ 2,300.00 No Bid No Bid $49.00 $2,450.00 Call for quote $375.000 | $3,750.00] No Bid No Bid $79.08 $3,954.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Regular #10, Window
Envelopes, and Special
Notes Window Envelopes are

priced with Hard box
packing.
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ITEM 3
PRINTED LETTERHEAD & FORMS

PRINTED LOGO LETTERHEADS WHITE 60# 1 COLOR FRONT PROCESS IN BLUE WITH DISTRICT LOGO

VENDOR Adams Printing Brown Industries | Kwik Kopy & Printing | Litho Business Forms Mendes Printing Rabo Business Forms Rapid Print Thompson Print Solutions |Weldon, Williams, & Lick, Inc.
PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE
PER PER PER PER PER PER PER PER PER
EST QTY | UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL | UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL
1000 $70.00 $350.00 NOBID | NOBID | $67.08 $67.08 No Bid No Bid $0.090 $90.00 No Bid No Bid $48.00 $48.00 | $139.00 $139.40 No Bid No Bid
5000 $45.00 $450.00 NOBID | NOBID | $37.01 $185.22 $44.530 $222.65 $0.060 $300.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $48.36 $241.80 No Bid No Bid
10000 $28.00 $700.00 NOBID | NOBID | $33.89 $338.90 $38.690 $386.90 $0.050 $500.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $46.23 $460.23 No Bid No Bid
25000 $22.00 $1,100.00 NOBID | NOBID | $31.00 $775.00 $35.730 $893.25 $0.040 $1,000.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $30.80 $770.00 No Bid No Bid
50000+ NO BID NO BID NOBID | NOBID | $27.50 $1,375.00 $33.500 $1,675.00 $0.030 $1,500.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $25.81 $1,290.50 No Bid No Bid
TAX STATEMENT 24# BOND BLACK, RED & BLUE INK,
PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE
PER PER PER PER PER PER PER PER PER
EST QTY UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL
1000 NO BID NO BID NOBID | NOBID | NoBid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid | $420.00 $420.12 No Bid No Bid
5000 NO BID NO BID NO BID | NOBID |$108.40 $542.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid | $100.90 $504.50 No Bid No Bid
10000 $75.00 $750.00 NOBID | NOBID | $68.50 $685.00 $76.88 $768.80 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $61.10 $611.00 No Bid No Bid
25000 $50.00 $1,250.00 NOBID | NOBID | $42.20 $1,055.00 $47.79 $1,194.75 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $38.13 $953.25 No Bid No Bid
50000+ $38.00 $1,900.00 NOBID | NOBID | $35.00 $1,750.00 $42.75 $2,137.50 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $32.34 $1,617.00 No Bid No Bid
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ITEM 4
CARBONLESS CONITNUOUS FORMS
PURCHASE ORDER 2 COLOR INK CONTINUOUS FEED

VENDORS

EST. QTY
PRICE PER PRICE PER PRICE PER PRICE PER PRICE PER PRICE PER PRICE PER PRICE PER PRICE
6 PART UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL UNIT ToTAL  |PER UNIT| TOTAL
5000 NO BID NO BID NOBID | NoBID] $251.00 [ $1,255.00 | s$216.49 | $1,082.45 No Bid No Bid $990.00 | $257.01 [ $1,285.06 | s$171.20 $856.45 | NoBid | NoBid
10000 NO BID NO BID NoBID | NoBID] s$211.00 | $2,11000 | $17655 | $1,765.50 No Bid No Bid $158.50 | $1,585.00 | $206.91 | $2,069.06 | $143.39 | $1,433.90 | NoBid | NoBid
15000 $156.67 $2,350.00 NOBID | NOBID] $199.53 [ $2,993.00 | $16556 | $2,483.40 No Bid No Bid $149.90 | $3,248.50 | $190.20 | $2,853.06 | $134.06 | $2,011.35 | NoBid | No Bid

VENDORS

RECIEPT BOOK 3 NCR COPIES WHITE, YELLOW, AND PINK 4 TO A PAGE 200 SHEETS PER BOOK

EST. QTY
3 PART

50 BOOKS $850.00 NO BID No Bid $750.50 $875.00 No Bid $762.50 $669.00 No Bid
75 BOOKS $1,200.00 NO BID No Bid $1,043.25 $1,200.00 No Bid $937.50 $907.20 No Bid
100 BOOKS $1,600.00 NO BID No Bid $1,200.00 $1,450.00 No Bid $1,187.50 $1,087.20 No Bid
100+BOOK S} $1,550.00 NO BID No Bid 11.68/book or less at $13 book No Bid $1,187.50 $1,869.20 for 200 books No Bid
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UNITED INDEPENDENT SCHOOL DISTRICT
PRINTING SERVICES
RFP 2010-061

ITEM #5
LASER CHECKS-SECURITY FEATURES
LASER CHECK 11" 24# MAROON

VENDORS
PRICE PER
EST QTY UNIT TOTAL |PERUNIT| TOTAL |PERUNIT| TOTAL |PERUNIT| TOTAL |JPERUNIT| TOTAL |PERUNIT| TOTAL |PERUNIT| TOTAL |PERUNIT| TOTAL |PERUNIT| TOTAL
25000 $48.00 $1,200.00 | NO BID NO BID $61.64 | $1,541.00 No Bid No Bid $29.95 $748.75 No Bid No Bid $47.05 | $1,411.50 No Bid No Bid
50000 $45.60 $2,280.00 | NOBID NO BID $48.98 | $2,449.00 No Bid No Bid $23.95 | $1,191.50 No Bid No Bid $36.61 | $2,196.50 No Bid No Bid
75000 $43.00 $3,225.00] NOBID NO BID $44.64 | $3,349.00 Call for Quote No Bid No Bid $21.95 | $1,646.25 No Bid No Bid $34.60 | $4,152.00 No Bid No Bid
ITEM#6

LASER CHECKS-NO SECURITY FEATURES/VOUCHER
LASER CHECK 11" 24# MAROON

VENDORS
PRICE PER PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE
EST QTY UNIT TOTAL |PERUNIT| TOTAL |PERUNIT| TOTAL |PERUNIT| TOTAL |JPERUNIT| TOTAL |PERUNIT| TOTAL |PERUNIT| TOTAL |PERUNIT| TOTAL |PERUNIT| TOTAL
25000 $48.00 $1,200.00 | NO BID NO BID $61.64 | $1,541.00 No Bid No Bid $29.95 $748.75 No Bid No Bid $47.05 | $1,411.50] No Bid No Bid
50000 $45.60 $2,280.00 | NOBID NO BID $48.98 | $2,449.00 No Bid No Bid $23.95 |$1,197.50] No Bid No Bid $36.61 | $2,196.50 | No Bid No Bid
75000 $43.00 $3,225.00 | NOBID NO BID $44.64 | $3,349.00 Call for Quote No Bid No Bid $21.95 | $1,646.25] No Bid No Bid $34.60 | $4,152.00] No Bid No Bid
ITEM #7
LASER FORM
LASER FORM 1099 24# PAPER
VENDOR
PRICE PER PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE
EST QTY UNIT TOTAL |PERUNIT| TOTAL JPERUNIT| TOTAL |PERUNIT| TOTAL JPERUNIT| TOTAL |PERUNIT| TOTAL |PERUNIT| TOTAL |PERUNIT| TOTAL |PERUNIT| TOTAL
100 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 4.57 4.57 No Bid No Bid
500 NO BID 75 NO BID NO BID No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $12.87 $12.87 No Bid No Bid
1000 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID No Bid No Bid $70.32 $70.32 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $25.73 $25.73 No Bid No Bid
5000 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID No Bid No Bid $46.88 $234.40 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $25.73 $128.65 No Bid No Bid
10000+ NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID No Bid No Bid $46.88 $468.80 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $25.73 $257.30 No Bid No Bid
LASER FORM W2 WAGE ON 24#
VENDOR
PRICE PER PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE
EST QTY UNIT TOTAL |PERUNIT| TOTAL |PERUNIT| TOTAL |PERUNIT| TOTAL PERUNIT| TOTAL JPERUNIT| TOTAL JPERUNIT| TOTAL |JPERUNIT| TOTAL JPERUNIT| TOTAL
6000 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID No Bid No Bid $46.88 $281.28 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $25.73 $154.38 No Bid No Bid
6500 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID No Bid No Bid $46.88 $304.72 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $25.73 $167.25 No Bid No Bid
7000 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID No Bid No Bid $46.88 $328.16 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $25.73 $180.11 No Bid No Bid
7500 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID No Bid No Bid $46.88 $351.60 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $25.73 $192.98 No Bid No Bid
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ITEM #8

UNITED INDEPENDENT SCHOOL DISTRICT
PRINTING SERVICES
RFP 2010-061

PROMOTIONAL DEPARTMENTAL 2 POCKET FOLDER W/DOUBLE SIDED LAYERED INSERTS

VENDORS
PRICE PRICE
PRICE PER PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PER PRICE PER PRICE
QTY PER UNIT| TOTAL UNIT TOTAL JPER UNIT| TOTAL JPERUNIT| TOTAL | PERUNIT| TOTAL [PERUNIT| TOTAL UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL PER UNIT| TOTAL
100 NO BID NO BID NO BID | NO BID No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
500 NO BID NO BID NOBID [ NOBID | No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $2,779.40 $2,779.40 No Bid No Bid
1000 NO BID NO BID NOBID [ NOBID | No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $3,122.60 $3,122.60 No Bid No Bid
ITEM #9
BROCHURES AND VOUCHERS
TRIFOLD BROCHURES 8.5 X 10 7/8" 60# GLOSS TEXT
VENDORS
PRICE PRICE
PRICE PER PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PER PRICE PER PRICE
QTY PER UNIT| TOTAL UNIT TOTAL |PER UNIT| TOTAL |PER UNIT| TOTAL | PERUNIT| TOTAL |PERUNIT| TOTAL UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL PER UNIT| TOTAL
500 NO BID NO BID NO BID | NO BID No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $1.00 $500.00 No Bid No Bid $1.35 $676.80 $358.49 $358.49 No Bid No Bid
1000 NO BID NO BID NO BID | NOBID | No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $0.70 $700.00 No Bid No Bid $0.76 $765.18 $458.49 $458.49 No Bid No Bid
5000 NO BID NO BID NOBID | NOBID | No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $0.35 $1,750.00] No Bid No Bid $0.30 $1,505.60 $132.23 $661.15 No Bid No Bid
TWO FOLD BROCHURES 8.5 X 10 7/8" 60# GLOSS TEXT
PRICE PRICE
PRICE PER PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PER PRICE PER PRICE
QTY PER UNIT| TOTAL UNIT TOTAL |PER UNIT| TOTAL |PERUNIT[ TOTAL | PERUNIT| TOTAL JPERUNIT| TOTAL UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL PER UNIT| TOTAL
500 NOBID | NoBID | NOoBID [ NOBID| NoBid | NoBid | NoBid | No Bid $0.90 $450.00 | No Bid No Bid $0.97 $486.06 $400.00 $400.00 No Bid | No Bid
1000 NO BID NO BID NO BID | NO BID No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $0.65 $650.00 No Bid No Bid $0.53 $532.26 $448.49 $448.49 No Bid No Bid
5000 NO BID NO BID NO BID | NO BID No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $0.30 $1,500.00] No Bid No Bid $0.20 $971.52 $107.10 $537.10 No Bid No Bid
VOUCHERS 8.5 X 11 24# WATERMARK STOCK WITH CONTROL NUMBER
PRICE PRICE
PRICE PER PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PER PRICE PER PRICE
QTY PER UNIT| TOTAL UNIT TOTAL |PER UNIT| TOTAL |PER UNIT| TOTAL | PERUNIT| TOTAL |PERUNIT| TOTAL UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL PER UNIT| TOTAL
5000 | $106.82 | $534.00 | NoBID [ NOBID| NoBid | NoBid | NoBid | NoBid | $0.04 | $200.00 | $79.98 | $399.40 | $197.29 | $986.45 $79.62 $398.10 NoBid | NoBid
10000 $82.96 $830.00 | NOBID | NOBID | No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $0.035 $350.00 $69.98 $699.80 | $154.96 | $1,549.60 $67.68 $676.80 No Bid No Bid
15000 $74.61 | $1,120.00] NOBID | NOBID | No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $0.030 $450.00 $59.98 $899.70 | $125.60 | $1,884.00 $44.47 $742.05 No Bid No Bid
ITEM #10 GRADUATION TICKETS AND BROCHURES
GRADUATION TICKETS FOR AHS, UHS, USHS, LBJ (8 COLOR TICKETS)
VENDOR
PRICE PRICE
PRICE PER PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PER PRICE PER PRICE
EST QYT |[PER UNIT[ TOTAL UNIT TOTAL JPER UNIT| TOTAL JPERUNIT| TOTAL | PERUNIT| TOTAL [PERUNIT| TOTAL UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL PER UNIT| TOTAL
8000 NO BID NO BID NO BID | NOBID | No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $0.0375 | $300.00 No Bid No Bid $0.0625 | 500/campus No Bid No Bid
GRADUATION PROGRAMS FOR AHS, UHS, USHS, LBJHS 24# COLOR PROGRAMS
PRICE PRICE
PRICE PER PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PER PRICE PER PRICE
EST QYT |[PER UNIT[ TOTAL UNIT TOTAL [PERUNIT| TOTAL |PERUNIT[ TOTAL | PERUNIT| TOTAL JPERUNIT| TOTAL UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL PER UNIT| TOTAL
2000 NO BID NO BID NO BID | NOBID | No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
4000 NO BID NO BID NO BID | NO BID No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
1.95-3.10 Price varies
$2.48 w/school
each quantity of #
average | of pages per
6000 NO BID NO BID NOBID | NOBID | No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid cost book No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
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ITEM #11

PUBLIC RELATIONS - UISD CALENDAR

UNITED INDEPENDENT SCHOOL DISTRICT
PRINTING SERVICES
RFP 2010-061

VENDORS
PRICE PRICE PRICE
PRICE PER PER PRICE PRICE PER PRICE PER PER PRICE PRICE PER
QTY PER UNIT | TOTAL UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL |PERUNIT| TOTAL UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL JPERUNIT| TOTAL UNIT TOTAL
250 NO BID NOBID | NOBID | NOBID | No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $8.00 $2,000.00 No Bid No Bid $11.44 2859.2 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
500 $4.80 $2,400.00f NO BID | NO BID | No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $7.00 $3,500.00 No Bid No Bid $6.35 3176.38 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
ITEM #12
PUBLIC RELATIONS -PUBLICATION
VENDORS
PRICE PRICE PRICE
PRICE PER PER PRICE PRICE PER PRICE PER PER PRICE PRICE PER
QTY PERUNIT | TOTAL UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL |PERUNIT| TOTAL UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL | PERUNIT| TOTAL UNIT TOTAL
100 NO BID NOBID | NOBID | NOBID ] No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $5.00 $500.00 No Bid No Bid $14.36 | 1436.52 | $865.69 865.69 No Bid No Bid
500 $2.90 $1,450.00] NO BID | NOBID ] No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $3.00 $1,500.00 No Bid No Bid $3.39 1695.16 | $968.56 968.56 No Bid No Bid
1000 $1.75 $1,750.00] NO BID | NOBID | No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $2.50 No Bid No Bid $2.06 2063.66 | $1,097.18 1097.1 No Bid No Bid
ITEM #13
ATHLETICS - ROLL OF TICKETS FOR STUDENT AND ADULTS
VENDORS
PRICE
PRICE PER PER PRICE PRICE PER PRICE PER PER PRICE PRICE PER
QTY PER UNIT | TOTAL UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL |PERUNIT| TOTAL UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL | PERUNIT| TOTAL UNIT TOTAL
1 ROLL NO BID NOBID | NOBID | NOBID | No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $218.66 218.66
10 ROLLS $110.00 | $1,100.00] NOBID [ NOBID | No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $32.14 $321.40
20 ROLLS $70.00 | $1,400.00] NOBID | NOBID ] No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $21.78 $435.60
50 ROLLS $40.50 | $2,025.00] NO BID | NOBID | No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $15.56 $778.00
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ITEM #14
PUBLIC RELATIONS - HELPING HANDS PIN

Thompson Print & Weldon, Williams, &
VENDORS Adams Printing Brown Industries | Kwik Kopy Printing JLitho Business Forms Mendes Printing Rabo Business Forms Rapid Print Mailing Solutions Lick, Inc.
PRICE PRICE PRICE
PRICE PER PER PRICE PRICE PER PRICE PER PER PRICE PRICE PER

QTY PERUNIT| TOTAL | uNniT [ TOTAL| UNIT | TOTAL |PERUNIT| TOTAL UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL UNIT | TOTAL |PERUNIT| TOTAL UNIT TOTAL
25 NOBID | NOBID | SEECATALOG; | NoBid | NoBid | NoBid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid NoBid | NoBid | NoBid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
50 NOBID | NoBID |PISCOUNTBASEDI™ \oRig | NoBid | NoBid | NoBid No Bid No Bid No Bid NoBid | NoBid | NoBid | NoBid No Bid No Bid No Bid
75 $9.10 $682.50 IDE?\#I(C?ZZ I?EMS NoBid | NoBid | NoBid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid NoBid | NoBid | NoBid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
100 $9.10 $910.00 | pLus sHipping | NoBid | NoBid | No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid NoBid | NoBid | NoBid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
150 $9.00 | $1,485.00] COSTLISTEDIN | NoBid | NoBid | NoBid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid NoBid | NoBid | NoBid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
200 $8.70 | $1,740.00 CATALOG. No Bid | No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid | No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
250 $8.50 | $2,125.00 SHITIF:IE;?\ISGE §|4E/5RT NoBid | NoBid | NoBid | NoBid | NoBid No Bid No Bid NoBid | NoBid | NoBd | NoBid | NoBid NoBid | NoBid
300 $8.25 | $2475.00) ~ Al S0 ON THE NoBid | NoBid | NoBid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid NoBid | NoBid | NoBid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
350 $8.00 | $2,800.00| sgounD IN ORDER| NoBid | NoBid | NoBid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid NoBid | NoBid | NoBid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
400 $7.85 | $3,140.00 FORM OF NoBid | NoBid | NoBid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid NoBid | NoBid | NoBid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
450 $7.65 | $3,442.50 |CATALOG, BESIDE| NoBid | NoBid | NoBid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid NoBid | NoBid | NoBid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
500 $7.45 | 372500 THE QUANTITY 17\55ig | NoBid | NoBid | NoBid | NoBid | NoBid | NoBid | NoBid | NoBid | NoBid | NoBid | NoBid | NoBid | NoBid
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UNITED INDEPENDENT SCHOOL DISTRICT
PRINTING SERVICES
RFP 2010-061

ITEM #15
PURCHASING-SMALL PURCHASE ORDER

VENDORS
PRICE PRICE PRICE PER PRICE PRICE PER PRICE PER PRICE PER PRICE PRICE
QTY PERUNIT| TOTAL JPERUNIT| TOTAL UNIT TOTAL |PERUNIT| TOTAL UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL JPERUNIT| TOTAL JPERUNIT| TOTAL
1000 NO BID NO BID NO BID | NOBID] $169.00 $169.00 No Bid No Bid $130.00 $130.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
2500 NO BID NO BID NO BID | NOBID] $150.00 $375.00 No Bid No Bid $120.00 $300.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
5000 $110.00 $550.00 NOBID | NOBID] $139.00 $695.00 No Bid No Bid $100.00 $500.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
ITEM #16

TAX OFFICE - LASER CHECK - REFUND CHECK

VENDORS
PRICE PRICE PRICE PER PRICE PRICE PER PRICE PER PRICE PER PRICE PRICE
QTY PERUNIT | TOTAL |PERUNIT| TOTAL UNIT TOTAL |PERUNIT| TOTAL UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL |PERUNIT| TOTAL |JPERUNIT| TOTAL
500 $0.5900 $295.00 NOBID | NOBID| $142.52 $142.53 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $178.50 No Bid No Bid $184.95 $184.95 No Bid No Bid
1000 $0.3310 $331.00 NOBID | NOBID|] $172.53 $172.53 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $190.00 No Bid No Bid $214.53 $214.53 No Bid No Bid
1500 $0.2467 $370.00 NOBID | NOBID| $172.53 $258.79 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $220.00 No Bid No Bid $214.53 $321.80 No Bid No Bid
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