

UNITED INDEPENDENT SCHOOL DISTRICT
ATHLETIC TURF CARE MAINTENANCE
RFP 2010-057

VENDORS	TEXAS MULTI-CHEM			
COST OF SERVICE PER SQUARE FT	0-20,000ft	20,001ft -86,000ft	86,000ft and up	
AERA-VATION:	\$500 min.	\$0.005	\$0.005	
DEEP TINE AERIFICATION	\$750 min	\$0.020	\$0.017	
LAZER GRADING	\$0.16	\$0.12	\$0.11	
TILLING W/BLECAVATOR	\$350 min	\$0.06	\$0.05	
SOD REMOVAL	\$0.18	\$0.12	\$0.10	
SOD INSTALLATION	\$0.18	\$0.15	\$0.13	
MANICURE INFIELD	BASEBALL \$650.00		SOFTBALL \$300.00	
COST OF SERVICE PER ACRE:	1/2-1 ACRES	1-2 ACRES	2-UP ACRES	
FIELD LEVELING	\$0.06	\$0.05	\$0.05	
	\$400.00	\$350.00	\$325.00	
OVERSEEDING W/BERMUDA	price is per arce and for labor only			
	\$400.00	\$350.00	\$325.00	
OVERSEEDING W/PERENNIAL RYE SEED	price is per arce and for labor only			
PEST CONTROL APPLICATION	CHEMICAL COST PER ACRE		LABOR COST PER TRIP	
BANVEL	\$38.00		FIRST ACRE	\$140.00
BARRICADE (21OZ PER ACRE)	\$50.00		1 1/2 ACRES	\$165.00
CELSIUS - LOW RATE (2.5OZ PER ACRE)	\$27.00			
CELSIUS - MED RATE (3.7OZ PER ACRE)	\$39.00		2 ACRES	\$190.00
CELSIUS - HIGH RATE (4.9OZ PER ACRE)	\$52.00		2 1/2 ACRES	\$215.00
CERTAINTY	\$132.00			
CONFRONT	\$49.00		3 ACRES	\$240.00
DRIVE 1/2 GAL PER ACRE	\$136.00		3 1/2 ACRES	\$265.00
DYLOX WETTABLE POWDER	\$193.00			
MANOR	\$90.00		4 ACRES	\$290.00
MSMA	\$17.00		4 1/2 ACRES	\$315.00
MSMS/SENCOR 75	\$38.00			
MSMA/SENCOR 75/TRIMEC	\$63.00		5 ACRES	\$340.00
MSMA/SENCOR 75/TRIMEC/CERTAINTY	\$195.00		5 1/2 ACRES	\$365.00
PENDULUM	\$35.00			
PRINCEP	\$27.00		6 ACRES	\$390.00
PRINCEP/TRIMEC	\$52.00		6 1/2 ACRES	\$415.00
REVOLVER	\$132.00			
ROUND UP 1%	\$42.00		7 ACRES	\$440.00
ROUND UP 2%	\$84.00		7 1/2 ACRES	\$465.00
ROUND UP 3%	\$138.00			
ROUND UP/SAHARA (1QT-4LB/55 GAL)	\$470.00		8 ACRES	\$490.00
SPEEDZONE (3 PINTS PER ARCE)	\$35.00		8 1/2 ACRES	\$515.00
SUFLAN	\$65.00			
TALSTAR 1/2 OZ/1000 SQ FT	\$34.00		9 ACRES	\$540.00
TALSTAR 1OZ/1000 SQ FT	\$45.00		9 1/2 ACRES	\$565.00
TRIMEC SOUTHERN (1QT/ACRE)	\$28.00		10 ACRES	\$590.00
		ZONE 1	\$75.00	
		ZONE 2	\$100.00	
		ZONE 3	\$130.00	
		ZONE 4	\$170.00	
		ZONE 5	\$220.00	
COST OF SERVICE PER YARD	0-20yd	21yd -60yd	60yd - 79yd	80yd +
TOP DRESSING	\$500.00 MIN	\$12.00	\$12.00	\$11.00
COST OF SERVICE PER SIZE LOAD	10 ton	15 ton	24 ton	
INSTALL INFIELD CONDITIONER	\$845.00	\$920.00	\$995.00	
	MATERIAL COST PER WT.			
DIAMOND PRO INFIELD CONDITIONER				
50 lb bag	\$10.00			
10 ton	-			
15 ton	-			
25 ton	-			
DIAMOND PRO MOUND CLAY				
50 lb bag	\$12.00			
10 ton	-			
15 ton	N/A			
25 ton	-			
SANDY LOAM PIT SAND				
50 lb bag	-			
10 ton	N/A			
15 ton	-			
25 ton	\$40.00 A TON			

UNITED INDEPENDENT SCHOOL DISTRICT
ATHLETIC TURF CARE MAINTENANCE
RFP 2010-057

VENDORS	TEXAS MULTI-CHEM		
RED INFIELD SAND CLAY MIX			
50 lb bag	N/A		
10 ton			
15 ton			
25 ton			
	\$58.00 A TON		
COST PER SQ FT.	0-20,000ft	20,0001ft - 86,000ft	86,0001ft and up
SOD HYDRID BERMUDA/TIFWAY SPORT	\$0.42	\$0.39	\$0.36
SOD HYDRID BERMUDA/TIFWAY SPORT 419	\$0.41	\$0.38	\$0.35
SOD/SEALSLES PASPALUM	NOT AVAILABLE IN TEXAS AS OF 01/01/09		
TEX-TURF 10 HYBRID BERMUDA	\$0.41	\$0.38	\$0.35
COST PER SQ FT.	1/2 ac.-1ac	1 ac.-2 ac	2 ac. And up
SPRIG/TIFWAY 419	\$0.18	\$0.12	\$0.12
SPRIG/TIF-SPORT	\$0.19	\$0.13	\$0.13
COMMON BERMUDA SEED	MATERIAL COST PER WT.		
25 lb bag	N/A		
50 lb bag	\$237.50		
JACKPOT TRIANGLE BERMUDA SEED			
25 lb bag	\$190.00		
50 lb bag	N/A		
20-0-10 SLOW RELEASE FERTILIZER (GREENKEEPER)			
25 lb bag	N/A		
50 lb bag	\$27.90		
20-0-8 SLOW RELEASE FERTILIZER (GRAND STAND)			
25 lb bag	N/A		
50 lb bag	\$24.85		
21-0-10 SLOW RELEASE FERTILIZER (TOUGH TURF)			
25 lb bag	N/A		
50 lb bag	\$28.15		
14-6-8 FERTILIZER (FAST START)			
25 lb bag	N/A		
50 lb bag	\$25.15		
10-12-8 STARTER FERTILIZER (SPROUT)			
25 lb bag	N/A		
50 lb bag	\$24.65		
18-1-0 FERTILIZER (N & IRON)			
25 lb bag	N/A		
50 lb bag	\$24.85		
22-0-6 W/PENDAMETHLIN PRE-EMERGENT			
25 lb bag	N/A		
50 lb bag	\$40.50		
8-2-34 W/RONSTAR G & BARRICADE (REGAL STAR)			
25 lb bag	N/A		
50 lb bag	\$95.50		
15-5-10 W.SURFAN:			
25 lb bag	NO BID		
50 lb bag			
PELLETIZED GYPSUM PELLETS (NOT POWDER)			
25 lb bag	N/A		
50 lb bag	\$16.00		
SUPER SPORT PERENNIAL RYE			
25 lb bag	N/A		
50 lb bag	\$62.50		
FUTURA 2000 PERENNIAL RYE			
25 lb bag	NO BID		
50 lb bag			
FUTURA TEE & FAIRWAY PERENNIAL RYE:			
25 lb bag	NO BID		
50 lb bag			
INSTALLATION OR OTHER GROUND WORK	\$60.00 - \$100.00 PER HOUR DEPENDING ON THE EQUIPMENT		
	COST PER ITEM	MODEL # AND BRAND PROPOSED	
BASES	\$175.00	MAC GREGGOR	
PITCHER RUBBER	\$75.00	MAC GREGGOR	
HOME PLATES	\$100.00	MAC GREGGOR	
ANCHORS	\$25.00	MAC GREGGOR	
HOSES	\$200.00	100 FT X 1" WHITE LINE	
MARKING EQUIPMENT	NO BID		
PERCENTAGE DISCOUNT OFF LIST PRICE	0%		