UNITED INDEPENDENT SCHOOL DISTRICT
LANDSCAPING MATERIALS
RFP 2010-055

VENDORS HILLSIDE NURSERY JOHN DEERE LANDSCAPES| JUSTIN SEED COMPANY | OLYMPIA LANDSCAPING
EST QTY DESCRIPTION UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE
SECTION | ANNUAL LANDSCAPING MATERIALS
A 3" MINIMUM CALIPER MEASURED ONE FOOT ABOVE THE BEGINNING OF THE ROOT SYSTEM IS REQUIRED FOR THIS ITEM
1-119 LIVE OAKS (QUERCUS VIRGINANA) $310.00 $300.00
120-200 LIVE OAKS (QUERCUS VIRGINANA) $310.00 $300.00
201-300 LIVE OAKS (QUERCUS VIRGINANA) $310.00 no bid no bid $300.00
301-400 LIVE OAKS (QUERCUS VIRGINANA) $310.00 $300.00
401-500 LIVE OAKS (QUERCUS VIRGINANA) $310.00 $300.00
A 4" MINIMUM CALIPER MEASURED ONE FOOT ABOVE THE BEGINNING OF THE ROOT SYSTEM IS REQUIRED FOR THIS ITEM
1-119 LIVE OAKS (QUERCUS VIRGINANA) $540.00 $550.00
120-200 LIVE OAKS (QUERCUS VIRGINANA) $540.00 $550.00
201-300 LIVE OAKS (QUERCUS VIRGINANA) $540.00 no bid no bid $550.00
301-400 LIVE OAKS (QUERCUS VIRGINANA) $540.00 $550.00
401-500 LIVE OAKS (QUERCUS VIRGINANA) $540.00 $550.00
1000-2000 PLANTING PELLETS $60.00 $0.25
2001-3000 PLANTING PELLETS $60.00 . . $0.25
no bid no bid
3001-4000 PLANTING PELLETS $60.00 $0.25
4001-5000 PLANTING PELLETS $60.00 $0.25
1-399 #419 COMMON BERMUDA GRASS (PALLETS) $109.00 $110.00
400-600 #419 COMMON BERMUDA GRASS (PALLETS) $109.00 $110.00
601-1000 #419 COMMON BERMUDA GRASS (PALLETS) $109.00 no bid no bid $110.00
1001-2000 #419 COMMON BERMUDA GRASS (PALLETS) $109.00 $110.00
2001-3000 #419 COMMON BERMUDA GRASS (PALLETS) $109.00 $110.00
1-149 CELLULOSE FIBER MULCH (50 LB BAG) $17.99 $10.85 $13.48 $16.00
150-250 CELLULOSE FIBER MULCH (50 LB BAG) $17.99 $10.85 $12.24 $16.00
251-400 CELLULOSE FIBER MULCH (50 LB BAG) $17.99 $10.85 $11.50 $16.00
401-550 CELLULOSE FIBER MULCH (50 LB BAG) $17.99 $10.85 $10.90 $16.00
551-700 CELLULOSE FIBER MULCH (50 LB BAG) $17.99 $10.85 $10.30 $16.00
1-24 NUMEX SAHARA BERMUDA SEED (25 LB BUCKET) $99.00 $71.25 $71.00 $120.00
25-49 NUMEX SAHARA BERMUDA SEED (25 LB BUCKET) $99.00 $71.25 $53.42 $120.00
50-100 NUMEX SAHARA BERMUDA SEED (25 LB BUCKET) $99.00 $71.25 $52.60 $120.00
101-200 NUMEX SAHARA BERMUDA SEED (25 LB BUCKET) $99.00 $71.25 $51.13 $120.00
201-300 NUMEX SAHARA BERMUDA SEED (25 LB BUCKET) $99.00 $71.25 $49.63 $120.00
150-250 PINE BARK IN 3 CUBIC FT BAGS $5.75 $5.25
251-400 PINE BARK IN 3 CUBIC FT BAGS $5.75 . . $5.25
no bid no bid
401-550 PINE BARK IN 3 CUBIC FT BAGS $5.75 $5.25
551-700 PINE BARK IN 3 CUBIC FT BAGS $5.75 $5.25
1-40 MAJESTIC BEAUTY INDIAN HAWTHORN (3 GAL. CONT) $8.95 $20.00
41-100 MAJESTIC BEAUTY INDIAN HAWTHORN (3 GAL. CONT) $8.95 $20.00
101-200 MAJESTIC BEAUTY INDIAN HAWTHORN (3 GAL. CONT) $8.95 no bid no bid $20.00
201-300 MAJESTIC BEAUTY INDIAN HAWTHORN (3 GAL. CONT) $8.95 $20.00
301-400 MAJESTIC BEAUTY INDIAN HAWTHORN (3 GAL. CONT) $8.95 $20.00
1-40 GREEN PITTOSPORUM (5 GAL. CONTAINER) $10.00 $16.00
41-100 GREEN PITTOSPORUM (5 GAL. CONTAINER) $10.00 $16.00
101-200 GREEN PITTOSPORUM (5 GAL. CONTAINER) $10.00 no bid no bid $16.00
201-300 GREEN PITTOSPORUM (5 GAL. CONTAINER) $10.00 $16.00
301-400 GREEN PITTOSPORUM (5 GAL. CONTAINER) $10.00 $16.00
1-24 WATER SOLUBLE FERTILIZER (25 LB. BAG) $37.00 $34.30 $39.00
25-50 WATER SOLUBLE FERTILIZER (25 LB. BAG) $37.00 $34.30 $35.00
51-100 WATER SOLUBLE FERTILIZER (25 LB. BAG) $36.00 $34.30 no bid $35.00
101-200 WATER SOLUBLE FERTILIZER (25 LB. BAG) $36.00 $34.30 $35.00
201-300 WATER SOLUBLE FERTILIZER (25 LB. BAG) $36.00 $34.30 $35.00
PERCENTAGE DISCOUNT OFF LIST PRICE FOR OTHER ITEMS 0% I 0% 2% 5%
provided a product guide
NOTES none none & price sheet for spring none
2010




