
SEC. I: WINDSHIELD REPAIR AND INSTALLATION UNIT COST INSTALLATION 
COST WARRANTY UNIT COST INSTALLATION 

COST WARRANTY UNIT COST INSTALLATION 
COST WARRANTY

1 WINDSHIELD FULL SIZE P/U TRUCK & CARGO VAN $100.00 $40.00 90 Days $85.00 $40.00 Lifetime

2 WINDSHIELD MINI PICK UP $80.00 $40.00 90 Days $75.00 $40.00 Lifetime

3 WINDSHIELD FULL SIZE CAR $95.00 $40.00 90 Days $85.00 $40.00 Lifetime

4 WINDSHIELD MID SIZE CAR $90.00 $40.00 90 Days $85.00 $40.00 Lifetime

5 WINDSHIELD THOMAS BUS (TBB705371) $560.00 $65.00 90 Days $390.00 $60.00 Lifetime $1,250.00 $350.00 12 Months

Full $300.00 $75.00 90 Days Full $200.00 $55.00 Lifetime

Half $115.00 $45.00 90 Days Half $100.00 $40.00 Lifetime

WINDSHIELD & WINDOWS FOR SCHOOL 
BUSES AND OTHER HEAVY DUTY VEHICLES:

10"X24" $35.00 $25.00 90 Days $30.00 $25.00 Lifetime

10"X36" $50.00 $25.00 90 Days $40.00 $25.00 Lifetime

12"X24" $40.00 $25.00 90 Days $35.00 $25.00 Lifetime

13"X24" $40.00 $25.00 90 Days $35.00 $25.00 Lifetime

26"X48" $120.00 $25.00 90 Days $90.00 $25.00 Lifetime

12"X40" $70.00 $25.00 90 Days $60.00 $25.00 Lifetime

14"X24" $50.00 $25.00 90 Days $40.00 $25.00 Lifetime

20"X31" $90.00 $25.00 90 Days $75.00 $25.00 Lifetime

13"X32" $60.00 $25.00 90 Days $50.00 $25.00 Lifetime

21"X31" $90.00 $25.00 90 Days $75.00 $25.00 Lifetime

16"X30" $70.00 $25.00 90 Days $60.00 $25.00 Lifetime

24"X 12" $40.00 $25.00 90 Days $35.00 $25.00 Lifetime

25"X10" $35.00 $25.00 90 Days $30.00 $25.00 Lifetime

MIRRORS FOR THE FOLLOWING SIZES:

10" X 24" 1/8" CLEAR TEMP $20.00 $20.00 Lifetime

8 1/2" X 23 1/8" CLEAR TEMP $20.00 $20.00 Lifetime

6" X 8 X 3/4" CLEAR TEMP. $15.00 $10.00 Lifetime

28 1/4" X 21 1/4" INSULATED $20.00 $20.00 Lifetime

SEC. II: PERCENTAGE DISCOUNT ON LABOR & PARTS

1 DISCOUNT FROM LIST PRICE ON REPLACEMENT 
PARTS 

2 LABOR RATE PER HOUR

SEC. III: QUESTIONS & STATEMENTS

2A SERVICE VEHICLES OUTSIDE NORMAL HOURS 

2B SERVICE VEHICLES AT ANY UISD PROPERTY

3 VENDOR AGREES TO KEEP ALL PARTS IN STOCK

Yes

Yes

Yes

Yes

No Bid

$270.24 $250.00 12 Months

No Bid 

No Bid 

Rotex Truck Center, Inc

20%

$70.00 Per/ Hour

Mon - Fri (7:00 am - 6:00 pm)  Sat (8:00 am - 2:00 pm)

No Bid 

$45 Per/Hour

Mon - Fri (8:00 am - 6:00 pm)  Sat (8:00 am - 1:00 pm)

Yes

Yes

Yes

Yes

7

Cruz Auto Glass Center

20%

Yes

Yes

WINDSHIELD INTL. BUS (2202541C3)6

65%

Yes

1 REGULAR WORKING HOURS Mon - Fri (9:00 am - 7:00 pm)  Sat (9:00 am - 3:00 pm)

UNITED INDEPENDENT SCHOOL DISTRICT
AUTOMOTIVE & BUS WINDSHIELD REPLACEMENT

RFP 2010‐053

VENDORS Beto's Windshield Mobile Service

4 VENDOR AGREES TO ADDRESS WARRENTY WORK 
W/IN 48 HRS FROM TIME OF WORK Yes

8


