
VENDOR

ITEM

ESTIMATED 
ANNUAL 

QUANTITY
UNIT 

PRICE EXTENSION UNIT PRICE EXTENSION
UNIT 

PRICE EXTENSION
UNIT 

PRICE EXTENSION
24 oz. 

Medium 
Microfiber 
Wet Mop 25376 NO BID NO BID $0.39 $9,896.64 $0.97 $24,614.72 $0.39 $9,896.64

24"x5" 
Microfiber 
Dust Mop 53,040 NO BID NO BID $0.21 $11,138.40 $0.78 $41,371.20 $0.18 $9,547.20

60"x5" 
Microfiber 
Dust Mop 15,964 NO BID NO BID $0.64 $10,216.96 $1.52 $24,265.28 $0.59 $9,418.76

EST. ANNUAL TOTAL NO BID $31,252.00 $90,251.20 $28,862.60

ORIGINAL REQUEST - 
MICROFIBER

UNITED INDEPENDENT SCHOOL DISTRICT
DUST MOP SERVICE

RFP 2010-043

CINTAS CORPORATION G&K SERVICES PATRIA UNIFIRST HOLDINGS


