UNITED INDEPENDENT SCHOOL DISTRICT

MARIACHI UNIFORMS, EQUIPMENT, SHEET MUSIC & SUPPLIES

RFP 2010-029

The Mariachi |[Melharts Music PERIPOLE San Marcos Mariachi | TEXAS BAND & | Washington
VENDOR The Band Shop | Hillje Music | JW Pepper | Connection Center NEMC BERGERAULT RBC SAM ASH Academy ORCHESTRA Music
DESCRIPTION
JACKET, VEST, SKIRT
% off catalog price NO BID NO BID NO BID 15% NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 5% NO BID NO BID
% off list price NO BID NO BID NO BID 15% 0-20% NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
% off shelf price NO BID NO BID NO BID 15% NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
HAT, BELTS, SHOES, TIES, & OTHER ATTACH.
% off catalog price NO BID NO BID NO BID 15% NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 5% NO BID NO BID
% off list price NO BID NO BID NO BID 15% 0-20% NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
% off shelf price NO BID NO BID NO BID 15% NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
COMPLETE 3 PIECE SUIT
WITH GALA, BELT, TIE & SHOES NO BID NO BID NO BID $405.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $403.00 NO BID NO BID
WITH GRECA, GALA, IMITATION PITA
OR EMBROIDERED BELT, SHOES & TIE NO BID NO BID NO BID $630.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $628.00 NO BID NO BID
WITH GRECA OR EMBROIDERY, HAT, IMITATION
PITA OR EMBROIDERED BELT OR EMBROIDERED
SHOES AND TIE NO BID NO BID NO BID $765.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $748.00 NO BID NO BID
WITH GALA, GRECA OR EMBROIDERY, HAT, IMITATION
PITA OR EMBROIDERED BELT OR EMBROIDERED
SHOES AND TIE NO BID NO BID NO BID $830.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $828.00 NO BID NO BID
SHEET MUSIC
SHEET MUSIC FOR MARIACHI
% off catalog price 25% 10% 0% 15% 0-10% NO BID NO BID 10% 10-30% 5% NO BID 25%
% off list price 25% 10% 0% 15% NO BID NO BID NO BID 10% 10-30% NO BID 0-20% 25%
% off shelf price 25% 10% 0% 15% NO BID NO BID NO BID 10% 10-30% NO BID NO BID NO BID
INSTRUMENTAL & VOCAL METHOD ALL LEVELS
% off catalog price 25% 10% 0% 15% 0-10% NO BID NO BID 10% 10-30% NO BID NO BID NO BID
% off list price 25% 10% 0% 15% NO BID NO BID NO BID 10% 10-30% NO BID 0-20% 25%
% off shelf price 25% 10% 0% 15% NO BID NO BID NO BID 10% 10-30% NO BID NO BID NO BID
INSTRUMENTAL/VOCAL EDU. VIDEOS & AUDIO RECORDINGS
% off catalog price 25% 10% 0% 15% 0-20% NO BID NO BID 10% 10-30% NO BID NO BID NO BID
% off list price 25% 10% 0% 15% NO BID NO BID NO BID 10% 10-30% NO BID 0-20% NO BID
% off shelf price 25% 10% 0% 15% NO BID NO BID NO BID 10% 10-30% NO BID NO BID NO BID
ANY OTHER RESOURSE MATERIALS & BOOKS
% off catalog price 25% 10% 0% 15% 0-20% NO BID NO BID 10% 10-30% 5% NO BID NO BID
% off list price 25% 10% 0% 15% NO BID NO BID NO BID 10% 10-30% NO BID 0-20% NO BID
% off shelf price 25% 10% 0% 15% NO BID NO BID NO BID 10% 10-30% NO BID NO BID NO BID
SUPPLIES
GUITAR STRINGS ( CLASSICAL) set of 6, normal tension
clear nylon, REF D'Addarrio Pro Arte or Equal $7.25 $9.50 NO BID $6.00 $7.49 NO BID $11.95 NO BID $5.29 $6.99 $11.19 $6.50
GUITARRON STRINGS Complete set of 6 strings
REF Standard set $24.99 $31.95 NO BID $25.00 $31.95 NO BID NO BID NO BID $11.95 $12.99 $29.00 $29.00
VIHUELA STRINGS REF Standard set $6.00 $7.95 NO BID $5.00 $3.95 NO BID NO BID NO BID $3.89 $5.99 $10.00 $7.95
VIHUELA CASE REF standard vihuela hard shell case $85.00 NO BID NO BID $89.95 $88.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $64.99 NO BID NO BID
GUITARRON CASE REF standard guitarron hard shell case $149.00 NO BID NO BID $150.00 $149.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $119.99 NO BID NO BID
INSTRUMENTS
CLASSICAL GUITAR
Full size guitar, w/nylon strings. Solid top, w/ case
REF YamahaCG101 or Equal $189.00 $175.00 NO BID $199.00 $243.99 $155.00 $175.95 NO BID $152.00 $150.00 $229.00 $197.00
VIHUELA
Standard Vihuela with case REF: Standard or Equal $219.00 NO BID NO BID $395.00 $482.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID $179.00 $425.00 NO BID $239.00
GUITARRA DE GOLPE
Standard Guitarra de golpe w/ case REF: standard or equal NO BID NO BID NO BID $425.00 $424.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $475.00 NO BID $939.00
GUITARRON
Standard Guitarron REF Standard Guitarron w/ case $350.00 NO BID NO BID $595.00 $743.00 $699.30 NO BID NO BID $519.00 $575.00 NO BID $829.00
GUITARRON
Deluxe Guitarron REF: Deluxe Guitarron w/ case or equal NO BID NO BID NO BID $954.00 $784.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
ARPA (HARP) JALISCIENSE
32 string arpa w/ gig bag case REF: stardard arpa w/ case NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $3,399.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $1,500.00 NO BID NO BID




