United Independent School District

RFP 2010-024

Incentives
VENDORS AE OFFICE CASA GUERO GOLD METAL JERRY'S SPORT IMPRINT POSITIVE REALLY GOOD SMART
DISCOUNTS 4IMPRINT | ADAMS PRINTING pRODUCTS | PG BOBS TROPHIES| BLUE MOOSETEES [~ " =0 | CLASS UNIFORMS SPORS UNIFORMs | MAGESTUFE.COM| e oo [NEFFmomvaTIon| o o oNs | RAYMOND GEDDES STURF pROMOTIONAL | THE SPORT CENTER
off list: $100 (5%) - 9% off catalog price
o 20% off catalog & 0% - 35% off catal lume discount
% off Catalog, Shelf & List Price | 10% off WEB price off catalog 30% 5% - 10% off catal 0% $250 (10%) - $1000 15% 10% N/A 0% 70 O catalog| ¢ om approved | 5% off catalog price N/A volume cliscoun 5% 0%
list price % Off catalog & list price (see proposal)
price on orders (15%) catalog
greater than $1000
depends on product - set}
one time imprint set up charge - 30% $20.00 - $30.00 N/A - N/A 10% - up is noted on catalog & | varies with supplier 9% - - - 5% -
website
DESCRIPTION
12 0z ceramic mug w/ logo
unit price $2.00 $4.50 - $5.00 $2.40 $5.50 $3.00 1354'222959/ $1.29-.95 $1.99 $2.20
’ ) ) 1 color imprint is
one time imprint set up charge see note below $30.00 $30.00 $50.00 o bid o bid $10.00 - $40.00 list price o bid $50.00 for 1 color oo o bid $40.00 o bid o bid $50.00 o bid
price depends on
brand / model specified / notes gold bond colorful logo min 72 - 45140 . 11 oz ceramic Hozmattec | o6 each for 36 min ceramic mug
Budget Mvg handle ceramic mug N
shipping
16 oz plastic stadium cups w/imprint
unit price 160-$1.00 $1.25 $0.80 $7.50 $1.25 $0.75 41-.62 $1.10 $0.80
) ) 1 col t
one time imprint set up charge $30.00 $20.00 n/a $10.00 - $40.00 Jist price $35.00 per color Coﬁl"ﬂiﬂ" s $40.00 $38.00
see note below no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid
price depends on
brand / model specified / notes american accents | 1 color imprint custom brand - 16 0z (smooth) 16 0z Stadium Cup | gty - .06 each for 50 min 516C
shipping
28 oz or 32 oz transparent plastic sporf
water bottle w/ imprint (variety of
colors)
unit price 5275 $4.99 & Up $2.09 $2.00 $1.14-$1.49 $1.99 $2.45
) ) 1 col t
one time imprint set up charge $30.00 $30.00 $50.00 list price co_m‘"zp:" s $40.00 $38.00
see note below no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid ) ”: ! ed no bid no bid no bid no bid
: price depends on
brand / model specified / notes r'(‘)"":‘;”gz:al 1 color min ioo“) '::;fel Eco) 280z gty - .20 each for 100 min 1288
P Y shipping
63/4" x85/8" x 6 1/2" durable nylon
construction zippered cooler w/
imprint (variety of colors)
unit price $15.00 $6.00 - $10.00 $5.43 $5.25 $1.79-$2.25 $4.50 $3.30
one time imprint set up charge $40.00 $30.00 $50.00 list price 1 °°‘°"'”;":"‘ s $40.00 $50.00
see note below no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid » _Ce":fe“ Eids o no bid no bid no bid no bid
) rice dep n
brand / model specified / notes ‘a:ie: a:g:;’" 2 colors '"'"PZ‘;’k' 22&3: Six 8" x6"x6" qty - .20 each for 50 min 45036
W shipping
w/ imprint
unit price $175 $50.00 (cs of 100) 85-$1.50 $1.75 45-.52 .97 -51.90 $0.33 $0.50
one time imprint set up charge $20.00 $15.00 $10.00 - $40.00 list price 57:?;’;;5:;:;:“/ 1 color imprint is $25.00 $10.00
see note below no bid no bid no bid no bid _included no bid no bid no bid no bid
norwood prices varies depending | Price depends on
brand / model specified / notes tonal - - .015" one color onaty (see| qty - .03 each for 150 min w/ imprint 4 color process
promotional proposal) shipping
desk calendars w/ imprint
unit price $2.25 $5.50 $3.00 $1.62-$2.47 $3.09 $2.50
one time imprint set up charge $20.00 $25.00 list price 1 color imprint is $9.95 $50.00
see note below no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid _included no bid no bid no bid no bid
price depends on
brand / model specified / notes RCC-Koozie 7"x 10" 3"xs" qty - .15 each for 150 min 4303
shipping
lanyards w/ imprint
unit price $3.00 $3.00 $2.95 $1.71-$1.94 91-$1.56 $1.02 $1.60
one time imprint set up charge $0.00 no charge list price $25.00 1 color imprint is $40.00 $50.00
see note below no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid _included no bid no bid no bid no bid
578" width one coloe prices varies depending | Price depends on
brand / model specified / notes Universal nylon / custom front side imprint on gty qty - .05 each for 50 min 65154
(see proposal) shipping
#2 pencils w/ imprint
- dd 15 B
unit price 5021 20-.25 5028 5025 17-.25 13-.24 $0.20 B pr';’:e' eato 5032
R 1 color imprint is
one time imprint set up charge 0.00 15.00 0.00 list price 22.00 14.95 20.00 20.00
P P charg see note below s s s no bid no bid no bid st no bid s included no bid s s no bid s no bid
i - prices varies depending | Price depends on
brand / model specified / notes Shepenco regular / foil min 1000- 55096 various colors onaty qty - .02 each for 288 min - 14070

Bandet Pencil

(see proposal)

shipping
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United Independent School District

RFP 2010-024

Incentives
VENDORS A&E OFFICE CASA GUERO GOLD METAL JERRY'S SPORT IMPRINT POSITIVE REALLY GOOD SMART
DISCOUNTS 4IMPRINT | ADAMS PRINTING RODUCTs |G BOBS TROPHIES| BLUEMOOSETEES [~ "0 "0+ | CLASS UNIFORMS SPORS UNiFoRms | MAGESTUFR.com| oo e o [ NerrmomvaTion| ot ns | RAYMOND GEDDES STURF PROMOTIONAL | THE SPORT CENTER
off list: $100 (5%) - 9% off catalog price )
i - I
% off Catalog, Shelf & List Price | 10% off WEB price | 2% °ff catalog & 30% 5% - 10% off catal 0% $250 (10%) - $1000 15% 10% N/A 0% 0% - 35% off catalog| ¢ . roved | 5% off catalog price N/A volume discount 5% 0%
list price 6 off catalog * & st price (see proposal)
price on orders (15%) catalog
greater than $1000
pens w/ imprint
unit price $0.30 .40-$3.00 5045 $0.90 47-.55 $0.49 add 'lsr'i’z eato $0.60
R - 1 color imprint is
t it set h: . . . . . X
one time imprint set up charge see note below $30.00 $20.00 $0.00 no bid no bid no bid fist price no bid no bid included no bid $20.00 $20.00 no bid $10.00 no bid
] price depends on
) 300 - Element
brand / model specified / notes Express plastic / metal min Pen emen tempo "cilc" pen qty - .02 each for 200 min - ppen
shipping
mouse pads w/ imprint
unit price $2.80 $5.00 $2.75 85-$1.01 $0.99 $3.50
one time imprint set up charge $20.00 $20.00 list price 1 color imprint is $40.00 $45.00
see note below no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid _included no bid no bid no bid no bid
subliminated soft price depends on
brand / model specified / notes Star standard size 116 thick qty - 11 each for 100 min MPLG
N shipping
tote bags and canvas
w/ imprint
unit price $2.75 $5.00 - $8.00 $4.48 $4.00 - $12.00 $6.50 $2.15-$2.39 $4.15 $2.80 $5.00
one time imprint set up charge $30.00 $30.00 $50.00 $10.00 - $40.00 list price 1 °°‘_°"'";pz"‘ Is $40.00 $50.00 N/A
see note below no bid no bid no bid no bid  Include no bid no bid no bid )
15003 price depends on price includes only 1
brand / model specified / notes Custom Crest different sizes Barenin B . beach tote qty - 35 each for 50 min 15003 color print on 1 side
gain 538 shipping only
nylon umbrellas w/
one color logo
unit price $7.00 $13.99 $9.50 $8.00 - $15.00 $10.50 $5.0 - $6.50 $8.99 $7.00
one time imprint set up charge $30.00 $40.00 $90.00 $10.00 - $40.00 list price 1 color imprint is $40.00 $50.00
see note below no bid no bid no bid no bid _included no bid no bid no bid no bid
min 72 - 20002 Star price depends on
brand / model specified / notes Magic E - two tone 44" arc qty - .50 each for 25min 4022
/ Parkman .
shipping
100% cotton, short sleeve
t-shirts w/ embroidery
(variety of colors)
unit price $4.00 $18.00 - $20.00 $5.75 $7.00 - $15.00 $8.50 $8.75 $6.00 $4.99 - $6.29 $10.00 $7.00
. . . $20.00 if less than $80.00 - no chg if
one time imprint set up charge see note below $30.00 $40.00 o bid n/a o bid $10.00 - $40.00 list price 2pes o bid 1o bid seing neft svaphics $50.00 o bid o bid $0.00 N/A
. Edwards, Blue price variasions are . . price varies depending Tshirt Jerzee
brand / model specified / notes o o s e Gilden 2000 E various upon request TSG 500G Gildan | Pree vares Seper M32 ok
100% cotton, pique short sleeve shirts
w/ collar & embroidery (variety of
colors)
unit price $17.50 $25.00 - $28.00 $10.95 $13.00 - $20.00 $15.00 $12.50 $15.29 $12.95 - $14.95 $25.00 $14.00
. . . $20.00 if less than $80.00 - no chg if
one time imprint set up charge see note below $30.00 $40.00 no bid n/a no bid $10.00 - $60.00 list price 24pes no bid o bid seing et evaphics $35.00 no bid o bid $30.00 N/A
. Trophy Colonial | price variasions are . SSG 748 Gildan price varies depending polo jerzee
brand / model specified / notes A e Gilden 3800 - hanes 054x upon request (69755 Py Comon) e 3200 o
heavy 100% cotton cap w/ embroidery|
(variety of colors)
unit price $6.00 $12.00 $5.89 $6.00 - $15.00 $9.00 $9.50 $8.50 $11.10 $4.35 $10.00 $9.00
one time imprint set up charge $30.00 $30.00 n/a $10.00 - $60.00 list price 520'002:: less than $30.00 ui?:“:é};"’r:"ii'é $40.00 $30.00 N/A
see note below no bid no bid pes no bid & neft grap no bid no bid
Custom Velcro Pacific Headwear low profile outdoor
brand / model specified / notes Gemline - P, E brushed cotton upon request oo NuFit Twill Cap 50 min CAP 45413 cap GL271
adjustable
heavy 100% cotton cap w/ screened
imprint
(variety of colors)
unit price $5.00 $8.00 $5.00 - $10.00 $7.00 $5.75 $2.49 $6.00
R $20.00 f less than
one time imprint set up charge see note below $30.00 $20.00 no bid no bid no bid $10.00 - $40.00 list price 24 pes no bid no bid no bid $45.00 no bid no bid $30.00 no bid
brand / model specified / notes Promos Excel - - polyfoam mesh upon request 48 min $45,043.00
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United Independent School District

RFP 2010-024

Incentives
VENDORS ARE OFFICE CASA GUERO GOLD METAL JERRY'S SPORT IMPRINT POSITIVE REALLY GOOD SMART
DISCOUNTS 4IMPRINT [ ADAMSPRINTING | 20" |BIG BOBS TROPHIES| BLUEMOOSETEES [ 20 "LVt | CLASS UNIFORMS SPORS Uniromms | MAGEsTURE.com| Pl [ NeremomvaTion [ BT |RAYMOND GEDDES Py PROMOTIONAL | THE SPORT CENTER
off list: $100 (5%) - 9% off catalog price )
o 20% off catalog & 0% - 35% off catalo olume discount
% off Catalog, Shelf & List Price | 10% off WEB price % off catalog 30% 5% - 10% off catal 0% $250 (10%) - $1000 15% 10% N/A 0% % off catalogl ¢ o approved | 5% off catalog price N/A volume discoul 5% 0%
list price % - 10% off catalog * & st price (see proposal)
price on orders (15%) catalog
greater than $1000
award jacket for elementary, middle &
high schools
unit price $54.00
one time imprint set up charge n/a
they have many minimums on
products under each screen or die charges quanitys ordered are exceptions to bid &
) " return policy: does
item listed - each apply - bid deviations applied - provided a oy o
quote will be provided| on FOB Destination, listing of suggested N pRing,
" s prices do not include on all tshirts & polo
individually as the Insurance catalogs - bid discount
notes discounts on shipping & handeling shirts there are
need arises - a 10% " Requiements, Right tol cannot be combined
" ¢ none none merchandise only - none none none none none none ! none none charges, volume none upcharges on 2XL
discount off the unit Inc/Dec Qty's, with other specials or
not on SHIPPING discount - prices (52), 3XL ($4), 4XL
price will be allowed delivery information, offers - free shipping
20 " ) range from 3-15% off, (s6)
off the unit price warranty information, is on standard
regular price on any
based on the current certification (see delivery only, rush or
; ; ' order over $30 (see
web pricing: proposal for details) express shipping o)
www.dimprint.com charges will apply prop
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