SECTION I. DAY TRIPS

United Independent School District
Charter Bus Services
RFP 2010-017

DOT #/MC#| 1127893/459987-C/P 397239/005034499C 1598946/591511 1489149/560733 1167678/463270 570178/277375 991034/418249 1764020/644733
BUS FLEET 16 BUSES 25 BUSES 15 BUSES 3 BUSES 47 BUSES 17 BUSES 2 BUSES 7 BUSES
REGULAR | HANDICAP Seat REGULAR | HANDICAP | Seat REGULAR |HANDICA| Seat | REGULAR [ HANDICA | Seat | REGULAR | HANDICAP | Seat | REGULAR | HANDICAP Seat REGULAR | HANDICAP | Seat | REGULAR |HANDICAPB| Seat

DESTINATION BUS BUS CAP. BUS BUS CAP. BUS P BUS CAP. BUS P BUS CAP. BUS BUS CAP. BUS BUS CAP. BUS BUS CAP. BUS us CAP.
SAN ANTONIO $1,250.00 | $1,550.00 | 52-58 | *$1,566.00 | $1,566.00 57 $1,150.00 N/A 51-55 | $1,800.00 N/A 55 |$1,525.00 | $1,525.00 55 $1,695.00 | $2,120.00 55 $1,280.00 N/A 52 $1,350.00 N/A 52
ICORPUS CHRIST]| $1,250.00 | $1,550.00 | 52-58 | *$1,566.00 | $1,566.00 57 $1,150.00 N/A 51-55 | $1,700.00 N/A 55 |$1,525.00 | $1,525.00 55 $1,695.00 | $2,120.00 55 $1,280.00 N/A 52 $1,350.00 N/A 52
BROWNSVILLE | $1,350.00 | $1,650.00 [ 52-58 | $1,807.00 | $1,807.00 57 $1,300.00 N/A 51-55 | $2,207.00 N/A 55 |$1,790.00 | $1,790.00 55 $1,925.00 | $2,350.00 55 $1,500.00 N/A 52 $1,550.00 N/A 52
MCALLEN $1,250.00 | $1,550.00 | 52-58 | *$1,566.00 | $1,566.00 57 $1,200.00 N/A 51-55 | $1,833.00 N/A 55 |$1,600.00 | $1,600.00 55 $1,695.00 | $2,120.00 55 $1,280.00 N/A 52 $1,350.00 N/A 52
KINGSVILLE $1,250.00 | $1,550.00 | 52-58 | *$1,566.00 | $1,566.00 57 $1,150.00 N/A 51-55 | $1,625.00 N/A 55 |$1,525.00 | $1,525.00 55 $1,450.00 | $1,875.00 55 $1,280.00 N/A 52 $1,350.00 N/A 52
EAGLE PASS $1,250.00 | $1,550.00 | 52-58 | *$1,566.00 | $1,566.00 57 $1,150.00 N/A 51-55 | $1,625.00 N/A 55 |$1,525.00 | $1,525.00 55 $1,575.00 | $2,000.00 55 $1,280.00 N/A 52 $1,350.00 N/A 52
AUSTIN $1,400.00 | $1,700.00 | 52-58 | $1,999.00 | $1,999.00 57 $1,300.00 N/A 51-55 | $2,276.00 N/A 55 |$1,875.00 | $1,875.00 55 $2,195.00 | $2,620.00 55 $1,500.00 N/A 52 $1,650.00 N/A 52
NEW BRAUNFELY $1,300.00 | $1,600.00 [ 52-58 | $1,714.00 | $1,714.00 57 $1,200.00 N/A 51-55 | $1,997.00 N/A 55 |$1,630.00 | $1,630.00 55 $2,100.00 | $2,525.00 55 $1,350.00 N/A 52 $1,600.00 N/A 52
HOUSTON $2,200.00 | $2,500.00 | 52-58 | $2,509.00 | $2,509.00 57 $2,200.00 N/A 51-55 | $3,150.00 N/A 55 |$2,300.00 | $2,300.00 55 $2,500.00 | $2,925.00 55 $2,100.00 N/A 52 $2,266.00 N/A 52
DALLAS $2,400.00 | $2,700.00 | 52-58 | $3,229.00 | $3,229.00 57 $2,752.00 N/A 51-55 | $3,783.00 N/A 55 |$3,030.00 | $3,030.00 55 $3,300.00 | $3,725.00 55 $2,800.00 N/A 52 $2,884.00 N/A 52
DEL RIO $1,350.00 | $1,650.00 | 52-58 | $1,652.00 | $1,652.00 57 $1,300.00 N/A 51-55 | $2,086.00 N/A 55 |$1,525.00 | $1,525.00 55 $1,795.00 | $2,150.00 55 $1,350.00 N/A 52 $1,550.00 N/A 52
UVALDE $1,200.00 | $1,500.00 | 52-58 | *$1,566.00 | $1,566.00 57 $1,150.00 N/A 51-55 | $1,632.00 N/A 55 |$1,525.00 | $1,525.00 55 $1,525.00 | $1,950.00 55 $1,280.00 N/A 52 $1,200.00 N/A 52

SECTION Il. OVERNIGHT TRIPS

includes the driver's room in
addition to the amount quoted
above. The amount quoted above
for overnight is for the first
overnight.

DESTINATION BUS BUS CAP. BUS BUS CAP. BUS P BUS CAP. BUS P BUS CAP. BUS BUS CAP. BUS BUS CAP. BUS BUS CAP. BUS BUS CAP.
SAN ANTONIO $1,850.00 | $2,150.00 | 52-58 |**$2,592.00| $2,610.00 [57/*39| $1,650.00 N/A 51-55 | $1,995.00 N/A 55 |$2,450.00 | $2,450.00 55 $2,150.00 | $2,575.00 55 $1,900.00 N/A 52 $1,800.00 N/A 52
ICORPUS CHRIST| $1,850.00 | $2,150.00 [ 52-58 |**$2,652.00 | $2,610.00 [57/*39| $1,650.00 N/A 51-55 | $1,995.00 N/A 55 |$2,450.00 | $2,450.00 55 $2,150.00 | $2,575.00 55 $1,900.00 N/A 52 $1,800.00 N/A 52
BROWNSVILLE $1,950.00 | $2,250.00 | 52-58 |**$2,652.00| $2,610.00 [57/*39| $1,800.00 N/A 51-55 | $2,295.00 N/A 55 | $2,600.00 | $2,600.00 55 $2,350.00 | $2,775.00 55 $2,000.00 N/A 52 $2,050.00 N/A 52
MCALLEN $1,850.00 | $2,150.00 | 52-58 |**$2,652.00| $2,610.00 [57/*39| $1,700.00 N/A 51-55 | $1,995.00 N/A 55 |$2,450.00 | $2,450.00 55 $2,120.00 | $2,545.00 55 $1,900.00 N/A 52 $1,800.00 N/A 52
KINGSVILLE $1,850.00 | $2,150.00 | 52-58 |**$2,652.00| $2,610.00 [57/*39| $1,650.00 N/A 51-55 | $1,995.00 N/A 55 |$2,450.00 | $2,450.00 55 $1,875.00 | $2,300.00 55 $1,900.00 N/A 52 $1,800.00 N/A 52
EAGLE PASS $1,850.00 | $2,150.00 | 52-58 |**$2,652.00| $2,610.00 [57/*39| $1,650.00 N/A 51-55 | $1,995.00 N/A 55 |$2,450.00 | $2,450.00 55 $2,000.00 | $2,425.00 55 $1,900.00 N/A 52 $1,800.00 N/A 52
AUSTIN $2,000.00 | $2,300.00 | 52-58 |**$2,652.00| $2,610.00 [57/*39| $1,800.00 N/A 51-55 | $2,295.00 N/A 55 | $2,450.00 | $2,450.00 55 $2,620.00 | $3,045.00 55 $2,000.00 N/A 52 $2,150.00 N/A 52
NEW BRAUNFELY $1,900.00 | $2,200.00 | 52-58 | **$2,652.00 | $2,610.00 | 57/*39 | $1,700.00 N/A 51-55 | $2,025.00 N/A 55 |$2,450.00 | $2,450.00 55 $2,525.00 | $2,950.00 55 $2,000.00 N/A 52 $2,100.00 N/A 52
HOUSTON $2,800.00 | $3,100.00 | 52-58 |**$2,652.00| $2,728.00 [57/*39| $2,700.00 N/A 51-55 | $3,250.00 N/A 55 |$2,600.00 | $2,600.00 55 $2,925.00 | $3,350.00 55 $2,500.00 N/A 52 $2,700.00 N/A 52
DALLAS $3,000.00 | $3,300.00 | 52-58 | $3,389.00 | $3,243.00 [57/*39| $3,252.00 N/A 51-55 | $3,895.00 N/A 55 | $3,150.00 | $3,150.00 55 $3,725.00 | $4,150.00 55 $3,000.00 N/A 52 $3,300.00 N/A 52
DEL RIO $1,950.00 | $2,250.00 | 52-58 |**$2,652.00| $2,610.00 [57/*39| $1,800.00 N/A 51-55 | $2,195.00 N/A 55 | $2,450.00 | $2,450.00 55 $2,250.00 | $2,675.00 55 $2,000.00 N/A 52 $1,800.00 N/A 52
UVALDE $1,800.00 $2,1Q0.0Q 52-58 | **$2,652.00 | $2,610.00 [ 57/*39| $1,650.00 N/A 51-55 | $1,995.00 N/A 55 |$2,450.00 | $2,450.00 55 $1,950.00 | $2,375.00 55 $1,900.00 N/A 52 $1,700.00 N/A 52
Cougar Bus Lines is not *Trip price is based on 12 hours. *ELC = El Conejo Bus
responsible for toll fees, Price will drop for trips less than Lines/Renacimiento
amusement park entrances, or any 11 hours.
other parking fees associated with | *Trips based on 36 hours. Price
charter trips. Each additional may change depending on actual
Deviations overnight charge is $600 which hours used.
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UNITED INDEPENDENT SCHOOL DISTRICT
CHARTER BUS SERVICE
RFP 2010-017

SECTION Ill. RESERVED DATES FOR UISD - Band/Football Cougar Bus Lines, LTDpaisy Charters & Shuttle ELC Management G-Tours Kerrville Bus Co. OK Tours Tornado Tours Zima Real Bus Line
ALEXANDER HIGH SCHOOL SEATING UNIT SEATING UNIT SEATING UNIT SEATING UNIT SEATING UNIT SEATING UNIT SEATING UNIT SEATING UNIT
DATES DESTINATION QTY. CAPACITY PRICE CAPACITY PRICE CAPACITY PRICE CAPACITY PRICE CAPACITY PRICE CAPACITY PRICE CAPACITY PRICE CAPACITY PRICE
Friday, September 24, 2010 Del Rio, Texas (Football Game) 5 52-58 1,350.00 57-285 $1,652.00 51-55 1,300.00 55 $2,086.00 55 $1,525.00 | 550r56 1,600.00 | No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Saturday, October 2, 2010 Marching Contest in SA or McAllen 5 52-58 1,150.00 No Bid No Bid 51-55 1,200.00 55 $1,833.00 55 1,525.00 550r56 1,545.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Saturday, October 16, 2010 Corpus Christi, Texas (UIL Marching ) 5 52-58 1,150.00 No Bid No Bid 51-55 1,150.00 55 1,700.00 55 1,525.00 | 550r56 1,495.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Saturday, October 23, 2010 San Antonio, Texas (Area Marching) 5 52-58 1,150.00 No Bid No Bid 51-55 1,150.00 55 1,800.00 55 1,525.00 | 550r56 1,495.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
LYNDON B. JOHNSON HIGH SCHOOL

DATES DESTINATION QTY.

Friday, September 10, 2010 Eagle Pass, Texas (football game) 4 52-58 1,150.00 57-228 1,566.00 51-55 1,150.00 55 1,625.00 55 1,525.00 | 550r56 1,495.00 52 $1,180.00 52 $1,200.00
Saturday, October 2, 2010 Marching Contest in SA or McAllen 4 52-58 1,150.00 57-228 1,566.00 51-55 1,200.00 55 1,833.00 55 1,600.00 | 550r56 1,495.00 52 No Bid No Bid No Bid
Friday, October 8, 2010 Eagle Pass, Texas (football game) 4 52-58 1,150.00 57-228 1,566.00 51-55 1,150.00 55 1,625.00 55 $1,525.00 | 550r56 1,495.00 52 No Bid 52 $1,200.00
Saturday, October 16, 2010 Corpus Christi, Texas (UIL Marching ) 4 52-58 1,150.00 57-228 1,566.00 51-55 1,150.00 55 1,700.00 55 1,525.00 | 550r56 1,495.00 52 No Bid No Bid No Bid
Saturday, October 23, 2010 San Antonio, Texas (Area Marching) 4 52-58 1,150.00 57-228 1,566.00 51-55 1,150.00 55 1,800.00 55 1,525.00 | 550r56 1,495.00 52 No Bid No Bid No Bid
UNITED HIGH SCHOOL

DATES DESTINATION QTY.

Friday, September 24, 2010 Eagle Pass, Texas (football game) 5 52-58 1,150.00 57-285 $1,566.00 51-55 $1,150.00 55 1,625.00 55 1,525.00 | 550r56 1,495.00 No Bid No Bid 52 1,200.00
Saturday, October 2, 2010 Marching Contest in SA or McAllen 5 52-58 1,150.00 No Bid No Bid 51-55 $1,200.00 55 1,833.00 55 1,600.00 | 550r56 1,495.00 No Bid No Bid 52 1,200.00
Saturday, October 16, 2010 Corpus Christi, Texas (UIL Marching ) 5 52-58 1,150.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 55 1,700.00 55 1,525.00 | 550r56 1,495.00 No Bid No Bid 52 1,200.00
Friday, October 22, 2010 Eagle Pass, Texas (football game) 5 52-58 1,150.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 55 1,625.00 55 $1,525.00 | 550r56 1,545.00 | No Bid No Bid 52 1,200.00
Saturday, October 23, 2010 San Antonio, Texas (Area Marching) 5 52-58 1,150.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 55 1,800.00 55 1,525.00 550r56 1,495.00 No Bid No Bid 52 1,200.00
UNITED SOUTH HIGH SCHOOL

DATES DESTINATION QTY.

Friday, September 03, 2010 Corpus Christi, Texas (Football Game) 4 52-58 1,150.00 57-228 $1,566.00 51 1,150.00 55 $1,700.00 55 $1,525.00 | 550r56 1,495.00 52 $1,180.00 52 $1,200.00
Saturday, October 2, 2010 *Marching Contest in SA or McAllen 4 52-58 1,225.00 No Bid No Bid 51 1,200.00 No Bid No Bid 55 1,600.00 550r56 1,495.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Saturday, October 8, 2010 Del Rio, Texas (Football Game) 4 52-58 1,150.00 No Bid No Bid 51 1,300.00 55 $2,086.00 55 1,525.00 | 550r56 1,495.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Saturday, October 16, 2010 *Corpus Christi, Texas (UIL Marching ) 4 52-58 1,225.00 No Bid No Bid 51 1,150.00 No Bid No Bid 55 1,525.00 | 550r56 1,495.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Saturday, October 23, 2010 *San Antonio, Texas (Area Marching) 4 52-58 1,225.00 No Bid No Bid 51 1,150.00 No Bid No Bid 55 $1,525.00 | 550r56 1,495.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
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