Communication Devices

RFP 2010-003
Communication Devices and Interactive Boards

Vendors Dynavox Prentke Romich Company
Est.

Description Qiy Price Extension Warranty Price Extension | Warranty
Dynavox V - 10 $7,820.00 $78,200.00 1Year No Bid
Dynavox VMAX - 10 $8,420.00 $84,200.00 1 Year No Bid
Spring Board Lite 10 No Bid $2,495.00 $24,950.00 2 Year
*Four (4) vendors "No Bid" Section Il
Interactive Boards

Education 2000
Option 1- Education 2000 Troxell
Vendors Aisys Audio Visual Aids Mimio Option 2 Communications

Description Cii; Price Extension Price Extension Price Extension Price Extension Price Extension
Interactive White Board - software must be
included X 50 $1,369.00 $68,450.00 $895.00 $44,750.00 $619.00 $30,950.00 | $999.00 | $49,950.00 |$1,067.00 $53,350.00
Reference: SMART Board™ Interactive
Whiteboard SB660
Installation for wall mounting the interactive
whiteboard 50 $100.00 $5,000.00 $70.00 $3,500.00 N/A N/A $10.00 | $500.00 | $250.00 | $12,500.00
Wireless Bluetooth Connection - for 600 series
interactive boards 50 $199.00 $9,950.00 $299.00 $14,950.00 Included Included $196.00 $9,800.00
Reference: Smart WC6-NA
Training 1 $700.00 $700.00 Not Provided Not Provided Not Provided $0.00 $0.00

*Two (2) Vendors "No Bid" Section IlI

**Three Vendors (3) submitted a "No Bid" for the entire bid




