UNITED INDEPENDENT SCHOOL DISTRICT
GRADUATION SUPPLIES

RFP 079-2011

VENDORS Graduation Source Herff Jones South Texas Balfour, LLC
Description Qty Price | Ext. | Item Number Price | Ext. | Item Number Price | Ext. | Item Number
Section |. Percentage Discounts
% Off Catalog Price 15% 0% 0%
% Off List Price 15% 0% 0%
Section Il. Rental - Staff gowns only
Bachelor Gowns 345 $39.95| $13,782.75 $15.75 $5,433.75 $16.00 $5,520.00
Bachelor Hoods 345 $19.95| $6,882.75 $15.75 $5,433.75 $16.00 $5,520.00
Master Gowns 95 $45.95| $4,365.25 $15.75 $1,496.25 $16.75 $1,591.25
Master Hoods 95 $25.95| $2,465.25 $15.75 $1,496.25 $16.75 $1,591.25
Section Ill. Purchase - Staff & Student
Cap & Gown Unit for student 100 $11.50| $1,150.00 GI-CGAS $16.95-$28.95 | $1,695-52,895 $19.00-$34.50 $1,900-$3,450
Bachelor Gowns 345 $39.95 | $13,782.75 GI-GOWNBD $26.50 $9,142.50 $17.50 $6,037.50
Bachelor Hoods 345 $19.95| $6,882.75 GI-GOODBD $21.50 $7,417.50 $20.90 $7,210.50
Master Gowns 95 $45.95| $4,365.25 GI-GOWNMD $27.50 $2,612.50 $19.05 $1,809.75
Master Hoods 95 $25.95| $2,465.25 GI-HOODMD $22.50 $2,137.50 $22.15 $2,104.25
$3.80 UHS
Diplomas 1741 $4.95 $8,617.95 | VD-DIPLOMAC $3.40 $5,919.40 $4.20 Magnet
$3.95 AHS, LBJHS, USHS

Diploma Covers, Acetate & Envelopes 2405 $5.95 | $14,309.75 VD-DIPCOVC $5.75 $13,828.75 $6.50 $15,632.50
DAP Stoles 1880 $5.95 | $11,186.00 VG-STOLEC $15.95 $29,986.00 $16.40 $30,832.00
Salutatorian Stoles 4 $5.95 $23.80 VG-STOLEC $15.95 $63.80 $21.50 $86.00
Valedictorian Stoles 4 $5.95 $23.80 VG-STOLEC $15.95 $63.80 $21.50 $86.00
Double Honor Cords 415 $6.95 $2,884.25 GI-CORDAD1 $6.85 $2,842.75 $6.95 $2,884.25
Single Honor Cords 565 $4.95 $2,796.75 GI-CORDA1 $4.45 $2,514.25 $4.40 $2,486.00
DAP Seals 1780 $0.50 $890.00 VG-SEALC $0.50 $890.00 $0.65 $1,157.00
Salutatorian Seals 4 $1.95 $7.80 VG-SEALC No Bid No Bid No charge
Valedictorian Seals 4 $1.95 $7.80 VG-SEALC No Bid No Bid No charge
Sash with Graduation Medals 425 $6.95 $2,953.75 VD-MEDALC $2.85 $1,211.25 $2.75-$5.95 $1,168.75-52,528.75
Graduation Seal for Magnet School 188 $0.85 $159.80 VG-SEALC $0.85 $159.80 $0.75 $141.00
Honor Society Patches 120 $4.95 $594.00 VG-EMBROID $6.95 $834.00 $5.64 $676.80
Honor Society Diploma Seals 120 $0.85 $102.00 VG-SEALC $0.85 $102.00 $0.65 $78.00
Blue Hoods (Honor Society) 100 $7.95 $795.00 VG-SHIELD $14.95 $1,495.00 $14.70 $1,470.00
Gold Hoods (Top 10%) 80 $7.95 $636.00 VG-SHIELD $14.95 $1,196.00 $14.70 $1,176.00

Set up Fee N/A N/A N/A

SPECIAL NOTES




