Section I. Police Uniforms

Police Officer Uniforms, Equipment and Accessories

RFP 078-2009

Vendors Est Al& Robs EVP Group Gall's GT Distributors Novastar Promega Signs
Iltem Qty. Unit Price Ext. Price Unit Price | Ext. Price Unit Price Ext. Price | Unit Price | Ext. Price | Unit Price | Ext. Price] Unit Price [ Ext. Price
Women's Police Oficer Uniform Long Sleeve Shirt |, $39.95 | $799.00 | NoBid | NoBid $31.99 $639.80 | $30.80 | $616.00 | NoBid | NoBid | NoBid | NoBid
Ref: Gall's SH455
Women's Police Oficer Uniform Long Sleeve Shirt 40 = . o
& 20 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid SZ.40= 33099, 42§ 5610.80/ No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Ref: Gall's SH048 46 = $34.99 $699.80
Women's Police Officer Uniform Short Sleeve Shir $38.95 | $779.00 | NoBid | NoBid $27.99 $550.80 | $27.73 | $55460 | NoBid | NoBid | NoBid | NoBid
Ref: Gall's SH454
Women's Police Officer Uniform Short Sleeve Shirt] 20 $38.95 $779.00 No Bid No Bid 32-40 = $27.49; 42.46 | $549.80/ No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Ref: Gall's SH047 = $34.99 $699.80
Men's Police Officer Uniform Long Sleeve Shirt 14.5-18.5 = $31.99; 19-| $8477.35/$
265 | 4095 |[$10851.75] NoBid | NoBid |20=$35.99;  21-22|9537.35/51] $30.80 |$8,262.00] NoBid | NoBid | NoBid | NoBid
Ref: Gall's SH531 =$40.99 0,862.35
Men's Police Officer Uniform Long Sleeve Shirt 265 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 14.5-18.5 = $30.99; 19-| $8212.35/$ No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Ref: Gall's SHO18 22 =$34.99 9,272.35
Men's Police Officer Uniform Short Sleeve Shirt 265 $39.95 $10,586.75 No Bid No Bid 14.5-18.5 = $28.99; 19-|$7,682.35/9| $27.73 | $7,348.45 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Ref: Gall's SH532 20=$31.99 8,477.35
Men's Police Officer Uniform Short Sleeve Shirt 265 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid MD-XL = $27.49; $7,284.85/ No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Ref: Gall's SH020 2x = $29.99 $7,947.35
Women's Police Office Uniform Gabardine Trouser| 84550 | $91000 | NoBid | NoBid $31.99 $639.80 | 43487 | $697.40 | NoBid | NoBid | NoBid | NoBid
Ref: Elbeco E9314LC
Men's Polllce Officer Uniform Gabardine Trousers 265 $45.50 $12,057.50 No Bid No Bid 28-42=$31.99; 44-|$8,477.35/ $34.87 $9,240.55 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Ref: Gall's TR165 54 = $33.99 $9,007.35
Unisex Tactical Vest 20 No Bid No Bid NoBid | NoBid MD-2X=$55.99; ($L,119.80/) (..o |<115100] NoBid | NoBid | NoBid | Nogid
Ref: Gall's JA295 5.11 3x = $60.99 $1,219.80
Men’s Tactical Pant 20 No Bid No Bid NoBid | Noig |P0-44=°3499% 46-| 569980/ |eapen | 4690.00 | NoBid | NoBid | Nosid | Nosid
Ref: Gall's TR135 59 = $41.99 $839.80
Men'’s Tactical Pant - Nylon Canvas 20 No Bid No Bid NoBid | NoBid $33.99 $679.80 | 3450 | $690.00 | NoBid | NoBid | NoBid | NoBid
Gall's TR248
Unisex Tactical Pant 10 No Bid No Bid NoBid | NoBid No Bid No Bid $23.87 | $23870 | NoBid | NoBid | NoBid | Nosid
Ref: Propper
Women's Tactical Pant . . . . . . . .
3 No Bid No Bid NoBid | NoBid $35.99 $107.97 | $3450 | $10350 | NoBid | NoBid | NoBid | NoBid
Gall's TR219
Unisex Tactical Shirt - Short Sleeve 10 No Bid No Bid NoBid | NoBid No Bid No Bid $21.20 | $212.00 | NoBid | NoBid | NoBid | NoBid
Ref: Propper
Unisex Tactical Shirt -Long Sleeve 10 No Bid No Bid NoBid | NoBid No Bid No Bid $23.87 | $23870 | NoBid | NoBid | NoBid | NosBid
Ref: Propper
All Season Jacket SM-XL=$79.99;  2X|$3599.55/$
4 . 4 _ =$84.99; 3824.55/$4 _ , _ _
45 No Bid No Bid NoBid | NoBid 86.44 |4$3,889.80] NoBid | NoBid | NoBid | NoBid
o Bi o Bi o Bi o Bi 3X = $89.99; 1049.55/%4, S S o Bi o Bi o Bi o Bi
Ref: Gall's JA102 4X = $99.99 499.55
Tactical Waterproof Precint Jacket 12 | sases | sss1.40 | nosid | Nomig | SMXL=211999 [51439.88/5 oy | nogia | NoBid | Nosid | Nosid | Nosid
Ref: 5.11 Tactical Jacket or Gall's JA486 3X - 6X =$124.99; 1,499.88
Reversible Windbreaker 45 | sas.95 | $2,067.75 | wNoBid | NoBid $89.99 $4,04955 | $7734 |$3.48030| NoBid | NoBid | NoBid | NoBid
Ref: First Class
Tactical Quarter Boot . . . . . . . .
45 No Bid No Bid NoBid | NoBid $92.99 $4,184.55 | $81.17 |$3,652.65] NoBid | NoBid | NoBid | NoBid
Ref: 5.11 Haste Quarter Boot
Zipper Boot - Tactical Boot -Quarter Boot 45 $67.95 | $3,057.75 | NoBid | NoBid $89.99 $4,049.55 | $67.64 |$3,043.80] NoBid | NoBid | NoBid | NoBid
Ref: Magnum 6" Stealth Force Zipper
Zipper Boot - Tactical Boot - B
No Zipper Boot - Tactical Boot -Quarter Boot 45 No Bid No Bid NoBid | No Bid $75.99 $3,419.55 | NoBid No Bid NoBid | NoBid | NoBid | NoBid
Ref: Magnum 6" Stealth Force No Zipper
Zipper Boot - Tactical Boot- Boot- 6" zi
ipper Boot - Tactical Boot-Quarter Boot - 6" zippe{ ¢ No Bid No Bid NoBid | No Bid $84.99 $3,824.55 | $67.94 |$3,057.30] NoBid | NoBid | NoBid | NoBid
Reference: Bates Ind. Comfort System
Police Caps . . . . . . . .
115 | NoBid No Bid NoBid | No Bid $11.99 $1,378.85 | $4.75 | $546.25 | NoBid | NoBid | NoBid | NoBid
Ref: no reference
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Section Il. Police Accessories

RFP 078-2009
Police Officer Uniforms, Equipment and Accessories

Vendors Al& Robs EVP Group Gall's GT Distributors Novastar Promega Signs
Item Est Qty. JUnit Price| Ext. Price JUnit Price| Ext. Price Unit Price Ext. Price J Unit Price| Ext. Price JUnit Price| Ext. Price j Unit Price| Ext. Price
48" PVC Vynil Raincoat with title 60 NoBid | NoBid | NoBid | No Bid $10.99 $659.40 | $17.58 | $1,054.80| NoBid | NoBid | NoBid | NoBid
Ref: Gall's RW032
Nickel Finished Handcuff
cke’ Finished Mandcutts 55 $25.95 |$1,427.25] NoBid | No Bid $23.99 $1,319.45 | $20.40 |$1,122.00] NoBid | NoBid | NoBid | NoBid
Ref: Gall's RS021
Traffic Mesh Blue Best 30 NoBid | NoBid | NoBid | No Bid $23.99 $719.70 | $20.85 | $625.50 | NoBid | NoBid | NoBid | NoBid
Ref: Gall's H5190
Traffic Reflective Security . . . . . . . .
30 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $12.99 $389.70 $20.85 $625.50 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Ref: Gall's HS235
Body Armor 15 NoBid | NoBid | NoBid | Noid | SMXL=9581.59 |58723.85/5) geog a3 | 67.002.30] NoBid | NoBid | NoBid | NosBid
Galls' BP 427 2X = $599.99 8,999.85
Adjustable Black Belt with Vel
justable Black Belt with Velcro 30 NoBid | NoBid | NoBid | NoBid $12.99 $389.70 | $14.12 | $423.60 | NoBid | NoBid | NoBid | NoBid
Gall's NP251
Police Duty Holster 10 NoBid | NoBid | NoBid | NoBid $86.99 $869.90 | $72.54 | $725.40 | NoBid | NoBid | NoBid | NoBid
Ref: Gall's LP568
High Ride Belt L
igh Ride Belt Loop 10 NoBid | NoBid | NoBid | NoBid $11.99 $119.90 | NoBid | NoBid | NoBid | NoBid | NoBid | NoBid
Ref: Gall's ZA1452
Police Duty Rigs 7 NoBid | NoBid | NoBid | NoBid No Bid NoBid | pNms | pNms | NoBid | NoBid | NoBid | No Bid
Ref: Black Hills BH80
Double Magazine 7 NoBid | NoBid | NoBid | NoBid No Bid NoBid | onms | pnms | NoBid | NoBid | NoBid | NoBid
Ref: Black Hills BH61D
Hand Cuff Case . . . . . . ) . . .
K 7 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid DNMS DNMS No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Ref: Black Hills BH64
Glove Pouch 7 NoBid | NoBid | NoBid | NoBid No Bid NoBid | onms | pnms | NoBid | NoBid | NoBid | NoBid
Ref: Black Hills BH31
Radio Holder 7 NoBid | NoBid | NoBid | NoBid No Bid NoBid | pNms | pNms | NoBid | NoBid | NoBid | No Bid
Ref: Black Hills BH54
Four Snaps Belt Keeper 11/8 7 NoBid | NoBid | NoBid | NoBid No Bid NoBid | onms | pnms | NoBid | NoBid | NoBid | NoBid
Ref: Black Hills Leather BH67
Under Belt . . . . . . . . . .
X 7 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid DNMS DNMS No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Ref: Black Hills BH125
Glove Pouch 7 NoBid | NoBid | NoBid | NoBid No Bid NoBid | onms | pnms | NoBid | NoBid | NoBid | NoBid
Ref: Black Hills BH31
Heavy Duty Leather Gloves . . . . . . . .
60 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $24.99 $1,499.40 | $24.39 | $1,463.40] No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Ref: Gall's GL214
Vehicle First Aid Kit with Nylon Pouch 60 NoBid | NoBid | $10.99 | $659.40 $10.99 $659.40 | NoBid | NoBid | NoBid | NoBid | NoBid | NoBid
Ref: Gall's EM118
Fast Charge Flashlight
ast Lharge Hashlght 10 NoBid | NoBid | DNMS | DNMs $111.99 $1,119.90 | $87.29 | $872.90 | NoBid | NoBid | NoBid | NoBid
Ref: Streamlight Polystiger LED
One Line Professional Name Plate 60 NoBid | NoBid | NoBid | NoBid $5.99 $359.40 | $7.26 | $435.60 | NoBid | NoBid | NoBid | NoBid
Ref: Gall's NTO17
Police B
olice Badges 10 NoBid | NoBid | NoBid | NoBid $109.99 $1,099.90 | NoBid | NoBid | NoBid | NoBid | NoBid | No Bid
Ref: Blackinton
security Badges 10 NoBid | NoBid | NoBid | NoBid $10.99 $109.90 | s$16.64 | $166.40 | NoBid | NoBid | NoBid | NoBid
Ref: Gall's BC355

DSMS = Does Not Meet Specifications
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Section Ill. Police Equipment

RFP 078-2009
Police Officer Uniforms, Equipment and Accessories

Vendors Al& Robs EVP Group Gall's GT Distributors Novastar Promega Signs
Item Est Qty. J Unit Price| Ext. Price | Unit Price | Ext. Price J Unit Price | Ext. Price | Unit Price | Ext.Price J UnitPrice | Ext. Price JUnit Price| Ext. Price
Partitions - Expanded Metal 10 NoBid | NoBid | $365.58 |$3,655.80 | $319.99 | $3,199.90 | $440.32 | $4,403.20 | $420.00 | $4,20000 | NoBid | NoBid
Ref: Gall's SS072
9-K Canine Partition 5 NoBid | NoBid | $498.31 |$2,491.55 | $329.99 | $1,649.95 | $540.20 | $2,701.00 | $499.00 | $2,495.00 | NoBid | NoBid
Ref: Gall's SS078
Security Screen with Plexiglass Lockable . . . .
10 NoBid | NoBid | $365.58 |$3,655.80 | $319.99 | $3,199.90 | $509.47 | $5,004.70 | $517.00 | $5,170.00 | NoBid | NoBid
Ref: Gall's SS016
Dual Scale Template Kit . . . . . :
10 NoBid | NoBid | NoBid | NoBid | $1499 | $149.90 | $1421 | $142.20 | $1750 | $17500 | NoBid | NoBid
Ref: Gall's HS082
Road Wizard Traffic Template 10 NoBid | NoBid | NoBid | NoBid | NoBgid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid NoBid | No Bid
Citation Holder . . . . . .
10 NoBid | NoBid | NoBid | NoBid | $13.99 | $139.90 | s1668 | $166.80 | $2000 | $20000 | NoBid | NoBid
Ref: Gall's CPO07
100 Watt Siren with Tap Il 10 NoBid | NoBid | $117.00 [$1,270.00] $199.89 | $1,998.90 | $194.70 | $1,947.00 | $295.00 | $2,950.00 | NoBid | NoBid
Ref: Gall's SK023
9-Function Switch Control
10 NoBid | NoBid | $101.35 [$1,013.50] $139.99 | $1,399.90 | $209.55 | $2,095.50 | $189.00 | $1,890.00 | NoBid | NoBid
Ref: Gall's SEO09
Full Function Siren 10 NoBid | NoBid | $117.00 |[$1,170.00] $129.99 | $1,299.90 | $129.95 | $1,299.50 | $159.00 | $1,590.00 | NoBid | No Bid
Ref: Gall's SK124
Car Console . . . .
10 NoBid | NoBid | $209.00 |$2,090.00 | $139.99 | $1,399.90 | $177.31 | $1,773.10 | $285.00 | $2,850.00 | NoBid | NoBid
Ref: Gall's VEO13
100 Watt Signal Speaker 10 NoBid | NoBid | $114.00 [$1,240.00] $139.99 | $1,399.90 | $156.75 | $1,567.50 | $198.00 | $1,980.00 | NoBid | NoBid
Ref: Gall's SK179
LED Mini Bar
5 NoBid | NoBid | $687.50 |$3,437.50 | $649.99 | $3,249.95 | $691.90 | $3,459.50 | $839.00 | $4,19500 | NoBid | NoBid
Ref: Gall's LBOO4
Lightbar With Traffic Advisor
5 NoBid | NoBid |$1,265.00 | $6,325.00 | $1,549.59 | $7,747.95 | $1,669.80 | $8,349.00 | $2,049.00 | $10,245.00] NoBid | NoBid
Ref: Gall's LBOOS RB
90 Watt Hide -A-Way Strobe System 10 NoBid | NoBid | $198.00 [$1,980.00] $249.99 | $2,499.90 | $205.70 | $2,057.00 | $339.00 | $3,390.00 | NoBid | NoBid
Ref: Gall's GR225
Flasher for Vehicles with Light Control 10 NoBid | NoBid | NoBid | NoBid | $59.62 | $596.20 | No Bid No Bid $69.00 | $690.00 | NoBid | No Bid
Ref: Gall's FS008
Six Head LED Deck Master 10 NoBid | NoBid | $274.00 |$2,740.00 | $238.49 | $2,384.90 | $329.26 | $3,292.60 | $365.00 | $3,650.00 | NoBid | NoBid
Ref: Gall's GR241
Ford Crown Victoria HD Package 10 NoBid | NoBid | $68.42 | $684.20 | $59.00 | $500.00 | $3850 | $385.00 | NoBid NoBid | NoBid | NoBid
Ref: Gall's FS058
;/22' zzmtgr:lgﬂjx Combo Kit 5 NoBid | NoBid | $233.75 |$1,168.75 | $229.99 | $1,149.95 | No Bid NoBid | $369.00 | $1,845.00 | NoBid | No Bid
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Section Ill. Police Equipment RFP 078-2009
Police Officer Uniforms, Equipment and Accessories

Vendors Al& Robs EVP Group Gall's GT Distributors Novastar Promega Signs
Item Est Qty. J Unit Price| Ext. Price | Unit Price | Ext. Price J Unit Price | Ext. Price | Unit Price | Ext.Price J UnitPrice | Ext. Price J Unit Price| Ext. Price
2-way VHF Radio Syst
way adio system 10 NoBid | NoBid | NoBid | NoBgid | NoBid No Bid No Bid NoBid | $529.00 | $5,290.00 | NoBid | No Bid
Ref: Motorola
Whistles . . . . . . . .
100 NoBid | NoBid | NoBid | NoBid $4.99 | $499.00 | NoBid No Bid $9.99 $999.00 | NoBid | No Bid
Ref: Gall's UA330
Day/Night Barrier Tape 25 NoBid | NoBid | NoBid | NoBid | NoBgid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid NoBid | No Bid
Fingerprint Pad 15 NoBid | NoBid | NoBid | NoBid | $18.99 | 28485 | 1857 | $27855 | NoBid No Bid NoBid | No Bid
Ref: Gall's LE137
Master Pac Drug Kit . . . . . . . .
50 NoBid | NoBid | NoBid | NoBid | $279.99 |$13,999.50 | $236.19 |$11,809.50| No Bid NoBid | NoBid | NoBid
Ref: Gall's LEO87
Cocaine/Crack Drug Test Refill Pack 25 NoBid | NoBid | NoBid | NoBid | $2499 | ¢624.75 | $21.51 | $5372.75 | NoBid No Bid NoBid | No Bid
Ref: Gall's LEO65
';ti”’;gﬂi E’Egge“ Refill Pack 25 NoBid | NoBid | NoBid | NoBid | $24.99 | s$624.75 | $2151 | $537.75 | NoBid | NoBid | NoBid | NoBid
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Section IV. Handguns

RFP 078-2009
Police Officer Uniforms, Equipment and Accessories

Vendors Est Al & Rob's EVP Group Gall's GT Distributors Novastar Promega Signs
Iltem Qty. o ) - . - . o . o . o .
Unit Price Ext. Price Unit Price Ext. Price Unit Price | Ext. Price § Unit Price Ext. Price Unit Price | Ext. Price | Unit Price | Ext. Price
Magazines for Handguns 10| NosBid No Bid No Bid No Bid NoBid | NoBid | NoBid No Bid NoBid | NoBid | NoBid | NoBid
Ref: Beretta
Magazines for Handguns 120] NoBid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid NoBid | $31.70 | $3,804.00 | NoBid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Ref: Sig Sauer model P226 cal 40
Sig Sauer Pistol Model P226 Cal 40
'8 sauler Fistol Mode 2 60| Nogid No Bid No Bid No Bid NoBid | NoBid | $608.00 |$36,480.00] NoBid | NoBid | NoBid | NoBid
Ref: as above
thf:;:" Model 92Fs, Cal SMM 5 | NoBid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
iji
A ition - 9MM, 147 Grai
mmunition ' rain 10| wNoBid No Bid No Bid No Bid NoBid | NoBid | $351.17 | $3512.70 | nNoBid | NoBid | NoBid | NoBid
FMJ Silver tip
/:'\r;‘;“””'t'or’ - SMM,115 Grain 10] NoBid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid NoBid | $154.01 | $1,540.10 | NoBid No Bid No Bid No Bid
. Al & Rob's EVP Group Gall's GT Distributors Novastar Promega Signs
Catalog Discount
0% 41% 15% 5% 10% 0%
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