UNITED INDEPENDENT SCHOOL DISTRICT
GRADUATION SUPPLIES
RFP 074-2009

VENDORS BALFOUR GORDON INTERNATIONAL OVERALL OFFICE - HERFF JONES
PERCENTAGE DISCOUNTS
% Off Catalog Price 0% 15% 0%
% Off List Price 0% N/A 0%
DESCRIPTION UNIT PRICE / RANGE NOTES UNIT PRICE / RANGE NOTES UNIT PRICE / RANGE NOTES
all schools except for
Cap & Gown Unit $19.00 - $32.99 AHS use the cap & $10.25/$15.95 shinny/matte finish $28.00
gown of $32.99
Bachelor Gowns $32.00 $25.00 $22.00
Bachelor Hoods
rental rental rental
Master Gowns $35.50 $25.00 $22.00
Master Hoods
UHS $3.60
UHS Magnet $4.20
USHS $3.95
Diplomas LBJ $3.95 no bid $3.50
price range provided
AHS $3.60 - $4.20] b/c they don't know
their specs
Diploma Covers, Acetate & Envelopes $6.50 $5.92 $6.60
DAP Stoles $20.95 $9.95 manufacture $19.00
Salutatorian Stoles $21.50 $9.95 own $20.00
Valedictorian Stoles $21.50 $9.95 items $20.00
Double Honor Cords $8.95 $6.95 $8.00
Single Honor Cords $4.50 $4.45 $4.00
DAP Seals $0.65 no bid no charge
Salutatorian Seals no charge no bid no charge
Valedictorian Seals no charge no bid no charge
Graduation Medals $2.75-$5.95 $2.95-$11.95 | custom $1.50
Graduation Seal for Magnet School $0.75 no bid $0.78
Honor Society Patches $5.64 no bid $6.10 see note below
Honor Society Diploma Seals $0.65 no bid $0.78
Blue Hoods (Honor Society) $14.70 $19.95 $15.00
Gold Hoods (Top 10%) $14.70 $19.95 $15.00
Set up Fee no charge N/A no charge
suggests that all honor society patches be
SPECIAL NOTES samples provided samples provided ordered directly from the national honor
society / samples provided

ONE (1) VENDOR SUBMITTED A "NO BID"




