UNITED INDEPENDENT SCHOOL DISTRICT
BUS VEHICLE REPAIRS AND SERVICES

RFP 067-2009

WINDSHIELD REPAIR AND INSTALLATION

INSTALLATION

INSTALLATION

INSTALLATION
cosT

INSTALLATION
cosT

VENDORS A & B Wheel Alignment ANDY'S AUTO AIR & SUPPLY CRUZ AUTO GLASS CENTER CUMMINS SOUTHERN PLAINS D RODRIGUEZ AUTO INSPECTION
[SEC. I: HOURLY LABOR AND REPLACEMENT PARTS FOR 9%DISC. | INSTALLATION | WARRANTY 9%DISC. | INSTALLATION WARRANTY %DISC. | INSTALLATION WARRANTY %DISC. | INSTALLATION WARRANTY 9%DISC. | INSTALLATION | WARRANTY
MECHANICAL TRADES LIST PRICE | OFF LIST | RATE/HOUR | (MOS/MILES) |LISTPRICE| OFF LIST | RATE/HOUR (MOS/MILES) | LISTPRICE |OFF LIST| RATE/HOUR (MOS /MILES) LIST PRICE | OFFLIST | RATE/HOUR (MOS/MILES) | LISTPRICE | OFF LIST RATE /HOUR | (MOS/MILES)
1|A/C SERVICE AND INSTALLATION - 20% $60.00 12 MONTHS - -
BODY REPAIRS/COLLISION
2 BUSES| . . .
CARS & TRUCKS] .
3|TRANSMISSION REPAIRS AND SERVICE - - - -
4|MUFFLER REPAIRS AND SERVICE - - - -
5|GASOLINE ENGINE REPAIR AND SERVICE - - - - NO BID
90 DAYS
SERVICE
CRAFTSMANSHIP 1
CUMMINS [CENTER  |$93PERHIOUR | /oo o) ool o
MR&HD [PRICING MO. MR PARTS
6|DIESEL ENGINE REPAIRS - - - PRICE LIST *|
7|ELECTRIC SERVICE AND REPAIRS - - - -
8|RADIATOR REPAIR AND INSTALLATION - 20% $60.00 ‘ 12 MONTHS - -
9|DIAGNOSTIC REPAIRS AND SERVICE - - - -
SEC. Il: HOURLY LABOR AND REPLACEMENT PARTS FOR | PRICE PER| %DISC |[LABOR RATE FOR PRICE PER | %DISC [LABOR RATE FOR PRICE PER %DISC |LABOR RATE FOR| PRICE PER (%DISC OFF| LABOR RATE FOR PRICE PER | %DISC OFF LABOR RATE
WHEEL ALIGNMENTS AND BALANCING AXLE | OFF LIST WORK WARRANTY AXLE | OFFLIST [ ADD WORK WARRANTY AXLE  |OFFLIST| ADD WORK WARRANTY AXLE LIsT DD WORK WARRANTY AXLE LisT FOR ADD WORK| WARRANTY
WHEEL ALIGNMENT FOR PICKUP TRUCKS & 3895172

1|CARGO VANS TON % $40.00/ HOUR 30 DAYS - - -
2[WHEEL ALIGNMENT FOR DISTRICT CARS $29.95 % $40.00/ HOUR 30 DAYS - - -
3|WHEEL ALIGNMENT FOR SCHOOL BUSES NIA - - -

$85.00 NOT

INCLUDING
4|WHEEL ALIGNMENT FOR HEAVY DUTY VEHICLES |EXENTRICS 0% $40.00/ HOUR 30 DAYS - - -

NO BID
LABOR RATE PER LABOR RATE PER LABOR RATE PER
% DISC. WHEEL TO 9 DISC. WHEEL TO 9%DISC. | WHEEL TO PRICE PER [%DISC OFF| LABOR RATE FOR

LIST PRICE | OFF LIST BALANCE WARRANTY | LisT PRICE | OFF LIST BALANCE WARRANTY LIST PRICE |OFF LIST BALANCE WARRANTY AXLE LIST ADD WORK WARRANTY
1|BALANCING FOR PICKUP TRUCKS & CARGO VAN | $6.00/ TIRE| 0% $40.00/ HOUR 30 DAYS - - NO BID
2|BALANCING FOR DISTRICT CARS SS00MRE | 0% $40.00/ HOUR 30 DAYS - - NO BID
3[BALANCING FOR SCHOOL BUSES - - - - - NO BID
4[BALANCING FOR HEAVY DUTY VEHICLES $16.00/ TIRE $40.00/ HOUR 30 DAYS - - NO BID
5{PERFORM THE ALIGNMENT OR BALANCING NO BID

UNIT COST

INSTALLATION
cosT

WARRANTY

WINDSHIELD & WINDOWS FOR SCHOOL
BUSES AND OTHER HEAVY DUTY VEHICLES:

VENDORS UNIT COST cosT WARRANTY UNIT COST COST WARRANTY UNIT COST WARRANTY UNIT COST WARRANTY
1|WINDSHIELD FULL SIZE P/U TRUCK & CARGO VAN - NIA $70.00-$130.00 $55.00-$110.00 * NO BID
2|WINDSHIELD MINI PICK UP - NIA $70.00-$110.00 $55.00-$110.00 NO BID
3|WINDSHIELD FULL SIZE CAR - NIA $70.00-$130.00 $55.00-$110.00 NO BID
4|WINDSHIELD MID SIZE CAR - NIA $70.00-$110.00 $55.00-$110.00 NO BID
5|WINDSHIELD THOMAS BUS - $1,090.68 [ $300.00 NIA $450.00-$490.00 __|$110.00-$165.00 NO BID
6|WINDSHIELD INTL. BUS - $562.73 $250.00 N/A $220.00-$250.00 _|$110.00-$165.00 NO BID

MIRRORS FOR THE FOLLOWING SIZES:

10°%24" - NIA $25.00 $25.00 NO BID
10°X36" - NIA $35.00 $25.00 NO BID
12°%24" - NIA $25.00 $25.00 NO BID
13%24" - NIA $35.00 $25.00 NO BID
26"X48" - NIA $65.00 $25.00 NO BID
7|12"x40" - NIA $45.00 $25.00 NO BID
147%24" - NIA $35.00 $25.00 NO BID
20°%31" - NIA $45.00 $25.00 NO BID
13%32" - NIA $45.00 $25.00 NO BID
217%31" - NIA $45.00 $25.00 NO BID
16"X30" - NIA $45.00 $25.00 NO BID
247X 12" - NIA $25.00 $25.00 NO BID
25"%10" NIA $25.00 $25.00 NO BID

[SEC. IV: PERCENTAGE DISCOUNT ON LABOR & PARTS
DISCOUNT FROM LIST PRICE ON REPLACEMENT
ARTS

10" X24" 1/8" CLEAR TEMP. - NIA $20.00 $10.00 NO BID
8|8 1/2" X 23 1/8" CLEAR TEMP - NIA $20.00 $10.00 NO BID
6" X8 X 3/4" CLEAR TEMP. - NIA $10.00 $10.00 NO BID
28 1/4" X 21 1/4" INSULATED - NIA NO BID

2[LABOR RATE PER HOUR

[SEC. V: QUESTIONS & STATEMENTS

1{[REGULAR WORKING HOURS

MONDAY - FRIDAY 8:00AM - 6:00PM
& SATURDAY 8:00AM - 1:00PM

MONDAY - FRIDAY 8:00AM - 5:30PM

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

MONDAY - SATURDAY 9:00 AM - 6:00 PM

[WI/IN 48 HRS FROM TIME OF WORK

2A|SERVICE VEHICLES OUTSIDE NORMAL HOURS YES YES YES NO YES
2B|SERVICE VEHICLES AT ANY UISD PROPERTY. YES YES YES YES NO
3|VENDOR AGREES TO KEEP ALL PARTS IN STOCK. YES YES YES YES YES
VENDOR AGREES TO ADDRESS WARRENTY WORK vES vES vES vES vES

NOTES: Received 2 No bids



COST+25%

15%

FAMILY CHEVORLET GCR TIRES ROTEX TRUCK CENTER RUSH TRUCK CENTER
| %DISC. | INSTALLATION | WARRANTY | 9% DISC. |INSTALLAT\DN| WARRANTY | % DISC. |\NSTALLATION WARRANTY | 9% DISC. |INSTALLAT\0N| WARRANTY
LISTPRICE | OFFLIST | RATE/HOUR | (MOS/MILES) | LISTPRICE | OFFULIST | RATE/HOUR | (MOS/MILES) | LISTPRICE | OFFLIST | RATE/HOUR | (MOS/MILES) | LISTPRICE | OFFLIST | RATE/HOUR | (MOS/MILES) |
12 MONTHS/  [$65.00 HR + Parts Labor = 1 Labor 90 days Parts
COST+25%* _ $90.00HR* 12,000 MILES _[PARTS 15% $65.00HR _month NO BID $75.00  1year
No BID NO BID NO BID T;)::;ms/ NOBID 20% $70.00 12 MONTHS ST500 | oro0days Parts
COST +25% COST+25%  $90.00/ HR 12,000 MILES 20% 12 MONTHS 1year
Factory Warranty on
$65.00 HR + Parts Labor = 1 Labor 90 days Parts
NO BID PARTS 15% $65.00HR _month 10% $70.00 12 MONTHS $75.00  1year
Factory Warranty on
$65.00 HR + Parts Labor = 1 Labor 90 days Parts
NO BID PARTS 15% $65.00HR _month NO BID $7500  lyear
Factory Warranty on
$65.00 HR + Parts Labor = 1 Labor 90 days Parts
NO BID PARTS 15% $65.00HR _month NO BID $75.00  1year
Factory Warranty on
$65.00 HR + Parts Labor = 1 Labor 90 days Parts
NO BID PARTS 15% $65.00HR _month 20% $70.00 12 MONTHS $75.00 _ 1year
Factory Warranty on
$65.00 HR + Parts Labor = 1 Labor 90 days Parts
NO BID PARTS 15% $65.00HR _month 20% $70.00 3 MONTHS $75.00  1year
Factory Warranty on
[$65.00 HR + Parts Labor = Labor 90 days Parts
NO BID PARTS 15% $65.00HR _month NO BID $7500  1lyear
Factory Warranty on
$65.00 HR + Parts Labor = 1 Labor 90 days Parts
NO BID PARTS 15% $65.00 HR__month 20% $70.00 $75.00 1 year
PRICE PER | %DISC OFF | LABOR RATE PRICE PER | %DISC OFF | FOR ADD PW‘WC OFF | FOR ADD | PRICE PER | %DISC OFF | FOR ADD |
AXLE LIST FOR ADD WORK| WARRANTY AXLE uisT WORK WARRANTY AXLE LsT WORK WARRANTY AXLE uisT WORK WARRANTY
$49.99
$99.99 FOR
ONE TON 90 DAYS OR
DUELLYS $90.00/ HR_| 4000MILES |  $39.99 20% $65.00 hr 1 Month NOBID NO BID
$49.99 $90.00/ HR SAME $29.99 20% $65.00 hr 1 Month NO BID NO BID
Labor 90 days Parts
NOBID $89.99 20% $65.00 hr 1 Month NOBID $7500  lyear
Labor 90 days Parts
NO BID $49.99 20% $65.00 hr 1 Month NO BID $75.00 1year
LABOR RATE LABOR RATE LABOR RATE
PRICE PER | %DISC OFF | LABOR RATE PRICE PER | %DISC OFF | FOR ADD PRICE PER | %DISC OFF | FOR ADD PRICE PER | %DISC OFF | FOR ADD
AXLE LisT FOR ADD WORK| WARRANTY AXLE LisT WORK WARRANTY AXLE LsT WORK WARRANTY st WORK WARRANTY
90 DAYS OR
$49.99 $9.99 4,000 MILES $8.00 20% $16.00 hr 1 Month NO BID NO BID
90 DAYS OR
$49.99 $9.99 4,000 MILES $8.00 20% $16.00 hr 1 Month NO BID NO BID
NO BID $20.00 20% $16.00 hr 1 Month NO BID $75.00
NO BID $49.00 20% $16.00 hr 1 month NO BID $75.00 90 days labor
NO BID NO BID NO BID $75.00
INSTALLATION INSTALLATION INSTALLATION INSTALLATION
UNIT COST cost WARRANTY UNIT cOST cosT WARRANTY UNIT COST cosT WARRANTY UNIT cOST cosT WARRANTY
NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

10%

20%

$90.00/ HR

MONDAY - FRIDAY 7:30AM - 6:00PM
SATURDAY 8:00 AM - 12:00 NOON

$65.00 hr

MONDAY - FRIDAY 7:30AM - 5:00PM

$70.00 hr

MONDAY - FRIDAY 7:00AM - 6:00PM
SATURDAY 8:00AM - 2:00PM

$75.00

MONDAY - FRIDAY 7:00AM - 6:00PM

NO YES YES YES
NO YES YES YES
YES YES YES YES
YES YES YES YES




