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UNITED INDEPENDENT SCHOOL DISTRICT
MARIACHI UNIFORMS, EQUIPMENT, SHEET MUSIC & SUPPLIES

RFP 064-2009

WITH GALA, GRECA OR EMBROIDERY, HAT, IMITATION
PITA OR EMBROIDERED BELT OR EMBROIDERED
SHOES AND TIE

WITH GALA, BELT, TIE & SHOES
WITH GRECA, GALA, IMITATION PITA 

WITH GRECA OR EMBROIDERY, HAT, IMITATION
PITA OR EMBROIDERED BELT OR EMBROIDERED

OR EMBROIDERED BELT, SHOES & TIE

% off  catalog price
% off list price

% off shelf price

$750.00

$800.00

$480.00

% off  catalog price
% off list price

% off shelf price

SHOES AND TIE

COMPLETE 3 PIECE SUIT 

Standard Guitarra de golpe w/ case REF: standard or equal
GUITARRON

HAT, BELTS, SHOES, TIES, & OTHER ATTACH.

VENDOR
DESCRIPTION

JACKET, VEST, SKIRT 

REF YamahaCG101 or Equal NO BID
VIHUELA 
Standard Vihuela with case REF: Standard or Equal $450.00
GUITARRA DE GOLPE

$550.00

SHEET MUSIC
SHEET MUSIC FOR MARIACHI

INSTRUMENTAL & VOCAL METHOD ALL LEVELS

% off catalog price
% off list price

% off shelf price

% off catalog price
% off list price

% off shelf price
INSTRUMENTAL/VOCAL EDU. VIDEOS & AUDIO RECORDINGS

% off catalog price
% off list price

% off shelf price
ANY OTHER RESOURSE MATERIALS & BOOKS

% off catalog price
% off list price

% off shelf price
SUPPLIES

GUITAR STRINGS ( CLASSICAL)  set of 6, normal tension
clear nylon, REF D'Addarrio Pro Arte or Equal NO BID
GUITARRON STRINGS  Complete set of 6 strings 
REF Standard set NO BID
VIHUELA STRINGS REF Standard set
VIHUELA CASE  REF standard vihuela hard shell case
GUITARRON CASE REF standard guitarron hard shell case

INSTRUMENTS
CLASSICAL GUITAR
Full size guitar, w/nylon strings. Solid top, w/ case

Standard Guitarron REF Standard Guitarron w/ case $850.00
GUITARRON
Deluxe Guitarron  REF: Deluxe Guitarron w/ case or equal $1,200.00
ARPA (HARP) JALISCIENSE
32 string arpa w/ gig bag case REF: stardard arpa w/ case $4,750.00

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

$281.08

$282.08

$524.28

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

$9.50

NO BID

$190.00

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

$8.95

NO BID

$159.00

$195.00

NO BID

$319.00

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

$241.73

$230.30

NO BID

$699.30

NO BID

NO BID

$628.00

$748.00

$828.00

$6.00

$12.99

$150.00

$425.00

$475.00

$575.00

NO BID

$1,500.00

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

$8.99

$24.99

$189.00

$220.00

NO BID

$350.00

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

$8.50

$24.00

$169.00

$269.00

NO BID

NO BID

$779.00

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

$6.00

NO BID

$168.00

$188.00

NO BID

$271.00

NO BID

NO BID


