
VENDORS
DESCRIPTION

% Discount

UNIT EXT UNIT EXT UNIT EXT UNIT EXT UNIT EXT UNIT EXT UNIT EXT

160 9R22.5 $155.00 $24,800.00 $200.00 $32,000.00 $177.00 $28,320.00 $177.00 $28,320.00 $209.88 $33,580.80 $193.00 $30,880.00 $193.00 $30,880.00

Brand 

160 10r22.5 $176.00 $28,160.00 $238.00 $38,080.00 $196.00 $31,360.00 $197.50 $31,600.00 $218.71 $3,499.60 $251.40 $40,228.80 $251.43 $40,228.80

Brand

180 11R22.5 $190.00 $34,200.00 $225.00 $40,500.00 $214.00 $38,520.00 $213.50 $38,430.00 $251.16 $40,185.60 $207.00 $37,260.00 $207.00 $37,260.00

Brand

150 1000R20 $243.00 $36,450.00 $282.00 $42,300.00 $254.00 $38,100.00 $239.00 $35,850.00 $203.79 $30,568.50 $243.00 $30,880.00 $243.00 $36,450.00

Brand

50 1000R20 TUBE $17.00 $850.00 $17.00 $850.00 $19.95 $997.50 $21.60 $1,080.00 $18.00 $900.00

Brand

50 205/75R 15 $47.00 $2,350.00 $55.00 $2,750.00 $47.00 $2,350.00 $48.00 $2,400.00 $56.47 $2,823.50 $58.28 $2,914.00 $58.28 $2,914.00

Brand

50 235/75R 15 $53.00 $2,650.00 $62.00 $3,100.00 $61.00 $3,050.00 $61.00 $3,050.00 $73.19 $3,659.50 $75.01 $3,750.50 $75.01 $3,750.50

Brand

160 225/60R 16 $52.00 $8,320.00 $66.00 $10,560.00 $55.95 $8,952.00 $57.50 $9,200.00 $60.76 $9,721.60 $72.75 $11,640.00 $72.75 $11,640.00

Brand

160 LT225/75R 16 $71.00 $11,360.00 $104.00 $16,640.00 $76.00 $12,160.00 $76.16 $12,184.00 $82.27 $13,163.20 $108.40 $17,358.40 $108.49 $17,358.40

Brand

180 235/70R 16 $64.00 $11,520.00 $90.00 $16,200.00 $80.00 $14,400.00 $80.75 $14,535.00 $79.12 $14,241.60 $79.16 $14,248.80 $79.16 $14,248.80

Brand

150 235/75R 16 $72.00 $3,600.00 $91.00 $13,650.00 $82.00 $12,300.00 $82.50 $12,375.00 $71.81 $10,771.50 $99.48 $14,922.00 $99.48 $14,992.00

Brand

SAMSON GL 74

GOODYEAR INTEGRITY

GOODYEAR INTEGRITY

SAMSON GL 74

CARLISLE GATEWAY

SAMSON GL-88

FIRESTONE FR380 GOODYEAR WRANGLERBFG LONGTRAIL

SUMMIT SIEMPRE VI FIRESTONE FR380 GOODYEAR INTEGRITYBFG LONGTRAIL

WESTLAKE SU307

FIRESTONE TRANSFORCE GOODYEAR WRL SRA

SUMMIT SIEMPRE VI FIRESTONE FR380 SL

NEPTUNE EXPERIENCE FIRESTONE DESTINATION

GOODYEAR WRL SRAFIRESTONE DESTINATIONTOYO OPHT FIRESTONE DESTINATION A/T

FIRESTONE FS560

no bid no bid

FIRESTONE TRANSFORCE HT

0%

FIRESTONE DESTINATION A/T

SEE ATTACHED

FIRESTONE FS560

FIRESTONE FS560

GOODYEAR USA

GOODYEAR USA

GOODYEAR USA

GOODYEAR USA

GOODYEAR USA

TOYO OPHT

GOODYEAR USA

GOODYEAR USA

GOODYEAR USE

GOODYEAR USA

GOODYEAR USA

A TO Z TIRE            
OPTION 1

SAMSON AR110

COOPER STARFIRE

SAMSON GL 83

UNITED INDEPENDENT SCHOOL DISTRICT
TIRES

RFP 061-2009

SOUTHERN TIRE MART T & W TIRE

SEE ATTACHEDEST.      
QTY

CARLISLE

TOYO EXTENSA

TOYO EXTENSA

TOYO EXTENSA

A TO Z TIRE            
OPTION 2

0%

TOYO M120

TOYO M120

TOYO M122

TOYO MM140

TOYO OPHT

FIRESTONE T819

GATEWAY TR444

FIRESTONE FR380 SL

FIRESTONE FR380 SL

FIRESTONE FR 380

TIRE CENTERS LLCGCR TIRE CENTERS

12%

FIRESTONE FS560

FIRESTONE FS560

FIRESTONE FS560

FIRESTONE T819

GATEWAY TR444

WINGFOOT

0%

GOODYEAR G149

DUNLOP SP160

DUNLOP SP160

GOODYEAR G149HANKOOK AH-11

BFG TRACTION

BFG LONGTRAIL

BFG LONGTRAIL

BFG LONGTRAIL

10%

MICHELIN

BFG ST230

BFG ST230



VENDORS
DESCRIPTION

% Discount

UNIT EXT UNIT EXT UNIT EXT UNIT EXT UNIT EXT UNIT EXT UNIT EXT

0% SEE ATTACHED

A TO Z TIRE            
OPTION 1 SOUTHERN TIRE MART T & W TIRE

SEE ATTACHEDEST.      
QTY

A TO Z TIRE            
OPTION 2

0%

TIRE CENTERS LLCGCR TIRE CENTERS

12%

WINGFOOT

0%10%

50 235/85R 16 $78.00 $3,900.00 $106.00 $5,300.00 $81.00 $4,050.00 $81.00 $4,050.00 $90.55 $4,527.50 $110.60 $5,532.50 $110.65 $5,535.50

Brand

50 LT245/75R16 $75.00 $3,750.00 $113.00 $5,650.00 $87.50 $4,375.00 $88.30 $4,415.00 $91.15 $4,557.50 $115.80 $5,792.50 $115.85 $5,792.50

Brand

50 235/55R17 $69.00 $3,450.00 $104.00 $5,200.00 $85.00 $4,250.00 $85.25 $4,262.50 $86.00 $4,303.00 $106.10 $5,308.00 $106.16 $5,308.00

Brand

50 245/75R17 $115.00 $5,750.00 $115.00 $5,750.00 $95.50 $4,775.00 $95.35 $4,767.00 $108.80 $5,440.00 $136.80 $6,844.00 $136.88 $6,844.00

Brand

50 245/75R22.5 $195.00 $9,750.00 $195.00 $9,750.00 $216.00 $10,800.00 $216.50 $10,825.00 $226.00 $11,300.00 $189.00 $9,450.00 $189.00 $9,450.00

Brand

50 255/70R22.5 $157.00 $7,850.00 $189.00 $9,450.00 $191.00 $9,550.00 $191.00 $9,550.00 $218.06 $10,903.00 $245.10 $12,258.50 $245.17 $12,258.50

Brand

50 235/70R17 $104.00 $5,200.00 $104.00 $5,200.00 $91.00 $4,550.00 $91.00 $4,550.00 $101.90 $5,095.00 $118.30 $5,917.50 $118.35 $597.50

Brand

50 255/70R16 $74.00 $3,700.00 $97.00 $4,850.00 $84.95 $4,247.50 $84.40 $4,220.00 $90.67 $4,533.50 $99.21 $4,960.50 $99.21 $4,960.50

Brand

50 265/70R17 $85.00 $4,250.00 $109.00 $5,450.00 $87.00 $4,350.00 $87.35 $4,367.50 $103.23 $5,161.50 $118.90 $5,948.50 $118.97 $5,948.50

Brand

50 7.50-16 $68.00 $3,400.00 $68.00 $3,400.00 $64.95 $3,247.50 $64.00 $3,200.00 $60.95 $3,047.50 $114.70 $5,735.50 $114.71 $5,735.50

Brand

50 7.00-15 $57.00 $2,850.00 $57.00 $2,850.00 $54.00 $2,700.00 $54.00 $2,700.00 $58.84 $2,542.00 $107.10 $5,357.50 $107.15 $5,357.50

Brand

50 20.5X800-10 $33.56 $1,678.00 $33.56 $1,678.00 $37.06 $1,853.00 $57.00 $2,850.00 $49.00 $2,450.00

Brand

50 225/70R15 $54.68 $2,734.00 $54.68 $2,734.00 $60.38 $3,019.00 $64.00 $3,200.00 $70.49 $3,524.50 $65.66 $3,283.00 $65.66 $3,283.00

Brand

TOYO OPHT GOODYEAR WRL SRA

GOODYEAR WRL SRA

no bid no bid

FIRESTONE TRANSFORCE H/T

FIRESTONE INDY 500 SL

GOODYEAR USA

GOODYEAR USA

FIRESTONE DESTINATION

FIRESTONE DESTNATION

DUNLOP SP160GOODYEAR USA

TOYO M124

FIRESTONE TRANSFORCE

GOODYEAR WRL SRA

FIRESTONEGT PURSUIT GOODYEAR EAGLE GT

FIRESTONE TRANSFORCE HT

WESTLAKE SV308 TOYO PROXIES FIRESTONE FIREHAWK G-T

CB TROOPER HIWAY

CB TROOPER HIWAY FIRESTONE TRANSFORCE H/T FIRESTONE TRANSFORCE HT

FIRESTONE FS560

FIRESTONE DESTINATION GOODYEAR USA

TOYO M154

BFG ST230

BFG LONGTRAIL

TOYO OPHT

TOYO OPHT

FIRESTONE TRANSFORCE H/T

TOYO M124 BRIDGESTONE R250 BRIDGESTONE R 250 GOODYEAR G149GOODYEAR USA

GOODYEAR WRL SRA

TOYO OPHT

GOODYEAR USA

GOODYEAR USA

GOODYEAR USA

NEPTUNE EXPERIENCE

TOYO OPHT FIRESTONE DESTINATION

FIRESTONE DESTINATION

NEPTUNE EXPERIENCE

SAMSON GL 83 TOYO M120

TOYO OPHT TOYO OPHT FIRESTONE DESTINATION AT/X

FIRESTONE FS 560

SAMSON HWY

SUPERMAX HWY TL

SUPERMAX HWY TL

SUPERMAX HWY GOODYEAR USA

GOODYEAR USA

SAMSON HWY

SUPERMAX HWY

COOPER TRENDSETTER 

DEESTONE

PRIMEWELL PS580

CARLISLE USA TRAILCARLISLE

TOYO OPHT

SAMSON HWY

SAMSON HWY

CARLISLE SPORT TRAIL

COOPER TRENDSETTER

RUGGED TRAIL

GOODYEAR WRL SRA

GOODYEAR WRL SRA

GOODYEAR WORKHORSE

GOODYEAR WORKHORSE

GOODYEAR INTEGRITY

BFG ADVANTAGE

GOODYEAR USA

GOODYEAR USABFG COMM

BFG LONGTRAIL

BFG LONGTRAIL

SUPERMAX

SUPERMAX

DEESTONE

BFG LONGTRAIL

BFG LONGTRAIL



VENDORS
DESCRIPTION

% Discount

UNIT EXT UNIT EXT UNIT EXT UNIT EXT UNIT EXT UNIT EXT UNIT EXT

0% SEE ATTACHED

A TO Z TIRE            
OPTION 1 SOUTHERN TIRE MART T & W TIRE

SEE ATTACHEDEST.      
QTY

A TO Z TIRE            
OPTION 2

0%

TIRE CENTERS LLCGCR TIRE CENTERS

12%

WINGFOOT

0%10%

50 225/70R16 $64.12 $3,206.00 $64.12 $3,206.00 $72.00 $3,600.00 $80.40 $4,020.00 $82.37 $4,118.50 $78.69 $3,934.50 $78.69 $3,934.50

Brand

50 225/70R19.5 $107.00 $5,350.00 $107.00 $5,350.00 $169.00 $8,480.00 $152.50 $7,625.00 $173.28 $8,664.00 $183.00 $9,150.00 $183.00 $9,150.00

Brand

50 18X8.5-8 $25.00 $1,250.00 $25.00 $1,250.00 $24.71 $1,235.50 $27.00 $1,350.00 $21.00 $1,050.00

Brand

50 235/75/R16 $89.64 $4,482.00 $89.64 $4,482.00 $82.00 $4,100.00 $82.50 $4,125.00 $77.66 $3,883.00 $99.48 $4,974.00 $99.48 $4,974.00

Brand

50 23X8.5-12 $42.00 $2,100.00 $42.00 $2,100.00 $34.69 $1,734.50 $53.00 $2,650.00 $35.00 $1,750.00

Brand

no bid no bid

no bid no bid

-

-

-

-

-$6.50 Per tire 20" rim or 
larger

LIGHT DUTY 
TRUCKS & 

BUSES
-

-

HEAVY DUTY 
TRUCK & BUSES

$6.50 Per tire 20" rim or 
larger

$6.50 Per tire 20" rim or 
larger

LIGHT DUTY 
TRUCKS & BUSES

Frequency       
of pick up Once a week

$3.50 Per tire with less 
than 20" rim

HEAVY DUTY 
TRUCK & BUSES

$3.50 All sizes for LT - 
Disposal Charge $0.00 All sizes

Amount to be paid to UISD per discarded tire picked up by vendor

-

-

Monthly

-

Monthly

$0.00 All other Tires$3.50 Per tire with less 
than 20" rim

-

$3.50 11R22.5 Disposal 
Charge

$41.50 11R22.5 Recappable 
(less than 4yrs old) -

GOODYEAR WRL SRA

$40.00 11R22.5/ Re-threadable 
(w/casing less than 4 yrs old

--

GOODYEAR USA

SUMMIT TRAIL CLIMBER A/W FIRESTONE DESTINATION FIRESTONE DESTINATION GOODYEAR USA

CARLISLE CARLISLE FAIRWAY PRO DEESTONE CARLISLE FAIRWAY PRO

SAMSON GL 83 SAMSON GL 83 FIRESTONE FS560 FIRESTONE FS560

CARLISLE CARLISLE TURF SAVER DEESTONE CARLISLE TURF SAVER

TOYO OPHT TOYO OPHT FIRESTONE DESTINATION FIRESTONE DESTINATION -

SUMMIT TRAIL CLIMBER

$3.50 Per tire with less 
than 20" rim

$6.50 Per tire 20" rim or 
larger

$3.50 Per tire with less 
than 20" rim

Once a week

$15.00 SEE BID FOR 
NOTES

GOODYEAR INTEGRITY

GOODYEAR G149

$40.00 SEE BID FOR 
NOTES

$45 11R22.5; 10:00R20; 
11R24.5

BFG LONGTRAIL

BFG ST230

FAIRWAY PRO 

BFG TRAIL TOUR

DEESTONE


