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UNITED INDEPENDENT SCHOOL DISTRICT
ELECTRICAL SUPPLIES

RFP 060-2009

VENDORS 3-G ELECTRICAL BREAKER CED. McCOY'S e
PERCENTAGE DISCOUNT SUPPLY INTERNATIONAL BUILDING SUPPLY
% Off Catalog Price 20% - 40% 15%
% Off List Price 20% 15% 25% 0% -
% Off Shelf Price 10% - 5% -
DESCRIPTION UNIT UNIT COST UNIT COST UNIT COST UNIT COST UNIT COST
BALLAST 120V 3F32T8 EA $16.57 $17.40 $16.90 $38.79 $13.46
BALLAST 120V 4F32T8 EA $17.82 $18.16 $18.90 $29.99 $14.74
BALLAST 277V 3F32T8 EA $16.57 $17.40 $16.90 $38.79 $13.46
BALLAST 277V 4F32T8 EA $17.82 $18.19 $18.90 $29.99 $14.74
BALLAST KIT 70 WATT EA $59.46 $77.16 $81.50 no bid $57.68
BOX WIREMOLD 2X4 PLASTIC DEEP EA $5.96 $6.13 $5.14 no bid no bid
BOX METAL 4X4 % K.O. EA $0.97 $0.68 $0.89 $1.99 $0.63
80 AMP DOUBLE BREAKER SD EA $52.50 $91.12 $89.90 no bid no bid
CONDUIT EMT %" X 10’ EA $1.45 $1.63 $1.49 $2.89 $0.36
CONDUIT EMT %" X 10’ EA $2.78 $3.41 $2.89 $5.69 $0.63
CONDUIT FLEX MC 3/8 EA $90.63 $0.33 $322.00 no bid no bid
COPPER WIRE #12 THHN/THWN (BLACK) RL 500' EA $33.65 $43.17 $39.50 $62.89 no bid
COPPER WIRE #12 THHN/THWN (BLUE) RL 500' EA $33.65 $43.17 $39.50 no bid no bid
COPPER WIRE #12 THHN/THWN (GRAY) RL 500' EA $33.65 $43.17 $39.50 no bid no bid
COVER RECEPTACLE 1 GANG IVORY EA $0.22 $0.20 $0.21 $0.19 $0.18
COVER SWITCH 1 GANG IVORY EA $0.22 $0.20 $0.21 $0.19 $0.18
EXIT SIGN VOLTAGE DUAL EA $20.00 $20.52 $27.90 $20.99 $16.23
FIXTURE LAMP LAYIN 2X4 EA $41.00 $45.09 $45.90 $51.69 $54.83
GROUNG ROD 5/8” X 8 EA $12.19 $11.43 $10.58 $12.79 no bid
HAND DRYER VOLTAGE 115 EA $393.75 no bid $363.98 no bid $148.82
TIMER INDOOR 277 VOLT EA $45.43 $52.81 $62.90 $17.99 no bid
TIMER INDOOR 110 VOLT EA $52.74 $45.82 $60.90 $8.39 no bid
WALL PACK HPS 100 EA $122.50 $133.08 $141.00 no bid $42.01
WALL PACK HPS 150 EA $112.00 $78.43 $141.00 no bid $88.91
WALL PACK HPS 70 EA $140.00 $71.57 $67.50 no bid $40.14
NOTES noted there may
be price increases
due to the
prices of certain
commoditites






