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UNITED INDEPENDENT SCHOOL DISTRICT
PLUMBING SUPPLIES
RFP 059-2009

VENDORS ALAMO APPLE CLARK MARKS McCOY'S
IRON WORKS SPECIALTIES HARDWARE |PLUMBING PARTS | BUILDING SUPPLY
SECTION I: PERCENTAGE DISCOUNTS % DISCOUNT % DISCOUNT % DISCOUNT % DISCOUNT % DISCOUNT
% OFF CATALOG PRICE 10% off website -
chicago (47%), 20% - 85%
tes (40%) & sloan X 0% 0%

% OFF LIST PRICE ; (49%) (depending on MFG)

% OFF SHELF PRICE - -

SECTION II: GENERAL LINE ITEMS UNIT UNIT COST UNIT COST UNIT COST UNIT COST UNIT COST

BOWL WAX EACH no bid no bid $0.69 $1.08 $1.29
PVC CEMENT GREY 1 QT. EACH no bid no bid $10.89 no bid no bid
PVC CEMENT REGULAR 1 QT. EACH $13.64 no bid $4.98 $12.13 $7.99
PVC PRIMER 1QT. EACH $13.83 no bid $5.79 $8.77 $10.99
CHICAGO LAVATORY SINGLE FAUCET EACH no bid $68.79 $65.88 $93.82 no bid
URINAL SPONGE GASKET EACH no bid no bid $0.34 $1.01 no bid
SLOAN O RINGS EACH no bid $0.12 $0.59 $0.18 no bid
POLYFLEX SUPPLY 1/2 X 3/8 EACH no bid no bid $3.14 $4.91 $3.59
RECTORSEAL #5 ONE PINT EACH no bid no bid $11.69 $19.03 no bid
LAVATORY STRAINER GRID 1 1/4" EACH no bid no bid $8.47 $26.71 no bid
P TRAP 1 1/4" CHROME 17 GAUGE EACH no bid no bid $11.39 $20.15 $8.99
P TRAP 1 1/2" CHROME 17 GAUGE EACH no bid no bid $13.50 $24.42 $10.89
HOSE BIBB 1/2" EACH $5.81 no bid $5.49 $8.77 $6.59
HOSE BIBB 3/4" EACH $6.50 no bid $5.69 $10.54 $7.59
RELIEF VALVE URINAL SLOAN EACH no bid $1.99 $3.75 $5.73 $8.49
RELIEF VALVE TOILET SLOAN EACH no bid $1.99 $3.75 $5.45 no bid
WASHER SET SLOAN A156AA EACH no bid $5.17 $7.85 $12.48 $11.99
LAVATORY FLAT WASHER SET (CAN) EACH no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid
COIL TUBING COPPER 1/4" COIL no bid no bid $21.94 no bid $34.95
COIL TUBING COPPER 3/8" COIL no bid no bid $31.25 no bid $47.95
PVC TOILET FLANGE FLOOR 3" TO 4" EACH no bid no bid $4.98 $9.19 $4.83
STOP REPAIR KIT 1"SLOAN EACH no bid $3.98 $6.94 $10.40 $23.99
TOILET BRASS BOLT 1/4" EACH no bid no bid $0.55 $3.07 $1.99
TOILET SEAT ELONGATED OPEN FRONT EACH no bid no bid $15.59 $25.98 $21.49
VACUUM BREAKER KIT SLOAN EACH no bid $1.20 $3.09 $3.13 $7.29
RAINBIRD BUBBLER 1/2" EACH no bid no bid $0.82 no bid no bid
WIRE NUT CONNECTORS PRO FILLED EACH no bid no bid $11.83 no bid no bid
DIAPHRAM RICHDALE 1" EACH no bid no bid $5.29 no bid no bid
DIAPHRAM WEATHERMATIC 1 1/2" EACH no bid no bid $9.63 no bid no bid
DIAPHRAM WEATHERMATIC 2" EACH no bid no bid $40.94 no bid no bid
ELBOW PVC 2" SCHEDULE 40 EACH $1.21 no bid $0.72 no bid $1.48
ELBOW PVC 3/4" SCHEDULE 40 EACH $0.23 no bid $0.15 no bid $0.31
ELBOW PVC 1" SCHEDULE 40 EACH $0.41 no bid $0.25 no bid $0.54
SPRINKLER HEAD RAINBIRD 1800 EACH no bid no bid $1.34 no bid no bid
SPRINKLER HEAD HUNTER PGP 3/4" EACH no bid no bid $11.00 no bid no bid
PLASTIC VALVE BOX ROUND 10" EACH no bid no bid $5.90 no bid $10.89
PLASTIC VALVE BOX ROUND 6" EACH no bid no bid $2.00 no bid $3.99
VALVE RICHDALE 2" EACH no bid no bid $75.63 no bid no bid
VALVE WEATHERMATIC 2" EACH no bid no bid $138.73 no bid no bid
VALVE WEATHERMATIC 1 1/2" EACH no bid no bid $69.00 no bid no bid
WEATHERMATIC SOLENOID 24 VOLTS (SPRINKLERS) EACH no bid no bid $42.00 no bid no bid
WEATHERMATIC SOLENOID 12 VOLTS (SPRINKLERS) EACH no bid no bid $45.63 no bid no bid
PLASTIC NIPPLE CUTOFF 1/2"X 6" EACH no bid no bid $0.47 no bid $0.19
PLASTIC NIPPLE CUTOFF 3/4" X 6" EACH no bid no bid $0.68 no bid $0.29
PIPE PVC 1/2 " X 20' SCHEDULE 40 EACH $2.39 no bid $3.19 no bid $3.39
PIPE PVC 1" X 20' SCHEDULE 40 EACH $4.41 no bid $6.19 no bid $6.99
PIPE PVC 3/4" X 20' SCHEDULE 40 EACH $2.62 no bid $4.16 no bid $4.39
PIPE PVC 2" X 20' SCHEDULE 40 EACH no bid no bid $11.94 no bid $14.99
LID FOR 10" ROUND PLASTIC VALVE BOX EACH no bid no bid $3.83 no bid no bid
LID FOR 6" ROUND PLASTIC VALVE BOX EACH no bid no bid $2.28 no bid no bid




