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UNITED INDEPENDENT SCHOOL DISTRICT
HVAC EQUIPMENT & SUPPLIES
RFP 058-2009

VENDORS

PERCENTAGE DISCOUNTS

AIRGAS REFRIGERANTS

BAKER DISTRIBUTION CO

TRANE

R&M REFRIGERATION SUPPLY

% Off Catalog Price 0% - 70%
% Off List Price 0% - Net - Call for Price 80%
% Off Shelf Price 0% 25% 40%
DESCRIPTION Unit Unit Cost | Brand & Item # Unit Cost Brand & Item # Unit Cost | Brand & Item # Unit Cost Brand & Item #
Run Capacitor 35/5, MFD, 5% 370 VAC EA $4.76 MARS NO BID $7.53 Global
Run Capaciotr 25 MFD, 5% 370VAC EA $4.41 MARS $8.72 CPT00160 GE $4.82 Global
Run Capacitor 35/5 mfd, 440VAC EA $4.76 MARS $18.48 CPT00977 $7.53 Global
Contactor 3 pole, 40FLA, 50A, 600VAC coil 24VAC EA $25.72 MARS $29.23 CTR01161 Simens $11.95 Fasco
Contactor 2 pole, 30A- coil 120VAC EA $55.00 MARS $12.76 CTR01147 Siemens $4.20 Fasco
Contactor 3 pole, 40A-600V, coil-120V EA $22.15 MARS $41.25 CTR02099 SF $11.98 Fasco
Coil Cleaner Non Acid GAL $9.75 Specialty Chemical NO BID $10.90 Virginia
Liquid line filter dryer, 3/8 SWEAT EA $14.94 ALCO $18.79 DHY00150 Emerson $12.30 Parker
Liquid line filter dryer, 1/2 ODF Solder EA $17.45 ALCO $19.58 DHY00152 Emerson $13.32 Parker
Liquid Line filter dryer, 5/8 ODF Solder EA NO BID $17.45 ALCO $21.75 DHY00154 Emerson $12.28 Parker
Transformer 40VA PR1 120/208/240V SEC 24V- EA $7.01 Best Tech $5.26 Smart Ele
Footmount NO BID
Fan Relay - SPNO/SPNC - 12A.cont 120vac-coil 24vac EA $5.80 Best Tech NO BID
Silver Brazing Alloy .050"x 1/8 sticks EA $58.72 J W Harris $75.57 ALY00001 Silfos $47.23 * | Harris
HVAC foil tape EA $12.39 Ideal $10.75 TAP00077 Diversitech NO BID
Electric motor 1HP, 1100rpm 380-415/460v-1ph 2.5 EA $297.60 Emerson $189.85 AO Smith
amps, 50/60Hz, frame 48Y shaft 0.5x3.1 flats NO BID
Blower motor 3/4hps, 1075rpm 3Spd, 227volts, 1PH, EA $85.58 Emerson $155.30 Fasco
3.3amps, 60Hz, frame 48YZ
Gas refrigerant R-22, 30lbs cylinder oL | s164.89 R22-30 $169.80 Du Pont $194.83 R2230 Aspen $160.00 * Genetron
Chlorodifluorometone
Dual element fuse FNM 6/10 EA
IR 35amp, 250vac & IR10Kamp, 125vac
NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Dual element low peak fuse EA
600vac & 300VDC
Brands that they supply are: They're pricing matrix (discounts) can be * commodity items which are subject
Arkema - "Forane", Dupont - "Freon", held for the yr but the book price on any to increase or decrease with world
Honeywell - "Genetron", & item can increase during the yr (trane market prices
NOTES Refron - "Refron" none usually has qtrly increases) currently stocking parts & supplies used

made exceptions to the districts contract

Information concerning warranty, liabil-

ity & imdemnification were included

freight will be added to the invoice

heavly by the district including
Carrier & Trane

3 VENDORS SUBMITTED A "NO BID"




