UNITED INDEPENDENT SCHOOL DISTRICT

LANDSCAPING MATERIALS & IRRIGATION INSTALLATION & SERVICE

RFP 053-2011

Vendors Olympia Landscape
Irrigation, Inc.
Est Qty | Description Unit Price

Section I. Annual Landscaping Materials

A 3" minimum caliper measured one foot above the beginning of the root system is required for this item

1-119 Live Oaks (Quercus Virginana) $300.00
120-200 Live Oaks (Quercus Virginana) $300.00
201-300 Live Oaks (Quercus Virginana) $300.00
301-400 Live Oaks (Quercus Virginana) $300.00
401-500 Live Oaks (Quercus Virginana) $300.00

A 4" minimum caliper measured one foot above the beginning of the root system is required for this item

1-119 Live Oaks (Quercus Virginana) $475.00
120-200 Live Oaks (Quercus Virginana) $475.00
201-300 Live Oaks (Quercus Virginana) $475.00
301-400 Live Oaks (Quercus Virginana) $475.00
401-500 Live Oaks (Quercus Virginana) $475.00

1000-2000 [Planting Pellets $0.25
2001-3000 |Planting Pellets $0.25
3001-4000 |Planting Pellets $0.25
4001-5000 |Planting Pellets $0.25

1-399 #419 Common Bermuda Grass (Pallets) $105.00
400-600 |#419 Common Bermuda Grass (Pallets) $105.00
601-1000 (#419 Common Bermuda Grass (Pallets) $105.00

1001-2000 |#419 Common Bermuda Grass (Pallets) $105.00
2001-3000 |#419 Common Bermuda Grass (Pallets) $105.00

1-149 Cellulose Fiber Mulch (50 Ib. Bag) $25.00
150-250 |Cellulose Fiber Mulch (50 Ib. Bag) $25.00
251-400 |Cellulose Fiber Mulch (50 Ib. Bag) $25.00
401-550 [Cellulose Fiber Mulch (50 Ib. Bag) $25.00
551-700 |Cellulose Fiber Mulch (50 Ib. Bag) $25.00

1-24 Numex Sahara Bermuda Seed (25 Ib. Bucket) No bid
25-49 Numex Sahara Bermuda Seed (25 Ib. Bucket) No bid
50-100 Numex Sahara Bermuda Seed (25 Ib. Bucket) No bid
101-200 [Numex Sahara Bermuda Seed (25 Ib. Bucket) No bid
201-300 |Numex Sahara Bermuda Seed (25 Ib. Bucket) No bid
150-250 Pine Bark in 3 Cubic ft. Bags $5.25
251-400 [Pine Bark in 3 Cubic ft. Bags $5.25
401-550 Pine Bark in 3 Cubic ft. Bags $5.25
551-700 |Pine Bark in 3 Cubic ft. Bags $5.25

1-40 Majestic Beauty Indian Hawthorn (3 Gal. Container) $25.00
41-100 Majestic Beauty Indian Hawthorn (3 Gal. Container) $25.00
101-200 [Majestic Beauty Indian Hawthorn (3 Gal. Container) $25.00
201-300 Majestic Beauty Indian Hawthorn (3 Gal. Container) $25.00
301-400 |Majestic Beauty Indian Hawthorn (3 Gal. Container) $25.00

1-40 Green Pittosporum (5 Gal. Container) $18.00

41-100 Green Pittosporum (5 Gal. Container) $18.00
101-200 [Green Pittosporum (5 Gal. Container) $18.00
201-300 |[Green Pittosporum (5 Gal. Container) $18.00
301-400 |Green Pittosporum (5 Gal. Container) $18.00

1-24 Water Soluble Fertilizer (25 Ib. Bag) $19.00

25-50 Water Soluble Fertilizer (25 Ib. Bag) $19.00

51-100 Water Soluble Fertilizer (25 Ib. Bag) $19.00
101-200 [Water Soluble Fertilizer (25 Ib. Bag) $19.00
201-300 [Water Soluble Fertilizer (25 Ib. Bag) $19.00

Labor Cost per tree installation $75.00
Nursery/Floral Registration Number 478445




Section Il. Irrigation Parts & Supplies

Olympia Landscape
Irrigation, Inc.

Description

1” Dv-1 1Ps auto valve

2" RPP back flow preventer

24 HR timer 277V

Outdoor Transformer for mark-230 weather-matic

Toro version 2(12station outdoor plastic cabinet)

Hunter PGP-Adjustable pop up rotor

34/" x 6" PE multi nipple

ESP-LX-12. 12station outdoor timer

ESP-LX-20. 20station outdoor timer

ESP-LX-24. 24station outdoor timer

Pump start relay

Electrode sensor

B/W controls Cat. 1500. G-L157-N1-X

Pump starter w/pump projection

PVC 90* Elbow 3/4" 5x5

PVC 90 elbow 3/4" SXTH

PVC 45* street elbow 3/4" slip

PVC 90* elbow 1" 5x5

PVC tee 1" 5x5x5

Solenoid for weather-matic 110V

Nozzle tees low angle for hunter PGP

10" valve cover

10" Valve box w/lid

5 HP irrigation pump 100GPM

1-40 hunter head plastic riser

1-40 hunter head steel riser

1-20 hunter head 360* pop up rotor

2" weather-matic diaphragm

Square meter box

12F full circle nozzle

12H 1/2 circle nozzle

12Q 1/4 circle nozzle

8H 1/2 circle nozzle

8Q 1/4 circle nozzle

10H 1/2 circle nozzle

10Q 1/4 circle nozzle

1 ¥," x 1 bushing PVC

30 station lawn mate weather-matic timers

24 station master valve activator

SVAWC super vee handy electric

Galvanized plugs 2"

2" weather-matic 2100 sel. Valve

1" rain bird valve

Toro bubblers 1/2"

PVC pipe sch40 bell end 1 1/4" x 20"

PVC pipe sch40 bell end 1" x 20"

PVC pipe sch40 bell end 3/4" x 20"

PVC pipe sch40 bell end 1 1/2" x 20"

PVC bushing 1 1/2" x 3/4" 5x5

PVC bushing 1 1/4" x 1" 5x5

PVC bushing 1 1/4" x 3/4" 5x5

PVC tee 1 1/4" 5x5x5

PVC bushing 1" X 3/4" 5x5

PVC tee 3/4" 5x5x5

PVC tee 2" 5x5x5

PVC pipe sch 40 1/2" X 20" bell end

14-1 red UF wire

14-1 white UF wire

# 1804 rain bird spray head

Cut off nipple 1/2"

No bid




Section Il. Irrigation Parts & Supplies Cont.

Description

Olympia Landscape
Irrigation, Inc.

ESP-4 station outdoor timer

ESP-6 station outdoor timer

PVC 90* elbow 1/2" SXTH

Copper 2" male adapter

Copper 2" elbow 90*

PVC female adapter 2"

15-sst nozzles for rain bird

No bid
PVC glue
PVC primer
1-25 adjustable rotor w/nozzle
Richdale diaphragms
Richdale solenoids
Kingwire Connectors (bags of 20ct.)
Marking flags
Labor Cost per man hour for irrigation service $38.00
Section lll. Percentage Discount
% Off Catalog Price N/A
% Off List Price N/A

% Off Shelf Price

N/A




