
VENDORS

DESCRIPTION

% Discount

UNIT EXT UNIT EXT UNIT EXT UNIT EXT UNIT EXT UNIT EXT

160 9R22.5 $215.00 $34,400.00 $248.48 $39,756.80 $240.58 $38,492.80 $254.00 $40,640.00 $323.06 $51,689.60 $276.10 $44,176.00

Brand 

160 10r22.5 $240.00 $38,400.00 $270.80 $43,328.00 $261.92 $41,907.20 $248.00 $39,680.00 $295.51 $47,281.60 $293.17 $46,907.20

Brand

180 11R22.5 $257.00 $46,260.00 $282.33 $50,819.40 $274.33 $49,379.40 $269.00 $48,420.00 $329.39 $59,290.20 $295.91 $53,263.80

Brand

150 1000R20 $291.00 $43,650.00 $342.04 $51,306.00 $272.32 $40,848.00 $260.00 $39,000.00 $402.05 $60,307.50

Brand

50 1000R20 TUBE $20.00 $1,000.00 $20.62 $1,031.00 $23.00 $1,150.00 $28.00 $1,400.00 $20.00 $1,000.00 $32.00 $1,600.00

Brand

50 205/75R 15 $69.33 $3,466.50 $81.65 $4,082.50 $46.32 $2,316.00 $77.00 $3,850.00 $64.07 $3,203.50

Brand

50 235/75R 15 $78.30 $3,915.00 $89.22 $4,461.00 $53.18 $2,659.00 $80.00 $4,000.00 $93.59 $4,679.50 $69.97 $3,498.50

Brand

160 225/60R 16 $68.91 $11,025.60 $79.26 $12,681.60 $63.02 $10,083.20 $76.00 $12,160.00 $77.53 $12,404.80 $76.80 $12,288.00

Brand

160 LT225/75R 16 $99.50 $15,920.00 $90.79 $14,526.40 $86.79 $13,886.40 $86.00 $13,760.00 $101.14 $16,182.40 $107.28 $17,164.80

Brand

180 235/70R 16 $92.50 $16,650.00 $88.39 $15,910.20 $118.11 $21,259.80 $89.00 $16,020.00 $116.20 $20,916.00 $88.63 $15,953.40

Brand

150 235/75R 16 $109.92 $16,488.00 $93.00 $13,950.00 $117.18 $17,577.00 $87.00 $13,050.00 $102.04 $15,306.00 $95.65 $14,347.50

Brand Goodyear USA

Misc Not USA

Goodyear USA

Goodyear USA

Goodyear USA

Goodyear USA

No Bid
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50 235/85R 16 $133.00 $6,650.00 $100.36 $5,018.00 $97.36 $4,868.00 $95.40 $4,770.00 $114.36 $5,718.00 $115.41 $5,770.50

Brand

50 LT245/75R16 $134.00 $6,700.00 $96.55 $4,827.50 $93.55 $4,677.50 $91.30 $4,565.00 $123.39 $6,169.50 $114.27 $5,713.50

Brand

50 235/55R17 $95.00 $4,750.00 $90.27 $4,513.50 $162.60 $8,130.00 $86.80 $4,340.00 $93.34 $4,667.00 $105.75 $5,287.50

Brand

50 245/75R17 $145.00 $7,250.00 $103.19 $5,159.50 $105.15 $5,257.50 $97.50 $4,875.00 $123.39 $6,169.50 $144.43 $7,221.50

Brand

50 245/75R22.5 $265.00 $13,250.00 $284.88 $14,244.00 $276.88 $13,844.00 $270.00 $13,500.00 $300.00 $15,000.00 $233.69 $11,684.50

Brand

50 255/70R22.5 $210.00 $10,500.00 $251.03 $12,551.50 $243.00 $12,150.00 $237.00 $11,850.00 $293.99 $14,699.50 $285.86 $14,293.00

Brand

50 235/70R17 $126.55 $6,327.50 $99.00 $4,950.00 $136.99 $6,849.50 $94.50 $4,725.00 $132.63 $6,631.50 $120.48 $6,024.00

Brand

50 255/70R16 $119.12 $5,956.00 $97.57 $4,878.50 $126.91 $6,345.50 $92.50 $4,625.00 $142.31 $7,115.50 $102.77 $5,138.50

Brand

50 265/70R17 $125.90 $6,295.00 $114.96 $5,748.00 $116.58 $5,829.00 $104.50 $5,225.00 $119.11 $5,955.50 $121.81 $6,090.50

Brand

50 7.50-16 $86.00 $4,300.00 $143.76 $7,188.00 $91.86 $4,593.00 $97.80 $4,890.00 $218.03 $10,901.50 $139.20 $6,960.00

Brand

50 7.00-15 $70.00 $3,500.00 $110.49 $5,524.50 $74.80 $3,740.00 $80.40 $4,020.00 $145.85 $7,292.50 $120.84 $6,042.00

Brand

50 20.5X800-10 $44.00 $2,200.00 $80.23 $4,011.50 $50.00 $2,500.00 $69.30 $3,465.00 $77.00 $3,850.00

Brand

50 225/70R15 $79.55 $3,977.50 $85.64 $4,282.00 $107.38 $5,369.00 $74.00 $3,700.00 $83.14 $4,157.00 $83.53 $4,176.50
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VENDORS

DESCRIPTION

% Discount

UNIT EXT UNIT EXT UNIT EXT UNIT EXT UNIT EXT UNIT EXT

WINGFOOT

See Attached

A TO Z TIRE            SOUTHERN TIRE MART

0% See AttEST.      
QTY

GCR TIRE

5%

TCI

10%

AMERICAN TIRE

5-30%

50 225/70R16 $90.00 $4,500.00 $87.80 $4,390.00 $111.41 $5,570.50 $83.00 $4,150.00 $101.62 $5,081.00 $84.92 $4,246.00

Brand

50 225/70R19.5 $158.00 $7,900.00 $220.98 $11,049.00 $214.31 $10,715.50 $195.00 $9,750.00 $229.44 $11,472.00 $278.53 $13,926.50

Brand

50 18X8.5-8 $28.00 $1,400.00 $40.59 $2,029.50 $30.00 $1,500.00 $37.50 $1,875.00 $39.00 $1,950.00

Brand

50 235/75/R16 $109.92 $5,496.00 $93.00 $4,650.00 $106.91 $5,345.50 $88.20 $4,410.00 $102.04 $5,102.00 $95.65 $4,782.50

Brand

50 23X8.5-12 $35.50 $1,775.00 $57.90 $2,895.00 $46.00 $2,300.00 $52.00 $2,600.00 $66.50 $3,325.00

Brand

Note:
Southern Tire Mart: additional disposal fees for Tires, $5.00 for Truck, $1.50 for Light Truck, and $1.00 for Passenger
Wingfoot Tire:  Will not adhear to all RFP Requirements, They have some Deviations. They Have deviations to Insurance Requirements, and Indemnification

$50.00 11R22.5

0.00 all other sizes

$0.00

$0.00

Not Stated

No Bid

Goodyear USA

Dunlop USA

Goodyear USA

No Bid

$0.00

Once a Week

$0.00

LIGHT DUTY 
TRUCKS & BUSES

Frequency       
of pick up

Once a week 

$3.50/Tire on all rim 
diameters less than 20"

$0.00

Bi weekly or as requested 
by UISD

$0.00

HEAVY DUTY 
TRUCK & BUSES

HEAVY DUTY 
TRUCK & BUSES

$0.00
$6.50/ Tire on all 20" and 

larger rim diameters

$0.00

$0.00
LIGHT DUTY 
TRUCKS & 

BUSES

Monthly

$0.00 All other Tires

$6.50/ Tire on all 20" and 
larger rim diameters

$30.00 11R22.5

$3.50/Tire on all rim 
diameters less than 20"

$0.00

Amount to be paid to UISD per discarded tire picked up by vendor

$45.00 Recappable ( less than 4 
years old)

BF Goodrich USA

Samson China Firestone USA Firestone USA

Falken Japan Firestone USA

Kenda China Deestone Deestone China

Cooper USA Firestone USA Firestone USA

Carlisle USA

Kenda China Deestone Deestone China

Firestone USA BF Goodrich USA

Carlisle USA

Carlisle USA

BF Goodrich USA

$50.00 11R22.5 & 
11R24.5

No Bid

FRS USA

BRS USA

FRS USA

Carlisle USA

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00


