
Cost per 

item Model # 

Cost per 

item Model # 

Cost per 

item Model # 

Bases $185.71 $185.00 BBB1SEPR

Pitcher Rubber $94.27 $85.00 BBPR4WAY

Home Plates $65.70 $100.00 BBHPSAFE
Anchors $24.00 BBANCHOR

Hoses $225.00 02307K

$285.00 BBDLM654

$100.00

Free with 

30 cases of 

paint 

purchase
% Off product list

SECTION II MAINTENANCE: 

VENDORS 

COST OF SERVICE PER SQUARE FT 0-20,000ft

20,001ft -

86,000ft 0-20,000ft

20,001ft -

86,000ft 0-20,000ft

20,001ft -

86,000ft

AERA-VATION: $500.00 $0.005
DEEP TINE AERIFICATION $770.00 $0.020
LAZER GRADING $0.16 $0.12
TILLING $570.00 $0.06
SOD REMOVAL $0.18 $0.12
SOD INSTALLATION $0.18 $0.15

COST OF SERVICE PER ACRE: 1/2-1 ACRE 1-2 ACRES 1/2-1 ACRE 1-2 ACRES 1/2-1 ACRE 1-2 ACRES
FIELD LEVELING $0.06 $0.05
OVERSEEDING W/BERMUDA $400.00 $350.00
OVERSEEDING W/PERENNIAL RYE $400.00 $350.00

PEST CONTROL APPLICATION
ALLECTUS ACRES COST

BANVEL 1 $140.00
BARRICADE (21OZ  PER ACRE) 1.5 $165.00
CELSIUS - LOW RATE (2.5OZ PER 

ACRE)
CELSIUS - MED RATE (3.7OZ PER 

ACRE) 2 $190.00
CELSIUS - HIGH RATE (4.9OZ PER 

ACRE) 2.5 $215.00
CERTAINTY
CONFRONT 3 $240.00
DRIVE 1/2 GAL PER ACRE 3.5 $265.00
DYLOX WETTABLE POWDER
END RUN (1 1/2 QTS PER ACRE)
MANOR 4 $290.00
MONUMENT (15 GRAMS PER ACRE) 4.5 $315.00
MSMA
MSMS/SENCOR 75
MSMA/SENCOR 75/TRIMEC 5 $340.00
MSMA/SENCOR 

75/TRIMEC/CERTAINTY 5.5 $365.00
PENDULUM
PRINCEP 6 $390.00
PRINCEP/TRIMEC 6.5 $415.00
REVOLVER
ROUND UP 1% 7 $440.00
ROUND UP 2% 7.5 $465.00
ROUND UP 3%
ROUND UP/SAHARA (1QT-5LB/55 

GAL) 8 $490.00
SPEEDZONE (3 PINTS PER ARCE) 8.5 $515.00
SUFLAN
TALSTAR 1/2 OZ/1000 SQ FT 9 $540.00
TALSTAR 1OZ/1000 SQ FT 9.5 $565.00

10 $590.00

Ewing Irrigation

VENDORS Brand

MacGregor Major League 
MacGregor 4 way pitcher 

rubber
MacGregor in ground 

waffle style

BASEBALL
MANICURE INFIELD

No bid

Ewing Irrigation

86,000ft and up

No bid
2-UP ACRES

0%

LABOR COST PER TRIP

TRIMEC SOUTHERN (1QT/ACRE)

TRAVEL CHARGES N/A

White line 1"x 100ft vinyl 

big league 

Justin Seed Company Texas Multi Chem Ltd.

Brand Brand
MacGregor set of 3 

w/anchors

MacGregor 

Alumagoal 4 wheel 65# 

capacity dry line marker

Justin Seed Company Texas Multi Chem Ltd.

Seymour 4 wheel paint 

striper

SECTION I SUPPLIES & EQUIPMENT

SOFTBALL

MacGregor Wood Backed 
MacGregor  set of 3

86,000ft and up 86,000ft and up

$0.05
$0.10
$0.13

$0.005
$0.017
$0.11

BASEBALL SOFTBALL BASEBALL SOFTBALL
$300.00No bid

$325.00
No bid
No bid

2-UP ACRES 2-UP ACRES
$0.05

$325.00
No bid

$50.00

$27.00

$39.00

LABOR COST PER TRIP

CHEMICAL COST PER 

ACRE LABOR COST PER TRIP

$38.00

$136.00
$193.00

$90.00

$52.00
$132.00
$49.00

$195.00
$35.00
$27.00

$17.00
$38.00
$63.00

$84.00
$138.00

$470.00

$54.00
$134.00
$42.00

$45.00

$28.00

$35.00
$65.00
$34.00

$202.00

$130.00N/A

CHEMICAL COST PER 

ACRE

CHEMICAL COST PER 

ACRE

No bid No bid

$122.50

$20.00

UNITED INDEPENDENT SCHOOL DISTRICT

ATHLETIC TURF CARE MAINTENANCE 

RFP 048-2011

$650.00

Marking Equipment $148.00

World Class Stripe 

Machine

No Bid

No bid
No bid
No bid

0%

No bid

1%

No bidNo bid



VENDORS 

COST OF SERVICE PER YARD 0-20yd 21yd -60yd 60yd - 79yd 80yd + 0-20yd 21yd -60yd

60yd - 

79yd 80yd + 0-20yd 21yd -60yd 60yd - 79yd 80yd +
TOP DRESSING $500.00 $12.00 $12.00 $11.00
COST OF SERVICE PER SIZE LOAD 0-10 ton 11-15 ton 0-10 ton 11-15 ton 0-10 ton 11-15 ton
INSTALL INFIELD CONDITIONER $845.00 $920.00

DIAMOND PRO INFIELD 

CONDITIONER
50 lb bag
10 ton
15 ton
25 ton 
DIAMOND PRO MOUND CLAY
50 lb bag
10 ton
15 ton
25 ton 
SANDY LOAM PIT SAND 
50 lb bag
10 ton
15 ton
25 ton 

RED INFIELD SAND CLAY MIX 
50 lb bag
10 ton
15 ton
25 ton 

COST PER SQ FT. 0-20,000ft

20,0001ft - 

86,000ft 0-20,000ft20,0001ft - 86,000ft 0-20,000ft20,0001ft - 86,000ft
SOD HYDRID BERMUDA/TIFWAY 

SPORT $0.42 $0.39
SOD HYDRID BERMUDA/TIFWAY 

SPORT 419 $0.41 $0.38
SOD/SEAISLES PASPALUM

COST PER SQ FT. 1/2 ac.-1ac 1 ac.-2 ac 1/2 ac.-1ac 1 ac.-2 ac 1/2 ac.-1ac 1 ac.-2 ac
SPRIG/TIFWAY 419 $0.18 $0.12
SPRIG/TIF-SPORT $0.19 $0.13
COMMON BERMUDA SEED 
25 lb bag
50 lb bag
JACKPOT TRIANGLE BERMUDA SEED
25 lb bag $190.00
50 lb bag
21-3-12 SLOW RELEASE FERTILIZER 
25 lb bag
50 lb bag
20-5-10 SLOW RELEASE FERTILIZER 
25 lb bag
50 lb bag
24-4-15 SLOW RELEASE FERTILIZER 
25 lb bag
50 lb bag
15-15-15 FERTILIZER
25 lb bag
50 lb bag
10-20-10 STARTER FERTILIZER 
25 lb bag
50 lb bag
33-0-0 FERTILIZER (N & IRON)
25 lb bag
50 lb bag
22-0-6 W/PENDAMETHLIN PRE-

EMERGENT
25 lb bag
50 lb bag

8-2-32 W/RONSTAR G & BARRICADE 
25 lb bag
50 lb bag
15-5-10 W.SURFAN:
25 lb bag
50 lb bag
PELLETIZED GYPSUM PELLETS
25 lb bag
50 lb bag
SOUTHERN GREEN PERENNIAL RYE
25 lb bag
50 lb bag
FUTURA 2000 PERENNIAL RYE
25 lb bag
50 lb bag
FUTURA TEE & FAIRWAY PERENNIAL 

RYE:
25 lb bag
50 lb bag

Notes:

MATERIAL COST PER WT. 

No bid

INSTALLATION OR OTHER GROUND 

WORK LABOR RATE PER HOUR

15 ton+ 

MATERIAL COST PER WT. 
No bid

$184.47

2 ac. And up

No bid

No bid

Prices for fertilizer are subject to change with 30day 

written notice due to market fluctuations.

Prices for Diamond Pro subject to change  Jan. 1, 

2012 due to manufacturer new price list. 

No bid
$28.00

No bid

No bid

No bid

$17.80

No bid

No bid

No bid

No bid

No bid

$6,600.00

No bid

No bid

$19.60

86,0001ft and up

No bid

No bid

No bid

No bid

$7.36

25% Uflexx 

No bid

$995.00
MATERIAL COST PER WT. MATERIAL COST PER WT. 

$10.50

No bid
15 ton+ 15 ton+ 

No bid

No bid

$2,820.00
$3,330.00
$4,176.00

No bid

$48.00

No bid

$70.00

No bid

No bid

$12.50

No bid

86,0001ft and up 86,0001ft and up

$0.36

$0.35
Not available

2 ac. And up 2 ac. And up

No bid

$0.12
$0.13

MATERIAL COST PER WT. MATERIAL COST PER WT. 
No bid

$67.25 Pro tour

$82.50 15-15-10 Promate

$106.75

$89.00
$161.75

Sahara Bermuda Seed
Sahara Bermuda Seed

No bid
$196.75 $250.00 *sold in 5lb bag

No bid

$11.38 No bid
$22.08

$12.20 No bid
$23.70

Texas Multi Chem Ltd.

$11.74 No bid

$11.14 No bid
$21.58

$20.35 $24.00 18-1-10 N & Iron

$10.82 No bid
$20.93

21-0-10 Tough Turf

$25.15 14-6-8 Fast Start

$24.80 10-12-8 Sprout

$10.53 No bid

$22.78

No bid

20-0-10 Greenkeeper

$24.85 20-0-8 Grandstand

$29.50

No bid
$41.50

No bid

No bid

Bermuda Triangle sold in 7.6lb bag

$28.50

Justin Seed Company

No bid

$16.00

No bid

No bid

$37.50 Pro tour

No bid

$67.25 Pro tour

$37.50 Pro tour

$64.00 Super Sport Perenial Rye

No bid

No bid $60.00 -$100.00 per hr depending on equipment 

used

$37.50 Pro tour
$67.25 Pro tour

No bid

No bid

No bid

No bid

No bid

Sub: Turface MVP 

Conditioner

Sub: Turface Mound Clay

$10.37
$4,400.00

$11,000.00

$17.13
$6,852.00

$10,278.00
$17,130.00

Ewing Irrigation


