UNITED INDEPENDENT SCHOOL DISTRICT

FOOD BAGGING SUPPLIES
RFP NO. 047-2011

VENDORS

SECTION | - BAGS

Ekono-Pac, Inc.

Flavorseal, LLC

M & Q Packaging Corporation

Plascon Packaging Inc.

BREAD BAGS

UNIT (CASE) PRICE EXT.PRICE

UNIT (CASE) PRICE EXT.PRICE

UNIT (CASE) PRICE EXT.PRICE

UNIT (CASE) PRICE EXT.PRICE

1]100| Cs

Polyprogylene Clear Bags Unprinted
10-1/2" x 18" - 4Bg x .001

Wicket pack poly bags

1000 ct. / CTN or equal

$62.00

Polyethelene

$6,200.00

- No Bid

- No Bid

- No Bid

FLAVOR SEAL BAGS

2]125]| Cs

Flavorseal bags or Equal

10" x 18", Barrier | Clipped
Cold-100 F, Hot + 250 F

4.5 Mil., 400 CT./ CS or Equal

- No Bid

$86.00 $2,150.00

$117.50
Case of 500

$2,937.50

$90.40
104S-18CLB

$2,260.00

Flavorseal bags or Equal

10" x 24" (1 gal), Barrier | Clipped,
Cold-100 F, Hot + 250 F

4.5 Mil., 400 CT./ CS or Equal

- No Bid

$96.00 $2,400.00

$123.60
Case of 500

$3,090.00

$106.80
104S-24CLB

$2,670.00

Flavorseal bags or Equal

10" x 30" (2 gal), Barrier | Clipped
Cold-100 F, Hot + 250 F

4.5 Mil., 400 CT./ CS or Equal

- No Bid

$112.80 $11,280.00

$113.30
Case of 400

$11,330.00

$125.20
104S-30CLB

$12,520.00

Cold Bags or Equal
Non Vent 6" x 8"

5000 ct. / CS or Equal

1-20 EA $105.00 $7,875.00

21-50 ea $95.00 $7,125.00

51+ $90.00 $4,590.00

- No Bid

- No Bid

- No Bid

SECTION Il - SUPPLIES: SPOOLS, TIES, & CLIPS

1 5 ]Cs

Plas-Ties

Part #312B ir Equal
2000 x 5/32" per roll
5 rolls per case

- No Bid

- No Bid

- No Bid

- No Bid

Label Tape for Kiwi Model #T105 or Equal

2.5" TYVEK Label Tape
12 Rolls/CS

- No Bid

$123.00 $1,845.00

$177.00 $2,655.00

$109.80 $1,647.00

UNITS

Tie-Matic Machine Spools #312 or Equal
5/32" width x 2000" ; One 24 Gauge wire
4800 Closures / SPL

- No Bid

- No Bid

- No Bid

- No Bid

C & K Clips #CL4100H or Equal
Soup Clips
24,960/ CS

- No Bid

$443.75 $4,437.50

$500.00
25 M Per Case

$5,000.00

$426.82 $4,268.16




