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Section II.

Interboro Medical
Audio Conney Safety ICS Jail Packaging William V. Shipment | Moore Medical |Prime Source School Kids School Nurse South Texas
VENDORS Alert Services | Electronics Inc Products Health Edco | Henry Schein | Supplies Inc. Corp MacGill & Co. LLC LLC Services LLC] School Health Health Supply Medical
Brand /Amt Brand /Amt Brand /Amt Brand /Amt Brand /Amt Brand /Amt Brand Brand /Amt Brand /Amt Brand /Amt Brand /Amt Brand /Amt Brand /Amt Brand /Amt| Brand
Unit Unit I Unit Unit | /Amt per Unit Unit IAmt per
Price per BX/ Price per BX/ Unit Price per BX/  JUnit Price| per BX/ JUnit Price| per BX/ Price per BX/ Price BX/ PKG/ Unit Price| per BX/ Price per BX/ |Unit Price| per BX/ Price per BX/  JUnit Price per BX/ Unit Price per BX/ Unit Price per BX/ | Unit Price BX/ PKG/
PKG/ CS PKG/ CS PKG/ CS PKG/ CS PKG/ CS PKG/ CS cs PKG/ CS PKG/ CS PKG/ CS PKG/ CS PKG/ CS PKG/ CS PKG/ CS cs
DESCRIPTION
BAND-AIDS
Derma Moore Dynarex Curad
Flex-Band Sciences Economy #68188 50/box Dynarex 50pk
Extra Large 50/pk $7.00 /50 pk $6.30 50/bx $3.25 Dynarex $2.78 50/bx $2.10 Sheer $3.99 32044 $4.07 #3614 $3.09 50/bx $8.50 2"x4"
Dynarex
Fingertip Flexi Fabric 100/pk Flex-Band Dynarex MacGill Nutramax dynamex 100/box Dynarex
Regular size $7.00 /100 pk $7.45 100/bx $3.86 [ Soft Flex $5.21 100/bx $3.20 68269 $3.83 32248 $2.99 #3617 $4.59 100/bx No bid
Conco Dynarex
Fingertip Flexi Fabric 100/pk Flex-Band Derma Soft Flex MacGill Nutramax 32153 100/box Dynarex
Large size $7.00 /100 pk No bid $9.80 100/bx No bid $3.76 50/bx No bid No bid $6.46 100/bx No bid $3.65 68268 No bid $3.65 50/pk $4.20 #3618 $4.49 50/bx
Dynarex
Flex-Band Dynarex MacgGill Nutramax 100/box Dynarex Curad
Knuckle Flexi Fabric 100/pk | $6.00 /100 pk $7.60 100/bx $3.58 | Soft Flex $4.23 100/bx $2.50 72881 $5.50 32230 $3.73 #3619 $4.49 100/bx $12.50 100/pk
White
Cross
Flex-Band Derma MacaGill Nutramax 1500/cs Dynarex Medline
Regular Size 1500/cs $5.00 | /1500 cs $57.70 1500/bx No bid $32.46 | 1500/bx $15.80 09684 $34.09 32071 $25.17 |#1314000| $24.79 1500/bx | $36.00 | 1200/cs
ACE BANDAGES/DRESSINGS
Dynarex Dynarex
Alert Hartmann Economy Cypress per roll rolls 4.5 ACE per
2" X 5 Yards $8.00 10/box $1.65 Conco $0.60 roll $0.20 83637 $0.70 31006 $0.30 #0620 $0.57 yds $5.00 roll
Dynarex Dynarex
Alert Hartmann Economy Cypress per roll rolls 4.5 ACE per
3" X 5 Yards $10.00 10/box No bid $2.25 Conco No bid 15% off. catalog No bid No bid $0.69 roll No bid $0.25 83638 No bid $0.80 31007 $0.43 #0630 $0.64 yds $6.15 roll
price Dynarex Dynarex
Alert Hartmann Economy Cypress per roll rolls 4.5 ACE per
4" X5 Yards $16.00 10/box $2.55 Conco $0.97 roll $0.30 83639 $1.20 31008 $0.56 #0640 $0.84 yds $7.85 roll
Dynarex Dynarex
Hartmann Economy per roll rolls 4.5
4" X 6 Yards $3.00 each $4.10 Conco $1.43 roll No bid $1.80 31009 $0.82 #0660 $1.10 yds No bid
COBAN
3M 3M 35357 Coban Coban
30roll/bx 30/bx 31022 Coban roll 5/pk
1" - Pack of 5 Rolls $50.50 | $1.68 roll $6.45 | $1.29/roll $23.70| $.79roll $8.25 [ $1.65/roll $0.90 #1581 $1.20 Coban $10.00 [$2.00 roll
3M 3M 35350 Coban Coban
36roll/bx 36/bx 31014 Coban roll 5/pk
" o
2" - Pack of 5 Rolls No bid No bid $110.25 | $3.06 roll No bid 15% (;frficc:ta\og No bid No bid $11.10 | $2.22/roll No bid $51.90| $1.44/roll No bid $13.15 | $2.63/roll $1.66 #1582 $2.04 Coban $18.00 [$3.60/roll
3M 3M 35349 Coban Coban
24rolllbx 24/bx 31015 Coban roll 5/pk
3" - Pack of 5 Rolls $92.70 | $3.86 roll $13.45 | $2.68/roll $43.45| $1.81 roll $15.60 | $3.12/roll $2.08 #1583 $2.29 Coban $22.00 [$4.40/roll
3M 3M 35348 Coban Coban
18roll/bx 18/bx 31016 Coban roll 5/pk
4" - Pack of 5 Rolls $88.60 | $4.92 roll $16.70 | $3.34/roll $40.80| $2.27/roll $19.15 | $3.83/roll $2.60 #1584 $2.64 Coban $26.00 [$5.20/roll
ELASTIC GAUZE BAND.
Hartmann Cypress Dynarex
Conco 15% off catalog Duform 80872 #3102 Flexicon
2" - bag of 12 $7.95 | Flexicon No bid $5.85 12/bag No bid price No bid No bid $2.33 | 12/bag No bid $0.75 | nonsterile No bid $2.85 27545 $1.17 12/bag $4.79 12/bag No bid
GAUZE
Moore Dynarex
Alert Dukal MacGill 08251 #3353 Dynarex Curad
3" x 3" - 100 per bx $6.00 10/box No bid $10.90 100/bx No bid $3.64 H.SI No bid No bid 511 100/bx No bid $3.15 | sterile No bid $5.61 27543 $3.12 100/bx $3.45 100/bx | $11.50 [ 200/bx




Audio Interboro
Electronics | Conney Safety ICS Jail Packaging William V. Medical Moore Medical | Prime Source School Kids School Nurse South Texas
VENDORS Alert Services Inc Products Health Edco | Henry Schein | Supplies Inc. Corp MacGill & Co. | Shipment LLC LLC Services LLC | School Health Health Supply Medical
unie |Brand Am Ll Brand /Amt] L | Brand AAme | :(?m Unit | Brand /Amt Brand /Amt| L | Brand /Amt Brand /Amt Brand /Amt Brand /Amt Brand /Amt Brand /Amt Brand /Amt Brand /Amt Brand /Amt
Prr“c'e per BX/ Prr“c'e per BX/ Prr“c'e per BX/ PKG/ Prr“c'e BXTPEZ/ pr"c‘e perBx/ | UnitPrice | per BX/ pr"c‘e perx/ |unitprice| perBx/ | unitPrice | perBx/ |unit Price| perBx/ |unit Price| perBx/ JunitPrice| perBx/ | Unit Price |per Bx/ PKG/junit Price| per Bx/  funit Price| per BX/
DESCRIPTION PKG/ CS PKG/ CS cs cs ! PKG/ CS PKG/ CS ! PKG/ CS PKG/ CS PKG/ CS PKG/ CS PKG/ CS PKG/ CS cs PKG/ CS PKG/ CS
TELFA PADS
Kendall
08668
Gulf South Non Tezfa White
Medium 2 x 3- 10 per bg / 100 Alert Medical Dukal MacGill adhera #1961 Cross Non Kendall
per bx $7.00 | 100/box No bid $18.90 100/bx No bid $5.02 100/bx No bid No bid $5.32 100/bx No bid $7.70 100/bx No bid $12.02 27529 $8.82 100/bx $5.40 | Adhesive | $3.50 10/box
Kendall
08669
Gulf South Non Tezfa White
Large 3x4- 10 per bg / 100 per Alert Medical Dukal MacGill adhera #1050 Cross Non Kendall
bx $9.00 | 100/box $28.85 100/bx $7.46 100/bx $8.60 100/bx $12.40 | 100/bx $18.65 27530 $7.31 50/bx $9.95 | Adhesive | $32.50 100/bx
BLOOD PRESSURE CUFFS - PROFESSIONAL SPHYGMONAMOMETERS
ADC Mabis
Adult (10.75 TO 15.75) $29.95 Mabis $29.50 Mabis $7.40 | Medsource $20.45 | economy | $29.00 ADC760 $8.85 66297 $19.14 56134 $11.22 | ADC #775A $27.00 Medline
ADC Mabis
Pediatric (7" TO 10.75) $19.95 | Mabis $34.40 Mabis $7.40 | Medsource $20.45 | economy | $29.00 | ADC7601 | $8.85 66298 $19.14 56133 $11.22 |ADC #775C]| $45.00 Medline
. . . . ADC Mabis .
Obese (13.75 TO 19.5) $35.95 | Mabis No bid $34.40 | Mabis No bid $8.23 | Medsource No bid No bid $27.46 | economy | $35.00 | ADC760x | $11.55 | 6307 No bid $22.70 | 56135 | $11.22 |ADC #775x No bid $39.00 | Medline
Mabis ADC Mabis
Gauge - F part $22.95 | Mabis $22.00 | #05230010 No bid $11.07 | MacGill $15.99 | ADCBO8N | $4.95 72829 $11.53 56165 $7.31 | ADC #809N| $20.00 Medline
Mabis o bl ADC Mabis
Bulb $12.95 Mabis $4.90 | #05285000 $8.23 MacGill $2.49 ADC873 $0.90 66310 $5.70 56166 $3.10 ADC #875 $11.00 Medline
DISINFECTANTS
Metrex 1 gal.
Cavicide Envirocide
Surface Envirocide #30124
Envirocide Refill - 1 gallon $31.55 | Disinfectant $23.72 $19.50 | #53858 $26.48 34194 $23.47 gallon $24.38 | Envirocide | $54.00 | Envirocide
Metrex 24 oz 15% off catalog price No bid
Cavicide Envirocide
Envirocide Spray Bottle - 24 surface Envirocide #30024 24 Envirocide
oz No bid $12.25 | disinfectant $7.30 $6.65 | 53857 $8.86 50062 $8.16 oz. $7.31 240z. | $18.50 | Envirocide
Welch
Welch Welch Allyn| Welch Allyn
755778 Allyn 53021 #52432-U Allyn 850/25pkg/
Di Specular 2.75mm Discontinued $1.29 34 tube $22.20 | 850/bag $1.55 34/bx $1.02 34/sleeve | $1.24 34/tube | $78.00 cs
Hospital Hospital ICS Naturelle Gard #4 - Capri/Medli
Feminine Gards - 250 /cs Size Specialty Co. Spec. 250/cs Nature 16 No bid 22003 147A Naturelle ne 180/cs
$65.30 250/cs $46.64 250/cs $30.60 #250IM $49.76 250/cs $53.36 250/cs $38.27 250/cs $51.50 250/cs $48.00 9"
Ear Ease Ear Ease
Ear Ease single No bid No bid No bid No bid $7.30 No bid No bid $7.97 37016 $5.62 #1246 $6.94 FMI No bid
Coverlet Cypress Dukal
BSN economy Dual Med 27023 #D841 Dynarex Curad
Eye Pads - 50 per bx $7.95 20/bx $11.80 | Dukal 50/bx $6.50 50/bx $5.22 63880 $7.83 50/bx $4.81 50/bx $6.59 50/bx $19.00 50/pk
Zulco SKHI
Lister Brand Scissors - 5 1/2" | $74.95 | 7 1/4" $3.25 Magnum $2.09 $1.55 77354 $1.77 36223 $0.95 #81050 $1.89 Zulco $3.50 Medline
Foreceps / Magnifying Glass - Zulco SKHL
312" $8.50 No bid $4.60 $10.95 | 64590 3" $2.71 36229 $3.68 #E2470 $3.29 Zulco No bid
15% off catall rit No bid Zulco SKHL
Splinter Foreceps - 4 1/2" $3.95 $2.15 | Magnum o ol calalog price ° $1.20 $2.30 | 91512 5161 | 36228 | $0.42 | #730000 | $149 | Zulco | $1.75 | Mediine
BV Med
Pen Lights Disposable w/pupil Triad 90650 EMP 32762 BY Medical Medline
|gauge 6/pkg $6.00 No bid $6.50 6/pk $2.90 81238 $7.79 6/pkg $4.35 6/pkg $6.19 6/pkg $18.50 6/pk
Kendall Kendall House
Cotton Balls -Non sterile Med. 2000/ US Cotton 30011 #2600 brand Medline
500 per bg $16.95 bag $15.30 | 2000/bag $2.84 $3.25 69544 $3.70 500/pkg $1.66 500/bag $2.40 500/bag $5.00 400/bag
Dyno
Merch. House
Safety Pins - Asst. steel 50 90618 brand
per pkg No bid No bid $1.59 No bid $1.56 50/pkg No Bid $1.55 | 90/pkg No bid
CPR/FAKIT
Laerdal Laerdal
Face Shields - Laerdal Laerdal 6 55046 #460000
Resusci 35/bx $9.95 ea $118.18| rolls 0f 36 No bid $8.85 35266 $12.42 36/pkg $76.87 50/bx No bid No bid
Major Dynarex Kendall
No bid Dynarex No bid 15% off catalog price No bid No bid No bid Pharm No bid PDI 49171 #33903 large Nice Pair
Alcohol Preps - 100 per bx $2.50 $5.05 200/bx $2.78 $0.90 96284 $2.00 100/pkg $1.43 200 /bx $2.78 100/bx $2.25 100/bx
89882
Dispatch Disinfectant Spary Dispatch Dispatch Dispatch
Bottle - 22 oz No bid $90.00 |Lagosse 8/cs| $7.58 $7.35 bleach' $9.35 50065 No Bid $7.54 220z $23.00 | Dispatch




Audio

Electronics | Conney Safety ICS Jail Supplies Interboro William V. Medical Moore Prime Source School Kids  |School Nurse| South Texas
VENDORS Alert Services Inc Products Health Edco | Henry Schein Inc. Packaging Corp | MacGill & Co. | Shipment LLC | Medical LLC | Services LLC | School Health Health Supply Medical
Brand Brand Brand Brand
Brand /Amt " Brand /Amt Brand /Amt Brand /Amt Brand /Amt Brand /Amt Brand /Amt Brand /Amt Brand /Amt .. |Brand /Amt
:”“ per BX/ :"“ &7‘;,‘23 Unit Price | per BX/ | Unit Price| per BX/ Pu"“ per BX/ | Unit Price B;‘jdprg‘l'gg' Unit Price|  per BX/ PU"" perBX/  |unit Price ‘/&T;Eg PU"" éﬁ';‘;i:/ PU"" per BX/ |unit Price| per BX/ PU"“ per BX/ PKG/ PU"“ é’;’?;&z/ :"" per BX/
DESCRIPTION e | prorcs | e | PR PKG/ CS pka/cs | T [ Prercs PKG/ CS "€ | pkaics AN rice s " | prarcs PKG/ CS riee cs et A nee | pkercs
GLOVES
Med Pride Dynarex
SM-VG Shepard vinyl Derm
Powered Small Latex Free - Cordova ICS 100/bx Dynarex 77108 Med 21075 #SVG100S Assist
100 per bx $7.00 Alert $8.45 100/bx $3.50 #M064VY $3.50 10bx/cs $6.31 High Fire $3.99 100/bx $2.20 vinyl $9.40 100/bx $3.45 100/bx $4.16 | 100/box No bid
Med Pride Dynarex
Med-VG Shepard vinyl Derm Care
Powered Medium Latex Free Cordova ICs 100/bx Dynarex 77109 Med 21076 #SVG100M Assist Mates
100 per bx $7.00 Alert $8.45 100/bx $3.50 #MO064VY $3.50 10bx/cs $6.31 High Fire $3.99 100/bx $2.20 vinyl No bid $9.40 100/bx $3.45 100/bx $4.16 | 100/box | $11.00| 100/bx
Med Pride Dynarex
Lrg-Vg Shepard vinyl Derm
Powered Large Latex Free - Cordova ICs 100/bx Dynarex Cypress Med 21152 #SVG100L Assist
100 per bx $7.00 Alert $8.45 100/bx $3.50 #MO064VY $3.50 10bx/cs $6.31 High Fire $3.99 100/bx $2.20 77110 $9.40 100/bx $3.45 100/bx $4.16 | 100/box No bid
Med Pride Dynarex
Xlrg -VG Microflex vinyl Derm Care
Powered X-Large Latex Free Cordova ICs 100/bx Dynarex Cypress 21286 #SVG100XL Assist Mates
100 per bx $7.00 Alert $8.45 100/bx $3.50 #MO064VY $3.50 10bx/cs $6.31 High Fire $3.99 100/bx $2.20 77111 $14.95 100/bx $3.45 100/bx $4.16 | 100/box | $11.00 [ 100/bx
No bid No bid 15% off catalog Med Pride Dynarex
price SM -VPFG vinyl Derm
Nonpowered Small Latex Omni ICs 100/bx Dynarex Cypress Invacare #SVF100S Assist Medline
Free- 100 per bx $8.00 Alert $8.95 100/bx $3.50 | #M064VYPF | $3.60 10bx/cs $5.81 Curad $3.99 100/bx $2.20 77114 | $2.39 | 100/bx $7.25 21311 $3.45 100/bx $4.27 | 100/box | $6.50 100/bx
Med Pride Dynarex
Med -VPFG| vinyl Derm
Nonpowered Medium Latex Omni ICs 100/bx Dynarex Invacare #SVF100M Assist Medline
Free- 100 per bx $8.00 Alert $8.95 100/bx $3.50 | #M064VYPF | $3.60 10bx/cs $5.81 Curad $3.99 100/bx $2.20 77105 | $2.39 | 100/bx $7.25 21312 $3.45 100/bx $4.27 | 100/box | $6.50 100/bx
Med Pride Dynarex
Lg -VPFG vinyl Derm
Nonpowered Large Latex Omni ICs 100/bx Dynarex Invacare #SVF100L Assist Medline
Free - 100 per bx $8.00 Alert $8.95 100/bx $3.50 | #M064VYPF | $3.60 10bx/cs $5.81 Curad $3.99 100/bx $2.20 77106 | $2.39 | 100/bx $7.25 21313 $3.45 100/bx $4.27 | 100/box | $6.50 100/bx
Med Pride Dynarex
Xirg -VPFG vinyl Derm
Nonpowered X-Large Latex Omni ICS 100/bx Dynarex Invacare #SVF100XL Assist Medline
Free - 100 per bx $8.00 Alert $8.95 100/bx $3.50 | #MO0B4VYPF | $3.60 10bx/cs $5.81 Curad $3.99 100/bx $2.00 | 77107 | $2.39 | 100/bx $7.25 21314 $3.45 100/bx $4.27 | 100/box | $6.50 | 100/bx
HOT / COLD COMPRESSORS
Thermal Therma
Gel Pack - Small 4 X 6 $18.75 Alert $1.65 Rapid Aid $0.54 H.SI $0.64 | economy $0.60 80546 $0.62 37181 $0.66 | Kool TK46 | $0.79 Kool No bid
Rapid Aid 6Xx10" 92932 Thermal Kool
Gel Pack - Large 4 1/2 X 10 | $27.75 Alert $2.40 5.25x9" $20.37 | 24prics $1.63 | Jack Frost $1.06 5x10 $1.16 37182 $1.00 | Kool TK49 | $1.10 4"x9" $2.75
H.SI Therma
Dynarex 5x5/12" Kwik Kold Kool
Instant Kool Press 4 X 6 $16.95 Alert $0.70 200/bx $19.29 | 50pr/cs $0.70 | Insta Kool $0.30 80543 $0.70 37131 $0.51 #103B $0.69 4"x9" No bid
H.SI Therma
Rapid Aid 6x10" 79451 5 Veridan Kool
Instant Hot Press 6 X 8 19.95 Alert . 23.85 24/cs . 1.08 each . . $20.46 | Insta Heet . 6.00 1/2x7 . 23.10 37278 13.20 | #1301 24/cs | $29.95| 24/cs 31.20
- $ No bid $ No bid $ No bid No bid No bid S ul No bid $ $ S s
Heating Pads Electric Mastex 3 SKHC
Moist/Dry $21.95 Alert No bid $15.92 | setting $17.29 $15.55 | 54970 $16.87 35001 $10.96 #23370 |$17.49| Cara |$20.00
Kleenex Kleenex
100/bx Kleenex #21400
Klenex - 125 per bx / 48 bxs 36/cs 48/cs 100/bx, 36 Kleenex
per cs $81.05 $50.88 $64.80 No bid No bid $1.43 box/cs $69.00| 48bx/cs No bid
SKHL
Kleenex Marcal
Puff 200/bx| #345175
Klenex - 144 per bx / 36 bxs 24/cs 1007036 economy 21598 160/bx
per cs No bid $111.65 $36.36 | PoXcs $54.72 $18.45 $58.30 e | $0.83 | 36bxics No bid




Conney Interboro Medical
Audio Safety ICS Jail Packaging William V. Shipment | Moore Medical | Prime Source School Kids School Nurse South Texas
VENDORS Alert Services | Electronics Inc Products Health Edco | Henry Schein |Supplies Inc. Corp MacGill & Co. LLC LLC Services LLC | School Health Health Supply Medical
Brand Brand Brand
Brand /Amt Brand /Amt Brand /Amt Brand /Amt Brand /Amt Brand /Amt Brand /Amt Brand /Amt Brand /Amt Brand /Amt Brand /Amt Brand /Amt
PUr'“C'; per BX/ PUr'“C"e per BX/ PKG/| Unit Price é’;{;‘;;g PU”"C"e perBX/ | unit Price| per BX/ ;T‘C"e per BX/ ;T‘C"e é”;g';zz/ Unit Price | per BX/ PL:TC"e &T;‘K’g/ PL:TC"e per BX/ ;Jr'rc"e per BX/ PL:TC"e per BX/ Pun"c"e per BX/ PKG/ Pun"c"e per BX/ PKG/ Pun"c"e per BX/ PKG/
PKG/ CS cs PKG/ CS PKG/ CS PKG/ CS PKG/ CS PKG/CS PKG/ CS PKG/CS cs cs cs
DESCRIPTION cs cs cs
OINTMENTS
Myoflex 89379
Myoflex - 4 oz $10.95 $20.10 | GSM $4.62 20z. No bid $6.65 cream No bid No Bid $7.89 Myoflex | $13.50 Myoflex
67412 Bactien
Bacitracin - 1 0z $11.95 $9.85 Bayer $5.55 Bactine $5.29 $4.60 spray $6.32 50035 $6.30 | #3311289 | $5.24 | Bactine 50z | $9.00 Bactine
GS Carmex 80817 .25
Carmex - 1/4 oz per jar $3.95 No bid $27.09 | 12/pk No bid $1.08 | .25gram No bid No bid $1.12 No bid $0.90 oz. No bid $1.20 43167 No Bid $1.19 Carmex | $2.00 Carmex
Caladryl - 6 oz / 6 bottles per Caladryl Caladryl
cs $10.95 $11.53 GSM $5.13 Caladryl $5.12 $1.96 |83624 clear $5.25 43039 $4.85 | #1265933 | $5.50 | Caladry 60z | $50.00 | 6bottle/bx
Anbesol 89384
Anbesol - .31 oz liquid $8.95 $12.70 | GSM $4.71 410z. $5.07 $4.40 .330z $6.14 34006 No Bid $5.05 Anbesol $9.00 Anbesol
Silver Solution .31 oz tube No bid No bid No bid $6.05 No bid No bid No bid No bid
BLOOD GLUCOSE KIT
Accucheck Accucheck Home Aide
Strips Accu Chech Adv. - 50 44344 Adv. Accucheck Easy Step
per bx $54.87 $60.00 76778 $65.86 50/bx $67.88 | #4107652 | $42.00 50/bx $22.00 50/bx
. . . . . . . Softclix Home Aide
No bid No bid No bid No bid 15% off catal No bid No bid No bid No bid
Lancets Ref: Softclix sterile - o ol o bl o ol o bl 7 off catalog price o ol o bl o bl o ol 36182 Softclix Accucheck Easy Touch
200 per bx $14.87 100/bx $14.40 58314 $25.63 | 200/bx | $21.00 | #3608742 | $17.48 200/bx $3.50 100/bx
90406
Round Batteries - 2 per pkg No bid No bid $4.90 [2/pk No Bid No bid No bid
SHAMPOO
Rid Shampoo 2 oz & 1 plastic . ) . ) RID 20z no } . .
lice comb kit No bid No bid No bid No bid $7.84 | comb No bid No bid $7.39 No bid No bid No bid $7.70 |Rid34061| $9.81 |Rid 2884450| $7.15 Rd  [$3000| Rid
SOAPS
Dial by
R3/AW
Dial Refill - 1 gallon No bid No bid $21.25 Di;\fby No bid $11.57 | Dial gallon No bid No bid $18.59 No bid $9.50 37696 No bid $18.07 | Dial 34073] $12.14 | Dial #88047 | $22.50 Dial No bid
R3/AW Dial 7.5 oz
Dial Pump Bottles - 7 1/2 oz $4.50 M $2.30 bottle $2.70 $1.85 62331 $2.71 |Dial 34007| $2.36 | Dial #80761] $2.75 Dial $3.00 Dial
SPLINTS/SLINGS
Protecto
Finger Spints - 3/4" x 10' roll No bid $8.28 No bid No bid $6.18 H610 $7.34 Protecto
No bid Protecto Protecto
Finger Spints - 3/4" x 20" roll $11.07 $14.06 20011 $8.75 H620 $10.55 Protecto
Basswood Splint - 18"x3"x1/8" No bid No bid 15% off catalog price No bid No bid No bid No bid 20006 Grahma No bid
12 per pkg $1.95 $8.28 $6.55 88622 $8.86 doz. No bid $8.24 Field
Dynarex
Armslings - bandage/safety pin| Triangular Triangular
12 per pkg $1.95 $1.00 |Magnum $8.76 $2.75 59950 $10.20 | 27549 (12)] $2.88 #11202 $5.95 | bandages




Audio Conney ICS Jail Interboro Medical Prime
Alert Electronics Safety Health Henry Supplies Packaging William V. Shipment | Moore Medical Source School Kids School Nurse South Texas
VENDORS Services Inc Products Edco Schein Inc. Corp MacGill & Co. LLC LLC Services LLC| School Health Health Supply Medical
Brand Brand Brand Brand Brand Brand Brand Brand Brand Brand
Unit [/Amtper| Unit | /Amtper | Unit BrandB/i;m Unit /Ag!)(;/)er Unit | /Amtper | Unit | /Amtper] Unit IAmt per Unit IAmt per Unit IAmt per Unit BrandB/Q;m Unit IAmt per Unit IAmt per Unit Bra;g/l:;é/ Unit Bra;g/l:;é/ Unit Brand /Amt per
price |Bx/ PKGI| Price |BX/PKGI| Price | P Price price |BX/PKG/| Price |BX/ PKGI| Price | BX/PKG/ | Price |BXx/PKG/| Price | BX/iPKG/ | Price | PST price | BX/ price | BX/PKG/| Price | P€" price | P price | BX/PKG/CS
cs cs PKGICS PKGI cs Ccs Ccs Ccs Ccs PKGICS PKG/Cs cs cs cs
DESCRIPTION cs
SOLUTIONS
Swam
Rubbing Alchohol - 16 0z / 12 34042 Swan #98003
per cs $2.20 | Hydrox $17.28 $12.00 81768 $17.04 12/cs | $15.00 12/cs No bid $39.50 | Medline 12/cs
Bactine by Bactine Bactine
Bactine - 4 oz $6.85 Bayer $3.62 $3.35 90224 $4.18 343256 | $4.56 #2399343 | $3.59 Bactien $6.50 Bactine
Campho
Campho Phenic - 3/4 oz bttle $4.19 $2.90 89554 $6.81 43045 No bid No bid $5.75 | CamphoPhenic
Hydrox Generic
Hydrogen Peroxide - 8 oz $11.69 12/cs $0.54 $0.45 90153 $0.71 34011 $0.80 |SKHL #87134] $0.54 Swan $3.50 Sun Mark
Hydrogen Peroxide - Spray 2 Water Jel First Aid Only
o0z $3.70 | Waterjel $2.33 $1.35 63942 $2.31 34414 $2.18 M5124 $2.15 | Water jel
; ; Acme ’ 15% off catalog ’ . . No bid
No bid No bid United No bid price No bid No bid No bid 15991 No bid Pac Kit Safetec Certified
Sting Kill - 10 wipes per bx / Packet 10bx 49007 #3852015 Safety
10 bxs per cs $2.50 | 10/singles $9.80 | Generic $18.50 /100cs $10.70 10/pk $0.88 10/bx $10.49 100/bx
Sting Relief Spray bottle Water Jel Safetc
(ORMD) $3.70 | Waterjel $2.65 $1.40 | 77500 20z $2.63 50122 $1.87 #52001 $2.89 | Safetec 2 oz| $8.75 Nexcare
Eye Wash - 4 oz. Screw Off Bausch & Nortech
top $6.90 Lomb $2.70 $1.20 75519 $2.63 |lab 34105] $2.12 [ Swift 100-3 | $2.39 Nortech No bid
o bi
Fully Medicated First Aid
Ointment - 1 oz (Bacitracin Dynamex Bactracin
Zinc Ointment) $4.80 GSM $2.13 | Generic $1.35 49117 $2.76 43009 $1.65 #1128 $2.59 Dynarex
Chloraseptic - 6 oz pump Generic Vicks Chloraseptic
Cherry flavor $3.70 GSM $5.57 $1.20 59137 $5.74 34107 $5.71 #1332022 | $5.69 | Chloraseptic| $3.75 Sun Mark
TAPE
Clear Tape - 1/2" x 10yrds - Dukal Dukal Dynarex Dynarex 24
24 rolls per bx $16.30 24/bx $6.96 | 24/bx $8.36 $4.95 71565 No bid $6.77 | #3571 24/bx | $9.49 roll/bx $18.50 | Curad 24 roll/bx
Clear Tape - 1" x 10yrds - 12 Dukal Dukal 12 Dynarex Dynarex Dynarex 12
rolls per bx . . $16.30 12/bx . $6.96 pr/bx . $8.36 . $4.95 69311 . $9.39 28278 $6.77 | #3572 12/bx | $9.49 rolls/bx $18.00 | Curad 12 roll/bx
- No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid
Cloth Tape - 1/2" x 10yrds Dynarex Dynarex Dynarex 24
latex free - 24 rolls per bx $2.30 North $7.74 | 24pr/ibox $9.29 $8.45 83154 $10.77 28280 $8.06 | #3561 24/bx | $9.95 roll/bx $20.00 |Curad 24 roll/bx
Cloth Tape - 1" x 10yrds Dukal Dynarex Dynarex Dynarex 12
latex free - 12 rolls per bx $17.10 12/bx $7.74 | 12pr/bx $9.29 | 24/box $8.30 67544 $10.77 28281 $8.06 | #3562 12/bx | $9.95 rolls/bx $19.50 |Curad 12 roll/bx




Interboro

Alert Audio Conney Safety ICS Jail Packaging |William V. MacGill Medical Prime Source School Nurse South Texas
VENDORS Services | Electronics Inc Products Health Edco | Henry Schein | Supplies Inc. Corp & Co. Shipment LLC | Moore Medical LLC | Services LLC | School Health |School Kids Health Supply Medical
Brand
Brand /Amt Brand /Amt Brand /Amt Brand /Amt Brand /Amt Brand /Amt Brand /Amt Brand /Amt Brand /Amt Brand /Amt Brand /Amt Brand /Amt
Pu”" per BX/ F';J"" per BX/ PKG/ F';J"" per BX/ PKG/| F';J"" per BX/ PU”" per BX/ PU”" per BX/ PKG/ PU”" :/3};'/“::&2/ Unit Price | per BX/ PKG/ ;J"" per BX/ PKG/ | Unit Price B;",dpr‘;‘gse' ;J"" perBX/ | UnitpPrice | perBx/ | unit Price Bg;”ﬂprg,‘é’;’ Unit Price | perBX/ | Unit Price | per BX/ PKG/
niee | pkercs | 7o° cs rice cs " | pkercs nee | pkores | P cs rice cs rice cs "ce | pkercs PKG/ CS PKG/ CS cs
DESCRIPTION cs
THERMOMETER SUPPLIES
Thermosca 77239 w/ Welch
' Thermoscan Machine w/ n Pro by rechargeable Allyn Thermoscan
Security Station Ref: Pro 4000 $256.05| Welch Allyn $244.58 [ Pro 4000 No bid $220.65 base $240.00 13087 $253.75 | #04000-300 | $209.00 [Welch Allyn| $933.20 Pro 4000
Mabis w/5
Electronic Digital probe 77238 Mabis Mabis
 Thermometer No bid $2.46 covers $4.64 economy $160.55| Thermoscan $5.33 13095 $3.31 #15600 $4.25 Mabis No bid
Electronic Digital
' Thermometer Replacement Eveready
battery $0.73 H.Slea $0.98 economy No bid $1.29 13014 No bid $0.95 Duracell
| | . " Filac Filac 3000 Ez
3000 EZ Filac Thermometer No bid No bid $384.62) GSM No bid §182.93| Kendall Nobid Nobid $181.35 No bid §163.25| 85560 Nobid 518868 | 13107 | $187.50 | #504000 | $159.00 | Filc | $325.00 | Filac
Welch
Allyn Thermoscan
‘Thermometer Probes - 200 GSM Welch Allyn| Braun 76803 21393 #55560b Welch Allyn
per bx /800 per cs $28.78| 200/bx $47.84 box $52.84 800/cs $48.80| Thermoscan $53.36 800/cs $56.00 800/cs $50.00 800/bx
Filac No bid
Filac Probes - 500 per bx - 10 GSM filac 21081 #500500 Filac
bx per cs $29.72|  500/bx $14.24 | Kendall $158.50 . $205.00 500/bx $15.12 500/bx $13.95 500/bx
— No bid
Steri-Temp (cover for digital Mabis
thermometer) 100 /bx 50bx 21289 #156618 Sanitherm
percs No bid $131.00 | TIDI 50/bx $137.00 |Sani- Therm $131.50 500/bx $2.18 100/bx $104.00 5000/cs
CUPS
ici Medline Mediine Medine Dynarex Medline
Medicine Cups - 50 tubes - 100/pk ICS#789395 100/tubes Cypress 81772 21406 #D80000 SgOO/cs 5000/cs
5000 per cs No bid No bid $2.45 P No bid 15 off catalog price | $80.00| 5000/cs No bid $1.39 No bid $27.50 No bid $68.09 | 5000/cs | $50.00 5000/cs $55.00 $70.50
SCHOOL CLINIC START-UP KIT
Ambu Resusitator - with Ambu
oxygen reservoir bag $23.05 Ambu 15% off catalog price $157.19 $8.90 Ambu 81050 No bid $9.41 #520211 $18.10 |Ambu Adult No bid
Child Mask Adapter $5.35 Ambu $3.81 child mask No bid No bid $1.50 #158200
Ambco Welch No bid
model Allyn Welch Allyn
Audiometer - Welch Allen No bid $805.57 650A No bid $1,140.50 | Manuel 95430 $711.11 53011 $1,449.95 #28200 $2,509.33 | Welch Allyn
Health o Health o Health O Health O
Balance Scale w/ Height Health o meter Detecto meter Meter Meter
Measurement with casters $336.80| Detecto $188.28| Detecto $215.65 meter  [$219.00 402KL $199.95 | 25607/47903 $230.51 58003 | $186.25 | #402LBWH | $198.00 402KL No bid
Cots - hardwood legs 300 Ibs wMmC
capacity No bid $404.27| Clinton $428.00 No bid $398.72 24142 No bid No bid
Adapta Hi/ Lo Platforms $1,705.25 No bid $2,249.00 [ Hausman
repl. Bottle Speriam Lavoptick
Eye Wash Station - 32 0z. $31.40 North $8.04 only $23.90 | Bel-Art 31552 $11.13 42062 $13.68 #24202 $29.25 Bel Art $102.04 Medline
Good-Lite Vision Tester Good Lite Good lite
Cabinet No bid $147.87 $99.55 73632 $155.75 52385 |$1,401.56| #915000 No bid
Good Lite
Good-Lite Vision Tester Stand $92.07 No bid $84.51 52367 No bid
Single Door, single lock wall
mount cabinet (steel
wi/plexiglass window) 27"x Durham
18"x 8" No bid No bid $298.70 [ Durham No bid No bid No bid $227.05 $167.25 | Durham 44497 No bid $218.05 42026 No bid $527.04 Medline
United
Double Door / Double lock Metal MPD Med
Narcotic Cabinet $548.33 | Fabricators 15% off catalog price $261.25 | #75289 $100.00 40565 $413.85 | 24377 $199.00 Harloff | $650.00 Medline
BAW No bid
MSDS Station $21.55 | Plastics No bid No bid No bid
Junkin
safety Junkin Basket Ferro Junkin
Aluminum Portable Stretcher $512.90 | includes kit $208.05 $190.00 | stretcher 55789 $623.89 59012 $190.79 #JSAB03 No bid
Stereoptic Vision Tester - w/ Optec
HOTV slide & peripheral test 5000 Stereo No bid
Ref: Optec 2000 $1,463.00 No bid $2,857.79 | 52736 No bid $1,795.00 | Optical
Telescopic Medline
No bid wallmounted $71.20 14100 $91.87 Winco #340 No bid
Curtains No bid $90.00 79270
Trashcan with li - Stainless Moore 81934 s11303 | Grone! $51.00 | Polder
Steel w/ Foot Press 5.3 gal $32.95 white 5gal. No bid
'Wheelchair w/ Leg Lifts - 18in. Everest &
Seat $329.60 Mabis $240.62 | Tech Med $236.55 $155.00 36335 $281.24 10029 $229.00 | Jennings | $250.00 Invacare
Lakeside Brewer
Stainless steel cart No bid $231.71| Lakeside $204.25 $190.00 91535 $208.26 24012 $199.95 #63500 No bid No bid






