
DESCRIPTION UNIT 

Welding Rod’s #6011-1/8” (50 LB 

box)
BOX

Pure Argon for Aluminum MIG                 

(200 c/f series)
CYL

Argon 75/25 for Mild Steel MIG                 

(200 c/f series)
CYL

Oxygen #200 CYL

Acetylene #4 (125 c/f) CYL

Victor Cutting Tip

(0-1-101, 1-1-101, 2-1-101, & 3-1-

101)

Standard Size Tip Cleaner EACH

OXY/ACE Hose (¼” x 25’) EACH

OXY/ACE Hose (¼” x 50’) EACH

Shoe Handle Carbon Wire Brush EACH

Cutting Goggles (shade #5) EACH

Section II. Repairs

% off 

Catalog 

Price

% off 

Shelf 

Price

% off 

Catalog 

Price

% off Shelf 

Price

% off 

Catalog 

Price

% off 

Shelf 

Price

% off 

Catalog 

Price

% off 

Shelf 

Price

% off List 

Price

0% 0% $85 0% 0% $70 10% 10% 10% $73

0% 0% $85 0% 0% $70 10% 10% 10% $73

0% 0% $85 0% 0% $70 10% 10% 10% $73

Delivery charge @ $18.75 per location. 

One (1) vendor submitted a "No Bid".

Best Welds

Eagle BW112

Victor

Notes

No Bid

Clear Face Shield with Headgear EACH

Cylinder rental $4.00 per cylinder per 

month.

Kiypo

Best Welds

(School Specialty Career & Technical Education)

Brodhead Garrett 

Fibre Metal $21.68 7-1051706087 sa5145

No Bid

No Bid

UNITED INDEPENDENT SCHOOL DISTRICT

WELDERS EQUIPMENT & SUPPLIES

RFP 41-2011

VENDORS

% Off List Price

7-570750087 6011-1/8 

50lb

Est. Delivery Time

No Bid

No Bid

Miller Dialac 250 AC/DC Welding Machine

10%

0%

0%

5-45 days ARO

UNIT PRICE
BRAND & MODEL 

PROPOSING

$148.78

% Off Catalog Price

$22.50

BRAND & MODEL 

PROPOSING

Murex Lincoln 

AOC

$82.50

$35.00

$35.00

No Bid

Acetylene Oxygen Company (AOC)

DESCRIPTION

EACH

Section I. Equipment  & Supplies

% Off Shelf Price

$9.50

$35.00

$2.25

$22.00

$30.00

AOC

AOC

AOC

25%

25%

25%

1 business day

$10.50

UNIT PRICE

$2.75

$14.25

% off List 

Price

15%

Material Cost Discount

Acetylene Oxygen Company (AOC)

Jackson Wildcat

15%

15%

Miller Bobcat 250 AC/DC Welding Maching

Miller Bobcat 225 AC/DC Welding Maching

Victor Cutskill

No Bid

$13.96 FMP F400

$7.19 71126402087 0387-0487

No Bid

No Bid

$14.75 7-583994087 AT-A

$9.78 7-567709087  85450

Brodhead Garrett

Material Cost Discount

Lab Resources

10%

0%

0%

30-60 days ARO

UNIT PRICE
BRAND & 

MODEL 

PROPOSING

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

Delivery charge @ $15.00 per 

location.  

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

Material Cost Discount

% off 

List 

Price

20%

20%

20%

Hazardous Materials charge $4.00.

Cylinder rental: $3.75 per cylinder per month 

1st year.

Cylinder rental: $4.00 per cylinder per month 

2nd year.

Cylinder rental: $4.25 per cylinder per month 

3rd year.

Matheson Tri Gas

15%

15%

15%

Next business day on stock items

UNIT PRICE
BRAND & MODEL 

PROPOSING

$78.00 Lincoln Murex

$18.87 336 CF

$26.47 356 CF

$7.36 251 CF

$28.39 125 CF

$8.71

$4.67 ORS 1014199 C

$2.04 Wypo Standard

$18.43 Anchor RTCL 1425

$30.48 Anchor RTCL1450

$1.92 Anchor 387

$5.49 Anchor GOGGCS550

Matheson Tri Gas

Material Cost Discount

Discount applies to 2011 Gen. Brodhead Garrett 

Catalog for items with suffix 087.  2011 shipping 

rate of 15% of order after applicable discount. Some 

items quire an addtl. Crating or oversize handling 

charge due to package size or weight.  A min. of 

$25 surcharge will be added to any order w/items 

that require DOT hazardous labeling. Contract 

#2011242313ss-bg needs to be noted on orders to 

ensure pricing.

Labor 

Cost
Labor Cost

Labor 

Cost

Labor 

Cost

% off List 

Price

Lab Resources


