UNITED INDEPENDENT SCHOOL DISTRICT
SAFETY EQUIPMENT AND SUPPLIES

RFP 039-2009

| VENDORS AIRGAS ALAMO IRON WORKS FISHER SCIENCE EDUCATION GULF COAST PAPER 1) INTERNATIONAL LOWE'S SAF-T-GLOVE SCHOOL NURSE SUPPLY WEST TEXAS WAREHOUSE
PERCENTAGE DISCOUNTS

% OFF CATALOG PRICE: - 10% off web prices 20% 40% - 50% 30% 10% 0% 7%

% OFF LIST PRICE 16% - (EXCLUDES 'ND' [TEMS) 0% - 0% 25% - 0%

% OFF SHELF PRICE - - - 0% - 10% 0% -

BACK SUPPORT BELTS UNIT PRICE BRAND UNIT PRICE BRAND UNIT PRICE BRAND UNIT PRICE BRAND UNIT PRICE BRAND UNIT PRICE BRAND UNIT PRICE BRAND UNIT PRICE BRAND UNIT PRICE BRAND
MEDIUM E57 11382 S15.64 Alegro 7130-02 Valeo 2198402
LARGE E57 11383 $13.64 Valeo $17.25 Alegro 7130-03 $12.75 AWP $7.10 Valeo 2198403

$10.00 $18.71
XL-LARGE E57 11384 $13.11 Alegro 7130-04
XXL-LARGE E57 11385 no bid Ergodyne no bid $10.00 n $21.74 Valeo $7.70 Pyramex Safety o bid $16.20
$27.97 Valeo 2198404
XXXL-LARGE $10.00 E57 11386 no bid (detachable no bid no bid $8.36
suspender straps)
[WORK GLOVES CLOTH AND LEATHER
MEDI SLOVES — CLOTH $0.36 ﬁ:g Z:g:;igé $0.51 Protective zg';‘; 8; pg $0.37 Anchor 1110 $8.90 T b'\‘jv —_— zg'gg $25.00 (12 pk) | Valeo 2865800
Industrial - £ P.LP MCR : S Lamon - Saf-T-Glove no bid

MEDIUM GLOVES — LEATHER $1.00 RAD 64057593 $1.33 Products | -223:62 (12 pk) $1.31 Anchor 2100 $14.10 $9.10 Dura Worx $10.80 $7.25 Valeo 2840100
LARGE GLOVES — LEATHER RAD 64057594 $23.62 (12 pk)

[SAFETY GLASSES EYE PROTECTION CLEAR / TINTED -DARK

SAFETY GLASSES - CLEAR $0.76 CRE CL110 $2.03 Radians $1.65 Sperian $3.31 | Bandido 51730 $2.90 Crews $250 | AOSafety $0.68 | Pyramex Safety o bid $1.70 | Valeo 2811100
[SAFETY GLASSES — DARK CRE CL112 $2.48 1 $4.00 | Bandido 51731 $9.00 | Dewalt 50.89 | no bid

[SAFETY FACE SHIELDS CLEAR / TINTED

SAFETY FACE SHIELDS - CLEAR $091 IWR 3940 $4.50 Fibre-Metal $9.57 | Sperian $500  [Hunsmansooor2| sto70 | $12.00 | AO Safety soos | oo o b S850 | Crews
[SAFETY FACE SHIELDS - TINTED IWR 394DLG $4.67 no bid $5.93 | Huntsman 3000123]  $20.70 | $16.88 | AO Safety 52.06 | no bid

[GENERAL ITEMS bracket for shields $7.61

HARD HAT (BUMP CAPS) $6.60 RAD 64051020 $11.30 MSA $9.53 MSA $11.17 MSA 454733 $12.10 $5.45 AO Safety $3.30 Pyramex Safety $8.00 | Valeo 2851730
EAR PLUGS FOAM (100/BOX) (NRR-32) $17.73 HLI LL-30 $19.43 Howard Light | $20.99 (200 bx) Three M $18.59 (200 bx) Moldex 6600 $29.50 $12.00 (80 pk) AO Safety $16.25 (laser 30) [ Howard Light

DUST MASK (100 PER BOX) $3.43(50bx) | CRERPDM1 | $8.68 (50 bx) SAS $8.53 (20 pk) Three M $4.24 (50bx) | Gerson 316-1501 $15.30 $16.00 AO Safety $2.90 SAS Safety

[CAUTION TAPE IN ROLL $6.35 RAD 64055720 $9.89 C.H. Hanson $24.54 Brady $6.75 (1000 ft) Empire 77-0201 $11.30 $6.00 (1000 ft) EVC $7.40 North Safety

INECK SHADE STANDARD WHITE ELASTIC . . " " .

HEAD BAND STYLE $1.55 0CC 971-KHK no bid $5.19 Occunomix no bid $7.90 no bid $1.55 Occunomix

[CHAIN SAW CHAPS MARMAC BRAND N N . MCR no bid .

LARGE 38" LENGTH $49.53 ES0 JE9439 no bid $114.51 Steel Grip no bid $30.00 $110.57 Conder $85.00 Elvex no bid

i’zFZEZTLVEGAS CAN 5-GALLON (TYPE 2) %" FLEX $56.59 JTR 10828 no bid $62.80 Just Rite $14.31 Blitz 81022 $37.00 $111.51 Eagle $56.50

[SAFETY GAS CAN 2-GALLON (TYPE 2) 11/32" ) ! $8.51 ) )

o LEX NOTZLE $61.59 JTR 10527 no bid $69.09 Just Rite (145 83/4) Blitz 81005 $29.00 $108.47 Eagle $61.80 Just Rite

[SAFETY GAS CAN 3-GALLON (TYPE 2) %” .

PLEXIBLE SPOUT { ! $55.93 JTR 10728 no bid $62.62 Just Rite $9.97 (2.8gl) Blitz 81010 $33.00 $108.89 Justrite $55.80

NOTES

TWO (2) VENDORS SUBMITTED A "NO BID"




